08.21.2018 ADOPTED
180670
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
Resolution # 670

AWARDS BID FOR FOOD & MEAT PRODUCTS

Councilman Hubbard offered the following resolution,

which was seconded by Councilwoman Kent

WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a notice for
sealed bids for FOOD & MEAT PRODUCTS for the Town of Riverhead and;

WHEREAS, 4 bids were received, opened and read aloud in the Office of the
Town Clerk, 200 Howell Ave, Riverhead, NY 11901 on JULY 23, 2018 at 11:00 a.m;
and

WHEREAS, the bids were reviewed and a bid tabulation was prepared and
presented to the Town Board for review.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the bid for FOOD & MEAT
PRODUCTS be awarded to Schrier Food Service, Adam Lowney Wholesale Meat
Company, Ace Endco and Mivila of New York, Inc. for prices on the attached pages:

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and
is hereby authorized to forward a copy of this resolution to all vendors listed above, the
Purchasing Department and the Senior Center; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that all Town Hall Departments may review and
obtain a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and if needed a
certified copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.

THE VOTE
Kent [X]Yes [ No Hubbard [X]Yes [ |No
Giglio X]Yes [ ]No Wooten X]Yes [ |No
Jens-Smith [X]Yes [_No

The Resolution Was [X] Thereupon Duly Declared Adopted
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FOOD BID 2017

SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1|ALFREDO SAUCE 4/3# 42.95 |4/96 OZ 78.00 12/16 OZ 37.95 N/B
2|APPLE CIDER 8/64 20.95 |8/64 16.95 8/64 19.50 N/B
3|APPLES, FRESH(MAC) 140 CT 28.75 (140 CT 31.95 125 CT 25.95 N/B
4|APPLES, SLICED, CANNED 6/10 34.75 |6/10 31.00 6/10 29.50 N/B
5|APRICOT HALVES 6/10 31.95 |6/10 30.60 6/10 33.90 N/B
6|ASPARAGUS SPEARS, FROZEN 6/2.5# 29.80 |6/2.5# 26.70 6/2.5# 25.95 N/B
7|ASST. HORS DOUVRES 60 CT 21.50 (100 CT 40.90 288 CT 62.00 N/B
8|BBQ SAUCE 4/1GAL 45.00 |4/1GAL 44.50 4/1GAL 44.90 N/B
9|BAY LEAF 16 OZ. 4.25 |16 OZ. 3.98 10 Oz 3.99 N/B
10|BASIL 24 Oz 4.75 |24 OZ 4.15 320Z 7.25 N/B
11|BEANS, FRENCH CUT, FROZEN 12/2.5# 24,95 |12/2.5# 23.40 12/2# 22.50 N/B
12|BEANS, GARBANZO 6/10 19.75 (6/10 18.35 6/10 20.95 N/B
13|BEANS, ITALIAN, FROZEN 12/2# 19.85 (12/2# 18.48 12/2# 17.95 N/B
14|BEANS, LIMA, FROZEN 12/2.5 38.50 |12/2.5 36.00 12/2.5 30.95 N/B
15|BEANS, STRING, REG. CUT, FROZEN 12/2.5# 19.90 (12/2.5# 18.90 12/2# 16.95 N/B
16|BEANS, THREE BEAN SALAD 6/10 27.50 |6/10 25.85 6/10 29.95 N/B
17|BEANS, WAXED, FROZEN 12/2.5# 24.20 |12/2.5# 28.80 12/2.5# 20.95 N/B
18|BEANS, WAXED 6/10 21.95 |6/10 18.90 6/10 29.95 N/B
19|BEEF, CHOPPED 80/20 2.90# 30.75 [2.90# 14.94 4/5# 56.95|10# 3.00#
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
20(BEETS, SLICED 6/10 18.40 (6/10 19.85 6/10 23.50 N/B
21|BISCUITS, OVEN READY 120/1 Oz 36.25 |120/1 Oz 18.75 120/1 Oz 34.50 N/B
22|BOLOGNA, DELI 2/7# 3.39# 2/7# 40.46 2/7# 3.09 N/B
23|BOW TIE NOODLES 20# 18.50 |20# 17.50 2/10# 15.50 N/B
24|BREAD, WHOLE WHEAT, LOAVES NO BID N/B
25|BREADCRUMBS 6/5# 18.95 (6/5# 15.90 6/5# 17.95 N/B
15/12 CT 120/1.8 OZ
26[BREADSTICKS, FRENCH 180 ct 37.50 (120 ct 29.90 125 CT 14.95 N/B
27|BROCOLLI FLORETS 12/2# 17.50 (12/2# 16.32 12/2# 16.25 N/B
28|BRUSSEL SPROUTS, FRESH 25# 75.00 (25# 68.00 25# 59.00 N/B
29|BRUSSELS SPROUTS, FROZEN 12/2.5# 19.95 (12/2.5# 18.90 12/2# 16.75 N/B
30[BUTTER BLOCK 36/1# 119.00 |36/1# 105.48 36/1# 109.50 N/B
4/425 # 47CT
31|BUTTER PATTIES (individual) 17# 69.95 (47 CT 17# 66.47 17# 66.95 N/B
32|CABBAGE, RED 6/10 32.75 |6/10 30.25 6/10 29.50 N/B
33|CABBAGE, SHREDDED (cole slaw mix) 4/5# 29.50 |4/5# 26.50 4/5# 24.95 N/B
34|CAKE, BROWNIE, SHEET, FROZEN 2 TRAYS 43.75 |2 TRAYS 41.75 48 CT 39.95 N/B
35[CAKE, CARROT, SHEET, FROZEN 4/96 OZ. 76.75 |4/96 OZ. 68.75 4-12X16 74.95 N/B
36| CAKE, CHEESE 2/10" 19.95 (2/10" 39.50 1/10" 19.25 N/B
37|CAKE, CRUMB, SHEET, FROZEN EACH 21.50 ([EACH 18.95 1/12 PC 16.95 N/B
12/16 OZ. 12/16 OZ. .30¢ 4/14 OZ
38| CAKE, POUND 192 oz 58.75 (192 oz /56.85 56 oz 28¢ 15.95 N/B
39|CAKE, POUND INDIVIDUAL 24/1.75 OZ 13.95 (24/1.75 0z éé/gg 1/24 CT 12.00 N/B
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
40(CAKE, RASPBERRY, SHEET, FROZEN 8# EACH 21.50 (NO BID 2/9# 41.00 N/B
6# 43¢ 20¢ 43¢

41|CANNOLI CREAM BAGS W/CHIPS 4/1.5# 24.95 3# 2/1.5# |59.85 6# 2/3#(25.95 N/B

42(CANNOLI SHELLS, SMALL 120 CT 37.95 (120 CT 36.20 120 CT 25.95 N/B

43|CANTELOUPE, FRESH 3CT 11.00 |3CT 10.26 3CT 10.25 N/B

44|CARROTS, FRESH 50# 24.95 |50# 39.50 50# 24.95 N/B

40# 55¢ 40# 50¢ 24#

45(CARROTS, BELGIAN 12/2.5# 21.95 12/2.5# 20.10 12/2# 49¢ 18.95 N/B
2.95# 30# 73¢ 24#

46|CARROTS, DICED, FROZEN (2.5 LB. PKG.) 10# 29.50 12/2.5# 21.90 12/2# 79¢ 18.95 N/B

47|CAULIFLOWER, FRESH 12CT 29.50 (12 CT 28.00 12CT 27.95 N/B

48|CAULIFLOWER, FROZEN, (2 LB. PKGS.) 12/2# 18.90 (12/2# 15.84 12/2# 15.95 N/B
1.52# 1.50# 1.12#

49|CELERY, FRESH 24 CT 36.50 24CT 36.00 30CT 33.50 N/B

50|CEREAL, CORN FLAKES (individual) 70CT 30.75 |70 CT 28.40 70-80Z. 27.95 N/B

51|CEREAL, CREAM OF WHEAT 12/280z 30.75 |12/280Z 25.65 12/280z 25.70 N/B

52[CEREAL, RAISIN BRAN (individual kellogs bowl) [90/1.25 OZ 38.75 (96 CT 33.70 96/1 OZ 32.90 N/B

70/.81
53|CEREAL, SPECIAL K 70/.81 OZ 41.50 |70/.81 OZ 38.50 oz 34.95 N/B
54|CEREAL, TOASTED OATS (individual) 70CT 30.75 |96 CT 27.75 84 CT 24.95 N/B
CHEESE, AMERICAN LOAF , SLICED, DELUXE 2.58#
55|WHITE 4/5# 2.30# 6/5# 77.40 5# 2.38# S5# 2.60#
2.19#

56|CHEESE,CHEDDAR, SHREDDED 5# 11.75 |20# 4/5#143.80 5# 2.19# S5# 2.35#
1.98# 1.45# 1.39#

57|CHEESE, COTTAGE 4/5# 29.75 1/5# 7.23 5# 6.96 N/B
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
2.35# 2.18#
58|CHEESE, MOZZARELLA. SHREDDED 5# 11.75 4/5# 43.6 5# 2.19# 5# 2.50#
2.45# 2.19#
59|CHEESE, PARMESAN 4/54# 48.95 12/1# 26.28 4/54# 57¢ 11.49 N/B
60|CHEESE, PARMESAN, PC 200/.5 EA 17.40 (200/.5 EA 16.90 N/B N/B
2.82#
61|CHEESE, PROVOLONE, DELI 12# LOAF | 2.59# 12# LOAF 33.84 1/6# 2.29|5# 3.00#
62|CHEESE, RICOTTA 6/3# 27.50 |6/3# 26.60 6/3# 24.95 N/B
CHEESE, SWISS (4" x 4™, FINLANDIA (OR 4.46#
63|EQUAL) 8# LOAF 2.85# 8# LOAF 35.68 1/5# 2.75|7# 3.90#
64|CHERRIES, NO PITS, NO STEMS 1 GAL 13.50 |1 GAL 12.25 1 GAL 11.95 N/B
65|CHERRY PIE FILLING 6/#10 68.75 |6/#10 57.90 3/#10 44.95 N/B
80 oz.
66|CHICKEN BROTH 12/46 OZ 26.75 |12/46 OZ 25.70 12/#5 25.50 N/B
67|CHICKEN, CORDON BLEU 36/4 OZ 53.75 |36/4 OZ 45.90 36/4 OZ 46.50 N/B
40/40Z 40/40Z 160 oz.
68|CHICKEN CUTLET 10# 37.50 |40/40Z 10# 38.70 10# 35.50|10# 42.00
404 OZ
69|CHICKEN CUTLETS, ITALIAN 34/4.7 OZ 53.75 |10# 38.00 10# 48.95(10# 45.00
70|CHICKEN, DICED 10# 38.75 |10# 37.80 2/5# 35.95 N/B
71|CHICKEN, GRILLED 10# 18.60 N/B
72|CHICKEN NUGGETS 10# 26.68 |10# 26.85 20# 24.50|10# 20.00
73|CHICKEN TENDERS, BRANDYWINE 104# 27.95 |10# 10# 27.50 N/B
352 oz 2.49% 1.47# 1.47#
74|CHICKEN, LEG & THIGH 48/7.33 OZ [54.69 40# 58.80 40# 58.66 N/B
1.87#
75|CHICKEN BREAST, RAW 404# 1.95# 4/10# CS 74.80 10# 1.80|10# 1.70#
76|CHOCOLATE TOPPING 4/1 GAL 35.65 |4/1 GAL 36.90 4/1GAL 42.50 N/B
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
77(CINNAMON 16 Oz 2.98 |16 OZ 2.67 16 OZ 3.32 N/B
78|CHIPS, COOL RANCH, IND. 64/1.75 OZ 28.75 |64/1.75 OZ 28.95 104/1 Oz 35.98 N/B
79|CHIPS, NACHO CHEESE., IND. 64/1.75 OZ 28.75 |64/1.75 OZ 28.95 2-)02/1 35.99 N/B
80|COFFEE, SANKA, (IND)(5 PKGS./100) 5/100 CT 95.00 |5/100 CT 87.50 5/100 CT 75.95 N/B
81|COLLARD GREENS, FROZEN 12/3# 24,95 |12/3# 22.68 12/3# 22.25 N/B
82|COOKIES, CHOCOLATE CHIP 10# 26.50 (10# 24.85 1(2)18*/ 23.95 N/B
83|COOKIES, LORNE DOONES 120/1 Oz 37.75 (30 CT. 19.85 g-)Z. i 34.95 N/B
84|COOKIES, OATMEAL 10# 22.50 (10# 21.60 10# 20.95 N/B
85|COOKIES, SUGAR 10# BULK 10# 22.50 (10# 21.60 10# 21.50 N/B
86|COOKIES, SUGAR FREE VARIETY NO BID S5# NO BID 5# 65.95 N/B
87|COOKIE, OREO, 4-PACK 120/1.6 Oz 43.75 |3/2 OZ. 16.95 120 CT. 41.95 N/B
88|CORN ON THE COB, FRESH 48 CT 2495 (48 CT 24.70 48 CT 23.50 N/B
89|CORN, COBETTES 96/3 OZ 14.25 |3"-96 CT 13.95 3"-96 CT 17.29 N/B
90[{CORN, WHOLE KERNEL 6/10 20.75 |6/10 19.60 6/10 22.99 N/B
91{CORN STARCH 24/1# 17.95 (24/1# 17.30 24/16 17.25 N/B
92[CORNED BEEF 2/7# 4.75# 18# 736.902; 2117# 3.79|10# 3.30#
2.5# $69.00
93|CRAB MEAT-SEALEGS SUPREME OR EQUAL |12/2.5# 85.50 |12/2.5# 75.00 12/2.5# 65.95(1 PACK |5.75
94|CRAB CAKES 10# 52.50 (10# 48.50 gZ./lO# 42.95 N/B
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
95|CRACKERS, OYSTERETTE TYPE 150 CT 14.25 |150 CT 13.35 150 CT 13.25 N/B
4¢ 6¢ 5¢
96|CRACKERS, PREMIUM UNSALTED 500/2 PK (18.50 300 CT 18.35 300 CT |14.99 N/B
97(CRANBERRY SAUCE, OCEAN SPRAY (JELLIED|6/10 40.75 |6/10 6/10 36.90 N/B
98|CREAM CHEESE, PC 100/1 OZ 18.95 (100/1 Oz 17.45 100/1 Oz 17.50 N/B
2.85# 4.98#
99|CREAM CHEESE , soft 4/5# NO BID  |4/5# 57.80 1/3# 14.95 S# 2.30#
100|CREAM, HEAVY 12CT 49.75 (12 QT. 45.85 12/32 Oz 45.95 N/B
1.04 EACH
101|CREAM PUFFS, CHOCOLATE, ICED NO BID 48 CT. 49.85 160 CT |44¢ 70.95 N/B
316 316 OZ 10z
102[CROISSANTS 144/2.2 45.40 |144/2.2 OZ. 42.70 225CT [27¢ 59.95 N/B
11.25% 2.45# 2.88# 1.90#
103|CROUTONS 5/2.25/# 27.65 o# 4/2.25# |25.90 10# 18.95 N/B
104[DANISH, ASSTD. FROZEN, WRAPPED 24 CT 19.95 |24 CT 19.45 24 CT 19.10 N/B
105|DRESSING, COLESLAW (GAL. JARS) 4/1 GAL 49.95 |4/1 GAL 49.85 4/1 GAL 47.50 N/B
106 DRESSING, FRENCH, PC 60/1.5 OZ. 14.25 (60/1.5 OZ. 13.90 200 CT 7.98 N/B
107|DRESSING, ITALIAN (4 GAL. JARS) 4/1 GAL 22.95 |4/1 GAL 21.94 4/1 GAL 20.50 N/B
108 DRESSING, ITALIAN, CREAMY, PC 60/1.5 OZ. 13.50 (60/1.5 OZ. 13.89 200 CT 7.98 N/B
60 CT/1.5 60 CT/15
109|DRESSING, RANCH, F/F, PC oz 19.50 |0z 16.90 60 CT 17.95 N/B
110[DRESSING, THOUSAND ISLAND 4/1 GAL 37.95 |4/1 36.70 4/1 36.50 N/B
48 CT/2
111{ECLAIRS, MINI CHOC ICED FROZEN NO BID 39.29 [NO BID OZ. 37.95 N/B
38/4.5
112|EGGPLANT ROLETTE 48/3.5 OZ. 39.60 |48/3.5 OZ. 38.60 oz 43.50 N/B
113|EGG PRODUCT, FROZEN 6/5# 46.75 |6/5# 59.40 6/5# 41.95 N/B
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY

114|EGG ROLL, CHICKEN 50CT 36.50 (50 CT 39.85 60/3 OZ. 45.50 N/B

115(EGGS, FRESH, DOZEN 30 DZ. 49.50 (30 DZ. 36.00 30 DZ. 42.50 N/B

116|FILLING, BLUEBERRY 6/10 69.50 |6/10 68.75 6/10 64.50 N/B
10#

117|(FISH BREWERS CHOICE 40/4 OZ 68.50 [POLLOCK 64.40 40/4 OZ 59.95 N/B
10#

118|FISH,HEALTHY CHOICE NO BID FLOUNDER 49.70 N/B N/B

119(FISH CAKES 10# 19.50 |10# 20.95 10#/2 OZ 18.50 N/B
4/6 OZ 2./5# 4/6 OZ

120[FISH, FILET NO BID TILAPIA 5-7 |27.50 POLLAK 2.39# N/B

10#/40-4
121|FISH, FLOUNDER 40/4 0z 44.50 |10#/40-4 Oz 39.50 0oz 38.50 N/B
159 OZ 4.50# 160 OZ 1.74#
122[POLLACK, POTATO CRUST 29/5.50Z |(71.50 10# 27.90 COD 10# 6.99# N/B
2.75# 3-5 3.59#
123[FISH, TILAPIA 3/5CT 2.15# 10# 27.50 0z/10# |35.95 N/B
124|FISH IN A MINUTE-BATTER DIPPED POLLACK [NO BID 10#/2 Oz 64.40 10#/1 OZ 36.95 N/B
10# NO
125[FISH, OCEAN PERCH BATTERED NO BID NO BID BATTER 7.95# N/B
32 CT/5 32 CT/5

126[(FISH SOLE SCALLOP & CRAB STUFFED (074 71.75 |32 CT/50Z 68.50 oz 67.95 N/B

127[FISH, TUNA, LARGE CAN, WHITE 6/66 OZ 97.95 |6/66 OZ 75.90 6/66 OZ 76.00 N/B

128(FLOUR 2/25# 17.95 |2/25# 16.35 2/25# 16.25|25# 13.00

129[FRENCH FRIES, OVEN READY 6/5# 31.95 |6/5# 26.80 6/5# 28.95 N/B
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
130|FRUIT COCKTAIL 6/10 34.50 |6/10 30.50 6/10 30.50 N/B
131|FRUIT BOWL, ASST. NO BID NO BID 8# 23.95 N/B
132|FRUIT SALAD MEDLEY 6/10 39.00 NO BID 8# 25.95 N/B
133|FRUIT SALAD, TROPICAL 6/10 34.50 |6/10 32.50 6/10 31.75 N/B
134|GARLIC POWDER 16 OZ. 7.25 |16 OZ. 6.50 18 OZ. 6.65 N/B
135|GRAHAM CRACKERS 200/2 PK 20.50 |200/2 20.45 200/2 18.25 N/B
136| GRAHAM CRACKER CRUMBS 2/5# 27.50 (10# 19.45 10# 19.10 N/B
137|GRAVY MASTER 32 OZ. 8.65 |32 0Z 9.95 320Z 9.50 N/B
138|CLAM BASE,GOLD LABEL OR EQUAL 6/1# 57.25 |6/1# 45.85 6/1# 62.95 N/B
139|CHICKEN BASE,GOLD LABEL OR EQUAL 6/1# 56.50 |12/1# 49.85 6/1# 43.50 N/B
140|BEEF BASE, GOLD LABEL OR EQUAL 6/1# 54.50 |12/1# 57.85 6/1# 34.95 N/B
2.49%
141|HAM, DELI, LOW SODIUM 26# AVG | 3.15# 26# AVG 64.74 2/13# 2.69|14# 3.50#
2.90#
142|HAM, VIRGINIA 10# 3.20# 40# AVG 116.00 1/15# 2.89 N/B
10#
143|[HAMBURGERS 10# 31.50 |40/4 oz 31.90 10# 28.25(10# 3.00#
144|HASH, CORNED BEEF 6/10 69.50 |6/10 59.50 6/10 66.00 N/B
72 .65¢C A41¢ 72CT/6" [.31¢
145[HERO ROLLS, 3X7 12/6 CT 46.95 dozen 6" 4.95 SLICED (22.50 N/B
4.50# 3.95# 8TO 3.98#
146|HOT DOGS, ALL BEEF,SABRETT 6/5# 134.95 S5# 19.75 1#/6/5# |119.50 S# 4.50#
384 oz. /¢ 96 OZ 24/4]11¢ 192 Oz
147]ICE CREAM CUP, CHOCOLATE 96/4 OZ 26.95 0oz 11.50 48/4 OZ. 17.95 N/B
48/4 OZ.
BLUE ¢
148[ICE CREAM CUP,STRAWBERRY 96/4 OZ 26.95 |24/4 OZ 11.50 BUNNY [17.95 N/B
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
48/4 OZ.
149]ICE CREAM CUP, VANILLA 96/4 OZ 26.95 |24/4 0z 11.50 BLUE 17.95 N/B
48/4 OZ.
150|ICE CREAM CUP, VANILLA FAT FREE 24/1 0Z 8.50 |24/4 Oz 11.50 BLUE 22.50 N/B
151|JELL-O, CITRUS 12/24 Oz 25.25 |12/24 Oz 23.75 12/24 Oz 26.95 N/B
152|JELL-O, RED 24 OZ. 12/24 Oz 25.25 |12/24 Oz 23.75 12/24 Oz 26.95 N/B
153|JELLY, MINT 6/4# 31.50 |6/4# 29.00 6/4# 28.95 N/B
154|JELLY, GRAPE, PC 200 ct 8.25 200 ct 7.60 200 ct 7.55 N/B
155|JUICE, APPLE 48/6 OZ 10.50 (8/64 oz 15.48 8/64 oz 18.95 N/B
156|JUICE, APPLE RASPBERRY, S/F N/B N/B NO BID N/B N/B
157|JUICE, CRANBERRY 8/64 Oz 19.95 (8/64 Oz 23.85 8/64 OZ 22.95 N/B
158|JUICE, GRAPE, SUGAR FREE NO BID N/B NO BID N/B N/B
159|JUICE, LEMONADE, CUPS NO BID 72/4 OZ 10.95 96 CT 10.50 N/B
160|JUICE, ORANGE, DIET OR SF NO BID N/B NO BID N/B N/B
161|JUICE, ORANGE -FROZEN (4 OZ) 70/4 OZ 12.50 (70/4 Oz 11.50 72CT 11.75 N/B
162|JUICE, PINEAPPLE 46 OZ. 12/46 OZ 26.50 |12/46 Oz 24.75 12/46 OZ 23.95 N/B
163|JUICE, PINEAPPLE/ORANGE, CUPS 70/4 OZ 1350 |72 CT 12.15 72CT 11.85 N/B
164|KALE, FROZEN 12/3# 31.50 |12/3# 29.16 12/3# 28.50 N/B
165|KETCHUP, IND. HEINZ OR EQUAL 1000 CT 14.50 |1000 CT 19.85 1000 CT 12.95 N/B
166|KETCHUP, HEINZ (OR EQUAL) 6/10 34.95 |6/10 32.50 6/10 20.50 N/B
167|KIDNEY BEANS (6 LB. CANS) 6/10 22.50 |6/10 21.45 6/10 24.50] 6/10 25.00
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
168|KRABBY CAKES NO BID 10#/3 OZ 48.50 10#/3 OZ 42.95 N/B
210z 1.69 210z 1.41 30 oz 1.30
169|LASAGNA ROLL UPS 6/3.50Z ([35.50 6/3.5 0Z 29.60 10#/3 0Z|39.03 N/B
170|LETTUCE, ICEBERG, FRESH 24 CT 29.50 (24 CT 27.90 24 CT N/B
24 90# 10#/40-4
171{LOBSTER TAILS NO BID 4/10# 996.00 oz 215.00 N/B
172|MACARONI SALAD 8# 31.50 (8# 12.56 8# 10.95 N/B
4/47
173|MANICOTTI, CELENTANO 60/2.7 0z 60/2.67 OZ 26.95 |60/2.67 OZ 20.75 0z/72 33.50 N/B
174]MARGARINE, BLOCK 30/1# 24,50 |30/1# 19.80 30/1# 24.50 N/B
175|MAYONNAISE, (IND.) HELLMANS/EQUAL 210 CT 31.50 (210 CT 26.60 200 CT 8.25 N/B
176|MAYONNAISE, HELLMANN'S 4/1 GAL 59.50 |4/1 GAL 55.50 4/1 GAL 53.95|4 GAL. |53.00
177\MEATBALLS,ITALIAN, COOKED 20Z 2/5# 29.50 |2/5# NO BID 2/5# 31.95|10# 26.00
178|MEATBALLS, PLAIN 10#/2 OZ 20.75 |10#/2 Oz 15.50 10#/2 OZ 23.60 N/B
179|MEATBALLS, MAMA, ITALIAN 2 OZ 10# 29.50 [N/B NO BID N/B N/B
180|MEATBALLS, SWEDISH 10#/2 OZ 39.50 |10#/2 Oz 36.00 4/60 OZ 55.00|10# 23.00
181({MRS. DASH .025 3/21 0z 59.50 |12/2/5 OZ 36.40 300 CT 29.95 N/B
17¢ 14¢
182[MUFFINS, BLUEBERRY 12/6 Oz 12.50 24/3.6 OZ 11.90 12/50z [19¢ 11.50 N/B
183|MUFFINS, BANANA, with nuts 12/6 Oz 12.50 (48/3.6 OZ 23.80 12/5 0z 11.50 N/B
184|MUFFINS, CHOCOLATE CHIP 12/6 Oz 12.50 (48/3.6 OZ 23.80 12/5 0z 11.50 N/B
185|MUSHROOMS, CANNED 6/10 38.50 |6/10 36.90 6/10 34.75 N/B

10X:\ulie\PUR - Food & Meat Copy of PRICES.2018.xIsx.FINAL




FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
186|MUSTARD, GULDEN'S 4/1 GAL 29.82 |4/1 GAL 25.90 4/1 GAL 19.95|4/1 GAL |32.00
187|MUSTARD, GULDEN'S, PC 500 CT 18.95 |500 CT 17.80 500 CT 16.95 N/B
188[MUSTARD, HONEY, PC 60/1.5 OZ. 17.25 (60/1.5 OZ. 16.05 200 CT 8.50 N/B
189|NUTMEG 16 Oz 10.50 |16 OZ 9.85 16 OZ 11.95 N/B
5¢ .07¢ .07¢
190|OATMEAL, QUAKER OATS, OLD FASHIONED (12/48 OZ |28.50 8/42 OZ. 22.90 12/42 OZ|34.95 N/B
191|OKRA, CUT, FROZEN 12/2# 21.50 |12/2# 19.68 12/2# 19.50 N/B
192|OLIVES, BLACK 6/10 29.95 |6/10 26.70 6/10 27.95 N/B
193|OLIVES, GREEN 4/1 GAL 42.50 |4/1 GAL 38.00 4/1 GAL 36.95 N/B
194|ONION POWDER 14 Oz 6.15 |16 OZ 2.89 20 0z 5.65 N/B
195|ONIONS, FRESH, RED 10# 8.95 [25# 25.95 5# 5.50 N/B
196|ONIONS,PEARL,FROZEN 12/2# 34.50 |12/2.5# 32.70 12/2# 23.95 N/B
197|ORANGES, FRESH 1/113 CT 42.50 |1/113 CT 41.85 1/113 CT |no price N/B
198|ORANGES, MANDARIN, CUPS, 4 OZ. NO BID 36 CT 22.60 36 CT 21.98 N/B
199|OREGANO 16 Oz 3.35 |16 OZ 3.90 24 Oz 6.25 N/B
200|PAM SPRAY 6/17 OZ 15.40 [6/17 Oz 14.40 6/17 OZ 16.95 N/B
201|PAPRIKA 16 Oz 3.25 |16 OZ 2.50 18 OZ. 2.95 N/B
53¢ .48¢ .66¢
202|PARSLEY, FLAKES 8 OZ 4.25 12 0z 5.70 110z |7.25 N/B
203|PASTA, EGG NOODLES 10# 15.50 |10# 14.80 10# 13.69 N/B
204|PASTA, ELBOW MACARONI 20# 29.24 |2/10# 12.40 2/10# 11.98 N/B
205|PASTA, PENNE 20# 14.75 [2/10# 12.40 2/10# 11.98 N/B
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SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY

206|PASTA, ROTINI 20# 14.75 (2/10# 12.40 2/10# 11.98 N/B
207|PASTA, SPAGHETTI 20# 14.75 [2/10# 12.40 2/10# 11.98 N/B
208|PASTA, SHELLS, MEDIUM 20# 14.75 [2/10# 12.40 2/10# 11.98 N/B
209|PASTA, TRI-COLOR MACARONI 10# 12.95 (24/1# 24.00 2/10# 21.98 N/B
210|PASTA, ZITI 20# 14.75 |2/10# 12.40 2/10# 11.98 N/B
211|PASTRY DOUGH SQUARES 5X5 NO BID 15# 44.25 120 CT 4497 N/B
212|PEACHES, SLICED,NATURAL,NO SUGAR 6/10 36.50 |6/10 29.40 6/10 29.98 N/B
213|PEANUT BUTTER 6/5# 45.00 |6/5# 36.90 6/5# 35.95

214|PEAR HALVES,NATURAL, NO SUGAR 6/10 36.50 |6/10 29.85 6/10 31.50 N/B
215|PEARS, FRESH 120 CT 42.50 (80 CT 52.90 100 CT N/B
216|PEAS & CARROTS, FROZEN 12/2.5# 22.95 |12/2.5# 21.00 12/2.5# 20.95 N/B
217|PEAS, FROZEN 12/2.5# 22.75 |12/2.5# 21.00 12/2.5# 20.75 N/B
218|PEARS, DICED,NATURAL, NO SUGAR 6/10 27.50 |6/10 26.50 6/10 26.50 N/B
219|PEPPER STRIPS, MIXED RED & GREEN 6.10 29.75 [6#10 24.90 20# FRZ 23.93 N/B
220|PEPPER, BLACK 16 OZ. 9.25 |16 OZ. 6.90 16 OZ. 8.50 N/B
221|PEPPER, BLACK, PC 3000 CT 8.95 (3000 CT 8.40 300 CT 8.50 N/B

4.15# 3.98#

222|PEPPERONI, DELI 5# 20.75 4# AVG 15.92 1/4.5# 4.29 N/B
223|PEPPERS, GREEN, FRESH 25# 27.95 |25# 28.90 25# N/B
224|PEPPERS, RED, FRESH 25# 37.95 |25# 39.75 25# N/B
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5 GAL/270 5 GAL/270 GAL/270
225|PICKLE SPEARS CT 23.75 |CT 21.30 CT 26.50 N/B
226|PICKLE, DILL CHIPS B & G 4/1 GAL 20.50 |4/1 GAL 20.90 4/1 GAL 22.50 N/B
6/42
227|PIE. COCONUT CUSTARD 6/10" 39.75 |6/42 Oz/10" 36.50 0z/10" 31.95 N/B
228|PIE FILLING, CHERRY 6/#10 63.50 |6/#10 59.00 3/10 52.50 N/B
229|PIE. PEACH 6/10" 44.50 (6/#10 41.00 6/47 Oz 52.50 N/B
230|PIE SHELLS, FROZEN 10" 20CT 30.50 |20 CT 28.60 20CT 27.50 N/B
6/46 6/46
231|PIE, PUMPKIN 0z/10" 36.50 |6/46 Oz/10" 34.80 0z/10" 28.95 N/B
6/46 6/46
232|PIES, MRS. SMITH, APPLE 10" 0z/10" 39.50 |6/46 OZ/10" 36.70 oz/10" 27.95 N/B
233|PINEAPPLE CHUNKS 6/10" 34.50 |6/10 28.75 6/10 29.50 N/B
234|PINEAPPLE SLICED 6/10 34.95 |6/10 29.25 6/10 29.50 N/B
80-100
235|PLUMS, FRESH 28# 49.50 [APPROX 45.40 25# N/B
104
CT/.62
236|POPCORN, VENDING 72CT 26.50 |72 CT 23.50 oz 34.95 N/B
237|PORK & BEANS, (BAKED) BUSH'S OR EQUAL |6/10 23.25 |6/10 26.10 6/10 21.15(6/10 23.00
47# 2.45#
238|PORK LOIN, RAW, CENTER CUT 2/6-9# 2.49% APPROX 115.15 10# 1.99|10# 1.95#
3.18# 52 CT/3.1 2.606# 52 2.39#
239|PORK PATTIES,RIB-B-QUE, COOKED 100/3 OZ |95.50 074 42.90 CT/3.1 |[38.50 N/B
3.19# 25/2-2-
240|PORK BABYBACK RIBS, RAW 18/2.5# 3.40# 32# AVG 102.08 1/4# @ |2.56# 10# 3.30#
241|POTATO AU GRATIN, DRY 6/2.25# 53.50 |6/2.25# 48.60 12/20 Oz 56.95 N/B
104 CT1/1 104 CT1/1
242|POTATO CHIPS (0Y4 41.68 (104 CT/1 0z 32.75 oz 34.95 N/B
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SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
243|POTATOES, FRESH, IDAHO 50# 20.50 (50# 19.80 50# 19.50 N/B
15¢ $1.23 6/3#/2 .56¢
244|POTATOES, HASH BROWN PATTY 240 CT 36.75 120/2.50Z (28.00 oz 34.90 N/B
245|POTATOES, INSTANT 6/10 41.50 |6/10 37.30 6/10 36.50 N/B
246|POTATO PANCAKE 432/.67 OZ 39.50 |432/.67 OZ 38.60 ?)/3#/2 38.50 N/B
247|POTATO SALAD 8# 11.25 |8# 10.56 8# 10.50 N/B
248|POTATO SKINS 4/4# 36.50 |4/4# 38.50 4/4# 34.50 N/B
249|POTATOES, SWEET, FRESH 1/40# 23.50 |1/40# 23.35 1/40# 22.95 N/B
250(POT ROAST W/GRAVY COOKED 3/6# 5.95# 12/11 Oz 4544;: 2/15# 5.09 N/B
251|PRETZEL, VENDING 88 CT 32.50 (88 CT 31.30 2-)220/.5 20.95 N/B
252|PUDDING, BANANA 6/10 28.50 |6/10 26.70 6/10 26.75 N/B
253|PUDDING, BUTTERSCOTCH 6/10 27.75 |6/10 25.70 6/10 26.75 N/B
254|PUDDING, CHOCOLATE 6/10 26.50 |6/10 25.70 6/10 25.75 N/B
255|PUDDING, LEMON 6/10 29.50 |6/10 28.25 6/10 25.75 N/B
256|PUDDING, RICE 6/10 32.95 |6/10 31.70 6/10 31.50 N/B
257|PUDDING, TAPIOCA 6/10 32.95 |6/10 31.70 6/10 31.50 N/B
258|PUDDING, VANILLA 6/10 26.50 |6/10 25.80 6/10 25.75 N/B
12/2
259|PUNCH 12/2 GAL | NOBID |12/2 GAL NO BID GAL 18.95 N/B
260[RAVIOLI, CANNED, BEEF, W/TOMATO SAUCE (6/10 34.95 |6/10 33.25 6/10 39.95 N/B
261|RELISH 4/1 GAL 23.75 |4/1 GAL 20.90 4/1 GAL 22.95|1 GAL |8.00
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DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SCHRIER MIVILA ACE ENDICO LOWNEY
262|RELISH (INDIVIDUAL) 200 CT 5.65 (200 CT 5.60 200 CT 5.75 N/B
263|RICE, MEXICAN FIESTA 6/2.5 0Z 36.50 |6/2.5 0z 34.60 2/5# 33.95 N/B
264|RICE, GARDEN BLEND N/B N/B 6/36 60.48 N/B
265|RICE PILAF 6/36 OZ 23.95 |6/36 OZ 20.90 6/36 OZ 27.95 N/B
266|RICE, SPANISH N/B N/B 6/36 OZ 52.50 N/B
267|RICE, UNCLE BEN'S (OR EQUAL) 25# 14.50 |25# 12.20 25# 11.50 N/B
268|RICE, WILD,LONG GRAIN 6/36 OZ 41.95 |6/36 OZ 34.50 6/36 OZ 53.50 N/B
ROAST BEEF, FOR POT ROAST, RUMP OR 3.85#
269|BOTTOM ROUND 4/6-8# 3.98 |70# AVG 269.50 15# 2.79(10# 2.85#
ROAST BEEF, RAW, TOP ROUND, TRIMMED & 4.90#
270(TIED 15# 5.40 |12# AVG 58.80 16# 4.09|10# 4.00#
ROAST BEEF, DELI, COOKED, TOP ROUND, 4.05#
271|DELUXE 2/6-8 # 4.40# 15# AVG 60.75 2/8# 4.09|10# 4.85#
BONELESS PRIME RIB,OVEN READY, C 10.35#
272|HOICE 88# AVG | NOBID |88# AVG 910.80 1/17# 10.49|20# 9.50#
273|ROLLS, DINNER 175/1.2 Oz 23.50 |6/20 CT 21.70 192 CT 21.75
274|ROLLS, HAMBURGER 120 COUNT 120 CT 19.95 (120 CT 18.70 120 CT 18.25
275|ROLLS, HOTDOG 144 CT 16.95 |144 CT 16.70 144 CT 16.95 N/B
276|ROMAINE HEARTS, FRESH 12/3CT 37.95 |12/3 CT 36.50 12/3CT
277|SALAD OIL 6/1 GAL 38.00 (35# 24.50 35# 23.88 N/B
3.60#
278|SALAMI, DELI 2[7# 3.29# 3/6# 21.60 3/6# 3.19(8# 3.75#
279|SALISBURY STEAK, NO GRAVY, 4 OZ. 40/4 0z 49.95 (84/4 0z 60.69 40/4 OZ 35.00 N/B
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280|SALT 24/2° OZ 13.50 |24/26 Oz 12.40 24/26 OZ 12.25 N/B
281|SALT, PC 3000 CT 4.40 (3000 CT 3.75 3000 CT 4.50 N/B
282|SAUCE, APPLE, DIET 6/10 24.50 |6/10 21.70 6/10 20.98 N/B
283(SAUCE, CHEESE, CAMPBELL'S OR EQUAL 6/10 40.35 (6/10 29.80 6/10 34.95 N/B
284|SAUCE, DUCK 4/1 GAL 24.50 |4/1 GAL 21.80 4/1 GAL 34.25 N/B
$11.94 $23.45
gal gal $22.25 gal
285|SAUCE, GENERAL TSAO 2/2 GAL 47.75 4/.5 GAL 46.90 2/1 GAL (44.50 N/B
286|SAUCE, MANDARIN/ORANGE,DRESSING 4/1 GAL 66.50 |4/1 GAL 63.70 4/1 GAL 62.95 N/B
$19.47 $15.93
SAUCE, ORANGE SESAME gal gal
287|GINGER,DRESSING 2/1 GAL 38.95 4/1 GAL 163.70 N/B N/B
288|SAUCE, SPAGHETTI 6/10 39.95 (6/10 15.70 6/10 15.60 N/B
289|SAUCE, SWEET & SOUR 6/64 OZ 39.98 (6/64 OZ 42.90 6/.5 GAL 41.95 N/B
290[{SAUCE, TOMATO 6/10 17.95 |6/10 16.00 6/10 15.95 N/B
291|SAUCE, WORCESTERSHIRE(1 GAL.) 4/1 GAL 16.50 |4/1 GAL 16.25 1 GAL 11.50 N/B
292|SAUERKRAUT 6/10 25.95 (6/10 23.35 6/10 22.95(10# 7.00
16¢ 14¢
293[SAUSAGE, BREAKFAST LINK 10# 25.95 10# 22.90 48/2 OZ |22¢ 21.30(10# 16¢ 26.00
5" LINKS/ 5"
294|SAUSAGE, ITALIAN, SWEET 10# 31.50 |10# 25.80 LINKS/ 25.95(10# 2.60#
295[SAUSAGE LINKS, COOKED 160/1 OZ 26.75 [10#/1 0Oz 24.90 10#/1 Oz 24.98 N/B
296 SAUSAGE PATTIES 10# 23.50 [10#/2 Oz 27.90 10#/2 Oz 21.50(10# 2.10#
297|SAUSAGE, POLISH, 10# PKGS., KIELBASA 10# 35.75 |10# 34.50 10# 33.95(10# 4.50#
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298|SAUSAGE, SWEET TURKEY 160/1 OZ 29.95 |10#/1 Oz 31.00 10#/1 OZ 27.50 N/B
299|SEA LEG SUPREME 12/2.5# 42.50 |12/2.5# 38.70 12/2.5# 65.95 N/B
300|SHELLS, STUFFED, MEDIUM 120/2 Oz 46.95 |96/2 OZ 36.50 ?3?'/1.75 32.95 N/B
301|SHORT RIBS COOKED N/B N/B N/B N/B
302|SHRIMP, BUTTERFLY,BREADED 16/20 LG. 4/3# 77.75 |4/3# 70.20 4/3# 64.95 N/B
303|SORBET, RASBERRY 3 GAL 27.95 (3 GAL 25.75 5LT 27.95 N/B
304|SOUP BASE,CREAMED-28 OZ. 6/28 OZ 45.95 |6/25.2 OZ 41.95 6/28 OZ 40.90 N/B
305|SOUP, BEEF BARLEY, LG. 51 OZ. 12/#51 OZ 61.50 |12/#51 OZ 57.80 2-)22/#51 67.95 N/B
306|SOUP, CHICKEN NOODLE -LG. 51 OZ. 12/51 Oz 43.95 |12/51 0z 32.60 12/51 Oz 42.95 N/B
307(SOUP, CREAM/CELERY, -LG 51 OZ. 12/51 Oz 43.50 |12/51 0z 33.60 N/B N/B
308[SOUP, CREAM/MUSHROOM, #5 CANS 12/51 Oz 45.75 |12/51 Oz 36.40 12/51 Oz 48.95 N/B
309|SOUP, MANHATTAN CLAM, LG. 51 OZ. 12/51 Oz 53.75 |12/51 Oz 45.60 12/51 Oz 57.95 N/B
310|SOUP, SPLIT PEA, CAMPBELL'S-LG 51 OZ. N/B 59.95 [N/B NO BID 12/51 Oz 66.50 N/B
311|SOUR CREAM 10# 17.75 |10# 16.40 5# 7.99 N/B
312|SOY SAUCE LOW SODIUM 6/.5 GAL 43.75 |6/.5 GAL 39.60 6/.5 GAL 39.75 N/B
313|SPINACH, CHOPPED, FROZEN 12/3# 21.75 |12/3# 20.16 12/3# 19.95 N/B
314|SPRINKLES, CHOCOLATE 10# 14.75 |10# 13.70 10# 15.25 N/B
315|SPRINKLES, RAINBOW 10# 14.75 |10# 13.70 10# 15.25 N/B
316|SQUASH GREEN FROZEN 12/3# 26.50 |12/3# 24.90 12/3# 24.75 N/B
317|SQUASH, YELLOW, SLICED, FROZEN 12/3# 26.50 |12/3# 24.90 12/3# 23.50 N/B
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3.60#
318|STEW BEEF, FROZEN 10# 4.25# 10# 36.00 10# 3.76 N/B
319|STRINGBEANS REG. CUT 6/10 19.95 (6/10 18.95 12/2 16.56 N/B
320{STRAWBERRIES, SLICED, FROZEN (6.5 #) 6/6.5# 55.75 |6/6.5# 57.72 6/6.5# 49.95 N/B
321|STUFFING, CHICKEN FLAVOR 6/28 OZ 32.95 |6/28 OZ 28.25 6/56 OZ 53.00 N/B
322|SUGAR 50# 26.95 |10/4# 23.70 50# 23.75|25# 13.00
323|SUGAR, BROWN 1 LB. PKG.LIGHT OR DARK  [24/1# 24.95 |24/1# 22.80 24/1# 22.85 N/B
324|SUGAR, IND. 2000 CT 13.75 (2000 CT 12.50 2000 CT 12.25 N/B
325|SUN CUP PUNCH 70/4 OZ 9.95 (70/4 OZ 8.85 72/4 0z 8.25 N/B
326|SUNCUP CRANBERRY 72/4 OZ 9.95 (72/4 Oz 8.60 72/4 0z 8.25 N/B
327|SUN CUP APPLE 72/4 OZ 9.25 [72/4 OZ 8.80 72/4 0z 8.25 N/B
328|SUN CUP PINE/ORANGE 74/4 OZ 12.75 |170/4 Oz 10.25 N/B N/B
329|SUPER CHICKEN 15# 64.95 |15# 58.60 15# 56.95 N/B
330|SWEET & LOW 2000 CT 22.75 |2000 CT 20.00 2000 CT 19.50 N/B
331|SWEET POTATO FRIES 6/5# 32.75 |15#/6-2.5 0Z| 25.85 ;55#52 24.95 N/B
332|SYRUP, PANCAKE 4/1 GAL 24.50 |4/1 GAL 22.50 4/1 GAL 20.50 N/B
333|SYRUP, PANCAKE, S/F 12/14.5 0z 24.75 |12/12 Oz 23.10 100 CT 18.50 N/B
334|SYRUP, SMUCKERS ASST N/B N/B 2-)22_19.5 36.95 N/B
$4.84% $5.52#
335|TACO, BEEF-COOKED N/B 6/5.5# 159.75 5/4# 110.50 N/B
336|TART SHELLS, BURRY 3" 72CT 2295 (72 CT 21.70 72CT 21.75 N/B
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337|TARTAR SAUCE, PC 200 CT 4.90 |200 CT 5.15 200 CT 5.99 N/B
10/100
338|TEA, LIPTON 10/100 CT 41.75 |10/100 CT 43.90 CT 39.95 N/B
339| TERIYAKI GLAZE 6/64 OZ 46.50 |6/5# 44.90 6/5# 44.50 N/B
340| TEXAS TOAST 120/1.4 Oz 32.50 |125/1.2 Oz 26.00 10/24 OZ 26.50 N/B
341|THYME 16 Oz 4.25 |16 OZ 3.90 6 OZ 3.50 N/B
342|TOMATO PASTE 6/10 33.50 |6/10 27.75 6/10 27.75 N/B
343|TOMATO PUREE 6/10 18.95 (6/10 16.60 6/10 16.25 N/B
344|TORTELLONI, CHICKEN N/B N/B N/B N/B
345|TORTELLONI, SPINACH N/B N/B 6# 44.95 N/B
6"/24/12
346|TORTILLAS, FLOUR 6/12 CT 31.75 |72 CT 14.85 CT 29.50 N/B
TURKEY BREAST, RAW, OVEN READY,
347|PERDUE OR EQUAL 2/10# 2.48# 40# APP 2.40# 2/10# 2.25 N/B
TURKEY BREAST, COOKED, LOW SODIUM, $3.70#
348|DELUXE KOHLER OR EQUAL N/B 20# APP 74.00 2/9# 3.69|8# 3.75#
349| TURNIP GREENS, FROZEN, CHOPPED 12/3# 40.20 |12/3# 30.96 12/3# 42.65 N/B
350| TURNIPS, FROZEN ,DICED 12/3# 40.20 |12/3# 30.60 12/2# 19.95 N/B
351(VANILLA FLAVORING (IMITATION) GAL 9.50 [GAL 7.85 10T 2.20 N/B
352|VEAL PATTIES 40/4 Oz 40.75 |40/4 Oz 31.50 40/4 OZ 25.95 N/B
353|VEGETABLE OIL 6/10 38.50 |6/10 34.00 6/10 33.95 N/B
354|VEGETABLES, MIXED CANNED 6/10 25.75 |6/10 22.50 12/2.5# 21.95 N/B
355|VEGETABLE, ITALIAN BLEND, FROZEN 12/2.5# 21.50 [12/2.5# 22.50 12/2# 15.75 N/B
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356|VEGETABLE, NORMANDY BLEND,FROZEN 12/2# 23.75 |12/2# 17.70 12/2# 17.95 N/B
357|VEGETABLE, SCANDINAVIAN BLEND,FROZEN |12/2# 22.50 |12/2# 20.40 12/2# 20.95 N/B
358|VINEGAR, WHITE 4/1 GAL 7.50 |4/1 GAL 6.60 4/1 GAL 6.60 N/B
359|WAFFLE, EGGO 144 CT 19.50 |144 CT 16.90 12/12 CT 15.95 N/B
360|WATER, SPARKLING 24/170Z | NOBID |24/17 OZ 19.85 (2)82/23.7 11.95 N/B
361|WATERMELON, FRESH EACH 8.95 |EACH 8.90 éSD#LS N/B
362|WHIPPED CREAM,EVERFRESH (15 OZ.) 12/15 Oz 27.95 |12/15 0z 26.85 12/15 Oz 26.50 N/B
363|WHIPPED TOPPING, EVERY READY -32 OZ. (12/320Z |[NOBID [12/320Z 47.85 12/32 Oz 64.25 N/B

48/4 OZ.

9¢ 10¢ BLUE .07¢
364|YOGURT, ALL LOW FAT, FLAVORS 48/4 OZ 17.95 12/6 Oz 6.99 BUNNY [14.95 N/B
365|ZUCCHINI STICKS NO BID 4/3# 21.70 6/2# 24.98 N/B
366|ZUCCHINI & TOMATOES 6/10 34.95 |6/10 31.50 6/10 31.50 N/B
367|ZUCCHINI, SLICED, FROZEN 12/3# 29.95 |12/3# 24.90 12/3# 24.50 N/B

NOTE: %150 MIN. ORDER PER DELIVERY CAN

BE MET WITH ANY CO

MBINATION OF AWARDED ITEMS

EXCEPTIONS TO SPECIFICATIONS(ACE)

17

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

26

PC BREAK STIX NOT FRENCH

40

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

73

BID IF FOR TYSON "NAE"BRANDYWINE $31.50

96

UNSALTED IS 300 CT;SALTED 500 CT=$11.90

112

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

117

NOT BREWERS CORONA SEAFOOD OVEN READY

122

COD,NOT POLLACK SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

142

VIRGINIA PIT HAM

162

12/46 OZ
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FOOD BID 2017

DESCRIPTION

UNIT

UNIT

UNIT

PRICE

UNIT

PRICE

169

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

186

GOLD MUSTARD,GULDEN 4/1 GAL=%$27.50

263

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

264

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

286

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

301

SPECIAL ORDER PRICED BY MARKET

310

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

334

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS OTHER BRAND AVAILABLE

335

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

347

BONE IN BONELSS IS AVAILAABLE

349

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

364

YOGURT FLAVORS AVAILABLE-
CHERRY,VANILLA,BLUEBERRY,PEACH,PLAIN,
STRAWBERRY,STRAWBERRY/BANANA

366

SPECIAL ORDER 7-10 DAYS

PRODUCE ITEMS AVAILABLE AT MARKET PRICE

21X:\Julie\PUR - Food & Meat Copy of PRICES.2018.xIsx.FINAL




