04.17.2018 ADOPTED
180289
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution # 289

AWARDS BID FOR WORK CLOTHES

Councilwoman Kent offered the following resolution,

which was seconded by Councilman Wooten

WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a notice for
sealed bids for WORK CLOTHES for the Town of Riverhead and;

WHEREAS, 3 bids were received, opened and read aloud in the Office of the
Town Clerk, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, NY 11901 on March 22nd, 2018 at 2:00
pm; and

WHEREAS, it is the recommendation of the Purchasing Department that the bid
for WORK CLOTHES be and hereby is, awarded to LONG ISLAND CAULIFLOWER
ASSOCIATION; PROVENGO, LLC; and WOODS MENS & BOYS CLOTHING for
prices on the attached pages; and

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby
authorized to forward a copy of this resolution to LONG ISLAND CAULIFLOWER
ASSOCIATION; PROVENGO, LLC and WOODS MENS & BOYS CLOTHING, and
the Purchasing Department; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain
a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and if needed, a certified
copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.
THE VOTE
Kent X]Yes [ _|No Hubbard [X]Yes [ |No
Giglio X]Yes [_INo Wooten X]Yes [ |No
Jens-Smith X]Yes [_]No

The Resolution Was <] Thereupon Duly Declared Adopted
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Item # Description LI
CAULIFLOWER PROVENGO WOODS
Item #1 Trousers Poly-Cotton Blend Dickies & 100% cotton
(A) Sizes 28-42 N/B REDKAP PT20 $13.42
(B) Sizes 44-60 N/B $16.24
(C) 100% Cotton Dickies PC Size 28-42 N/B $20.24
(D) 100% Cotton, Size 44-60 N/B $24.24
Item #2 Jeans — Dickies, Pre-washed CR393 Relaxed fit
(A) Sizes 28-42 Poly-cotton N/B $16.20
(A1) Sizes 44-50 Poly cotton N/B $17.70
(A2) Sizes 52-56 N/B $17.70
(B) Dickies, Pre-washed C993 Regular Fit
(B1) Sizes 28-42 N/B $16.30
(B2) Sizes 44-50 N/B $17.88
(B3) Sizes 52-56 N/B $17.88
(C) Dickies, Relaxed fit Carpenter Jeans 1993SNB
(C1) Sizes 28-42 N/B $22.74
(C2) Sizes 44-50 N/B $24.94
(C3) Sizes 52-56 N/B $24.94
(D) Carhartt Carpenter Jeans #74308 CARHARTT B237
(D1) Sizes 28-42 N/B $27.90
(D2) Sizes 44-50 N/B $27.90
(D3) Sizes 52-56 N/B CARHARTT B13 $32.24
(E) Carhartt Relaxed fit Jeans #74307
(E1) Sizes 28-42 N/B CARHARTT B460 $23.78
(E2) Sizes 44-50 N/B $23.78
(E3) Sizes 52-56 N/B $26.48
(F) Signature Levis N/B LEVIS 505 & 550
(F1) Sizes 28-56 N/B $44.20
ltem #3 Shor.t Sleeve Uniform Shirts Dickies — NAVY Poly/Cotton Blend
Dickies SP 24 (or equal)
(A) Sizes S-XL N/B REDKAP SP24 $9.14
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $10.94
(C) Sizes 4XL-5XL N/B $10.94




Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B $10.94
Item #4 Short Sleeve Uniform Shirts 100% Cotton-NAVY BLUE

(A) Sizes S-XL N/B RED KAP SC40 $14.74

(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $17.44

Tall add amount or % to above prices N/B REDKAP SC40 $16.65
ltem #5 Long Sleeve Uniform Shirts - Poly/Cotton Blend Dickies SP20 (or

equal)

(A) Sizes S-XL N/B REDKAP SP14 $10.70

(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $13.20

(C) Size 4XL-5XL N/B $13.20

Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B $13.20
Iltem #6 Long Sleeve Uniform Shirts - 100% cotton N/B

(A) Sizes S-XL N/B REDKAP SC30 $16.20

(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $18.88

(C) Size 4XL-5XL N/B $18.88

Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B $18.88
Item #7 Short Sleeve T-Shirt, Poly/Cotton Blend — Hi-Visibility & Blue

(A) Sizes S-XL N/B $2.28

(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $5.88

(C) Size 4XL-5 XL N/B $6.68

LT&XLT=$5.00

Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B 2XT&3XT=$8.00
Item #8 Long Sleeve T-Shirt, Poly/Cotton Blend- Hi-visibility

(A) Sizes SMALL-XL N/B $5.18

(B) Size 2XL-3XL-4XL N/B $7.72

LT&XLT=$6.75

Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B 2XT-4XT=$8.30
Item #9 Coveralls, one piece unlined - Dickies #4879 RED KAP CT10

(A) Sizes 28-46 N/B $23.90

(B) Sizes 48-50 N/B $23.90

(C) Sizes 52-60 N/B $27.90
ltem #10 Coveralls, Insulated 20 Degrees - Dickies #2430 (or equal) 100%

cotton - brown; black

(A) Sizes S-XL N/B DICKIES TB239 $65.78

(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $71.80




(C) Size 4XL N/B $71.80
Item #11 Bib Overalls, Insulated - Dickies Duck - brown; black
(A) Sizes S-XL N/B DICKIES TB839 $58.24
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $62.80
(C) Sizes 4XL-5XL N/B $62.80
Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B
ltem #12 I(_poun”goiI:)eve Sweatshirt - Poly/Cotton Blend — HI-VISIBILITY
(A) Sizes S-XL N/B $6.84
(B) Sizes 2XL N/B $9.78
3X N/B $9.98
(C) Size 4XL N/B $10.88
Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B
Iltem #13 Long Sleeve Hooded Zippered Sweatshirt, HI-VISIBILITY
(A) Sizes S-XL N/B $15.54
(B) Sizes 2XL N/B 19.44
3X N/B 19.94
(C) Size 4XL N/B $20.44
Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B 40% UPCHARGE
ltem #14 Long Sleeve Insulated Hooded Zippered Sweatshirt, HI-VISIBILITY &
BLUE
(A) Sizes S-XL N/B THERMAL LINED $32.24
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $35.24
(C) Size 4XL N/B $39.24
Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B 30%
M- Long Sleeve Hooded Zippered Sweatshirt,
HI VIS stripes (lighter weight)
(A) Sizes S-XL N/B LUXSWTLHZ $28.24
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $28.24
(C) Size 4XL N/B $28.24
Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B N/A
Iltem #16 High Visibility Parka (Scotch lite reflective material) Waterproof
(A) Sizes S-XL $57.00 N/B $47.24




(B) Sizes 2XL — 3XL $69.00 N/B $47.24
(C) Sizes 4XL-5XL $69.00 N/B $47.24
Tall add amount or % to above prices N/B N/A
Iltem #17 High Visibility Bomber jacket, waterproof
(A) Sizes S-XL N/B $35.88
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL N/B $35.88
(C) Sizes 4XL-5XL N/B $35.88
Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B
High Visibility Rain Jacket & Pants Breathable
Item #18
Game brand or equal
(A) Sizes S-XL $57.00 N/B PORT WEST $39.90
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL $65.00 N/B PANTS:H444 $39.90
(C) Size 4XL $65.00 N/B JACKET:VH443 $39.90
Tall add amount or % to the above prices N/B N/A
Item # Description
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS TO BE UTILIZED BY FIRE MARSHAL &
CODE ENFORCEMENT
5.11 (or equal) Men's Short Sleeve PDU shirt 65% poly/35% cotton
Item #19 .
twill. Navy
(A) Sizes S-XL $37.80 N/B
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL $43.80 N/B
(C) Sizes 4XL $43.80 N/B
3 " H 0, 0,
ltem #20 5.11 Tactical men's long sleeve PDU shirts 65% poly/35% cotton,
navy
(A) Sizes S-XL $37.80 N/B
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL $43.80 N/B
(C) Sizes 4XL $43.80 N/B
Iltem #21 Tac Lite Pro Pants - Navy
W 28-44
(A) Sizes 38-42 INSEAM
30,32,34,36 $36.20 N/B
; W-46-54
Iltem #22 TDU Poly cotton rip stop 5.11 pants, dark navy #74003
(A) Sizes S-XL S-2X $36.20 N/B
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL 3X-4X $41.60 N/B
(C) Sizes 4XL N/B




5.11 Short sleeved collared polo shirts, poly cotton & 100% cotton

Item #23 navy or black
(A) Sizes S-XL S-2X $28.50 N/B
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL 3XL $32.80 N/B
(C) Sizes 4XL-5XL TALL L-5X $32.80 N/B
Item #24 5.11 Long sleeved collared polo shirts, navy or black
(A) Sizes S-XL 2-2X $30.50 N/B
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL 3XL $35.50 N/B
(C) Sizes 4XL TALL L-5X $35.50 N/B
Item #25 5.11 Tactical s/s Taclite-Pro shirt w/free card wallet N/B
NO FREE
(A) Sizes S-XL CARD S-
2X $35.00 N/B
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL 3XL $39.50 N/B
(C) Sizes 4XL TALL L-5X $39.50 N/B
(e £ RAINGEAR for Fire Marshals w/lettering
Cornerstone, Class I, Level Il , or equal GAME 1340
(A) Sizes S-XL NO BID CLASS 3 STRIPED N/B
(B) Sizes 2XL-3XL NO BID HIVIZ RAIN JACKET N/B
) W/ONE COLOR
(C) Sizes 4XL NO BID SCREEN N/B
N/B
N/B
N/B
Item # Description Price N/B
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS TO BE UTILIZED BY THE PUMP OUT BOAT
OPERATORS N/B
ltem 5.11 Tactical Shorts TDU
#27 PROPPER F5264
(A) Size 32 $34.00 N/B
(B) Size 34 $34.00 N/B
(C) Size 36 $34.00 N/B
(D) Size 38 $34.00 N/B
(E) Size 40 $34.00 N/B
(F) Size 42 $34.00 N/B
(G) Size 44 $34.00 N/B




Item #28 5.11 Tactical Performance Polo Shirt White PROPPER F5341
(A) - Sizes S-XL S-2X $28.50 N/B
(B) - Sizes 2XL-3XL 3X $32.80 N/B
(C) - Sizes 4XL L-5X $32.80 N/B
N/B
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS TO BE UTILIZED BY BAY CONSTABLE N/B
Iltem #29 Danner striker Il GTX Men’s Waterproof Quarter Boot
Black #43011 $148.00 N/B
Item #30 Danner Striker 8" Torrent waterproof boot Gore-tex
Black #43003 $155.00 N/B
Iltem #31 Galls 6 pocket BDU Pants color Navy #TR077
ROTHCO 6
POCKET BDU
PANTS $22.00 N/B
RAINGEAR ADDITIONS N/B
L _ . _ CARHARTT MAYNE
Item #32 Grunden’s Clipper 116 Bib pants, mid weight PVC coating $67.00 NO BID BID OVERALL
101075 N/B
M-XL $68
Item #33 Grunden'’s Clipper 82 Hooded Jacket 2XL-$72  3XL- CARHARTT SURREY
$89.00 NO BID COAT #100100
3 ingley 107 ” Rubb b le #1400 1072650 15
Item #34 Tingley 10" & 15" Rubber over boot style #14 N/A NO BID $25.90
Item #35 Tingley PVC Knee Boot style 51144 & 51244 $24.85 $26.90
PATCH TO
ANY
GARMENT $2.00
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