
01.20.2016          ADOPTED 
160059 

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

Resolution   # 59 

AWARDS BID FOR WATER SERVICE MATERIALS REBID 
 

Councilman Dunleavy  offered the following resolution, 
 

which was seconded by  Councilman Wooten 
 

 WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a notice to 
bidders to rebid certain water service materials; and 

 WHEREAS, bids were received, opened and read aloud on the 7th day of 
January, 2016, at 11:00 a.m. at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York 
11901, the date, time and place given in the notice to bidders. 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT 

 RESOLVED, that the award for the rebid of water service materials be and is 
hereby award per the attached bid summary; and be it further 

 RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby authorized for forward a certified 
copy of this resolution to Blackman Plumbing Supply Co., Atten:  Kevin Regan, 900 
Sylvan Avenue, Bayport, New York, 11705; Ferguson Waterworks, Atten:  Joseph 
Baocellini, 200 Atlantic Avenue, New Hyde Park, New York, 11040; HD Supply 
Waterworks, Ltd., Atten:  Paul Meissner, 650 Sheafe Road, Poughkeepsie, New York, 
12601; and be it further 

 RESOLVED, that all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain a copy of 
this resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a certified copy of 
same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk. 

THE VOTE 
 

Hubbard Yes No       Giglio Yes No 
    Wooten Yes No  Dunleavy Yes No 

Walter Yes No 
 

The Resolution Was  Thereupon Duly Declared Adopted 
  



ITEM 
# DESCRIPTION BLACKMAN FERGUSON 

HD 
SUPPLY 

16 

24” bottom ID x 21” ID top x 48”-long thermoplastic meter pit, notched 
(3”x 4”) 180°.  In addItion, pit wall thickness should be no more than 
.7” and no less than .3”.  $      165.24      

17 

36” bottom ID x 36” ID top x 48”-long thermoplastic meter pit, notched 
(3” x 4”) 180°.  In addItion, pit wall thickness should be no more than 
.7” and no less than .3”.   382.63   

63 
Mueller H-15403N ¾” straight 3-part union Mueller 110 conductive 
compression connection for CTS O.D. both ends, or equal.   14.63   

64 
Mueller H-15403N 1” straight 3-part union Mueller 110 conductive 
compression connection for CTS O.D. both ends, or equal.   15.96   

65 
Mueller H-15403N 1½” straight 3-part union Mueller 110 conductive 
compression connection for CTS O.D. both ends, or equal.   56.28   

66 
Mueller H-15403N 2” straight 3-part union Mueller 110 conductive 
compression connection for CTS O.D. both ends, or equal.   75.98   

67 Mueller H-15451N 1½” conductive compression CTS x FIP, or equal   50.08   

68 Mueller H-15451N 2” conductive compression CTS x FIP, or equalL   59.67   

69 
Mueller N-35428N 1” MIP inlet x Mueller 110 compression connection 
CTS 1” outlet, or equal.   49.96   

70 
Mueller N-35071N ¾” insulated straight service connection ¾” female 
copper flare x ¾” CTS outlet, or equal.   51.41   

71 
Mueller P-15381N 1 ½” X 1 ½” X 1” service tee pack joint connection 
for CTS O.D., or equal   78.32   

72 
Mueller P-15381N 2” X 2” X 1” service tee pack joint connection for 
CTS O.D., or equal   102.36   

73 
Mueller P-15343N 1” X 1 ½” two brand-body pack joint for CTS O.D. 
tubing, or equal   73.58   

74 
Mueller H-15343N 1” X 2” two branch-body 110 conductive 
compression connection for CTS O.D. tubing, or equal   85.5   

75 Mueller H-15346N 1” X 2” three branch fitting, or equal  $      115.15      

110 Smith Blair 4” 274 bell joint repair clamp, or equal     165.34 

111 Smith Blair 6” 274 bell joint repair clamp, or equal     182.08 
112 Smith Blair 8” 274 bell joint repair clamp, or equal     251.6 

113 Smith Blair 10” 274 bell joint repair clamp, or equal     316.14 

114 Smith Blair 12” 274 bell joint repair clamp, or equal     341.93 

124 6” MJ cast iron compact sleeve, less accessories - domestic casting   85.59   

125 8” MJ cast iron compact sleeve, less accessories - domestic casting   111.87   

126 10” MJ cast iron compact sleeve, less accessories - domestic casting   167.8   

127 12” MJ cast iron compact sleeve, less accessories - domestic casting   226.43   

128 6” x 6” x 6” hydrant tee, less accessories - domestic casting   163.09   

129 8” x 8” x 6” hydrant tee, less accessories - domestic casting   203.52   

130 10” x 10” x 6” hydrant tee, less accessories - domestic casting   320.11   

131 12” x 12” x 6” hydrant tee, less accessories - domestic casting   371.33   

132 6” mechanical joint with 90° bend, less accessories   97.72   



ITEM 
# DESCRIPTION BLACKMAN FERGUSON 

HD 
SUPPLY 

133 6” mechanical joint with 45° bend, less accessories   80.87   

134 6” mechanical joint with 22° bend   73.46   

139 Mueller 6” A-2361 MJ resilient wedge gate valve.  $      581.00      

140 Mueller 8” A-2361 MJ resilient wedge gate valve.  $      926.25      

141 Mueller 10” A-2361 MJ resilient wedge gate valve.  $   1,444.25      

142 Mueller 12” A-2361 MJ resilient wedge gate valve.  $   1,827.50      

143 Mueller 6” HC-2361-44-D-150 MJ cut-in valve.  $      940.24      

144 Mueller 8” HC-2361-44-D-150 MJ cut-in valve.  $   1,453.86      

145 Mueller 10” HC-2361-44-D-150 MJ cut-in valve.  No Bid   No Bid  No Bid 

146 Mueller 12” HC-2361-44-D-150 MJ cut-in valve.  No Bid   No Bid  No Bid 

147 
Mueller Super Centurion 250 4 ½” MVO fire hydrant with acuagrip 
foot & 5’ bury.    $   2,265.95    

148 Mueller Super Centurion  6” hydrant extension kit.    $      314.55    

149 Mueller Super Centurion 1’ hydrant extension kit.    $      369.10    

150 Mueller hydrant repair stems, 4 ½’ MVO (all models)    $      112.89    

161 Mueller Super Centurion 250 fire hydrant breakaway repair kit.      $   155.00  

162 Fire hydrant breakaway repair kit with brass safety stem coupling.  $      155.00      

178 
25 lbs. lead wool (indicate if price is per pound or per 25 pounds; i.e., 
$10.00/lb or $10/25 lbs).    5 lbs.  $       25.76      

179 
4” Mueller Line Seal III butterfly valve, flange x flange, with hand 
wheel.    $      489.72    

180 
6” Mueller Line Seal III butterfly valve, flange x flange, with hand 
wheel.    $      602.73    

181 
8” Mueller Line Seal III butterfly valve, flange x flange, with hand 
wheel.    $      646.16    

182 
10” Mueller Line Seal III butterfly valve, flange x flange, with hand 
wheel.    $      890.80    

183 
12” Mueller Line Seal III butterfly valve, flange x flange, with hand 
wheel.    $   1,067.18    

191 ¾” CC drill & tap for “Mueller B101” tapping machine    $      150.47    

192 1” CC drill & tap for “Mueller B101” tapping machine    $      200.47    

193 1 ¾” carbide-tip hole saw cutter  $   1,380.36      

194 ¼” carbide-tip pilot cutter  $         3.36      

195 Silver reflective paint (price per quart)    $      125.00    

196 
Safety orange hydrant paint (Rust-Oleum enamel brush-on/roll-on 
only - price per gallon).    $       75.00    

197 Markout paint (AWWA blue) 20 oz. cans, or equal    $         2.49    

198 MA013922 food-grade anti-seize, 1 lb., or equal    $       14.65    

204 16” ductile iron valve box top flange top section with cover, domestic    $       42.55    



205 Domestic valve box cover    $       14.60    

ITEM 
# DESCRIPTION BLACKMAN FERGUSON 

HD 
SUPPLY 

209 Buffalo-type 2 ½” cast iron valve box    $       68.31    

210 Mueller H-10373 2 ½” repair lids for new style Buffalo-type curb box    $         9.77    

211 Mueller H-10374 2 ½” repair lids for old style Buffalo-type curb box    $         9.77    

212 Mueller H-10374 3” repair lids for old style Buffalo-type curb box    $       12.73    

213 Mueller H-10310 curb box complete for 1 ½” x 2” service, or equal    $       65.93    

214 CH15535 ¾” copper disk    $         1.59    

215 DH15535 1” copper disk    $         1.59    

219 CST magnetic locator, Model 100, or equal    $      803.55    
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