

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution # 584

**AWARDS BID FOR SENSUS WATER METERS & ACCESSORIES,
OR REASONABLE EQUIVALENT, & REPAIR TO METER READING
EQUIPMENT FOR THE RIVERHEAD WATER DISTRICT**

Councilman Dunleavy offered the following resolution,

which was seconded by Councilman Wooten

WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a notice to bidders for water meters for use by the Riverhead Water District; and

WHEREAS, bids were received, opened and read aloud on the 21st day of July, 2016, at 2:05 p.m. at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York 11901, the date and time specified in the notice to bidders; and

WHEREAS, the bid proposals were reviewed by the Riverhead Water District for compliance with the bid specifications.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the bid for water meters for use in the Riverhead Water District be and is hereby awarded to T Mina Supply, Inc., as listed on the bid proposal sheet attached hereto; and be it further

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized to forward a certified copy of this resolution to T Mina Supply, Inc., 168 Long Island Avenue, Holtsville, New York, 11742; and be it further

RESOLVED, that all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a certified copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.

THE VOTE

Hubbard Yes No Giglio ABSENT
Wooten Yes No Dunleavy Yes No
Walter Yes No

The Resolution Was Thereupon Duly Declared Adopted

BID PROPOSAL SHEET
BID #RWD-2016-20

ALL PRICES ARE "PER ITEM", UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED

**ALL BRASS ITEMS BID MUST BE "NO-LEAD" PURSUANT
 TO THE *REDUCTION OF LEAD IN DRINKING WATER ACT*
 (SENATE BILL 3874 SIGNED JANUARY, 2011)**

<u>ITEM #</u>	<u>ITEM DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>NET DELIVERED PRICE</u>
<u>iPERL WATER METERS</u>		
1.	5/8" x 1/2" iPERL Meter*	\$ <u>112.17</u>
2.	3/4" iPERL Meter*	\$ <u>119.52</u>
3.	1" iPERL Meter*	\$ <u>165.07</u>
4.	3/4" iPERL Water Management System Fire Service non-pit installation	\$ <u>148.19</u>
5.	3/4" iPERL Water Management System Fire Service pit installation	\$ <u>154.59</u>
6.	1" iPERL Water Management System Fire Service non-pit installation	\$ <u>185.43</u>
7.	1" iPERL Water Management System Fire Service pit installation	\$ <u>191.84</u>

*iPerl meters are 2-wire w/6' wire & TR/PL sensor

IPERL ACCESSORIES

8.	Strainers for iPerl meters	\$ <u>.80</u>
9.	Touch Pad	\$ <u>14.00</u>
10.	TR/PL Housing	\$ <u>10.00</u>
11.	25' 2-Wire Cable TR/PL Sensor End	\$ <u>26.11</u>
12.	6' 3-Wire Cable – Plain End	\$ <u>14.45</u>
13.	25' 3-Wire Cable – Plain End	\$ <u>17.59</u>
14.	6' 3-Wire Cable – TR/PL Sensor End	\$ <u>22.99</u>
15.	25' 3-Wire Cable – TR/PL Sensor End	\$ <u>26.11</u>

ITEM # **ITEM DESCRIPTION** **NET DELIVERED PRICE**

OMNI C2 METERS & ACCESSORIES

16.	1.5" C ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>997.22</u>
17.	2" C ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>1150.63</u>
18.	3" C ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>1457.46</u>
19.	4" C ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>2531.37</u>
20.	6" C ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>4601.80</u>
21.	8" C ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>6897.05</u>
22.	10" C ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>8899.41</u>
23.	C ² Omni Electronic Register	\$ <u>260.66</u>

OMNI T2 METERS & ACCESSORIES

24.	1.5 T ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>682.45</u>
25.	2" T ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>809.48</u>
26.	3" T ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>1008.73</u>
27.	4" T ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>1963.80</u>
28.	6" T ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>3535.49</u>
29.	8" T ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>5858.78</u>
30.	10" T ² Omni Meter	\$ <u>7638.66</u>
31.	T ² Omni Electronic Register	\$ <u>260.66</u>

OMNI F2 FIRE METERS - COMPACT

32.	4" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>5732.18</u>
33.	6" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>7629.02</u>
34.	8" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>11152.94</u>
35.	10" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>15452.94</u>

OMNI F2 FIRE METERS - STANDARD

36.	4" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>5952.67</u>
37.	6" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>7849.53</u>
38.	8" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>11929.41</u>
39.	10" F ² Omni Fire Meter	\$ <u>16800.00</u>

ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	NET DELIVERED PRICE	
		TOUCH COUPLER VERSION	WIRED VERSION

FlexNet SmartPoint M2 RADIO TRANSCEIVERS

58.	MXU 510M Single Port Meter Transceiver Unit for use in non-pit (inside) installation	\$ <u>120.24</u>	\$ <u>117.86</u>
59.	MXU 510M Dual Port Meter Transceiver Unit for use in non-pit (inside) installation	\$ <u>138.10</u>	\$ <u>135.71</u>
60.	MXU 520M Single Port Meter Transceiver Unit for pit installation	\$ <u>126.19</u>	\$ <u>132.74</u>
61.	MXU 520M Dual Port Meter Transceiver Unit for pit installation	\$ <u>144.05</u>	\$ <u>150.60</u>

62.	Series FL6502 Handheld Device with Communications/Charger Stand	\$ <u>9727.50</u>	
63.	Auto Read Handheld Device/Programmer Standard Model FL6502 Upgrade w/ Communications/Charger Stand	\$ <u>7295.62</u>	
64.	Auto Gun RF 4090	\$ <u>1108.97</u>	
65.	Auto Gun 90° Pit Probe Extension	\$ <u>217.49</u>	

66.	1.5" Companion Brass Meter Flange & Gaskets*	\$ <u>43.35</u>	
67.	2" Companion Brass Meter Flange & Gaskets*	\$ <u>56.60</u>	
68.	4" Companion Brass Meter Flange & Gaskets*	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	
69.	6" Companion Brass Meter Flange & Gaskets*	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	

*Includes nut and bolt; (2) needed for each meter

BELOW ITEMS FOR USE WITH OMNI METERS:

70.	1.5" Companion Cast Iron Meter Flange & Gaskets**	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
71.	2" Companion Cast Iron Meter Flange & Gaskets**	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
72.	4" Companion Cast Iron Meter Flange & Gaskets**	\$ <u>52.07</u>
73.	6" Companion Cast Iron Meter Flange & Gaskets**	\$ <u>35.33</u>
74.	8" Companion Cast Iron Meter Flange & Gaskets**	\$ <u>64.00</u>

**Includes nut and bolt; (2) needed for each meter Maintenance and Repair Parts (i.e., freeze plates, gaskets, registers, etc.)

75. FlexNet CommandLink

\$ 413.02

76. 20 % discount off current 2016-2017 catalog list pricing (include copy of current catalog pricing sheet)

048	5390712039006	TR/PL Sensor Locking Plug	\$	6.62	
049	5390735239803	TR/PL Sensor with 6' Wire	\$	16.75	
050	5390735239805	TR/PL Sensor with 20' Wire	\$	16.75	

MXU

053	5395406039002	Bracket	\$	9.32	
054B	5395424400005	MXU Battery 505C "C" Cell Battery	\$	39.12	
056	5381400000006	Crimping Tool	\$	110.17	
084	5396114400008	M520 Battery, Radio or FlexNet	\$	20.42	
085A	5396100639004	Model 520R Pit Lid Housing	\$	14.25	
085B	5396034600004	Model 520M Pit Lid Housing	\$	28.90	
085C	5396115239001	Model 520R/520M TR/PL Adaptor (available in quantities of 10)	\$	0.68	
085D	5396105439003	Model 520R/520M Boot	\$	5.13	
085E	5396112039004	Model 520R/520M Pit Locking Nut	\$	6.27	0%
085F	5396112039002	Model 520R/520M Boot Locking Clip	\$	2.84	
085G	5396006255003	Model 520M Insulated Isolation Sleeve	\$	2.13	
085H	0001000101268	Gel Cap Splicing Butt Connector	\$	0.33	
085M	5396355500054	Model 520M Housing Assembly Complete	\$	40.98	
085R	5396155500002	Model 520R Housing Assembly Complete	\$	27.07	
086	5396100639008	Model 520 Gel Cap Cover	\$	3.97	
090	5396135252002	TouchRead Extension Cable (With TR/PL Housing)	\$	25.08	

Cables

092	5390711400184	SmartGun Connection Cable for 5000 Series and Compatible Handheld Units	\$	590.00	0%
093	0001000111071	PRO USB to RS232 Serial Adapter	\$	131.87	

4090 AutoGun

062	5390700539007	Snap Ring	\$	16.53	
068	5390705839001	Sensor Nut	\$	18.31	
069	5390711400115	Cable for Connection to Charging Stand	\$	70.13	
071	5390711300002	AutoGun Wall Mount Charger	\$	87.22	
072	0001000140164	Auto Gun Bottom Dust Cap	\$	80.69	0%
073	53907300600004	AutoGun Sensor	\$	173.10	
074	5390706021014	Bracket	\$	72.76	
104	5390711400192	Serial AutoGun Crossover Cable	\$	64.39	

No.

023 024 025 026 027 028 029 030 031 032 034 035 036 037 038 039A 039B 039C 040 041 045 045A 046 046A 047

Reading Equipment / Programmers

070	0001003501014	Charging Stand Wall Power Cable	\$ 75.81	
075	0006100425028	AR5000 / AR5500 Battery Replacement	\$ 212.50	
076	0001000141029	External Battery Charger	\$ 491.65	
077	0001000141028	AC (US) Wall Charger for AR5000/AR5500	\$ 168.00	
078	0001000110020	Cigarette Lighter Charger for AR5000/AR5500	\$ 75.00	0%
079	0006180443055	Hand Strap	\$ 56.99	
080	0006180443056	Shoulder Strap AR5000 HH	\$ 47.61	
094	5396311300001	CommandLink Wall Charger	\$ 132.05	
095	5395434600001	Roof Mount Antenna	\$ 899.79	
097	5390753750501	Communications/Charging Stand, Master (AR500)	\$ 1,725.80	
098	5390753750601	Communications/Charging Stand, Auxiliary (AR500)	\$ 1,643.00	
099	5390733755003	GPS Receiver (AR5501 FlexNet Programming HI)	\$ 1,001.70	
100	0006100412043	Stylus with Tether	\$ 87.73	
101	5390711400187	USB Micro Client Sync Cable	\$ 182.81	
102	5390711400191	International Plug Kit for FL6500 Series HH	\$ 113.10	
103	5390711400189	Serial Cable for FL6500 Series HH	\$ 113.10	

Notes:

¹ Please order parts by part number. Use the prefix 803 along with the item number. Example: 803008, 803023, 803024

**CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY INFORMATION OF SENSUS USA INC.
DO NOT DISCLOSE TO ANY PARTY WITHOUT THE EXPRESS WRITTEN CONSENT OF SENSUS USA INC.**

No.	Description	Prefix #	Price	
			7505	
PD-303 R6 SR II Meter - Accessory Equipment				
026	Spanner Wrench		\$	31.14
027	1/4" Drive Security Socket		\$	23.57
028	Test Ring for Standard Register		\$	2.63
029	Thread Protectors - 5/8" - 1"		\$	0.14
030	Sealing Tool		\$	214.87
031	Sealing Tool Die		\$	53.70
033	Seal Wire 24" Length		\$	0.46
034	Lead Seal		\$	0.30
035	Seal Wire 1000 ft Spool, not shown		\$	128.93
036	SR II Bonnet Wrench		\$	9.62

No.	Description	Prefix #	Price			
			Size	5/8"	3/4"	1"
				0805	0806	0808
PD-753 R6 SR Meter Parts - 5/8" through 1"						
001A	Register Cover - Brass ⁷		\$ 7.59	\$ 7.58	\$ 7.58	
002	Register Cover Hinge Pin		\$ 0.70	\$ 0.70	\$ 0.70	
003	Sealed Register (DR) ^{4, 8}		\$ 36.82	\$ 36.82	\$ 36.82	
004	Register Gasket		\$ 0.79	\$ 0.79	\$ 0.79	
009	Register Retainer		\$ 3.56	\$ 3.56	\$ 3.56	
010	Strainer		\$ 4.69	\$ 5.88	\$ 8.24	
011	Measuring Chamber Gasket		\$ 1.52	\$ 1.86	\$ 2.63	
012A	Measuring Chamber Complete - Rocksyn		\$ 33.59	\$ 61.03	\$ 89.20	
019	Full Liner for Cast Iron Bottom Plate (Bronze also available)		\$ 1.86	\$ 3.22	\$ 4.34	
020A	Bronze Bottom Plate Gasket (5/8" Size Only)		\$ 1.86	\$ 3.22	\$ 4.34	
021	Plastic Bottom Plate Gasket (5/8" Size Only)		\$ 1.86	N/A	N/A	
022A	Bronze Bottom Plate		\$ 34.41	\$ 51.57	\$ 85.97	
022B	Cast Iron Bottom Plate		\$ 9.62	\$ 12.96	\$ 19.11	
022C	Plastic Bottom Plate (5/8" Size Only)		\$ 9.62	N/A	N/A	
023	Stainless Steel Cap Screw Washer ⁹		\$ 0.46	\$ 0.53	\$ 0.53	
024A	Stainless Steel Cap Screw ¹⁰		\$ 1.39	\$ 2.62	\$ 2.62	
024B	Stainless Steel Cap Screw Drilled for Seal Wire ¹⁰		\$ 1.63	\$ 2.93	\$ 2.93	
025A	Bronze Cap Screw ¹⁰		\$ 1.86	\$ 2.93	\$ 2.93	
025B	Bronze Cap Screw, Drilled for Seal Wire		\$ 2.22	\$ 3.14	\$ 3.14	
013	Measuring Chamber O-ring		\$ 1.70	\$ 2.62	\$ 2.62	
015	Division Plate		\$ 5.38	\$ 8.09	\$ 10.72	
017	Piston Roller		\$ 2.07	\$ 2.07	\$ 2.07	

No.	Description	Prefix #	Price		
			Size	1-1/2"	2"
				0810	0812
PD-753 R6 SR Meter Parts - 1 1/2" through 2"					
001	Register Cover - Brass		\$ 7.59	\$ 7.59	
002	Register Cover Hinge Pin		\$ 0.70	\$ 0.70	

023A	Bottom Plate - Cast Iron	\$ 7.58	\$ 9.62	\$ 13.98
023B	Bottom Plate - Plastic	\$ 7.58	N/A	N/A
023C	Bottom Plate - Bronze	\$ 17.17	\$ 25.79	\$ 42.94
024A	Maincase Cap Screw - Stainless	\$ 1.39	\$ 2.62	\$ 2.62
024B	Maincase Cap Screw - Stainless, Drilled	\$ 1.63	\$ 2.93	\$ 2.93

003	Sealed Register (DR) ^{4, 6}	\$	36.82	\$	36.82	
004	Register Gasket	\$	0.79	\$	0.79	
005	Register Retainer	\$	3.56	\$	3.56	
006A	Maincase Cap Screw Stainless Steel ¹⁰	\$	2.62	\$	2.62	
006B	6A Drilled for Seal Wire ¹⁰	\$	2.93	\$	2.93	
006C	Maincase Cap Screw Bronze ¹⁰	\$	2.93	\$	2.93	0%
006D	6C Drilled for Seal Wire ¹⁰	\$	31.39	\$	31.39	
008	Main Flange Gasket	\$	6.40	\$	7.59	
009A	Measuring Chamber Complete - Rocksyn	\$	308.05	\$	345.04	
011	Division Plate	\$	12.96	\$	17.17	
013	Piston Roller	\$	9.71	\$	11.82	
015	Measuring Chamber Gasket	\$	3.76	\$	4.86	
016A	Strainer - Plastic	\$	13.89	\$	21.54	
016B	Strainer - Stainless Steel	\$	29.87	\$	28.38	

Prefix # **845**

PD-753 R6 SR Meter - Accessory Equipment

026	Spanner Wrench	\$	32.08			0%
-----	----------------	----	-------	--	--	----

Notes:

¹ Bronze lids must be used with bronze bonnets and plastic lids with plastic bonnets.

² Requires a 1/4" drive tool (order separately) for use.

³ Can be used only with plastic register bonnet.

⁴ Specify registration by letter designation:

- A. US Gallon
- B. Cubic Feet
- C. Cubic Meters
- D. Other (specify)

⁵ Specify spud size by letter designation:

- A. 5/8"
- B. 5/8" x 3/4"
- C. 3/4"
- D. 1"

⁶ For 3/4" maincase specify 9" or 7-1/2" laying length; 7-1/2" length available only with 3/4" spud

⁷ Plastic lid discontinued March 31, 2008

⁸ Specify register diameter (2-7/8" or 3-3/8") when ordering this part.

⁹ Not required with washerhead screw.

¹⁰ Washerhead Screw.

¹¹ Please specify the register identification number printed below the odometer. (Example: 3/4" T-01)

¹² Please order parts by part number. Use the prefix at the top of the column (size) along with the item number. Example: 7505001A, to order 5/8" Bronze Register Lid

¹³ Configurator is required when ordering Register (ICE/Electronic Register). See the Electronic Register Configurator located in the distributor portal.

OMNI C² Meter Parts
OMNI C2 Product Documents

LIST PRICE

No.	Description	Price															
		Size	1 1/2"	2"	3"	4"	6"	8"	10"								
		Prefix #	C1	C2	C3	C4	C6	C8	C10								
OMNI-404 C² Meter Parts - 1 1/2" - 10"																	
001	C ² Bonnet Lid	\$	10.79	\$	10.79	\$	10.79	\$	10.79	\$	10.79	\$	10.79	\$	10.79	\$	10.79
002	Hinge Pin	\$	3.67	\$	3.67	\$	3.67	\$	3.67	\$	3.67	\$	3.67	\$	3.67	\$	3.67
003	Bonnet	\$	17.25	\$	17.25	\$	17.25	\$	17.25	\$	17.25	\$	17.25	\$	17.25	\$	17.25
004	Bonnet Seal Screw	\$	1.60	\$	1.60	\$	1.60	\$	1.60	\$	1.60	\$	1.60	\$	1.60	\$	1.60
005A	Register Probe O-Ring	\$	0.56	\$	0.56	\$	0.56	\$	0.56	\$	0.56	\$	0.56	\$	0.56	\$	0.56
005B	Register w/ AMR and Pulse Wire ¹	\$	347.38	\$	347.38	\$	347.38	\$	347.38	\$	347.38	\$	347.38	\$	347.38	\$	347.38
005C	Register w/ ERT Cable and Pulse Wire ¹	\$	383.43	\$	383.43	\$	383.43	\$	383.43	\$	383.43	\$	383.43	\$	383.43	\$	383.43
005D	Register w/ AMR and Pulse - Reclaimed ¹	\$	360.86	\$	360.86	\$	360.86	\$	360.86	\$	360.86	\$	360.86	\$	360.86	\$	360.86
005E	Register w/ ERT Cable and Pulse - Reclaimed ¹	\$	396.80	\$	396.80	\$	396.80	\$	396.80	\$	396.80	\$	396.80	\$	396.80	\$	396.80
006	Locking Ring Screw	\$	1.49	\$	1.49	\$	1.49	\$	1.49	\$	1.49	\$	1.49	\$	1.49	\$	1.49
007	Locking Ring	\$	18.98	\$	18.98	\$	18.98	\$	18.98	\$	18.98	\$	18.98	\$	18.98	\$	18.98
008	Fixing Ring	\$	10.35	\$	10.35	\$	10.35	\$	10.35	\$	10.35	\$	10.35	\$	10.35	\$	10.35
009A	Chamber Cover Bolt Stainless Steel	\$	4.59	\$	4.59	\$	4.59	\$	13.08	\$	15.32	\$	15.32	\$	15.32	\$	15.32
009B	Chamber Cover Bolt 316 Stainless Steel	\$	7.47	\$	7.47	\$	7.47	\$	7.47	\$	17.01	\$	19.82	\$	19.82	\$	19.82
010A	Chamber Cover Bolt Washer Stainless Steel	\$	2.08	\$	2.08	\$	2.08	\$	2.08	\$	5.58	\$	5.58	\$	5.58	\$	5.58
010B	Chamber Cover Bolt Washer 316 Stainless Steel	\$	3.18	\$	3.18	\$	3.18	\$	3.18	\$	12.80	\$	12.80	\$	12.80	\$	12.80
011A	Chamber Cover	\$	231.13	\$	231.13	\$	351.63	\$	351.63	\$	438.75	\$	462.21	\$	462.21	\$	462.21
011B	Screw, Spring Hold Down	\$	1.85	\$	1.85	\$	1.65	\$	1.65	\$	1.85	\$	1.85	\$	1.85	\$	1.85
011C	Spring	\$	9.00	\$	9.00	\$	9.00	\$	9.00	\$	9.00	\$	9.00	\$	9.00	\$	9.00
012	Chamber Cover O-Ring	\$	9.34	\$	9.34	\$	11.12	\$	11.12	\$	12.53		N/A				
012	Chamber Cover Gasket				N/A							\$	12.77		\$	12.77	
013	Measuring Insert w/ Brg. and Thrust Assy	\$	104.39	\$	104.39	\$	198.50	\$	198.50	\$	289.04		N/A				
013	Measuring Insert w/ Rear Bearing Shaft				N/A							\$	659.34		\$	677.93	
014	Measuring Chamber Screw	\$	1.91	\$	1.91	\$	1.91	\$	1.91	\$	1.91	\$	1.91	\$	1.91	\$	1.91
015	Chamber Seal Gasket	\$	8.84	\$	8.84	\$	10.21	\$	10.21	\$	13.00	\$	13.00		N/A		
016	C ² Rotor and Shaft Assembly	\$	582.43	\$	582.43	\$	913.96	\$	812.25	\$	1,147.98		N/A				
016	C ² Rotor and Bearing Assembly				N/A							\$	1,194.92		\$	1,194.92	
017	OMNI Balance Plate w/ Brg and Thrust Assy	\$	94.01	\$	94.01	\$	173.60	\$	173.60	\$	284.41	\$	659.34	\$	677.93		
018A	Measuring Chamber Assy - TRPL / Pulse ^{2,3}	\$	1,415.26	\$	1,415.26	\$	1,950.79	\$	1,950.79	\$	2,560.27	\$	2,733.11	\$	2,733.11		
018B	Measuring Chamber Assy - ERT / Pulse ^{2,3}	\$	1,448.64	\$	1,448.64	\$	1,984.17	\$	1,984.17	\$	2,593.75	\$	2,766.49	\$	2,766.49		
018C	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink -	\$	1,427.75	\$	1,427.75	\$	1,963.28	\$	1,963.28	\$	2,461.45	\$	2,771.08	\$	2,771.08		
018D	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink -	\$	1,461.13	\$	1,461.13	\$	1,996.66	\$	1,996.66	\$	2,688.28	\$	2,804.46	\$	2,804.46		
018E	Measuring Chamber Assy - Nicorr/Pulse ^{2,3}	\$	1,448.64	\$	1,448.64	\$	1,984.17	\$	1,984.17	\$	2,593.75	\$	2,766.49	\$	2,766.49		
018F	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink -	\$	1,461.13	\$	1,461.13	\$	1,996.66	\$	1,996.66	\$	2,688.28	\$	2,804.46	\$	2,804.46		
018G	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - TRPL / Pulse ^{2,3}	\$	1,528.48	\$	1,528.48	\$	2,106.85		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		
018H	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - ERT / Pulse ^{2,3}	\$	1,564.53	\$	1,564.53	\$	2,142.91		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		
018J	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No	\$	1,541.97	\$	1,541.97	\$	2,120.34		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		
018K	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No	\$	1,578.02	\$	1,578.02	\$	2,156.40		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		
018L	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Nicorr/Pulse ^{2,3}	\$	1,564.53	\$	1,564.53	\$	2,142.91		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		
018M	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No	\$	1,578.02	\$	1,578.02	\$	2,156.40		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		
019A	Strainer Cover Cap Screw Stainless Steel	\$	4.45	\$	4.45	\$	4.45	\$	4.45	\$	4.45	\$	4.45	\$	4.45	\$	4.45
019B	Strainer Cover Cap Screw 316 Stainless Steel	\$	9.38	\$	9.38	\$	9.38	\$	9.38	\$	9.38	\$	9.38	\$	9.38	\$	9.38
020A	Strainer Cover Washer Stainless Steel	\$	2.02	\$	2.02	\$	2.02	\$	2.02	\$	2.02	\$	2.02	\$	2.02	\$	2.02
020B	Strainer Cover Washer 316 Stainless Steel	\$	4.28	\$	4.28	\$	4.28	\$	4.28	\$	4.28	\$	4.28	\$	4.28	\$	4.28
021	Strainer Cover	\$	112.37	\$	126.08	\$	137.88	\$	155.95	\$	175.07	\$	246.64	\$	286.08		
022	Strainer Cover Gasket	\$	4.03	\$	4.56	\$	8.78	\$	9.10	\$	10.53	\$	10.64	\$	11.04		
023	Strainer Screen	\$	55.60	\$	59.64	\$	63.61	\$	79.47	\$	83.53	\$	86.77	\$	132.92		
024	Test Plug - Stainless Steel	\$	23.71	\$	28.74	\$	43.11	\$	43.11	\$	43.11	\$	43.11	\$	43.11		
025	C ² Maincase - Only	\$	373.84	\$	509.08	\$	730.94	\$	1,803.96	\$	3,585.04	\$	2,753.60	\$	3,831.81		
026	Drain Plug								N/A								
027	Strainer Body				N/A							\$	1,440.39	\$	3,082.30		
028	Test Port Cover	\$	21.89	\$	21.89	\$	21.89	\$	33.96	\$	33.96	\$	45.42	\$	45.42		
029	Test Port Adapter	\$	32.40	\$	32.40	\$	32.40	\$	45.39	\$	44.21	\$	54.91	\$	54.91		
030	Test Port Cap Screws	\$	1.42	\$	1.42	\$	1.42	\$	1.42	\$	1.42	\$	1.42	\$	1.42		
031	Test Port O-Ring	\$	0.89	\$	0.89	\$	0.89	\$	1.44	\$	1.44	\$	3.89	\$	3.89		
032	Test Port Washer	\$	1.01	\$	1.01	\$	1.01	\$	1.01	\$	1.01	\$	1.01	\$	1.01		
033	Chamber Cover Washer - Black Nylon	\$	3.64	\$	3.64	\$	3.64	\$	3.64	\$	3.64	\$	3.64	\$	3.64		
034	Strainer Screen Edge Guard	\$	2.46	\$	2.46	\$	2.46	\$	2.46	\$	2.46	\$	2.46	\$	2.46		
OMNI Meter Blank Covers																	
5731200206052	CVR CHB MEAS 1.5-2" BLNK	\$	219.10	\$	219.10		N/A										
5731400206052	CVR CHB MEAS 3-4" BLNK		N/A		N/A	\$	262.91	\$	262.91		N/A		N/A		N/A		
5731800206052	CVR CHB MEAS 6" BLNK		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A	\$	438.22		N/A		N/A		
5731900206052	CVR CHB MEAS 8"-10" BLNK		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A	\$	463.14	\$	463.14		

Notes:

¹ Replacement register part orders require meter serial number for original meter calibration.

² **OMNI ReNew Replacement Chamber Program:** OMNI ReNew replacement chambers are new OMNI measuring chambers that have been accuracy tested to the appropriate AWWA standard, with the chamber seal o-ring included and ready for installation into your main case (NO old chamber return is necessary with the OMNI ReNew Program). Simply identify the type and size chamber that you require by type (T², C² or F²) which is displayed on the register lid and size displayed on side of OMNI meter. T² and C² chambers are interchangeable for like sizes. F² chambers must only be used in F² main cases due to the UL/IFM and Fire Protection liabilities.

³ Badger Recordal® Turbo Series: OMNI ReNew replacement chambers will retrofit Badger Turbos of like sizes (latest series only).

⁴ Please order parts by part number. Use the prefix at the top of the column (size) along with the item number. Example: C1001 is a 1-1/2" C2 bonnet lid, C3021 is a

⁵ For information on the OMNI Communicator with UniPro Software, refer to the Water Price Book & AMR/AMI Pricing.

OMNI T² Meter Parts
OMNI T² Product Documents

LIST PRICE

No.	Description	Price							
		Size	1 1/2"	2"	3"	4"	5"	8"	10"
		Prefix #	T1	T2	T3	T4	T6	T8	T10
OMNI-204 T² Meter Parts - 1 1/2" - 10"									
001	T ² Bonnet Lid		\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79
002	Hinge Pin		\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67
003	Bonnet		\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25
004	Bonnet Seal Screw		\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60
005A	Register Probe O-Ring		\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56
005B	Register w/ AMR and Pulse Wire ¹		\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38
005C	Register w/ ERT Cable and Pulse Wire ¹		\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43
005D	Register w/ AMR and Pulse - Reclaimed ¹		\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86
005E	Register w/ ERT Cable and Pulse - Reclaimed ¹		\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80
006	Locking Ring Screw		\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49
007	Locking Ring		\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98
008	Fixing Ring		\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35
009A	Chamber Cover Bolt Stainless Steel		\$ 4.59	\$ 4.59	\$ 4.59	\$ 4.59	\$ 13.08	\$ 15.32	\$ 15.32
009B	Chamber Cover Bolt 316 S. S.		\$ 7.47	\$ 7.47	\$ 7.47	\$ 7.47	\$ 17.01	\$ 19.82	\$ 19.82
010A	Chamber Cover Bolt Washer Stainless Steel		\$ 2.08	\$ 2.08	\$ 2.08	\$ 2.08	\$ 5.58	\$ 5.58	\$ 5.58
010B	Chamber Cover Bolt Washer 316 Stainless Steel		\$ 3.18	\$ 3.18	\$ 3.18	\$ 3.18	\$ 12.80	\$ 12.80	\$ 12.80
011A	Chamber Cover		\$ 231.13	\$ 231.13	\$ 351.63	\$ 351.63	\$ 438.75	\$ 482.21	\$ 482.21
011B	Screw, Spring Hold Down		\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65
011C	Spring		\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00
012	Chamber Cover O-Ring		\$ 9.34	\$ 9.34	\$ 11.12	\$ 11.12	\$ 12.53	N/A	N/A
012	Chamber Cover Gasket				N/A			\$ 12.77	\$ 12.77
013	Measuring Insert w/ Brg. and Thrust Assy		\$ 104.39	\$ 104.39	\$ 198.50	\$ 198.50	\$ 289.04	N/A	N/A
013	Measuring Insert w/ Rear Bearing Shaft				N/A			\$ 659.34	\$ 677.93
014	Measuring Chamber Screw		\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	N/A	N/A
015	Chamber Seal Gasket		\$ 8.84	\$ 8.84	\$ 10.21	\$ 10.21	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	N/A
016	T ² Rotor and Shaft Assembly		\$ 582.43	\$ 582.43	\$ 913.97	\$ 913.97	\$ 1,147.98	N/A	N/A
016	T2 Rotor and Bearing Assembly				N/A			\$ 1,194.92	\$ 1,194.92
017	OMNI Balance Plate w/ Brg and Thrust Assy		\$ 94.01	\$ 94.01	\$ 173.60	\$ 173.60	\$ 264.41	\$ 659.34	\$ 677.93
018A	Measuring Chamber Assy - TRPL / Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 817.60	\$ 817.60	\$ 914.55	\$ 914.55	\$ 1,732.39	\$ 2,241.38	\$ 2,241.38
018B	Measuring Chamber Assy - ERT / Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 850.98	\$ 850.98	\$ 947.93	\$ 947.93	\$ 1,765.77	\$ 2,274.76	\$ 2,274.76
018C	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink - TRPL/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 855.57	\$ 855.57	\$ 952.52	\$ 952.52	\$ 1,770.36	\$ 2,279.35	\$ 2,279.35
018D	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink - ERT Cable/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 888.98	\$ 888.98	\$ 985.90	\$ 985.90	\$ 1,803.74	\$ 2,312.73	\$ 2,312.73
018E	Measuring Chamber Assy - Nicor/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 850.98	\$ 850.98	\$ 947.93	\$ 947.93	\$ 1,765.77	\$ 2,274.76	\$ 2,274.76
018F	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink-Nicor/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 888.98	\$ 888.98	\$ 985.90	\$ 985.90	\$ 1,803.74	\$ 2,312.73	\$ 2,312.73
018G	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - TRPL / Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 883.01	\$ 883.01	\$ 987.71	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
018H	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - ERT / Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 919.06	\$ 919.06	\$ 1,023.76	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
018J	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink - TRPL/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 924.02	\$ 924.02	\$ 1,028.72	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
018K	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink - ERT Cable/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 960.07	\$ 960.07	\$ 1,054.77	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
018L	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Nicor/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 919.06	\$ 919.06	\$ 1,023.76	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
018M	SS Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink-Nicor/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 960.07	\$ 960.07	\$ 1,084.77	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
019A	Strainer Cover Cap Screw Stainless Steel		\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45
019B	Strainer Cover Cap Screw 316 Stainless Steel		\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38
020A	Strainer Cover Washer Stainless Steel		\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02
020B	Strainer Cover Washer 316 Stainless Steel		\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28
021	Strainer Cover		\$ 112.37	\$ 126.08	\$ 137.88	\$ 155.95	\$ 175.07	\$ 246.08	\$ 286.08
022	Strainer Cover Gasket		\$ 4.03	\$ 4.56	\$ 6.76	\$ 9.10	\$ 10.53	\$ 10.64	\$ 10.64
023	Strainer Screen		\$ 55.60	\$ 59.64	\$ 63.61	\$ 79.47	\$ 83.53	\$ 86.77	\$ 132.92
024	Test Plug - Stainless Steel		\$ 23.71	\$ 28.74	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11
025	T ² Maincase - Only		\$ 373.84	\$ 509.08	\$ 730.94	\$ 1,803.96	\$ 3,585.04	\$ 2,753.60	\$ 3,831.81
026	Drain Plug					N/A			
027	Strainer Body				N/A			\$ 1,440.39	\$ 3,082.30
028	Test Port Cap		\$ 21.89	\$ 33.86	\$ 45.42	\$ 45.42	\$ 45.42	\$ 45.42	\$ 45.42
029	Test Port Adapter		\$ 32.40	\$ 45.39	\$ 54.91	\$ 54.91	\$ 54.91	\$ 54.91	\$ 54.91
030	Test Port Cap Screws		\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42
031	Test Port O-Ring		\$ 0.89	\$ 1.44	\$ 3.89	\$ 3.89	\$ 3.89	\$ 3.89	\$ 3.89
032	Test Port Washer		\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01
033	Chamber Cover Washer - Black Nylon		\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64
034	Strainer Screen Edge Guard		\$ 2.46	\$ 2.46	\$ 2.46	\$ 2.46	\$ 2.46	N/A	N/A
OMNI Meter Blank Covers									
5731200206052	CVR CHB MEAS 1.5-2" BLNK		\$ 219.10	\$ 219.10	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 483.14
5731400206052	CVR CHB MEAS 3-4" BLNK		N/A	N/A	\$ 262.91	\$ 262.91	N/A	N/A	N/A
5731800206052	CVR CHB MEAS 6" BLNK		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 438.22	N/A	N/A
5731900206052	CVR CHB MEAS 8" - 10" BLNK		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 463.14	\$ 463.14

Notes:

¹ Replacement register part orders require meter serial number for original meter calibration.

² OMNI ReNew Replacement Chamber Program: OMNI ReNew replacement chambers are new OMNI measuring chambers that have been accuracy tested to the appropriate AWWA standard, with the chamber seal o-ring included and ready for installation into your main case (NO old chamber return is necessary with the OMNI ReNew Program). Simply identify the type and size chamber that you require by type (T², C² or F²) which is displayed on the register lid and size displayed on side of OMNI meter. T² and C² chambers are interchangeable for like sizes. F² chambers must only be used in F² main cases due to the UL/IFM and Fire Protection liabilities.

³ Badger Recordall® Turbo Series: OMNI ReNew replacement chambers will retrofit Badger Turbos of like sizes (latest series only).

⁴ Please order parts by part number. Use the prefix at the top of the column (size) along with the item number. Example: T1001 is a 1-1/2" T2 bonnet lid. T3021 is a 3" strainer cover.

⁵ For information on the OMNI Communicator with UniPro Software, refer to the Water Price Book & AMR/AMI Pricing.

OMNI F² Meter Parts
OMNI F2 Product Documents

LIST PRICE

No.	Description	Size Prefix #	Price						Discount Applied
			4"	6"	8"	10"	1-1/2"	2"	
			F4	F6	F8	F10	F1	F2	
OMNI-604 OMNI F2 Meter Parts - 1 1/2", 2", 4" - 10"									
001	F ² Bonnet Lid		\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	\$ 10.79	
002	Hinge Pin		\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	\$ 3.67	
003	Bonnet		\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	\$ 17.25	
004	Bonnet Seal Screw		\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	\$ 1.60	
005A	Register Probe O-Ring		\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.56	
005B	Register w/ AMR and Pulse Wire ¹		\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	\$ 347.38	
005C	Register w/ ERT Cable and Pulse Wire ¹		\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	\$ 383.43	
005D	Register w/ AMR and Pulse - Reclaimed ³		\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	\$ 360.86	
005E	Register w/ ERT Cable and Pulse - Reclaimed ³		\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	\$ 396.80	
006	Locking Ring Screw		\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	\$ 1.49	
007	Locking Ring		\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	\$ 18.98	
008	Fixing Ring		\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	\$ 10.35	
009A	Chamber Cover Bolt Stainless Steel		\$ 4.59	\$ 13.08	\$ 15.32	\$ 15.32	\$ 4.59	\$ 4.59	
009B	Chamber Cover Bolt 316 Stainless Steel		\$ 7.47	\$ 17.01	\$ 19.82	\$ 19.82	\$ 7.47	\$ 7.47	
010A	Chamber Cover Washer - Black Nylon		\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	\$ 3.64	
010B	Chamber Cover Bolt Washer Stainless Steel		\$ 2.08	\$ 5.58	\$ 5.58	\$ 5.58	\$ 2.08	\$ 2.08	
010C	Chamber Cover Bolt Washer 316 Stainless Steel		\$ 3.18	\$ 12.80	\$ 12.80	\$ 12.80	\$ 3.18	\$ 3.18	
011	Chamber Cover		\$ 351.63	\$ 438.75	\$ 462.21	\$ 462.21	\$ 231.13	\$ 231.13	
011A	Screw, Spring Hold Down		\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.65	
011B	Spring		\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	
012	Chamber Cover O-Ring		\$ 11.12	\$ 12.53			\$ 9.34	\$ 9.34	
012	Chamber Cover Gasket			N/A	\$ 12.77	\$ 12.77		N/A	
013	Measuring Insert w/ Brq. and Thrust Assy		\$ 239.23	\$ 269.04			\$ 104.39	\$ 104.39	
013	Measuring Insert w/ Rear Bearing Shaft			N/A	\$ 659.34	\$ 677.93		N/A	
014	Measuring Chamber Screw		\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	
015	Chamber Seal Gasket		\$ 10.21	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	N/A	\$ 8.84	\$ 8.84	
016	F ² Rotor and Shaft Assembly		\$ 974.70	\$ 1,377.58			\$ 582.43	\$ 582.43	
016	F ² Rotor and bearing shaft			N/A	\$ 1,194.92	\$ 1,194.92		N/A	
017	OMNI Balance Plate w/ Bro and Thrust Assy		\$ 173.60	\$ 264.41	\$ 659.34	\$ 677.93	\$ 94.01	\$ 94.01	
018A	Measuring Chamber Assy - TRPL / Pulse ^{3,4}		\$ 1,704.51	\$ 2,611.37	\$ 3,245.15	\$ 3,245.15	\$ 1,415.26	\$ 1,415.26	
018B	Measuring Chamber Assy - ERT / Pulse ^{3,4}		\$ 1,737.89	\$ 2,644.75	\$ 3,278.53	\$ 3,278.53	\$ 1,448.64	\$ 1,448.64	0%
018C	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink - TRPL/Pulse ^{3,4}		\$ 1,742.46	\$ 2,649.34	\$ 3,283.12	\$ 3,283.12	\$ 1,427.75	\$ 1,427.75	
018D	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink - ERT Cable/Pulse ^{3,4}		\$ 1,775.87	\$ 2,682.72	\$ 3,316.60	\$ 3,316.60	\$ 1,461.13	\$ 1,461.13	
018E	Measuring Chamber Assy - Nicorr/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 1,737.89	\$ 2,644.75	\$ 3,278.53	\$ 3,278.53	\$ 1,448.64	\$ 1,448.64	
018F	Measuring Chamber Assy - Reclaim Water/No Drink-Nicorr/Pulse ^{2,3}		\$ 1,775.87	\$ 2,684.91	\$ 3,318.69	\$ 3,318.69	\$ 1,461.13	\$ 1,461.13	
019A	Strainer Cover Cap Screw Stainless Steel		\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45	\$ 4.45			
019B	Strainer Cover Cap Screw 316 Stainless Steel		\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38	\$ 9.38			
020A	Strainer Cover Washer Stainless Steel		\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02	\$ 2.02			
020B	Strainer Cover Washer 316 Stainless Steel		\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28	\$ 4.28			
021	Strainer Cover		\$ 329.13	\$ 710.80	\$ 805.18	\$ 1,014.78			
022	Strainer Cover Gasket		\$ 21.33	\$ 37.46	\$ 41.84	\$ 43.72			
023	Strainer Screen		\$ 368.50	\$ 789.63	\$ 788.95	\$ 795.04			
024	Drain Plug		\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11		N/A	
025	F ² Strainer Body - Only		\$ 1,956.21	\$ 3,837.19	\$ 4,034.37	\$ 4,234.26			
026	Vent Screw		\$ 3.09	\$ 3.09	\$ 3.09	\$ 3.09			
027	Vent Washer		\$ 0.58	\$ 0.58	\$ 0.58	\$ 0.58			
028	Strainer Screen Support		\$ 86.98	\$ 106.11	\$ 106.11	\$ 106.11			
029	Washer		\$ 1.67	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91	\$ 1.91			
030	Screw		\$ 0.99	\$ 1.13	\$ 1.13	\$ 1.13			
031	F ² Maincase		\$ 603.89	\$ 1,169.02	\$ 1,803.66	\$ 3,585.04	\$ 373.84	\$ 509.08	
032	Test Plug - Stainless Steel		\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11	\$ 43.11			
033	Test Port Cover		\$ 45.42	\$ 45.42	\$ 45.42	\$ 45.42			
034	Test Port Adapter		\$ 54.91	\$ 54.91	\$ 54.91	\$ 54.91			
035	Test Port and Drain Port Cap Screws		\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42	\$ 1.42			
036	Test Port O-Ring		\$ 3.89	\$ 3.89	\$ 3.89	\$ 3.89			
037	Test Port and Drain Port Washer		\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01	\$ 1.01		N/A	
038	Drain Port Plug		\$ 54.81	\$ 54.81	\$ 54.81	\$ 54.81			
039	Drain Port Cap		\$ 103.59	\$ 103.59	\$ 103.59	\$ 103.59			
040	Drain Port Adapter		\$ 110.28	\$ 110.28	\$ 110.28	\$ 110.28			
041	Drain Port O-Ring		\$ 5.32	\$ 5.32	\$ 5.31	\$ 5.31			
042	Strainer Screen Edge Guard		\$ 2.48	\$ 2.48				N/A	
OMNI Meter Blank Covers									
5731200208052	CVR CHB MEAS 1.5-2" BLNK		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 219.09	\$ 219.09	
5731400208052	CVR CHB MEAS 4" BLNK		\$ 262.91	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%
5731800208052	CVR CHB MEAS 6" BLNK		N/A	\$ 438.22	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
5731900208052	CVR CHB MEAS 8" - 10" BLNK		N/A	N/A	\$ 463.14	\$ 463.14	N/A	N/A	

Notes:

- Replacement register part orders require meter serial number for original meter calibration.
- OMNI ReNew Replacement Chamber Program: OMNI ReNew replacement chambers are new OMNI measuring chambers that have been accuracy tested to the appropriate AWWA standard, with the chamber seal o-ring included and ready for installation into your main case (NO old chamber return is necessary with the OMNI ReNew Program). Simply identify the type and size chamber that you require by type (T², C² or F²) which is displayed on the register lid and size displayed on side of OMNI meter. T² and C² chambers are interchangeable for like sizes, F² chambers must only be used in F² main cases due to the ULFM and Fire Protection liabilities.
- Badger Recordal® Turbo Series: OMNI ReNew replacement chambers will retrofit Badger Turbos of like sizes (latest series only).
- Please order parts by part number. Use the prefix at the top of the column (size) along with the item number. Example: T1001 is a 1-1/2" T2 bonnet lid, T3021 is a 3" strainer cover.
- For information on the OMNI Communicator with UniPro Software, refer to the Water Price Book & AMR/AMI Pricing.