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Office of the Town Clerk
Diane M. Wilhelm
Registrar of Vital Statistics Records Management Officer Marriage Officer
TO: Supervisor Walter, Councilpersons Dunleavy, Wooten, Giglio, Hubbard,

Engineering, Sanitation, Town Attorney

FROM: Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk
DATE: July 28, 2017
RE: Open Bid Report for Residential Solid Waste Collection and Disposal Services

6 bids were received and opened on July 28, 2017 at 11:00am:

Too many items to list, see attached.
*All bids had bid bonds enclosed.

Colucci Carting, LLC

50 Miller Place Yaphank Rd
Middle Island, NY 11953
631 509-0427

European-American Waste Disposal Corp.

1800 Roland Avenue
Wantagh NY 11793
631 654-3026

Maggio Environmental Services, LLC
88 Old Dock Road

Yaphank NY 11980

631 696-6300

National Waste Services, LLC
1863 Harrison Avenue

Bay Shore NY 11706

631 242-0300

Quick-Way Sanitation
1770 Feuereisen Avenue
Ronkonkoma NY 11779
631 928-4242

Winter Bros. Waste System
120 Nancy Street

West Babylon NY 11704
516 937-0900
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BASE BID FORM FOR CBA A

BIDDER'S NAME: /J _g/f/ owzl. 44,4 Lo M /1285 Lé/c

YEAR | #of ANNUAL PRICE PER UNIT (IN WORDS) ANNUAL PRICE PER AMOUNT BID (IN
EQUALIZED UNIT (NUMBERS) NUMBERS) (2)
UNITS (1)
2018 1,738.00 FOR:
DOLLARS

CENTS

Thvee hundrd. FPive.| 395 |00 4 Ul—S’é 20

2019 1,738.00 FOR:
DOLLARS cmg 382 o0 '9; 1) / b 00
2020 1,738.00 FOR:
%L{;%L//) und wd Y \{i—uJ 'QI\C/?QE 338 |00 K% 52, Y DO

FOR

2021 1.738.00
Theoe hunded ok £10 | 245" 100 1597610 00

o %Kthun&HJ&Lﬂ%% 542/ OO Zo//,?é[pOO

TOTAL 5 YEAR BID|$ ALfO

TOTAL 5 YEAR BID MUST BE WRITTEN IN WORDS:

Two Milli s mmhwdwaL_f%rﬁ‘%ouSwwL Six )"Wé{-(d—’u;lu:@ SK 22

DOLLARS CENTS

In case of discrepancy between the amount shown in figures and the amount shown in words, the amount shown in words will govern, and will be used as the unit price to
determine correct extensions of the amount bid. As necessary, the total five year bid will be corrected in accordance with the foregoing.

If no bid is submitted for this CBA, initial here:

NOTES:

(I)  The Town acknowledges the number of equalized units may vary each year
(21 Amount Bid = Annual Puce Per Unit x # of Equalized Units.

8



BASE BID FORM FOR CBA B

BIDDER'S NAME: ,(_/4,/701/;4/(_‘ A/dj% M/ﬂ& LZC

YEAR #OF ANNUAL PRICE PER UNIT (IN WORDS) ANNUALPRICE PER AMOUNT BID (IN
EQUALIZED UNIT (NUMBERS) NUMBERS) (2)
UNITS (1) :
2018 1,946.00 FOR:
) DOLLARS

309 00 |bol31400
2019 1,946.00 FOR: JL h'jndeg n/ ‘ ;
o0 Aupdiod Pileer. (815~ 0D /2990 d0

2020 1,946.00 OR,
%ﬂ@a/;mdfd téum@ o 32 PO |4 blds 00

T WMSM 7 |Ob |2l 8400

2022 1,946.00 Fc;rOLﬁ{gL /)va// ” d% n/(,lb’ qgu / B8 L/ L0 b’/%q 00

CENTS

e

TOTALSYEARBID[SZ | & A5 i
i 7

W{j Frve %OUW-)[OU'@ hurdved.

CENTS et S b0 go

In case of discrepancy between the amount shown in figures and the amount shown in words, the amount shown in words will govem, and will be used as dllejmit price to M
determine correct extensions of the amount bid. As necessary, the total five year bid will be corrected in accordance with the foregoing. Vo
If no bid is submitted for this CBA, initial here:

NOTES:
(1) The Town acknowledges the number of equalized units may vary each year.
(2) Amount Bid = Annual Price Per Unit x # of Equalized Units.

TOTAL 5 YEAR BID MUST BE WRITTEN IN WORDS:

%r.%&, ps il s 6 v hundrzd.

DOLLA



BASE BID FORM FOR CBA C

BIDDER'S NAME: A/ %ﬁy@(, Loagde ib)/u/&as

lce

YEAR #OF ANNUAL PRICE PER UNIT (IN WORDS) ANNUAL PRICE PER AMOUNT BID (IN
EQUALIZED UNIT (NUMBERS) NUMBERS) (2)
UNITS (1)
2018 1,330.50 FOR:
poLLRs 29 00 51 04};!% 00
N — Yh/ze Dunbed S WU #Ine)
s B8le 00 573,050
s (e huandteL Eighty Six
Yhiee hurdwd ninety Wit B9800 523,053 00
2021 1,330.50 FOR
{:@Lﬁg h(‘mﬂl\/\l&L CENTS 400 D D ~93'Q’.4M ﬂD
2022 1,330.50 FOR: L
%}g&nﬁmdﬁzd ﬂz_/gﬁtm Ao8 DD 4[3‘/)4/2 00
TOTAL 5 YEAR BID &’(. I/[ lﬂr} 2/
] 15

TOTALS YEAR BID MUST BE WRITTEN IN WORDS:

Two netllease S1Xohundwd S 1yoleesx

DOLLARS

In case of discrepancy between the amount shown in figures and the amount shown in words, the amount shown in words will govern,

determine correct extensions of the amount bid. As necessary, the total five year bid will be corrected in accordance with the foregoing.

CENTS

If no bid is submitted for this CBA, initial here:

NOTES:

(1) The Town acknowledges the number of equalized units may vary each year.
(2)  Amount Bid = Annual Price Per Unit x # of Equalized Units,

and will be used as the unit price to

00

-—"

H,OW XWL;L///W/LAFW@ )%



BIDDER'S NAME: MMJM 7 Z h

BASE BID FORM FOR CBA D

asie Qowiess Lo

TOTAL 5 YEAR BID MUST BE WRITTEN IN WORDS:

Tewo yullhou. Semew hrndred.

DOLLARS

CENTS

YEAR #OF ANNUAL PRICE PER UNIT (IN WORDS) ANNUAL PRICE PER AMOUNT BID (IN
EQUALIZED UNIT (NUMBERS) NUMBERS) (2)
UNITS (1)
2018 1,443.50 FOR:
s Bloo 100 519,840|00
2019 1,443.50 ’Z)}, 141 "hu,EIM/ 3 )H_\lj
Thage hundied SidqSover 3lo3 |00 529,945 00
2020 1,443.50 OR: ‘ :
%ﬁxhuﬁd (ed gpwq‘lcﬁu (BZY¢ PO 1540051400
2021 1,443.50 FOR X )
WAsga Nunde g orlituoma 8100 557 1Y) 60
2022 1,443.50 pnp.
Yaser hundved oy ghtyes | 388 OO /ﬁoog;%z 00
TOTAL 5 YEAR BID y'q.ooi Q(S )

Yousard Jewn hurdied oIty 2,

In case of discrepancy between the amount shown in flgures and the amount shown in words, the amount shown in words will govern, and will be used as the unit price to
determine correct extensions of the amount bid. As necessary, the total five year bid will be corrected in accordance with the foregoing.
If no bid is submitted for this CBA, initial here:

NOTES:

(1) The Town acknowledges the number of equalized units may vary each year.
(2) Amount Bid = Annual Price Per Unit x # of Equalized Units.



BASE BID FORM FOR CBA E

BIDDER'S NAME: /\./MOMQ/Z— L{J&S% \S/b\/)/w LLL

TOTAL 5 YEAR BID MUST BE WRITTEN IN WORDS:

DOLLARS

& misllegu e hurdied S)ity Sevesc

YEAR #OF ANNUAL PRICE PER UNIT (IN WORDS) ANNUAL PRICE PER AMOUNT BID (IN
EQUALIZED UNIT (NUMBERS) NUMBERS) (2)
UNITS (1)
2018 2,346.00 FOR: 7
25 |0 ol S| 60
Two hurdved Q/Q/r)ufauf
2019 2,346.00 ‘
g /757X [’)und*\/ﬂrf WU - 290 100 é@@‘/ 0100
2020 2,346.00
’@gﬁblmdﬂ Ninety —gwe&s 295~ 00 b9 M) 00
2021 2,346.00
YPuse. hundiodonse 30| |00 Gl 14 00
2022 2,346.00
Vhpse. hurdied 2ignb \B08 | @ (29050400
TOTALS YEARBID[S 22 LLMZQK

L/ Q *i

In case of discrepancy between the amount shown in figures and the amount shown in words, the amount shown in words will govern, and w1l
determine correct extensions of the amount bid. As necessary, the total five year bid will be corrected in accordance with the foregoing.
If no bid is submitted for this CBA, initial here: 4

NOTES:

(1) The Town acknowledges the number of equalized units may vary each year
(2) Amount Bid = Annual Price Per Unit x # of Equalized Units.

vasamé.%/ﬁ,& }?urdlﬂi

used as tté ;vml price to



BASE BID FORM FORCBAF

BIDDER'S NAME: A“/a//?()l/’ﬂ,z. [Uﬂ(&% g ey jee8 LO2

TOTAL 5 YEAR BID MUST BE WRITTEN IN WORDS:

Yoo 1mill0 2t huondted .2/8#6 m%ﬁ 4

In case of discrepancy between the amount shown in figures and the amount shown in words, the amount shown in words will govern, an

CENTS

determine correct extensions of the amount bid. As necessary, the total five year bid will be corrected in accordance with the foregoing.
If no bid is submitted for this CBA, initial here:

NOTES:

(1)  The Town aclmowledges the number or equalized units may vary each year
(2) AmountBid = Annual Price Per Unit x # of Equalized Units.

YEAR #OF ANNUAL PRICE PER UNIT (IN WORDS) ANNUAL PRICE PER AMOUNT BID (IN
EQUALIZED UNIT (NUMBERS) NUMBERS) (2)
UNITS (1)
2018 1,695.50 FOR:
307 100 §5%.599 00
R et hurd sl Yua sty Soved
2019 1,695.50 FOR: 7
\hotor hundiod Moty Wl 323 160 Koy 08
2020 1,695.50 R:
DOU‘ARSLZQ.}?LL/?d 2d ot w8340 0 526,900
2021 1,695.50 FOR
Yoo hurdiod by S22l 100 1586,%51560
2022 1,695.50 FO /
S undfatp %{Hﬂdeét{é 00 5481054 060
o TOTAL 5 YEAR BID| $ oQ) 8 8{ , SD

0

o

-

s, 5 1ve hurcha

VT 0

d'will be used as the unit price to
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