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01.18.2017  ADOPTED 
170057  

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 
 

Resolution # 57  
 

AWARDS BID FOR FERTILIZER & LAWN CHEMICALS 
 

Councilwoman Giglio  offered the following resolution, 

which was seconded by  Councilman Hubbard 
 

WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a notice for 
sealed bids for FERTILIZER & LAWN CHEMICALS for the Town of Riverhead and; 

 
WHEREAS, 4 bids were received and opened at 2:00 pm on OCTOBER 31, 

2016 at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, the date, time and place 
given in the Notice to Bidders. 
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the bid for FERTILIZER & LAWN 
CHEMICALS for the Town of Riverhead be and hereby is, awarded to ALL PRO 
HORTICULTURE INC.; THE GARDEN DEPOT CORP.; LONG ISLAND 
CAULIFLOWER ASSOCIATION; and SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY for prices on 
the attached pages.  
 

RESOLVED, that all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain a copy of 
this resolution from the electronic storage device and if needed, a certified copy of same 
may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk. 

 
THE VOTE 

 
Hubbard Yes No       Giglio Yes No 

    Wooten Yes No  Dunleavy ABSENT 
Walter Yes No 

 
The Resolution Was  Thereupon Duly Declared Adopted 

 
 

 
 



BID ITEMS FERTILIZER LAWN CHEMICALS 2017

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT All Pro UNIT The Garden Dept UNIT LI Cauliflower UNIT SiteOne

1 GRASS SEED 30% FINE FESCUE, 40% PENTIUM 
P. RYE, 30% GOLDRUSH, KTY BLUE # 1.58 ? 39.74 # 1.50 BAG 50# 88.50

2 RAZOR PRO-GAL 2X2.5 GAL CASE** CASE 78.00 NO BID CASE 77.00 NO BID

3 ROUNDUP – GAL – 2X2.5 GAL CASE** GAL/CS 110.00 1.67 gal(2) 178.00 CASE 96.25 CASE 159.70

4 BAYLETON 1% G-11.25 LB BAG 25#BAG 39.25 NO BID BAG 39.75 BAG 51.50

5 PELLETIZED LIME 40 LB BAG 4.60 BAG 4.14 50# 4.45 BAG 4.55

6 PEAT MOSS 3.8 CU FT. BALE BALE 11.95 BALE 10.24 BALE 10.50 BALE 11.75

7 SCOTTS 19-0-7 26% SCU .9% PENDIMETHALIN 
CRABGRASS CONTROL 46 LB BAG ** 50#BAG 17.20 No Bid 50# 17.25 19.75

8 SCOTTS 18-0-9 29% SCU WEED & FEED 48 LB 
BAG ** BAG 19.50 No Bid 40# 17.40 BAG 14.75

9 ANDERSONS 15-0-5 W/ 2% MERIT 50# bag BAG 29.00  50#BAG 23.75 BAG 32.75

10 24-0-11 40% PSCU 50 LB BAG BAG 15.40 No Bid 50# 15.50 BAG 18.65

11 4-2-3 BIOBASIC ORGANIC 50 LB BAG NO BID No Bid NO BID BAG 13.75

12 ROOTS 15-3-8 ORGANIC 50 LB BAG BAG 45.00 No Bid 50# 41.75 BAG 48.75

13 STARTER 10-20-10 50 LB BAG BAG 20.00 No Bid BAG 15.50 BAG 18.65

14 ACCLAIM EXTRA 2.5 GAL CONTAINER ** BAG 550.00 1 GAL 587.00 GAL 525.00 1385.60

15 WATER SOLUBLE 20-20-20  25 LB BAG BAG 32.00 No Bid 25#BAG 31.00 BAG 41.50

16 OSMACOTE 15-9-12 5-6 MONTHS 40# BAG** BAG 65.00 No Bid NO BID BAG 69.50

17 TURFACE PRO LEAGUE SOIL CONDITIONER 
(REC. DEPT.) BAG 13.90 BAG 14.25 50#BAG 10.75 BAG 10.35

18 GUIDE LIME IN 50# BAGS (REC.) BAG 5.25 BAG 5.25 50#BAG 5.05 BAG 5.90

19 MOUND CLAY BLOCKS (304/PALLET) PALLET 548.00 No Bid PALLETT 520.00 PALLET 598.50

20 TURFACE RED MOUND CLAY (50#BAG) BAG 17.00 BAG 14.25 NO BID 10# 79.50

21 PHC TERRA SORB MED.GRADE HYDRUGEL 1# 
JAR 1# 11.50 No Bid NO BID 10# 79.50

22 PHC TERRA SORB MED.GRADE (DUPLICATE) 1# 11.50 No Bid NO BID 10# 79.50

23 TREFLAN WEED PREVENTION 25# BAGS 40# 30.00 25# 29.50 40#BAG 25.75 BAG 39.65

THE HIGHLIGHTED ITEMS LISTED ABOVE HAVE BEEN AWARDED TO THE BIDDER WHOSE NAME IS LISTED AT THE TOP OF THAT COLUMN
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