own Clerk

Diane M. Wilhelm
Registrar of Vital Statistics Records Management Officer Marriage Officer
TO: Supervisor Walter, Councilpersons Dunleavy, Wooten, Giglio, Hubbard, Sewer
District
FROM: Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk
DATE: September 29, 2017
RE: Open Bid Report for Chemicals for Sewer District

9 bids were received and opened on September 29, 2017 at 2:00pm:

See Attached

Coyne Chemical
3015 State Road
Croydon PA 19021
215 785-3000

Kuehne Company
86 N Hackensack Ave
S Kearny NJ 07032

973 589-0700

Long Island Cauliflower Assoc.

139 Marcy Avenue
Riverhead NY 11901
631 727-2212

Maxwell Turf & Supply Co., Inc.

414 Long Island Avenue
Wydanch NY 11798
631 643-8873

PVS Technologies, Inc.
10900 Harper Avenue
Detroit Ml 48213

313 571-1100

Shannon Chemical Corp
602 Jeffers Circle

Exton PA 19341

610 363-9090

Thatcher Company of NY
PO Box 27407
Salt Lake City UT 84127

E EOO O99N
10 JOI=IIIV

Triathlon Industries

87G North Industry Court
Deer Park NY 11729

631 242-6924

Twin County Swimming Pool
797 Conklin Street
Farmingdale NY 11735

631 249-1249



VENDOR NAME George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
Vv

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:
a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of

the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or

main office.
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. Address: 3015 State Road, Croydon, PA 19021(Mailing is same)

Telephone: 215-785-3000 Fax: 215-785-1585 Email: bidadministration@coynechemical.com

Primary contact: Sherry Dugan, Bid/Contract Administration Manager

b. Confirm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts

Yes or NO

c. Identify the location for pick-up of chemicals.

Coyne Chemical will be providing delivery of chemicals to the Town of Riverhead

2. Insurance:

a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products
completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of (§1,000,000.00.); and

¢. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)

3. Identify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within

the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:
GEORGE S. COYNE CHEMICAL CO. INC.
3015 State Road ,
Croydon, PA 190216987
Phone: 215-765-3000 Fax: 215-785-1585

D:\Users\TC2\AppData\Local\Microsoftt\Windows\Temporary Internet
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GEORGE S. COYNE CHEMICAL CO. INC.

VENDOR NAME George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 3015 State Road
Groydon, PA 100216997
VvV Phone: 215-785-3000 Fax: 215-785-1565
Chemical MANUFACTURER IN Stock Estimated Delivery Time
(yes or no)

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25%
SOLUTION 55 GALLON
CONTAINERS ,

Axiall/Oxy Chem Yes 5-7 Business Days ARO

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PER'Y EAR-20 DRUMS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM

$131.25/drum

Minimum 20 drums/delivery

POTASSIUM
PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND

Organic Industries/UMC | Yes

Minimum 1 pallet/del

5-7 Business Days ARO
§1.7486/1b

very (36 x 55.12=1,984 1bs net)

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS
APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES

5-7 Business Days ARO

PER YEAR - 50 BAGS PER Church & Dwight Yes $0.4559/1b

DELIVERY o

PRICED PER POUND Minimum 55 bags (one pallet)
per delivery

PPG ACCU-TAB SL

TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55

LB. CONTAINERS

QEQPYRE?\E E 5 5ELIVERIES Axiall Yes 5-7 Business Days ARO

CONTAINERS PER $133.08/pail

DELIVERY

PRICE PER PAIL

Minimum 24 pails (1 {

ballet) per delivery

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON

No Bid

HYDRATED LIME — 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications

No Bid

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION — BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —

No Bid
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VENDOR NAME Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.
1A%

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:
a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of
the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or

main office. David Zilberfarb, Director of Sales
Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc. Tel (973) 589-0700
86 North Hackensack Ave Fax (973) 589-4866
South Kearny, NJ 07032 bids@kuehnecomany.com

b. Confirm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts

@ or NO

c. Identify the location for pick-up of chemicals.

South Kearny, NJ and/or Delaware City, DE

2. Insurance:
a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products

completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)

3. ldentify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within
the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:
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VENDOR NAME Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.

\'A%

Chemical MANUFACTURER IN Stock Estimated Delivery Time
(yes or no)

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25%

SOLUTION 55 GALLON

CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES

PERY EAR-20 DRUMS PER

DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM NO BID

POTASSIUM

PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES

PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND NOBID

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY

PRICED PER POUND

NO BID
PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 25
CONTAINERS PER
DELIVERY
PRICE PER PAIL

NO BID

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES

PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON NO BID

HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications N/

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION — BULK

APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —
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VENDOR NAME Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.

VV

250 GAL PER DELIVERY
PRICE PER GALLON $8 00

Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc | Yes 3-5 days ARO

NOTE: IT IS THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE VENDOR TO MAKE CERTAIN
THIS BID DOCUMENT IS DELIVERED TO THE TOWN CLERKS OFFICE
AND CLEARLY INDICATED ON THE OUTSIDE OF THE ENVELOPE -
DISQUALIFICATION OF BID COULD RESULT IF THESE INSTRUCTIONS

ARE NOT FOLLOWED.

PLEASE PUT VENDOR NAME ON EVERY PAGE
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VENDOR NAME_Lona \sland Coulilower Bssociaon
\'A"

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:
a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of
the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or
main office.
Lona \slond Coulflounc fssodaton  ghledl-137- 3212 & (:3-137-4295
\G N\omué Qoo .

;Q\mhzaaj At ol B \ohan 2.RMJ'MJJ\{. Cs.0.- \&.%ot‘ma@ LcAssoc. Com
b. Confirm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts

Yes or - Dwdoisudor 9D w\*od_ucsr

c. I[dentify the location for pick-up of chemicals.

4G mgm% Que. Rworhead, SHEIL )

2. Insurance:

a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products
completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)

3. Identify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within
the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:
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VENDOR NAME_Long 1sland. Couli®lower Prsociedion

Vv

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25%
SOLUTION 55 GALLON
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PER Y EAR-20 DRUMS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM

POTASSIUM
PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY

PRICED PER POUND

PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 25
CONTAINERS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER PAIL

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON

HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications

QQQ%\X\OM .

Qes

(i Y’s) 35 /'/-SG) D €xly)

T -3 Dusiaedy

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION - BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —
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VENDOR NAME u V% U W \//P

\AY%

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:

a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of

the primary contact for this bid, anc;/)the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or

Maxweibaurt & Supply Co. Ine.  NONL - (02 (4
414&;9 is!grr)rg%vg " iy @5|(DQ?)U% M ﬁgH‘J? (O

—Wyandanch NY-11798 Al - Salpse Maxiuy hr{’fim/?

b(/ onfigm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts
es or NO
c. Identify the location for pick-up of chemicals.

n wmﬂwm MTGE

2. Insurance

a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products
completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)

3. ldentify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or abilit

v to enpnlu within
llllllllll I DWWy U 1 |18

vy
the tlme parameters set forth in the bid specmcatlons

D:\Users\TC2\AppData\Local\Microsoft\Windows\Temporary Internet

Files\Content.Outlook\GUOBSXON\17.BID.CHEMICALS.SEWER.DISTRICT revised per MR Superintendent
Request.docx



VENDOR NAME MOD((/JQ[ | T ¢

\'A%

M HYDROXIDE 25%
SOLUTION 55 GALLON
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PER'Y EAR-20 DRUMS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM

POTASSIUM
PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY

PRICED PER POUND

PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 25
CONTAINERS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER PAIL

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON

HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications

COvymMeuSL

Jes

|-Adass

i\O‘Jf‘f/?fvv

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION — BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —
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VENDOR NAME PVS Technologies, Inc.
v

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:

a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of
the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or
main office.

PVS Technologies, Inc.

10900 Harper Avenue, Detroit, Michigan 48213
313=571-1100 / 313-571-6765

Craig Mikkelson bids@pvschemicals.com

b. Confirm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts

Yes or @

c. Identify the location for pick-up of chemicals.

PVS Technologies, Inc. is a direct manufacturer of Liquid Ferric Chloride.

2. Insurance:

a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products
completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)

3. Identify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within
the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:
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VENDOR NAME PVS Technologies, Inc.

\'A%

Chemical

MANUFACTURER

IN Stock
(yes or no)

Estimated Delivery Time

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25%
SOLUTION 55 GALLON
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PER'Y EAR-20 DRUMS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

POTASSIUM
PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY

PRICED PER POUND

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 25
CONTAINERS PER

DELIVERY
PRICE PER PAIL

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON

$605.00 Dry Tomn

PVS Technologies,
Inc.

Yes

3 Business Days

HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION - BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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SHANNON CHEMICAL CORPORATION
P. 0. BOX 376

VENDOR NAME MALVERN, PA 19355

Vv

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:
a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of

the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or

main office. 602 Jeffers Circle, Exton, PA 19341
Shannon Chemical Corporation, P.0O. Box 376, Malvern, PA 19355

Ph- 610-363-9090 Fax- 610-524-6050

Contact: Daniel C. Flynn dcflynn@shannonchem.com

b.Co
e

firm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts

/ or NO
c. Idntify the location for pick-up of chemicals.
Exton, PA

"~ 2. Insurance:

a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products
completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.) Attached

3. Identify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within
the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:

Shannon Chemical Corporation guarantees uninterrupted supply
'0of potassium permanganate to the Town of Riverhead.
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SHANNON

CHEMICAL CORPORATION
P. 0. BOX 376 0

MALVERN, PA 19355

VENDOR NAME

\'A%

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25%
SOLUTION 55 GALLON
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PERY EAR-20 DRUMS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM no bid

POTASSIUM
PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES

PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND $1.684/

Organic
Industries

Yes

24-36 Hours ARO

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES

PER YEAR — 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY ,
PRICED PER POUND o bid

PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR — 25
CONTAINERS PER no bid
DELIVERY

PRICE PER PAIL

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES

PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON no bi

HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications no

bid

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION — BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —
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VENDOR NAME THATCHER COMPANY OF NEW YORK, INC.

\A%

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:
a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of

the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or
main office.
Thatcher Company of New York, Inc., 4135 Route 104, Williamson, NY 14589

Mailing Address: P. O. Box 27407, Salt Lake City, UT 84127-0407
Phone (315) 589-9330; Fax (315) 589-9835; csny@tchem.com; wendy.richmond@tchem.com

b. Confirm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts- chemicals.

Yes or NO

c. Identify the location for pick-up of chemicals.
40 D Cotters Lane, East Brunswick, NJ 08816

2. Insurance:
a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products

completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)  Attached to back of bid.

3. Identify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within
the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:
The material will ship directly from our supplier. They have agreed to have product available for
the town as needed.
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VENDOR NAME

THATCHER COMPANY OF NEW YORK, INC.

Vv

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25%
SOLUTION 55 GALLON
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PER Y EAR-20 DRUMS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

POTASSIUM
PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND

Manufacturer

United Mineral & Chemical
Corporation

Price
$ 1.8479

Minimum Order:
36 pails per pallet

Yes

Within 36 hours after
receipt of order.

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY

PRICED PER POUND

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR — 25
CONTAINERS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER PAIL

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION - BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —

Not Applicable

Not Applicable

Not Applicable
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VENDOR NAME Triathlon Industries, Inc. d/b/a/ Tridon Chemical
\'A%

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:

a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of
the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or
main office.

Triathlon Industries, Inc. d/b/a/ Tridon Chemical
87G North Industry Court Deer Park NY 11729

631-242-6924- Elizabeth Cattano- customerservice@tridonchemical.com

b. Confirm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts

or NO

c. ldentify the location for pick-up of chemicals.

2. Insurance:

a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products
completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)

3. Identify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within
the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:
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VENDOR NAME Triathlon Industries, Inc. d/b/a/ Tridon Chemical

\AY%

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25% OLTN vos
1. | SOLUTION 55 GALLON

CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PER Y EAR-20 DRUMS PER

5 to 7 days

DELIVERY
PRICE PER DRUM $114.27/drum
POTASSIUM United Mineral &
2. | PERMANGNATE FREE Chemical Yes 5 to 7 days
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR-25-30

PAILS/PALLET $2.23 per pound
PRICE PER POUND

3. | SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 Natural Soda Yes 5 to 7 days
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR - 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY

PRICED PER POUND §.47/4=823.50

)

4. | PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR — 25

CONTAINERS PER NO BID

DELIVERY
PRICE PER PAIL

5. | FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40% Kemira
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK Yes 3 to 5 days
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON $565.00

6. | HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking NO BID
required: see specifications

7. | SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION — BULK NO BID
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —
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VENDOR NAME TWIN-COUNTY SWIMMING POOL MAINTENANCE & SUPPLY CO., INC

CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT 2017
PROPOSAL/BID SHEET

1. Company information:

a. Name, physical address, mailing address, telephone number, fax number, the name of
the primary contact for this bid, and the e-mail address for the primary contact and/or
main office.

Karen Casmass- Office Manager email- karen@twincountypools.com
797 CONKLIN STREET FARMINGDAILE, NY 11735

PHONE 631-249-1249 FAX 631-249-1637
b. Confirm that the company is an authorized dealer/distributor of parts

@ or NO

c. ldentify the location for pick-up of chemicals.
SAmE As ANABOVE

2. Insurance:

a. Proof of Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including products
completed, contractual, property and personal injury in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence and $2,000,000.00 in the aggregate; and

b. Proof of professional liability insurance in the amount of ($1,000,000.00.); and

c. Proof of Automotive/Equipment Liability (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)
insurance in the amount of $100,000 (per occurrence)/$300,000 (total).

(Please annex proof of insurance.)

3. Identify or provide information regarding availability “in stock” or ability to supply within
the time parameters set forth in the bid specifications:
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VENDOR NAME TWIN-COUNTY SWIMMING POOL MAINTENANCE & SUPPLY CO., INC

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25%
SOLUTION 55 GALLON
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES
PERY EAR-20 DRUMS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER DRUM

NO BID

POTASSIUM
PERMANGNATE FREE
FLOWING 55 LB.
CONTAINERS

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR-25-30
PAILS/PALLET

PRICE PER POUND

NO BID

SODIUM BICARBONATE 50
LB. BAGS

APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR — 50 BAGS PER
DELIVERY

PRICED PER POUND

NO BID

PPG ACCU-TAB SL
TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55
LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR — 25
CONTAINERS PER
DELIVERY

PRICE PER

LEAN

DAI
[

|
[

PPG
INDUSTRIES
INC.

Yeo

$166.00

24-36 HOURS

FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40%
SOLUTION 4,000 BULK
DELIVERIES

APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES
PER YEAR

PRICE PER DRY TON

NO BID

HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB.
BAGS*unload and restacking
required: see specifications

NO BID

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
15% SOLUTION — BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH —

KUEHNE CHEMICAL
CO.INC.

YES
$ 2.11/PER
GALLON

24-36 HOURS
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