



Office of the Town Clerk
Diane M. Wilhelm

Registrar of Vital Statistics

Records Management Officer

Marriage Officer

TO: Supervisor Walter, Councilpersons Dunleavy, Wooten, Giglio, Hubbard, Maryann Tague

FROM: Julie O'Neill, Deputy Town Clerk

DATE: October 31, 2016

RE: Open Bid Report for 2016 Fertilizer & Lawn Chemicals

4 bids were received and opened on October 31, 2016 at 2:00pm:
Too many items to list, see attached

AllPro Horticulture Inc.
721 Main Street
Farmingdale NY 11735
631 36-0613
rickmwilhelm@yahoo.com

The Garden Dept. Corp
PO Box 711
Coram NY 11727
terri@gardendep.com

Long Island Cauliflower Assoc
139 Marcy Avenue
Riverhead NY 11901
631 727-2212
J.Bokina@licassoc.com

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Bissett Nursery
1385 E 36th Street
Cleveland OH 44114
800 321-5325
bids@siteOne.com

VENDOR NAME All Pro

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
 2 of 6 BID PROPOSAL FORM
 2015 FERTILIZER AND LAWN CHEMICAL BID

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST				
1	GRASS SEED 30% FINE FESCUE, 40% PENTIUM P. RYE, 30% GOLDRUSH, KTY BLUE	1,58	lb			
2	RAZOR PRO-GAL 2X2.5 GAL CASE**	78,00	CASE	RANGER	Pro	
3	ROUNDUP - GAL - 2X2.5 GAL CASE**	110.00	CASE			
4	BAYLETON 1% G-11.25 LB BAG	39,00	25# bag	Prophecy	.72	G
5	PELLETIZED LIME 40 LB BAG	4.60				
6	PEAT MOSS 3.8 CU FT. BALE	11.95	bale			
7	SCOTTS 19-0-7 26% SCU .9% PENDIMETHALIN CRABGRASS CONTROL 46 LB BAG **	17.20	50 # bag	18-0-3	TCS crabgrass control	
8	SCOTTS 18-0-9 29% SCU WEED & FEED 48 LB BAG **	19.50	Andersons	22-0-4	w/ Trimec W+F.	
9	ANDERSONS 15-0-5 W/ 2% MERIT 50 LB BAG **	29.00	Anderson	21-0-4	.2% merit	
10	24-0-11 40% PSCU 50 LB BAG	15.40	22-0-3	50%	PSCU	
11	4-2-3 BIOBASIC ORGANIC 50 LB BAG					
12	ROOTS 15-3-8 ORGANIC 50 LB BAG	45.00	Roots	15-0-8		
13	STARTER 10-20-10 50 LB BAG	20.00	bag			
14	ACCLAIM EXTRA 2.5 GAL CONTAINER **	550.00	/gallon			
15	WATER SOLUBLE 20-20-20 25 LB BAG	32.00	bag			
16	OSMACOTE 15-9-12 5-6 MONTHS 40 LB BAG **	65.00	18-6-12	5# bag	6-8 months	
17	TURFACE PRO LEAGUE SOIL CONDITIONER (REC. DEPT.)	13.90	/bag			
18	GUIDE LIME IN 50# BAGS (REC.)	5.25	bag			
19	MOUND CLAY BLOCKS (304/PALLET)	548,00	pallet			
20	TURFACE RED MOUND CLAY (50#BAG)	17.00	bag			
21	PHC TERRA SORB MED.GRADE HYDRUGEL 1# JAR	11.50	1#			
22	PHC TERRA SORB MED. GRADE HYDROGEL 1# JAR	11.50	1#			
23	TREFLAN WEED PREVENTION 25# BAGS	30.00	40# bag			

VENDOR NAME All Pro

****WHEN BRAND NAMES ARE MENTIONED THIS IS "OR EQUAL"*****

DISCOUNTS

If Bidder allows cash discount, it shall be as follows:

For payment within 15 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. 0 %
Discount

For payment within 30 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. 0 %
Discount

(Discount less than 1% will not be considered.)

Discounts will be considered but will not be the determining factor for bid awards.

THIS BID AWARD SHALL BE IN EFFECT FOR ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD.

VENDOR NAME The Garden Dept. Corp.

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
 BID PROPOSAL FORM
 2015 FERTILIZER AND LAWN CHEMICAL BID

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST				
1	GRASS SEED 30% FINE FESCUE, 40% PENTIUM P. RYE, 30% GOLDRUSH, KTY BLUE	39.74				
2	RAZOR PRO-GAL 2X2.5 GAL CASE**	No Bid				
3	ROUNDUP - GAL - 2X2.5 GAL CASE** 1.67 Gallon 89.00 ea	178.00				
4	BAYLETON 1% G-11.25 LB BAG	No Bid				
5	PELLETIZED LIME 40 LB BAG	4.14				
6	PEAT MOSS 3.8 CU FT. BALE	10.24				
7	SCOTTS 19-0-7 26% SCU .9% PENDIMETHALIN CRABGRASS CONTROL 46 LB BAG **	No Bid				
8	SCOTTS 18-0-9 29% SCU WEED & FEED 48 LB BAG **	No Bid				
9	ANDERSONS 15-0-5 W/ 2% MERIT 50 LB BAG **	No Bid				
10	24-0-11 40% PSCU 50 LB BAG	No Bid				
11	4-2-3 BIOBASIC ORGANIC 50 LB BAG	No Bid				
12	ROOTS 15-3-8 ORGANIC 50 LB BAG	No Bid				
13	STARTER 10-20-10 50 LB BAG	No Bid				
14	ACCLAIM EXTRA 2.5 GAL CONTAINER ** 1 Gallon	587.00				
15	WATER SOLUBLE 20-20-20 25 LB BAG	No Bid				
16	OSMACOTE 15-9-12 5-6 MONTHS 40 LB BAG **	No Bid				
17	TURFACE PRO LEAGUE SOIL CONDITIONER (REC. DEPT.)	14.25				
18	GUIDE LIME IN 50# BAGS (REC.)	5.25				
19	MOUND CLAY BLOCKS (304/PALLET)	No Bid				
20	TURFACE RED MOUND CLAY (50#BAG)	14.25				
21	PHC TERRA SORB MED.GRADE HYDRUGEL 1# JAR	No Bid				
22	PHC TERRA SORB MED. GRADE HYDROGEL 1# JAR	No Bid				
23	TREFLAN WEED PREVENTION 25# BAGS	29.50				

VENDOR NAME The Garden Dept. Corp.

****WHEN BRAND NAMES ARE MENTIONED THIS IS "OR EQUAL"*****

DISCOUNTS

If Bidder allows cash discount, it shall be as follows:

For payment within 15 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. 0 %
Discount

For payment within 30 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. 0 %
Discount

(Discount less than 1% will not be considered.)

Discounts will be considered but will not be the determining factor for bid awards.

THIS BID AWARD SHALL BE IN EFFECT FOR ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD.

VENDOR NAME Long Island Cauliflower Assoc.

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
 BID PROPOSAL FORM
 2015 FERTILIZER AND LAWN CHEMICAL BID

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST				
1	GRASS SEED 30% FINE FESCUE, 40% PENTUM P. RYE, 30% GOLDRUSH, KTY BLUE	\$1.50/lb	\$75.00	1 Bag		
2	RAZOR PRO-GAL 2X2.5 GAL CASE** <i>Credit extra</i>	\$38.50 / 2 1/2	or	\$77.00 / case		
3	ROUNDUP - GAL - 2X2.5 GAL CASE**	\$38.50 / case	\$96.25 / 2 1/2			
4	BAYLETON 1% G-11.25 LB BAG	\$39.75 / 15 LB Bag				
5	PELLETIZED LIME 40 LB BAG	\$4.45 / 50 LB Bag				
6	PEAT MOSS 3.8 CU FT. BALE	\$10.50 / 3.8 cu ft	+	Bale		
7	SCOTTS 19-0-7 26% SCU .9% PENDIMETHALIN CRABGRASS CONTROL 46 LB BAG **	20-0-4. 30% LSN .56 Pendimeth	\$17.25 / 50 LB Bag			
8	SCOTTS 18-0-9 29% SCU WEED & FEED 48 LB BAG **	20-0-7 25% metolac w/ iron	\$17.40 / 40 # Bag			
9	ANDERSONS 15-0-5 W/.2% MERIT 50 LB BAG **	\$23.75 / 50 # Bag				
10	24-0-11 40% PSCU 50 LB BAG	24-0-11 40% PSCU (50 #)	\$15.50 / Bag			
11	4-2-3 BIOBASIC ORGANIC 50 LB BAG	N/A				
12	ROOTS 15-3-8 ORGANIC 50 LB BAG <i>15-0-8</i>	\$41.75 / 50 # Bag	-	15-0-8		
13	STARTER 10-20-10 50 LB BAG	\$15.50 / Bag				
14	ACCLAIM EXTRA 2.5 GAL CONTAINER **	\$25.00 / Gal	-			
15	WATER SOLUBLE 20-20-20 25 LB BAG	\$31.00 / 25 LB Bag				
16	OSMACOTE 15-9-12 5-6 MONTHS 40 LB BAG **	N/A				
17	TURFACE PRO LEAGUE SOIL CONDITIONER (REC. DEPT.)	\$10.95 / 50 LB Bag				Give the Pro
18	GUIDE LIME IN 50# BAGS (REC.)	\$5.05 / 50 # Bag				
19	MOUND CLAY BLOCKS (304/PALLET)	\$520.00 / Pallet				
20	TURFACE RED MOUND CLAY (50#BAG)	N/A				
21	PHC TERRA SORB MED.GRADE HYDRUGEL 1# JAR	N/A				
22	PHC TERRA SORB MED. GRADE HYDROGEL 1# JAR	N/A				
23	TREFLAN WEED PREVENTION 25# BAGS	\$25.75 / 40 # Bag				

VENDOR NAME Long Island Cauliflower Assoc.

****WHEN BRAND NAMES ARE MENTIONED THIS IS "OR EQUAL"*****

DISCOUNTS

If Bidder allows cash discount, it shall be as follows:

For payment within 15 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. N/A %
Discount

For payment within 30 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. N/A %
Discount

(Discount less than 1% will not be considered.)

Discounts will be considered but will not be the determining factor for bid awards.

THIS BID AWARD SHALL BE IN EFFECT FOR ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD.

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
 BID PROPOSAL FORM
 2015 FERTILIZER AND LAWN CHEMICAL BID

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST				
1	GRASS SEED 30% FINE FESCUE, 40% PENTIUM P. RYE, 30% GOLDRUSH, KTY BLUE	\$ 50/bag \$5.50/bag	# 20-80-250			
2	RAZOR PRO-GAL 2X2.5 GAL CASE**	NO BID				
3	ROUNDUP - GAL - 2X2.5 GAL CASE**	\$ 70/case \$159.00/case	Pinnacle 1.67 gal x 2 case			
4	BAYLETON 1% G-11.25 LB BAG	\$ 51.50/bag	Bayleton 15 lb bags			
5	PELLETIZED LIME 40 LB BAG	\$ 4.55/bag				
6	PEAT MOSS 3.8 CU FT. BALE	\$ 11.75/bale				
7	SCOTTS 19-0-7 26% SCU .9% PENDIMETHALIN CRABGRASS CONTROL 46 LB BAG **	NO BID				
8	SCOTTS 18-0-9 29% SCU WEED & FEED 48 LB BAG **	\$ 19.75/bag	20-0-7 Lebanon			
9	ANDERSONS 15-0-5 W/ 2% MERIT 50 LB BAG **	\$ 32.75/bag	Lebanon			
10	24-0-11 40% PSCU 50 LB BAG	\$ 18.65/bag	24-0-5 40%			
11	4-2-3 BIOBASIC ORGANIC 50 LB BAG	\$ 3.75/bag	4-3-1 Nutrient Plus			
12	ROOTS 15-3-8 ORGANIC 50 LB BAG	\$ 48.75/bag				
13	STARTER 10-20-10 50 LB BAG	\$ 18.65/bag	18-24-12 40 lb bag			
14	ACCLAIM EXTRA 2.5 GAL CONTAINER **	\$ 1385.00/case				
15	WATER SOLUBLE 20-20-20 25 LB BAG	\$ 41.50/bag				
16	OSMACOTE 15-9-12 5-6 MONTHS 40 LB BAG **	\$ 69.50/bag	18-6-12. caliber cote			
17	TURFACE PRO LEAGUE SOIL CONDITIONER (REC. DEPT.)	\$ 10.35/bag	Turfacer All Sport 50lb.			
18	GUIDE LIME IN 50# BAGS (REC.)	\$ 5.90/bag				
19	MOUND CLAY BLOCKS (304/PALLET)	\$ 598.50/pallet	Turfacer Moundmaster blocks (photo)			
20	TURFACE RED MOUND CLAY (50#BAG)	\$ 15.25/bag	Turfacer Mound Clay 50lb.			
21	PHC TERRA SORB MED.GRADE HYDRUGEL 1# JAR	\$ 19.50/10lb	1lb no longer available			
22	PHC TERRA SORB MED. GRADE HYDROGEL 1# JAR	\$ 19.50/10lb	1lb. no longer available			
23	TREFLAN WEED PREVENTION 25# BAGS	\$ 29.65/bag	40 lb bag			

VENDOR NAME _____

****WHEN BRAND NAMES ARE MENTIONED THIS IS "OR EQUAL"*****

DISCOUNTS

If Bidder allows cash discount, it shall be as follows:

For payment within 15 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. 0 %
Discount

For payment within 30 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher. 0 %
Discount

(Discount less than 1% will not be considered.)

Discounts will be considered but will not be the determining factor for bid awards.

THIS BID AWARD SHALL BE IN EFFECT FOR ONE YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD.