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January 9, 1996 
Adopted 
TOWN OF R.IV]!;RHEAD 

Resolution # 50 
----.~--

SETS 1996 TIPPlNG FEES AT THE TRANSFER STATION 

__.,C...,.O-=UN;.;:.;C:::..::I=L=M=A=N=--=L-=U=L=L--------...-offered the following r~solutiOJ1, which was 

I 
seconded by COUNCILMAN WIT~MEIBR 

I, 

WHEREAS, the Town Code Sec. 103.51 and Sec. 103.52 of the Town of Riverhead 
pe1'tJlits the setting of fees for disposal of solid waste collected within the borders of the Town. of 
Riverhead; and · 

WI(EREAS, the East E.nd Recycling contract is adjU$ted annually in aeco11dance with lhe 
consumer price index. 

NOW; 'lliEREFORE, BE IT ·RESOLVED, that t~;, tipping tees are set as fbllows:· 

DESCRJrTION 

GARBAGE/SOLID WASTE 
DEMOLITION & WASTE WOOD 
fvlETAL 
~XEDP.AP~R 
CARDBOARD 
NEWSPRINT 
RECYCLABLES 
COMPOST/YARD WASTE 

TlPPING RAUf[ON 

$90.02 
$90.02 
$20.47 
$46.23 
$46.23 
$46.23 
$2S.OO 
$15.00 

YARD WA.STB DELIVERED BY DISTRICT HOtvfEOWNEllS S .00 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE rt.RESOLVED, that these rates per ton are effective 
January l. 1996 for all district and non-district cartel'S or haulers and there is a minimum charge of 
140.00 for ~~,per ®nth. . 

: 

TflB VOTE : 
WITT .. EIER 
ttWASNA 
LULL 
PRUSINOWSiti 
STARK 

Aye 
Aye 
Aye 
Abaent 
Aye 

Th~ resolution was thereupon d~clared 
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Adopted 
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

Resolution# 51 -..:;::;=-.:....,....:............,_. 

APPOINTS DENISE C.(YILE'ITI. ESQ., AS SPECIAL COUNSEL 

___..c .. o ...... u.;;;..;.N..;;..C""'"'IL=M=A=N~K=W::.:.:A:..:.:S=N~A~------offered the following resolutiOl\ which was . 

seconded by COUNCILMAN WITTMEIER 

RESOLVED, that Denise Civiletti, Esq., be and is hereby appointed as Special Counsel to 
represent the Town of Riverhead in Refuse & Gar~ge District lm\tters; and 

BE l'f FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Supervisor be and is hereby authorized to 
txecute a Retainer Agreement with Denise Civiletti, Esq., which agreement shaU set forth her 
inurty rate of compensation and which shall be on file with the Town Clerk; and 

BE tr 'FURTHER RltS·OL VED, that the Town Clerk be and is herebY directed to 
~rward a certified copy of this resolution to Denise Civilett~ Esq., the Sanitation Department and 
the Office of Accounting~ 

THE \UJTB 

WITTMBIER 
JCWASNA 
LOLL 
PROSl~OWSKI 
STARK 

Aye 
Aye 
Aye 
Absent 
AYB 

The cesolution vas thereupo n 
declcu:~d duly a:aopt~d . . ' 



JANUARY 8, 1996 Adopted 
AWARDS BID FOR MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

. RESOlUTION # s2 

63 

___ co_U_N_C_I_L_M_A_N_K_W_;A::.;..;S::...:N:..:.:A..::..._ ______ OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION 

WHICH WAS SECONDED BY COUNCILMAN LULL • . 

WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a NoUce· Ta Bidders 

f.or M!OICAL SUPPLIES; and 

·wHE·AEAS, bids were received opened and read aloud on the 28th day of :No.vember, 

t995, at 11 :1 0 a.m. at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, 11901, the 

date, tfme and place given Jn Notice To Bidders. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT 

RESOL VEO, that the bid for MEDICAL SUPPLIES be, and hereby 19, awarded to 

MOORE MEDICAL; G.E. PICKERING;. PECONIC FIRE EQUIPMENT; AAMST.RONQ 

fiiOtCAl..; AND MA TRX MEDICAL u indicated on the attached itemized p:aoes .. 

. RESOLVED,' that the Town $daru llerebJ dtrects the Town Clerk. to rlltJm .. any end au · 
~td bonds received In connection with the above. 

RESOlVED that the Town Cte.rk be, and hereby Is, authorized to· forward a cartlfled 

copy of this resolution to MOORE MEDICAL; G.E. PICKERING; PECONIC FIRE 

EQUIPMENT; MATRX MEDICAl; the Ambulance Corp. and Pollee Dep&rt·ment. 

~RlsoLUTIOR WAS TBBREU~ON 
ARilt) DULY ADOPTEe> .. · 

TBB VOTe: 
WlTTMBIBR 
KWASNA 
LULL 
PRUSINOWSXI 
STARk 

Aye 
Aye 
~ye 
.Absent 
Aye 
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AWARD FOR MEDlcCAL StJPl?LIES 

ITEM 
NO. 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES 
DESCRIPTION 

1 AC~D NE~RALIZE~ 
2 AIRWAYS ~ORAL -- 40 ·llOMM 
3 AIRWAYS-tllASOPHAR-EVEN SIZES 20F-36F 
4 ALCOHOL PREPS 
5 ALCOHOL P-REPS 
6 ALUMINUM -FOIL STERILE 
7 AMMONIA INHALANTS CS/10 BX 
8 AMMONIA INHALANTS, lO BX 
9 BAGs,osw ·soocc 

10 BAGS,NORMAL SALINE - 100CC 
11 BAGS,NORMAL SALINE p 250CC 
12 BAGS, NORMAL SALnlE - ~ SO·OCC 
13 BAGS,NORMAL SALINE - lOOOCC 
14 BAGS,RINGERS 1000CC 
15 BANDAGE .. NON-JIDHESlVE 
16 BANDAGE LARGE PATCH,4"X4" 
17 BANDAGE(DURA-STRIP),l"X3" 
18 BANDAGE (ELASTIC STRIP), 7 /8"X3'1 

·19 BANDAGE, -'BtJTTERFLY . 
20 BANDAGE,FINGERTIP,XL 
21 BANDAGE,FLEXICON SIZE 2"X5YD 
22 BANDAGE,FLEXICON,SIZE 3"X5YD. 

. 2 3 BANDAGE I FLEXI CON' sIZE 4 "X5 YD·. 
24 BANDAGE,KNUCKLE 
25 BANDAGE,SM STRIP 
26 BANDAGE, SPRAY·ON·, 3 OZ 
27 BANDAGE,TRIANGULAR 
28 BLANKET,WOOL BLEND 6i"X80" 
29 BLANKETS ,DlSPOSABLE YELLOW 
30 BLOOD PRESSURE COFF 
31 BURN SHEETS STERILE 
32 BVM,ADULT I DISPO-SABLE 
3 3 BVM, CHILD~ REUSABLE 
3 4 BVM I INFANT, REUSABLE 
3 5 CANNULA, ADULT NASAL 
36 CANN'OLA, PEDIAT~IC NASAL 

P!\lCES :tN .EFF,E C:T UNTl:'L' l 0/31/ ~6 

MOORE 

N·B 
$0.20 

1.13 
34.40 

25.38 

20.64 
17.04 
21.12 

1.89 
3.38 
3.94 
5.95 
5.55 
8.19 
9.63 
4.68 
1.69 

10.13 

PECONlC PICKERING AJD4STR·ONG MA'r:R.X 

39.95 

30 .. 00 

0.33 
2.90 
2~~ 40 

45.50 
7.95 

16.75 
l :.c '8 

46 .. 50 
379.00 

7fi:75 
44.00 
25 . 75 
31.00 

8.50 

7..50 

5.70 
14.10 
45..00 
15 . .' 00 
52.00 
18:. 00 

125 \ ()() 
125.00 
22.00 
60 . 00 

NO BI D 
0. 29 
2.52 
l ' .99 

3·9 
S. l 

12.2 
1.25 

$48.00 
NO BID 

- $45.6,0 
$48.(1;0 
$26 . 40 
$25.20 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

$2. 7S 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO s·Io 

"" . NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BI'O. 

$0 . l S 
$22.39 

$·4 .l-$. 
$12.06 
$4.15 

Sl4.78 
$113.4.1 
$10S.lt 
$28.00 
$51 . 0.0 

~ 

~1 



ncwARD rUk M~UlCAL BUPf'Llt:~ 

ITEM 
NO~ 

MEDICAL SUPPLLES 
DESCRIPTION MOORE - PECONIC PICKERING ARMSTRONG MATRX 

~ ~ ~ ~ 

37 CARRY-BAG,OXYGEN "Du SIZE-GREEN 
38 CARRY-BAG,STIFNBCK 
39 CARTRIDGE,REPLACEMENT V·V'AC 
40 CATHETER,IV,22G 
41 CATHETER,IV,20G 
4 2 CATHETER, !V, 18G 
4 3 CA'rHETER, IV, l ~G 
44 CAHTETER,IV,l4G 
45 CATHETER,SUCTION,lOFR 
46 CA~HETER,SUCT!ON,l4FR 
47 CATHETER,SUCT!ON,lSFR 
48 CATHET~,SUCTION,SFR 
49 CATHETER, SUCT:EON, 6FR 
50 CATHETER,SOCTION,SFR 
51 CHARCOAL 12.5GR. 1/20Z. 
52 CLAMPS,I{tLLY SIR. 5-1/2" S.S. 
53 COlS'AN 4 ... XSYDS • 
54 COB-AN 61fX5YDS. 
55 COLLAR,STIFNECK{ANY SIZE) 
56 COMBINES -STERILE 5 n. X-9 tt 

57 CREAM,ANTIBIOTIC,3 IN 1 
58 CREAM,BURN SEPTIC 
59 CREAM, FIRST AID 

_ 60 CREAM, H-YDROCORTISONE 
61 CUTTER,RING 
62 CUTTER,SEAT BELT 
63 CYLlNDER.cALUMINUM 11 D" sz. 02 
64 DR.AlN, PENROSE 
65 DRESSING,BIOCLUSIVE TRANSPARENT 8Xl0 
66 DRESSINGS,MULTI~TRAUMA 
.67 E/T ·DIS_. UNCUFF W/STYLETTE 2 .. 0 ~ 5_. 5 
68 E/T TUBE POUCH_ ROLL-UP 
69 E/T TUBES SIZE 6.5 
70 ELECTRODES,RAM 
·71 EMES!N BAsiN-DISP .. 
72 EXTENSION SETr20" BOXED 
73 EXTENSION SET,DIAL-A.:FlO 

PRiCES ! N EFFECT ONT!L 10/11/96 

56.46 

NB 

0.46 
0 .46, 
0.46 

0. 4·0 
0.46 
2 . 76 

4.18 
5 . 88 
9.81 
0.64 
5.76 
9.37 
2.40 

66.17 
NB 

19.65 
NB 
NB 

1, '8i 
NB 
NB 

14.95 

52.00 

66 . 00 
19 .00 
a. 95 

54.00 
54 . 00 
!)~' · 00 
54.00 
5~. 00 
0.62 
0.62 
0.50 
o. 58 

0. 62 _ .. 
7 . 13 
2.30 

10.25 
6-.00 

ULOO 
2.50 

69 .. 50 
2~ "' 00 
41.50 
82.25 
3 L45 

24.00 
3.90 

265.00 
0;39 

83.00 
263. 50 

NB 
21. 3 0 

6.-30 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 

5 . 30 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NS 

10 ,. 10 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 

as .oo 
3. 80 

21 .. ~0 
43.50 

NB 
t-m 
NB 
NB 

$.66 .7.2 
$19 . !tS 

$6 . ·99 
$68.00 
$68.6& 
$68 . ·6.1 

·No BIO 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID « 
NO BID 
NO BID 
-NO BIP 
NO BID 

$3.97 
$1.41 

NO BIO /' 
NO BI D 

$9.70 
$4.19 

llO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BI D: _ 

$14. 92 
NO BID 

$59.39 
NO SID 
NO BID 

$78.50 
- .J.~9 
$24.8/ 

$3.94. 
,a ·~ 20 
$0, t f 

NO BID­
NO BID 

~ 



\0 
1.0 

IT·EM 
NO . 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES 
DESCRIPTION 

7 4 EYE SHIELD/FACE MASK COMBO 
7 5 EYE WASB PROTECTOR 
76 EYE WASH ,STERILE,40Z 
77 'EYE/SKIN BUFFERED, 80Z 
78 FERNO HEAD IMMOBILIZER 
7 9 FERNO K. E. D . 
8'0 FERNO 'l'RAC ADULT 
81 FERNO TRAC CHILD 
82 FORCEPSI MAGILL, CHILD 
83 ~ORCEPS,MAGILL,ADULT 
8 4 GLASSES, B'AAR!ER PROTECT'IVE - .. . " 

85 GLOVES, •'HIGH -RISK'• -LATEX 
86 GLOVES,LATEX 
87 GLOVES, VINYL -- (50/PR~ 
8 8 GLUCOSE t INST:A 
89 GOGGLES,DISPOSABLE 
90 HUMIDIFIER,AIRLIFE -PREFILLED 
91 tf(JMIDIFlERS t~BUBBL.e BOTT!tES} 
92 INSECT STING RELIEF 
9 3 INSTA HEAT (SMALL) 
94 ISOLATION KIT (GOGGLES,GQWN,GLOVES,~SKS 
95 g .. y JELLY 4 OZ. TUBE 
96 KIT,BLOOD PRESSURE 
97 KlT,EGTA 
9 8 ~IT I FIRST AID,. LARGE - . . 
99 KIT,FIRST AID,SMALL 

100 KIT, v~VAC STARTER 
101 KITS,O , B. 
102 LONG BOARD NO PINS W/RAI:LS 
103 MASK,LAERDAL -ADULT SILICONE 
104 MASK, LAERDAL CHILD SILICONE 

,,105 MASK,~ERDAL INFANT S,ILICONE 
10 6 MASK, LAERDAL POCKET 
107 MASK, NON-BREATHER 
108 MASK,PED. NON-REBREATRER 
109 MASK/sHIELD, COM'BO . -
110 MED-ADENOCARD 6MG/2ML 

PRICES lN EFFSCT UNT!L l.0./31!/'96 

MOORE 

NB -
1 .. 16 

NB 

25. 2'2 

4.55 

1.29 
29.33 

4.24 

30.64 

26 .. (),1) 

PECONIC PICKERING ARMSTRONG MATRX 

6.75 

27 . 95 

2 . 39 

105.00 
113.00 
l$5 .. 00 
185.00 

6.00 
6 . 00 

'51. s.o 
12.00 

6.50 

2.99 
2.25 

35.00 
1.50 

22.00 
6.70 

12.50 
24.95 
48.95 

13.18 
69 . 00 

6.00 
130 . 00 

28.00 
28.00 
~1.50 
19.95 
55.75 
65. 7,5 
21.95 
29.00 

NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 

90 , 10 
97.60 

l6J . 45 
163.45 

4.00 
4.40 

NS 
N8 
NB 
N&' 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NS 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 

Sl.65 
46 . 25 

NS 
NB 

SQ.60 
5.30 

1Z1 ; 80 
20.65 
24·.10 
1-S_, 10 

9.70 
NB 
NB 
N.B 
N8 

$23:92 
NO BtD 
NO 9 l'O­
l't0 S l l) 

$98.6.9 
$106 .. 99 
$177' .. ,,.47 
$li~L47 

$5~79 
$5.79 

NO am 
$6.99 
$4 . 91 

NO ii'O 
$6.1.2 

NO B!O 
$3.00 
$1.90 
$·1. •. 4 i 

NO BID 
NO BIP 

$11 ~35 
NO BI D 

$48 . 00 
NO Bl t) 
NO BlD 
NO BID 
NO SID 
>NO B-I~ 
NO B!b 
NO BID 
NO BI-D 

-NO BID 
NO Birr 

$60 ; oo 
$62.5() 

$7. -46 

' 
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AWARD FOR MeDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITEM 
NO. 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES 
DESCRIPTION 

111 MliO-ALKA·S~L-TZER 72/BOX 
112 MED-ALOPENT 2 • SML 
113 MED-ANTAC!P,lOO/BOX 
114 Mto-AS:PIRIN 5 GiL 250/BOX 
115 MSD-ASPIRIN, CHILDREN'S CHEWABLE 
1i 6 MED-ASPIRJ:N (.UNASPrRIN) ,~50/BX 
117 M!D-ATROPHlNE lMG 
118 MED-BRETYLIUM 500MG. 
l ·l 9 MED • BRETYL,£UM S. OOMG. 
120 MEn-DEXTROSE 50\·5~ CC 
121 MED-DOBUTAMINE 250MG/250CC PRE-MIXED 
122 MED-DOPAMINE 200MG/250CC PRE-MIXED 
123 MED-DOPAMINE 400MG/250CC 
12 4 MED- EP'INEPliRINE 1 : l ., 0 00 ~ 1 MG/ CC 
125 MED-EPINEPRINE 1:10,000 lMG 
126 MED-FOROSEM!DE lOGMG PRE-FILLED 
127 MED-GLOCAGON lMG " 
128 MED-IBUTAB,100/BOX 
129 MED· IPECAC SYRUP 1 OZ. 
1~0 MED-ISOPROTERENOL 2MG. 
131 MED-LASIX lOOM~ 
1~2 MSD-LIDOCAINE 2% lOOMG 
133 MED-L!DOCAINE lGM/SOOCC 
13 4 MED ~ MAGNESTUM SULFATE- 5 _ GM 
135 MEV-NALOXONE 2MG 
136 MED-PAIN -AID 
13'? MED- SALINE -2SOML C:S/24 
13 8 MED- SODIUM B !CARBONATE 50 MEG 
ll9- ~D-TET-RAHYDROZ:ALINE t HCL, 1 /ZOZ 
14:0 MED- THIAMilfE 1 0-0MG 
141 MED-WATER 250 ~· CS/24 
142 MED ·WATER 500 ML. CS/18 
143 NEBULIZER,ADULT "T" (FOR ALUPENT) 
144 NEBULIZER, CKILD "T" (FOR ALUPENT) 
145 NEBULIZER MASK, ADULT 
14~ NEBULIZER MASK~ CHILD 
147 NEliDLES I 19GX1. ,.; ~/2.. ' 

Pl\ICES I N EFFECT tJNtl'IL 1'0 /31/,96': 

MOORE 

4.41 
42.49 

9.71 
2 .T2 

2.87 
NB 
NB 
NB 

NB 
NB 
NB 

0 ~9 -9 

NB 

1.91 
NB 
NB 

7.78 

NB 
2.87 
0.81 

NB 
33.36 
22.68 

Na 
' 

$1.70 
~ 8 ~ 6 

, _, ' 
PECONIC PICKERING ARMSTRONG -MATR.X 

NB' $3_4. Otl 
NS - NO kib 
NB :'- NO BID 

10 .~ -s NB ~ NO< BlO. 
1.60 NB NO BID 

NB, NO B-IO 
2.35 NB- $2~ 15 

NB $2. i 5 
3 .10 NS - $6.95 
3.65 NB $2.15 

19 . 30 NB - $280 . 00 
: 11.25 NB NO- BID 
10.62 NB NO BID 

3 A)O Nl3 - $.1 . {)0 
2.30 NB $2.60 
3.30 NB $4.25 

31.25 NS ~ $3'9 .DO 
NB NO BID 

1. . 60 NB $2 .. 00 
N'B $6 .50 

3.30 NB $4.25 
2 .• 8-0 m;- $2 . $5 

NB NO BID 
2.95 N'a $3 . 95 

16.25 NB $24 .. tH) 
NB NO- BID 

42.-00 NB $44.40 
3.65 NB $3.00 

NB '~ NO BID 
2.25 N9 NO BI'O 

42.00 NB $44.40 
32 .. (){) ~,- NS • $46 .. 8.0 
1.15 NB ' $0.19 
1.65 NS NO _BID , 

NB- ' 0 -$1 . 20 
NB NO BID 

9 ~ 4'0 ~ :rm - NO .srp. 
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AWARD ruk M~UlCAL SUPPLL~~ 

ITEM 
NO. 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES 
DESCRIPTION 

1~8 NEEDLESt20GX1-1/2~' 
149 NEEDLES,22GX1-1/2•i 
~50 NEEDLES,INTRAOSSEOUS 
151 PACK,COLP,LARGE 
152 PACK,COLD,SMALL 
153 PACKS,COLD 6nx9n 
154 PA,~KS,HEAT 6"X9" 
155 PADS,ADULT DE'FIB 
156 PADS,EYt 
157 PADS, GAUZE, 2 ~X2 ·n 

158 PADS,GAUZE,3nX3" 
159 PADS,GAUZE,4nX4",$TERIL-E 2/PACK 
l~O PADS,PEDIATR-IC DEFIB 
161 PADS, STING RELIEF . 
162 PADS,TELFA,2nX3" 
16.3 POISON "[:VY WA,SH, ( 4CC EACH) 
164 PRESERVATIVE FOR PROTECTOR 
165 SALINE SOOML{BOTTLE)CS/18 
166 SC!SSORS,LLS'l'OR BANDAGE 5-1/2 11 S.S. 
167 SHARPS CONTAiNER . 
168 SHEARS,PARAMEDIC 
1,69 .SILVER SWADDrtER 
170 SODIUM CHLORIDE 2~0ML 
171 SP~INT,PADDED BOARD 15n 
172 SPL~NT I PTU)DED BOARD 18:., 
173 SPLINT,PADDED BOARD 36tt 
17 4 SPLINT, PADDED. BOARD 4 8 n· 
17·S SPL-INT, PADDED BOARD 54 n 
17 6 SPLINT, SAGER I INFANT 
177 SPLINT,SAGER,SUPER 
17·8 SPRAY I ANTISEPTIC, l oz. 
179 SPRAY,MADA CIDE 24 OZ. 
18Q SPRAY,NITRO STAT 
181.: STETHOSCOPE.- DUAL HEAD 
182 STETHOSCQPE-SPAG.TYPE 
183 STRAP,STD. 5' -2 PC. METAL BUCKLE 
18:'4 STRAP. STD . 9 , - 1 PC . MET"AL BOCKL·E 

-PRlCSS IN. EFFECT UNTIL lOj) 1/9.6 

MOORE 

7.68 
8.57 

11 
0 .,98 
4.49 
7 ._71 

10.4.7 

3.94 

23.22 

1.17 

2.'72 

4.24 
NB 

5 ~ 78 
NB 

NB 

NB 
4 •. 19 
7.05 

PECONIC ·PICKERING , ARMSTRONG- MA'ffUC 

9.40 

'. 40 
62.50 
17.00 
39.00 
13.60 

225 .. 00 
137.50 

5.75 9.55 
9.30 

11.80 
19 . 75 

135135.00 

32.75 
~. 0·0 
2.24 
3.75 
3~?5 

43.00 ' 
3..00 
J ,. 25 
4.65 

4.85 6.10 
6-.75 

22"5. 00 
2~5.00 

27.95 
5"00 
,9'.95 
9.50 
9. 5'0 

NfJ 
NB 
NB 
$ 
NB 
NB 
N9 
NS 
NB­
NB 
Na 
NB 
N9 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 

"' NB 
1. 95 

- 4. 40 
NS 
$ 
NB 
NB ~ 
NB 
NB 
224.00 
2_91. 00 
}$ 
NB 
NB 

4.20 
6.85 
8.95 
7.25 

- $tL 7 2 
$8.72 

$15.00 
NO ~SID 
NO BID 

$9.60 
#i6. S:6. 

$l14. 41 
$B.47 
$.2. 25 
$2.&4 
$3.09 

$114 .53 
NO SID 
NO BID 
NO- BID 
NO -SID 

21. 
1.2'7 
1.15 

3.1 
3.Bl 
1 . 6) 
2.15 
1.15 
4.67 

NO BID 
6.05 

2:41.14 
306.21 

NO' BID 
4.79 

32 
4.84 
7.77 
7.34 
7.34 

• 



"' \0 

AWARD FOR MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITEM 
NO. 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES 
DESCRIPTION 

185 STYLETTE. ,.PEDIATRIC,.D.ISPOSABLE 
186 STYLETTE,COPPER,AD 
187 SWABS,ANT!SEPTIC 
188 SWABS,PORIDONE IODINE 
189 .SYRINGE,20CC 
190 SYRINGE,lOCC 
191 SYRINGE,3CC 
192 TANKS(D 02)EVAC & FILL(IN HOUSE) 
l93 TANKS (.M 110) EYAC- & FILL (IN HOQSE) 
194 TANKS(M 02)EVAC & FILL(IN HOUSE) 
195 TAPE, DERMJCE~r 1 1

' ,2 n ,.3" 
196 TISSUES,SMALL FACIAL 
l97 TOURNIQUET,AOULT~VELCRO 
198 -TOORNIQUET,CHILD,VELCRO 
199 TUBE, YANKOWER SUCTION 
200 TUBES,BLOOD,RED TOP 
,2{)1 TUBEX HOLDER 
202 TUBING,7FT. 02 
2.·0 3 TUBING· 1 ODROP ADt1. SETS W /PORT- BOXED 
204 TUBING-60DROP ADM. SETS W/PORT··BOXED 
2'0 5 TWEEZER 
206 VACUTA!NER HOLDER 
207 VACTJTAtNER LU.ER ADAPTER 
208 VENI- GUARD 
209 WINDOW -PUNCH 
210 WIPES,CLEAN 

PR.l·CES .!NMEFFECT UNTIL 10/3 1/96 

MOORE 

5.9 5 
l .. SS 
2.88 

19 ~ 04 
17.82 
12 _. 51 

NB 
NB 
NB 

10.15 
29.61 

NB 
·6. 73 

14.68 
1.69 

27~31 

3.02 
2.9 

PECONIC PICKtRING A~STRONG MATRX 
,_. 

10.00 
24.00 
24.00 

2 .~0 
6.50 

23.,9:5 
21.95 

9.$0 

11.75 
0.94 
2 . 00 
2.00 
3.60 

14.'75 
4.$0 

16.00 
142 .95 
152.00 

,, 1. 99 
4.75 

32.70 
"' 60.40 

6.-QO 
8.25 

46.00 
7.60 

NB 
NB 
:~ 
NB 
NB .. 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
NB 
~ 
NB 
NB 
NB 
~ 
~ 
NB 
NB 
~ 
NB 
Ni3 

48.00 
NB 
NB 

4.52 
NO SID 
NO BID 
NO B'ID 

l-1. & 
19.59 

NO BID 
59.39 

NO BiD 
NO BlD , 

tL 45 
NO BID 

1.68 
1.6a 
lL 69 

$18 .50 
$~ ~3-0 

' $21.00 
$.l. 97 
$3.27 
$1..21 

N() B!D ·' 

$31. .35 
$51.04 

$3.19 
NO BtD 
NO BJD 
NO BID 
NO BlD 

• 
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JANUARY 8, 1996 
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

RESOLUTION #_....~:-5..._3 ___ _____ 

AUTHQ81ZATION TO REPUBLI$H BID 

_ c_o_u_N_C_I L_H_A_N_W_I_r_TH_E_I_E_R ___ OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION 

WHICH WAS SECONDED BY COUNCILMAN LUI.[. . 
• 

WHEREAS, the bid for CHEMICALS was received, opened and read aloud on the 

~th day of November, 1195 at 11 .:15 al'm., In the Town Clerk's offtce; and 

WHEREAS, there was alther one or no bids received on the tonowlng chemicals: 
1. METHANOL 

2. FERRIC CHLORIDE 
3. POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 

NOW. THEREFORE, BE IT 

RESOLVED, that the Town Board hereby authorizes the Town Clerk to 
l&advertlse tor sealed Bids for CHEMICALS (REBID) for use by the Town of 

. Riverhead. 

AESOlVED, that the Town Cterk be, and hereby bi, authorized to fot'Watd a copy 

"' this R$solutlon to the. Sewer and Water Departments. 

THE VOTB: 

WITTMEIBR 
KWASNA 
LULL 

PROSlNOWSkl 
STARK 

Aye 
Aye 
Aye 

Absent 
Aye 

The resoulution vas thereupon 
de-clared dt.t:ly adopted .. 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS (RE·StD) 

il 

, Sealed bids for the purchase of CHEMICALS (REBID) for use by the Town of 

Riverhead will be received by the Town Clerk at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, 
Rfverftead, .New York, 11901, untii11:1Q a.m .. on Jpnuary·a0.1996, 

Bid packets, Including Specifications, may be obtained at the Town Clerk's office 
at Town Hall Monday through Friday between the hours of 8:30 a,m. and 4:3() p .. m. 

~~~ blds must be submitted on the bid form provided. Any and all exceptions to 

the Specifications must be listed on a separate sheet of paper, beartng the 
designation .. EX~~PTIONS TO THE SPECIFICAnONS'.'- and be attached to the bid . 
fOtm, . 

The Town Board reserves the right and responsibility to reject any or all bids or 
to, watve any formality If It b8fteves such action to b.e In the r.est Interest of the 
Town. 

~~~ bids are to be submitted In a sealed envelope bearing the designation 

CliiMICAL$ (BEBQl). 

BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD 
OF TttE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD ·, 

Barbara Grattan. Town Clerk 
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JANUARY 8, 1996 
Adopted 
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

RESOLUTION#_..-.5..z..4 -----

' ' ' 

~UTHQFliZA TION 'ro PUBLISH B'ID 

_c=.:IOLZU=N.z...CI-.::L~M~A~N.....!L~U~L~L"------ OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION 

WHICH WAS SECONDED BY COUNCILMAN WITTMEIBR • . 

~~IT RE·SOL.VED, THAt. THE. 'rOWN 80ARD .HEREBY· AUTHO..,JZSS THE TOWN 

Cl&RK TO ADVERTISE FOR SEALED BIDS FOR ME;~I · ANQ eoULTRY 

~ODUCTS FOR USE JN THE NUTRITION CENTER IN THE · TOWN OF 

RIVERHEAD. 

SE IT RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK BE, AND HERESY IS, AUTHORIZED 

TO FORWARD A CO.PY OF THIS RESOLUTION TO THE NUTRITION CENTER. 

. TO'S VO'VB: . 
< 

WI~TMBl!Ht 
J.t.WA,SliA 
LULL 

PROSINOWSltl 
STAR~ 

A.ye 
Aye 
Aye 

Absent 
Aye 

The resolution was thereupon declared 
duly adopted. 



TOWN OF .RIVERHEAD 
NOnce TO SIDOERS 
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. sealed bids for the purcha$e of· MeAT AND E!®LTBY PRODUClS fo·r use by tHe IQWN 

Of RIVERHEAD NUTRmON CENTER will be received by the Town Clerk of the Town of 

Riverhead at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, 11901, until ] 1 :OQ 

a.m. on January 30, 1996. 

Sid ~cket$1 Including Specifications, may be e.bt•lned at the Towp Clerk's ,oftJ~e at 

Town Hall Monday through Friday between the hours of 8:30 a.m.. and 4.:30 p.m. 

AU bids mu!lt be submitted on the bid form provided. Any and all exceptions to the 

Specifications must be listed on a separate sheet of paper, bearing the designation 

"EXCEPTIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS'' and t»e attaQhed to the. bid form. , .. 

The Town BOard reserves the right and responsibility to reject any or· all bids or to 

wa4ve any formality If It believes such action to be In the best Interest of the Town. 

All bids are to be submitted In a sealed envelope bearing the designation BID fOB 

BY ORDER ·OF THE TOWN ~QA:RO 
OF THI! TOWN OF Rl'l&RHEAD 

Barbara Grattan, Town Clerk 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

RESOLUTION # 55 

Adopted~------------------~--~-

.AMENDS RESCLU'T!·ON #4 7; ADVERTISING FOR BlDS 
R!V'ElUIEAD SEWER DISTRICT AND 

RIVERHEAD/SOUTHAMPTON JOINT SCAVENGER WASTE ' ' OIST~ICT 
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COUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI offered the following resolution which 
vas seconded by COUNCILMAN LULL 

.RESOLVED, that Resolution #4 7 adopted by this Town Board be 
and is hereby amended to authorize the Town Clerk to publish and 
post the attached amended Notice to Bidders to advertise for bids 
tor. the hauling and disposal of liquid sludge and screening and 
}rit removal for the Riverhead Sewer District and 
Hve1~headjSouthampton Joint Scavenger Waste District, and be it 
further · 

~ESOLVEOI that tbe TQwn Clerk shall forward ~ ·eer~ified . copy 
)f. this rasolut.iott to the Rive·rhead Sew·er Oistrtct~ ·~outhampton 
"own· Clerk, and Pierte G. Lundberg; Esq~ 

' ' ' I " 

THE VOTE 
Nay 
Nay 

.HaY 
Nay 

.Nay 
The A11okltlon waa thereupon 
duty adOpted. 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

NOTICE TO BIDDERS 
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sealed bids for the }lauling an·d disposal of LIQUID SLUDGE, AND 

B~REENING AND GRIT REMOVAL by the TOWN OF RIVERHEAD SEW2R DISTRICT 

AND JOINT RIVERHEAD AND SOUTHAMPTON SCAVENGER WASTE DlSTRICT will 

be received by the Town Clerk of the Town O·f Riverhead at Town 

Ball, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York 11901, until ll:os 

t.m. on Janua·ry 22, 1996, at •hiob time all bids reoeived will be 

~ened and read aloud. 

B-id packets, including specifications, may be obtained at the 

!olin Clerk's Office at Tqwn Hall, .Monday through Friday between the 

hours of 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m. 

All bids must be submitted on the bid torm provided. Any· and 

tll exceptions to the specifications must be listed on a separate 

gtfeet of paper, bearing the designation *'EXCE1?TIONS TO THE 

S~!CIFICATIONS" and. be at taohed to the bid f .o:pn • 

The Town Board reserves the right and responsibility to rejeet 

~.y or .all bids or to waive any formality if it bel :Eeves such 

action to be in the best interest of the Town. 

All bi4s are to be submitted in a sealed envelope bearing the 

desi<_Jn4tion. BlOS FOR RSMOVAL AND .QISPOS.AL QF LIQUID SLQU<l·£, AMD 

~R£ENING AND GRIT REMOVAL. 

BY o~DER OF THE TOWN BOARD OF 

THE TOWN OF RIVBRHBAO. 

Barbara Grattan,, Town Cler~ 

... 


