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. Adopted

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

e RESOLUTION # 130
F | ADOPTED MARCH 21, 1995

 AUTHORIZES TOWN CLERK TO ADVERTISE FOR BIDS TO
|  FURNISH AND PLACE ASPHALT CONCRETE AND BITUMINOUS MATERIALS
| AND PLANT PICK UP OF ASPHALT CONCRETE

orrnmwmn&m ON,

B RISGLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BE
m 18 HEREBY AUTHORIZED TO ADVERTISE FOR SEALED BIDS TO FURNISH
| - ASPHALT CONCRETE AND BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AND PLANT

' PICK UP OF ASPHALT CONCRETE FOR THE USE OF THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY
g mmmuw FOR ONE (1) YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD,

mcn was snconnzn BY

AND BE IT RESOLVED,

. THAT THE SPECIFICATIONS AND FORMS FOR BIDDING BE PREPARED BY
m aupnnzmunzm- OF HIGHWAYS, AND BIDS BE RETURNABLE UP TO
. #4100 A.M. ON APRIL 7, 1995, AND BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK BE AND IS HEREBY DESIGNATED TO
| OPEN PUBLICLY AND READ ALOUD ON APRIL 7, 1995 AT 11100 A.M. AT

* THE TOWN CLERK’S OFFICE, 200 HOWELL AVENUE, RIVERHEAD, NEW YORK
oML BIDS BEARING THE DESIGNATION " BID TO FURNISH AND PLACE

. L _AND BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AND PLANT PICK UP OF

i The Vote
Gllam  Yes L MNo__
Ceighon Yes ' No___
Stark Yes L No___
Prusinowskd Yes L No___

The Resolution s therefore
declared duly adopted




s e

i NOTICE TO BIDDERS

SEALED BIDS FOR THE FURNISHING AND PLACING OF ASPHALT

_AND BITUMINOUS MATERIALS FOR THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY

| DEPARTMENT WILL BE RECEIVED BY THE TOWN CLERK OF THE TOWN OF

. RIVERHEAD AT TOWN HALL, 200 HOWELL AVENUE, RIVERHEAD, NEW YORK

- ¥TIL 11300 A.M. ON APRIL 7, 1995.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDER, SPECIFICATIONS AND BID FORMS MAY BE
" (BTAINED AT THE OFFICE OF THE TOWN CLERK, TOWN HALL, 200 HOWELL

. MWENUE, RIVERHEAD, NEW YORK BETWEEN THE HOURS OF 83130 A.M.

ALL BIDS WILL BE SUBMITTED ON THE BID FORM PROVIDED. ANY
. MND ALL EXCEPTIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS WILL BE LISTED ON A

. SEPARATE SHEET BEARING THE DESIGNATION " EXCEPTIONS TO THE
 SEECIFICATIONS" AND ATTACHED TO THE BID FORM.

L

F THE TOWN BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT AND RESPONSIBILITY TO
- RRJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS OR TO WAIVE ANY FORMALITIES IF IT BELIEVES
[ SUCH ACTION TO BE IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE TOWN.

.| AL BIDS WILL BE SUBMITTED IN A SEALED ENVELOPE BEARING THE

- ;L' i “.l _

- SITUMINOUS MATRRTALS".
2

}1

|"|.

i

.f‘li'-;.‘.'

BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD
OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD, N.Y.
BARBARA A. GRATTAN, TOWN CLERK

"te1 March 21, 1995
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

3!'21;’ 95

-:__:-__ TR

RESOLUTION #
ADOPTED MARCH 21, 81995

i  AUTHORIZES TOWN CLERK TO ADVERTISE FOR BIDS TO
E [SH AND PLACE ASPHALT CONCRETE AND BITUMINOUS MATERIALS
T AND PLANT PICK UP OF ASPHALT CONCRETE

NClLWOMAN GILLIAM OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,
mea WAS SECONDED BY s COUNCILMAN CREIGHTON

~ RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BE

. AND IS HEREBY AUTHORIZED TO ADVERTISE FOR SEALED BIDS TO FURNISH
. AND PLACE ASPHALT CONCRETE AND BITUMINOUS MATERIALS AND PLANT
k. ___j_‘_m'_or ASPHALT CONCRETE FOR THE USE OF THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY
ARTMENT FOR ONE (1) YEAR FROM DATE OF AWARD,

AND BE IT RESOLVED,

. THAT THE SPECIFICATIONS AND FORMS FOR BIDDING BE PREPARED BY
~ THE supnnzmmsm OF HIGHWAYS, AND BIDS BE RETURNABLE UP TO
. 41100 A.M. ON amu:. 7, 1995, AND BE IT FURTHER

| RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK BE AND IS HEREBY DESIGNATED TO

~ OPEN PUBLICLY AND READ ALOUD ON APRIL 7, 1995 AT 11:00 A.M. AT

L mm CLERK'S OFFICE, 200 HOWELL AVENTgE, nzvggm:w, NEW YORK
; = BID FURNISH AND PLACE
_amms THE DESIGNATION * B pxmcx £ or




'NOTICE TO BIDDERS

| SEALED BIDS FOR THE FURNISHING AND PLACING OF ASPHALT

. CONCRETE AND BITUMINOUS MATERIALS FOR THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY
. DEPARTMENT WILL BE RECEIVED BY THE TOWN CLERK OF THE TOWN OF

. RIVERHEAD AT TOWN HALL, 200 HOWELL AVENUE, RIVERHEAD, NEW YORK
. UNTIL 11:00 A.M. ON APRIL 7, 1995. |

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDER, SPECIFICATIONS AND BID FORMS MAY BE
- OBTAINED AT THE OFFICE OF THE TOWN CLERK, TOWN HALL, 200 HOWELL
~ AVENUE, RIVERHEAD, NEW YORK BETWEEN THE HOURS OF B:30 A.M.
. AND 4:30 P.M. L '

. ALL BIDS WILL BE SUBMITTED ON THE BID FORM PROVIDED. ANY
. AND ALL, EXCEPTIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS WILL BE LISTED ON A

| SEPARATE SHEET BEARING THE DESIGNATION " EXCEPTIONS TO THE

. SPECIFICATIONS® AND ATTACHED TO THE BID FORM.

THE TOWN BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT AND RESPONSIBILITY TO
- RRJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS OR TO WAIVE ANY FORMALITIES IF IT BELIEVES
~ SUCH ACTION TO BE IN THE BEST INTERESTS OF THE TOWN.

. ALL BIDS WILL BE SUBMITTED IN A SEALED ENVELOPE BEARING THE
. DESIGNATION *BID ON FURNISHING AND PLACING ASPHALT CONCRETE AND

BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD
OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD, N.Y.
BARBARA A. GRATTAN, TOWN CLERK

Date: March 21, 1995
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Adopted

- 3/21/95
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

RESOLUTION #1832
ADOPTED MARCH 21, 1995

MRDS BID FOR ACRYLIC WATER BASED TRAFFIC PAINT
COLD APPLICATION

OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION

mcn m SECONDED BY COUNCILPERSON _____COUNCILMAN STARK

m, THE TOWN CLERK WAS AUTHORIZED TO ADVERTISE FOR BIDS

| MR THE PURCHASE OF ACRYLIC WATER BASED TRAFFIC PAINT - COLD
. IPPLICATION FOR THE USE OF THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT, AND

mREhB, BIDS WERE RECEIVED AND READ ALOUD ON THE 13TH OF

 MARCH AT 11300 A.M. AT THE TOWN HALL, 200 HOWELL AVENUE,

| MVERHEAD, N.Y. THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE GIVEN IN THE NOTICE TO

. BIDDERS, AND

m Is HEREBY AWARDED TO CAPITOL HIGHWAY MATERIALS, P.O. BOX

WHEREAS, FOUR BIDS WERE RECEIVED

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, THAT THE BID FOR ITEM # 2123
5 A

{IN PLACE, NEW YORK 10505,




?jm £ ires F Ado pted

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

ATy e e

e e TR e

RESOLUTION # 183
ADOPTED MARCH 21, 1995

AWARDS BID FOR ACRYLIC WATER BASED TRAFFIC PAIHT

._ PHLB" IDH l ’ﬂLD APPLICATION

320

e g m Wﬁ n.:._i_'_-. ik

-.”e';

. ms, THE TOWN CLERK WAS AUTHORIZED TO ADVERTISE FOR BIDS
m THE PURCHASE OF ACRYLIC WATER BASED TRAFFIC PAINT - COLD
mnm&:m FOR THE USE OF THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT, AND

'WHEREAS, BIDS WERE RECEIVED AND READ ALOUD ON THE 13TH OF
mm 11:00 A.M. AT THE TOWN HALL, 200 HOWELL AVENUE,
¥ , N.Y. THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE GIVEN IN THE NOTICE TO
j m‘m' m

m:ns FOUR BIDS WERE RECEIVED

m. mnsronn, BE IT RESOLVED, THAT THE BID FOR ITEM #'S 1
HROUGH 4 BE AND IS HEREBY AWARDED TO LONG ISLAND PAINT CO.,
. 189, ONE CONTINENTAL HILL, GLEN COVE, NEW YORK 11542,

Sk 153 e (L P et ,_'::-- meirs .-,-',._-,___-_ _‘-;.-:-__-:\\- o

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK BE AND IS HEREBY
lmmm TO FORWARD A CERTIFIED COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION TO LONG

Pm co. AND THE RIVEREEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT .

O e "*-‘-t'.f-“:fi‘ﬁﬁ’-'{" ";‘?‘sz- BT o

~ Cea

L ~ The Vote
E Giiem Yul/'//uo
Creighon Yesl_ No___
Stark Yoo L MNo___
Prusinowski Yes L— No____
The Resolution s therefore
daclared duly adopted

R R i O e I
L e AR e

fmcnns .sncom:s BY councn.pmmm“g?g& BESOLUTI& —
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- B i e

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

| | RESOLUTION #;g
| | ADOPTED MARCH 21, 1995

'AWARDS BID FOR FURNISHING HEAT FUSED PREFORMED
PAVEMENT MARKINGS o

WHICH WAS SECONDED BY COUNCILPERSON AN GILLI/

‘ . LWM@REIGHTON . _ OFFERED THE FOLLOEING

_WHEREAS, THE TOWN CLERK WAS AUTHORIZED TO ADVERTISE FOR BIDS
| 'R FURNISHING HEAT FUSED PREFORMED PAVEMENT MARKINGS FOR THE USE

ks

. OF THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT, AND

. WHEREAS, BIDS WERE RECEIVED AND READ ALOUD ON THE 21ST OF

- TERUARY AT 11:00 A.M. AT THE TOWN HALL, 200 HOWELL AVENUE,

| m},mgt THE DATE, TIME AND PLACE GIVEN IN THE NOTICE TO
: &

S T A e g i, it s

AR T s e e S

AS, THREE BIDS WERE RECEIVED

o NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, THAT THE BID FOR FURNISHING
%0 ae.CSED PREFORMED PAVEMENT MARKINGS BE AND IS HEREBY AWARDED
. - AMERICAN REFLECTIVE PRODUCTS, SUITE 437, 442 ROUTE 206 NORTH,

NEW JERSEY 07921- 0753.

o

R

amg“n' FURTHER RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK BE AND IS HEREBY
.m‘mkn TO FORWARD A CERTIFIED COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION TO
CAN REFLECTIVE PRODUCTS THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT.

bl
i
A
o
L4

x

_ Credgon Yuz No__
Stark Y“_'é/ No___
Prusinowskd Yes . No___

The Resolution s therefore
deciared duly adopted
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Adopted

| mlmszs TOWN CLERK TO REPUBLISH_AND POST PUBLIC NOTICE TO
* CONSIDER THE AMENDMENT OF SECTION 108-64.5 ENTITLED, "BED-AND-

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution #185

s _ offered the following resolution, which was
NCILMAN-CREIGHTON

___Rl SOL VFIJ, that the Town Board be and is hereby authorized to publish and post the
pubhc notice to consider amending Section 108-64.5 entitled, "Bed & Breakfast
| lilities” in the March 22, 1995 issue of the Suffolk County Life, the newspaper hereby
| tsignated as the official newspaper for this purpose, and also to cause a copy of the pmpmed

§ ;I:glmm to be pos'led on the sign board of the Town in the Office of the Town Clerk; and be it

RES()LVED that the Town Clerk be and is hereby directed to forward a certified copy
Mns tesolution to the Suffolk County Planning Commission; the L.I. State Park Commission;
anwns of Brookhaven Southold and Southampton; and the L.I. Pine Bancns Review

ﬁslﬁﬂ
mvy
Gilliam Yes No____
Creighon Yes.  No__
Stark Yes, . No___
Prusinowskd  Yesi-— No__

e | deciared duly adopted
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
~ PUBLIC NOTICE

PLEASE TAK[‘ NOTICE, that a public hearing will be held on the 4th day of April,
5,2t 7:10 o'clock p.m. at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, to hear all
ierested persons to consider the amendment of Section 108-64.5 entitled, "Bed and Breakfast
ies” of the Riverhead Town Code by adding subsection L. as follows:

( 5 Bed-and-breakl‘ast facilities.

L An aDDllLdtlon for a Lomnhance permit shall be filed with the Building
 Department with a filing fee of one hundred ($100.00) dollars upon the initial
- application. No additional filing fee shall be required for five (5) years after
~ the date of the issuance of the initial compliance Qf:rmlt from the Building
| 'm;&rtment Upon special permit renewal, as required in subsection K. of this
Mﬂ, a fﬂ_lgg fee of one hundred ($ 100.00) dollars for a compliance permit
 shall become due.

poh -kfzi-ve'rh?éad-,‘wew York
. March21,1%95

BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD
OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

BARBARA GRATTAN, Town Clerk

., Underscore represents addition(s)
OVemlruck mpwsenls deletion(s)
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD Ad d

Resolution # 186 .pte |
. AMENDS RESOLUTION #156

ILMAN Pnusmowsm

_ offered the following resolution, which was

E '-WHEREAS by Rewlutlon #156 of the Town Board awarded Patrick Bistrian, Jr., Inc.,
1A Springs-Fireplace Road, East Hampton, New York 11937, the bid for the Annual Town
1 M;Bmmaga COﬂlst for a perlod of one (1) yedr and

K f._.‘:'i, Rcsalulion #l 56 omitted any reference to the disposition of the bid bonds
- ,-_-g._{____:ty submitted by the bidders.

N()W THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that Resolution #156 is hereby amended to
:_ Iﬂhe'l'own Clerk to return all bid bonds or b:d security to unsuccessful bidders.
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution #_187 AdOpted

EASTLAWN IMPROVEMENT
CAPITAL PROJECT
BUDGET ADJUSTMENT

| u--H L\“” MANSTARK  OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH
| '_,nm . ik OOUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI

" LVED, THAT THE SUPERVISOR BE AND HEREBY IS, AUTHORIZED TO
JBLISH T EFOLLOWING BUDGET ADJUSTMENT:

2.

" .99;30046: APPROPRIATED FUND BALANCE $2,900
181000.80046 TRANSFER FROM GENERAL FUND $2,500

TO:
HISTORICAL PROP. FACADE IMPROVEMENT  §5,400

g
E _- Stark Yes \_ No
r Prusinowskd  Yes 1~ No___
'y T ! § i




- TOWN OF RIVERHEAD Adopted

Resolution # 188

APPROVES MERIT RAISE TO TOWN EMPLOYEE

WUNUILMA GHE'GHTON offerf:d the following resolution, which was
it _ _ COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM

W“EREAS Candee Ulmet, by letter dated January 19, 1995, requested the Town Board
&mwaderdemal of a merit raise as requested by Police Chief Grattan; and

1 W 'REA"} Town Board members had granted Candee Ulmet an npportunuy to set
i :h&r mnﬂ why a merit raise should be granted.

b N{)W THEREI‘ORF BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Board be and hereby
P *tamem raise to Candee Ulmet, effective January 1, 1995; and be it further

o '-EES VFD that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized to forward a certified
ﬁ"h’“___,..,_,... lutmn to Cdndec Ulmet, Chief Joseph Grattan and the Accounting Department.

The V
Gillilam Yes N
Cre 1 Yes | N .
s xrm Yes___ No__ (= ddow.
. Prusiomld - Yoo LT N0 |
' " The Resolution s therefore
deciared duly adopted




Adopted

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

~ RESOLUTION#__ 189 ¢_

~ ADOPTED
AUTIHORIZATION TO PUBLISH BID

cc’UNC".WOMAN GILLIAM 0rFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION
-tf:ﬂ_-WAs SECONDED BY

HEITIIESOLVFD TIIAT THE TOWN BOARD HEREBY AUTHORIZES THE TOWN

- CUERK TO ADVERTISE FOR SEALED BIDS FOR POLICE CARS FOR USE BY TIIE
- TOWN OF RIVERHEAD.

- mr nmsm,vm THAT THE TOWN CLERK BE, AND HIEREBY IS, AUTHORIZED
.,;;mlwmn A corv or 'rms RESOLUTION TO ALL DEPARTMENTS.

327
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
NOTICE TO BIDDERS

Se:ledhmsfnr the p-!l'réh'asé of POLICE CARS for use by the Town of Riverhead will he
rmivetlby the Town Clerk at Town T1all, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York,
11901, until 11:15 a.m. on Monday, April 3, 1995.

Biﬂpatkels,inchuling Specifications, may be obtained at the Town Clerk’s Office at Town

Tl Mmjﬂ:n_y through Friday between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m.

| ﬂﬂhiﬂamug( be submitted on the bid form provided. Any and all exceptions to the

s?;l"-_-lj'-sﬂlﬁﬁtﬁ_ﬁnm must be listed on a separate sheet of paper, bearing the designation

f.- 'EXCEPT{ONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS" and be attached to the bid form.

mﬂ"“'“ﬁﬁam reserves the right and responsibility to reject any or all bids or o waive

- " formality if it believes such action to be in the best interest of the Town.

M' 'M”re to be submitted in a sealed envelope hearing the designation POLICE CARS.

I e ————

BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD
OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Barbara Grattan, Town Clerk

e e e

?."“-"'-I"“



S — Adopted

RESOLUTION # 190

M'HORI!!B THE EOLICITATIORS OF BIDS FOR WATER SERVICE
- MATERIALS FOR USE BY THE RIVERHEAD WATER DISTRICT

MAN PRUSINOWSKI

offered the following RESOLUTION, which
T “‘"’“d"a Lo - COUNC|LMAN STARK
. RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and hereby is authorized

tn advertiae for sealed bids for the purchase of WATER SERVICE
for use by the TOWN OF RIV‘ERHEAD and be it further

 REBOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and hereby is authorized
Eto o n and publicly read aloud said bids at 11100 A.M. on April
6, 1995 at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York,

. 19901; and to make a report of said bids to the Town Board at the
. next public meeting following the opening of the bids.

ey e IR (A,

k
;\ i
..\' i
i

i

!

(R

The Vote

Gilliam Yoot W .
Creighton  Yes .. No_
Stark Yes \  No___
Prusinowskd Yauzm
The Resolution is therefore
declared duly adopted

i | A T 5 L il




P TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

. NOTICE TO BIDDERS

. SEALED BIDS FOR THE PURCHASE OF WATER SERVICE

%: mm FOR USE BY THE RIVERHEAD WATER DISTRICT WILL BE

5 m:fEVED BY THE TOWN CLERK OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD AT TOWN

_ﬁ,m!ﬂﬂ HOWELL AVENUE, RIVERHEAD, NEW YORK, 11901 UNTIL _ 11A.M.
APRIL 6, 1995.

330

i
| BIDPACKETS, INCLUDING SPECIFICATIONS, INSTRUCTIONS AND

tmmms MAY BE OBTAINED AT THE TOWN CLERK'S OFFICE AT TOWN
IALL, MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY BETWEEN TIIE HOURS OF 8:30 A.M. AND
'eﬂ# PM. '
. ALL BIDS MUST BE SUBMITTED ON THE BID FORM PROVIDED.
mv AND ALL EXCEPTIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS MUST BE LISTED ON A
i wmm: SHEET OF PAPER BEARING THE DESIGNATION " EXCEPTIONS TO

CATIONS", AND BE ATTACHED TO THE BID FORM.
. THETOWN BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT AND THE RESPONSIBILITY
mmc'l’ ANY OR ALL BIDS OR TO WAIVE ANY FORMALITY IF IT BELIEVES

| wc”'\tﬁow TO BE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE TOWN.

ALL BIDS ARE TO BE SUBMITTED IN A SEALED ENVELOPE,

mkiwc THE DESIGNATION " WATER SERVICE MATERIALS

D, . | BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD

b

OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD, MY,

BARBARA GRATTAN, TOWN CLERK

PAGE 2




- ~ Adopted

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution # 191

Authorizes Submission of an Application to the
U.S. Department of Justice for COPS MORE Funding

:A% offered the following

rea@lution, which was seconded by COUNCILMAN_EBUSINGWSKI
du ilhetaas, Communlty Policing is an 1ntegral part of

"._",ac:hlevmg the goals of combatting crime and improving the quality
-;,'_af life for Town of Riverhead residents; and

: llhereas, the Town Board wholeheartedly endorses the concept
.._.";f cammunlty policing and likewise supports all efforts to

I'-:_fmhance community policing programs in the Town of Riverhead
; __._,I%Iice Department, and

4 ma.‘eas, the Riverhead Police Department has expressed the
*eﬁ for computer equlpment to reduce time spent on processing

b"?iperwerk for arrests in order to spend more time in our
1) Mﬁmties, and

ﬂhomas, there is funding available from the U.S. Justice
-:lj"':”_%partment's COPS MORE grant program to purchase equipment and
:"_%hnﬁlogy to bolster the Town of Riverhead Police Department’s
| nity Pollcing Program.

47 Therefore Be It Resolved that the Town Board hereby

f:" I:I'%!thorizes the submission of a COPS MORE grant to the U.S.

| ®Partment of Justice in an amount of $99,075. The Town Board
"'-il‘-:lﬁt‘EMs to use $28,500 in asset forfeiture funds from the Suffolk
""f;'&““tif District Attorney s office and a $6,000 grant from the New
"’E‘f""_.hl'k 5tate Division of Criminal Justice Services as its 25%

Ch. In the event the full amount of grant funds is not awarded

Ri Verhead Town Board is committed to meeting the funding
il’e_n_tent

"é Be It Further Resolved that the Town Clerk is hereby

\."%cted to forward a certified copy of this resolution to Police

| gl d Joseph Grattan, Financial Administrator Jack Hansen and
““’—Y Development Director Andrea Lohneiss. mv«b

o *'ém

mmhm
declared duly adopted
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Adopted

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

RESOLUTION # 192

ADOPTED
AUTHORIZATIONTO PUBLISH BID
4 |

_ COUNCILMAN CREIGHTON orFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION
fwmcn WAS SECONDED BY COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM

.BEIT RESOLVED THAT THE TOWN BOARD IHEREBY AUTHORIZES THE TOWN

Bs IT RESOLVED, THAT THE TOWN CLERK BE, AND HEREBY IS, AUTHORIZED
70 FORwARn A COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION TO ALL DEPARTMENTS.

~ TheVote
Creighton .
g Stark Yu; No.
Prusinowsid Yes _ No__
The Resolution is therefore
deciared duly adopted




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
~ NOTICE TO BIDDERS (REBID)

S!ﬁlﬂ”ﬁds for the _purchase of | L CHEMICALS for use by the

Tuwn of Riverhead will be received by the Town Clerk at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue,
f--_.--nher‘hen'd, New York, 11901, until 11:05 a.m. on February 21, 1995.

ggd j__n_:ket_s;, including Specifications, may be obtained at the Town Clerk’s office at Town

'l[all__M-nnd_ay__ through Friday between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m.

SRS

e L‘?ﬁ TS

Aﬂbids must be submltted on the bid form provided. Any and all exceptions to the
E Wﬁtﬁtmns must be listed on a separate sheet of paper, bearing the designation
f *EKCEPTIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS" and be attached to the bid form.
% The Tewn Bﬂar(l reserves the right and responsibility to reject any or all bids or to waive
| “‘Hummhly-' if it believes such action to be in the best interest of the Town.

l
7
\
i
|
Z

i Ail Md’ lre to he mbmmed in a sealed envelope bearing the designation CORROSION

BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD
OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Barbara Grattan, Town Clerk
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD - p ted
RESOLUTION# 193
ADOPTED L

'-?'f‘f-;_wm' anw el | 'AM OITERED THE FOLLOWING m:sownow
ZI'_:.;WAS GFCONDED BY |

;()LVED THAT THE TOWN BOARD HEREBY AUTHORIZES THE TOWN
'-f'-?_.-_;_--.:ADVERTISF FOR SEALED BIDS FOR mQ_ FOR USE IN THE
N CENTER IN THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD.

ijVED THAT THE TOWN CLERK ma, AND HEREBY IS, AU’I nommn .
| '"Mm A COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION TO AI,L mrm RTMENTS




| m

| mT"Wll Board reserves the right and responsibility to reject any or all bids or to

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
NOTICE TO BIDDERS
wedhiﬂs for the purchase of FOOD for use by the TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

3 W will be received by the Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead

ltTawn Hall, 200 Howell Avemle, Riverhead, New York, 11901, until 11:00 a.m. on

:'Ziz'-;-.;ii\-Bld}imkﬂs.'finclnding Specifications, may be obtained at the Town Clerk’s office

: ﬂTewn!Iall Monday through Friday between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m.

- Allbids mllsl be submnled on the bid form provided. Any and all exceptions to the

i sﬂdﬁmions must be listed on a separate sheet of paper, bearing the designation

ExCE"TIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS" and be attached to the bid form.

'“m' any formality if it helieves such action fo be in the best interest of the Town.

3

@m'tre-m be submitted in a sealed envelope bearing the designation

Y ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD
gF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Barbara Grattan, Town Clerk
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‘Adopted ™

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolut ion #194

~ GIVES CONSENT TO ASSIGNMENT OF CBA DISTRICTS

CLMAN PRUSINOWSK]

offered the following resolution, which was

VHEREAS, by Contracts dated June 22, 1992, Russ Davis Carting, Inc. agreed 1o
ide certain solid waste collection servic_cs within CBA District A and C; and

- WHEREAS, by Scction C. (6) of said contracts, Russ Davis Carting, Inc. was precluded
assignment of its rights, title and obligations unless consent was obtained from the Town of

WHEREAS, Russ Davis Carting, Inc. has requested the consent of the Town of
yign its rights and obligations to Eastland Carting, Inc.; and |
VHEREAS, the Town of Riverhead has conducted an 'invest_ig;:lioh regarding Eastland
which investigation has not revealed any impediment to said assignment.

~ NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Board of the Town of
| e and hereby gives its consent to the assignment of the contracts relative to CBA
1 C, subject to the following conditions: .

Eastland Cartin g, Inc. execute an assignment in form satisfactory to the Town

\ltorney;

hat Eastland Carting, Inc. apply for and obtain a solid waste disposal permit as
required by Town Code Chapter 103;

That Eastland Carting, Inc. submit insurance, performance security and any other
s which are required by said contracts as conditions precedent 1o its
ormance under said contracts; and be it further

J L1, that the Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead be and is hereby dtrt;cl_cd tn

| copy of this resolution to Russ Davis Carting, Inc., P.O. Box 227, 3'?”'”3)’-
tland Carting, Inc., 11 Lehigh Drive, Smithtown, New York 11787: John

. nent; Town Attorney and the Accounting Department. |




Adopted

AWARDS BID FOR CHEMICALS
RESOLUTION #___ 195

ADOPTED:

POUNC“'MAN STARK - offered the following resolution
w&ielmasseconded by __QQMLMAN_EBUSINOWSKl_

oy m--—- o i =

WHEREAS the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a Notice To Bidders

., fﬂrCﬂEMICALS

HE ""EAS bids were received, opened and read aloud on the 21st day of February,

"m!u 11:05 a.m. at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, 11901, the

t%ﬁme and place given in the Notice To Bidders..

& N'W THEREFORE, BE IT

RESOLVED that the bid for CHEMICALS be awarded as follows:

o ..#l Gaseous Chlorine to Jones Chemicals, Inc. at $.40/Pound
 #2 - Methanol to Captree Chemical Corp. at $1.85/Gallon
#3 - Ferric Chloride to Captree Chemical Corp. at $.7823/Gallon

i ($.17/Pound Dry Weight)

~ #4 - Dry Hydrated Lime to Long Island Cauliflower Asso. at

$3.32/50 Pound Bag

~ #5- Sodium Hypochlorite to Jones Chemicals, Inc. at $.7621/Gallon
- #6 - No Bids Received (to be Rebid).

| ﬂ mES_PLVED that the Town Board hereby directs the Town Clerk to return any and

" DONGs received in connection with the above.

0L ED that the Town Clerk be, and hereby is, authorized to forward a certified

| [f.?: ng& esolution to JONES CHEMICALS, INC.; CAPTREE CHEMICAL CORP.;

ND CAULIFLOWER ASSOCIATION and all Towvwaﬂmeﬂfs

sy
o I o oy

Stark .léuo

Prusinowsid Yu No____

The Resolution s therstore
deciared duly adopted
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD . Ad0pted

Resolution # 196

i AUTHORIZES PUBLICATION OF NOTICE

LMAN GRE'GHTON ___ OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION,

£ iiimw seconpeppy_ COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM

---AS The Rtverhead Town Board has utilized an extensive insurance program for
of the property, assets, liabilities and employees of the Town of Riverhead; and

WHEREAS the Riverhead Town Board wishes to solicit proposals for an extensive
rar am in order to maximize benefits and cost effectiveness to the Town of

O THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby authorized to publish
LR %Mhed legal nonce in the Suffolk Life on March 22, 1995.

._ BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby directed to forward a
- certified copy of this resolutlon to John Hansen in the Accounting Department.

declared duly adopted
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Adopted

- TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

 RESOLUTION # 197
ADOPTED

' mj Nr:ILWOM‘U\' GILLIAM OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION

ci WAS SI‘CONDED BY _

-_.Ig_____IF:E-l'T'RE-SOLVED, THAT THE TOWN BOARD HEREBY AUTHORIZES THE TOWN
MRK TO ADVERTISE FOR SEALED BIDS FOR PERCENT OFF GRAINGER
 WDUSTRIAL, AND COMMERCIAL EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES CATALOG OR
iQUAL FOR USE BY THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD.

. .' "‘" RESOLVED TIIAT TIIF TOWN CLERK BE, AND HEREBY IS, AUTHORIZED
__r;-_m'?ﬂllw,mn A cory OF THIS RESOLUTION TO ALL DEPARTMENTS.

The Vote
| Gillam Yu\/ No___
e | Creighton Yuz N
rF Stk Yool No__
- | . i g

mmhm
declared duly adopted




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
NOTICE TO BIDDERS

| taled bids for the purchase of EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES FROM GRAINGER
| NDUSTRIAL for use by the TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
i mm recaeived by the Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead at Town Hall, 200 llowell

&mn, Riverhead New York 11901, until 11:10 a.m. on Monday, April 3, 1995.

tﬂpﬂdtets, including Specifications, may be obtained at the Town Clerk’s office at Town
MMW"*}' through Friday between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 4:30 p.m. '

8 ﬂi&musi be submitted on the bid form provided. Any and all exceptions to the
i '_ _ -iﬂns must be listed on a separate sheet of paper, bearing the designation

CEPTIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS" and be attached to the bid form.

The Town Board reserves the right and responsibility to reject any or all bids or fo waive

fo ality ﬂ' it believes such action to be in the best interest of the Town.

L bids are to be submitted in a sealed envelope bearing the designation

BY ORDER OF THE TOWN BOARD
OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Barbaﬁ Grattan, Town Clerk
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E Tabled

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution # 198

'APPRQVES CHANGE OF ZONE PETITION OF 1994 SOUNDVIEW GOLF, INC.

COUNCH.MAN PHUSINOWSK] offered the following

: '_.iz.é_ffE'I“'resolutlon, which was seconded by ‘:“UNQ LMAN STARK

WHEREAS, the Riverhead Town Board is in receipt of a

petition from Allen M. Smith, Esqg. on behalf of 1994 Soundview

| Golf, Inc. as owner, to provide for the recreational zoning use

. district upon real property located on the northerly side of

Sound Avenue, Wading River; such property more particularly

 ﬁ;”dascr1bed as 0600- 57 1-1.4, and

WHEREAS , the Rlverhead Planning Board as lead agency in

i;jthis action has determined the petition to be Type I without a
“ﬁ_significant impact upon the environment and that an Environmental

'Impact Statement need not be prepared, and

WHEREAS, the Town Board has referred the application to

f;;the Riverhead Planning Board for its report and recommendation
| Such Plannlng Board recommendlng that the zoning amendment be

aﬂpreved with condltlons, and

WHEREAS, the Riverhead Town Board has carefully

considered the merits of the change of zone petition, the SEQRA

'“'Eécord created to date, the report of the Planning Department,
| the report of the Planning Board, the record of public hearing,
1 = well as all other relevant planning, zoning and environmental

fiﬂtnrmation, now

'rmmronn, Bz 1T
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RESOLVED, that in the matter of the change of zone

igmtition:Of 1994 Ssoundview Golf, Inc., the Riverhead Town Board

ﬁﬁﬁréby finds the following:

{ . FIRST: That the subject real property meets the
criteria for inclusion in the recreational
overlay distriét and by ihference conforms to
the goals of the Wading River Hamlet Study;

SECOND: That the golf course use is considered to be
open space pursuant to Section 278 of the

Town Law and Article XIX of the Riverhead

Zoning Ordinance;

THIRD: That the application of the recreational

| - overlay district would result in a reduction
in the total number of residential lots to be
created within the map of Sound Breeze which
will have a ppsitive fiscal impact upon the
Riverhead School District} |

. FOURTH: Thét the environmental impacts of the

proposed zone change have been identified and

th&t mitigation measures have been identified

by this Planning Board as Lead Agency; and
BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED that based upon its findings, the Riverhead

:ﬁh Board approves the change of zone petltlon of 1994 Soundview
{&ﬂf, Inc. subject to the following:

' ~ FIRST: That the contemplated site plan include those
| ~elements enumerated in the relevant

determination of environmental significance;
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SECOND :

THIRD:

344

That the application of theARecreational
Overlay District be applied in conjunction
with the existing Résidential A Zoning Use
District;

That the recreational use be limited to the
development of a golf club as defined in
Section 103-125 (A) (i), and that the Town
Board require a covenant restricting the use
of the real property to golf course related

actlvitles by specifically excludlng the

dvf‘ ”» hlg‘* élff\/ll\é é—-»g_.. nNon - {— (Ctaﬂ,‘k w/d.n&
lopment Of,two~family dweélling, tennis

FOURTH:

FIFTH:

;iSIxTH:

clubs, resorts, motels, nursery schools,
health spas, taverns, restaurants, and retail
stores as principle uses;

That a covenant be filed stating that in the
event the real property taxes are not paid,
thé Town of Riverhead may use or sell the
real property under the terms of the covenant

and its amendments as filed with the Clerk of

~the County of Suffolk;

The site plan for the propoéed golf.courSe
shall be referred to the Planning Board for
its recommendation to the Town Board.
.Thétfin the event that a golf course is
developéd as proﬁosed, a covenant be filed
limiting the residential development of the

property to no more than 140 lots or_uni;s;
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' SEVENTH: That the intersection of the proposed Roadway

e S e e A P A e

"A" and Sound Avenue be controlled with a
signal; |

.EIGHTH: That dufing the buildout df.the golf course
as well as section six of the subdivision all

construction machinery shall exit the site

e S TS e e

via roadway to Sound Avenue;
NINTH: That any irrigation well be screened in the
principal groundwater aquifer rather than any

perched water; and

BE IT FURTHER
_ﬁ' . RESOLVED, that the imposition of this zoning use
be 4 conjuncfoon (PR
lelassification iﬁx—ﬁ—add-rﬁea—m © the existing zone use
-f@la&siflcation; and
BE IT FURTHER

RESOLVED, that the Zoning Map of the Town of Riverhead is

fi%uﬁby-amended to reflect the above described change of zone; and

BE IT FURTHER
. RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk shall cause the publication
_égﬂ“this“resolution amending such zoning use map and she is
: ’*h&raafter directed to engage the services of Young & Young Land

_ﬁﬁﬂmayors to update the zoning use district map reflecting this

ﬁiﬂg change; and

. BE IT FURTHER

 RESOLVED, that a copy of this resolution, together with a
ﬁ;;gff;he_neﬁ zoning use district map incorporating the

dégmant_heretofpre adopted shall be posted on the sign board



" _ : 245
gmalntained by the Town Clerk and affidavits of postlng thereof

| shall be filed with the Town Clerk’s Office; and
BE IE'FERTBER-

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk shall forward a certified

—weﬂa,-.rn;:ﬂ-m e e
ST e e i ey E

cmpy of this resolutlon to Allen M. Smith, Esqg., attorney for the

l

mnﬂicant, the Bulldlng Department and the Riverhead Water
District L

R k'
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| WARCH 21,1995 ~ TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

RESOLUTION # 199 Adopted

e OOUNC|LMAN STARK OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION

{wiicn was seconpep By COUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI

 f i;lEREAS, a position currently exists for an Electrical Inspector in the Building Départment; |

| ':IWHEREAS, all applicants were thereafter interviewed in accordance with the provisions of the
W,

~ |"OW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that Scott Sinnickson be and is hereby appointed as
~ |Bectrical Inspector with the Building Department effective April 3, 1995 at the annual rate of
- .;-_?ﬁi{s&tiot&pf $33,226.46 as set forth in Group 6, Step P of the Administrative Salary
| Xhedule; and

{8 1T FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby directed to forward a

4 -?g;iﬁed copy of this resolution to Scott Sinnickson, Raymond Wiwczar and the Accounting
| “partment.




Adopted

| waRCH 21, 1995 | TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution # 200

AUTHORIZES TOWN CLERK TO PUBLISH AND POST A HELP WANTED AD FOR
MATNTENANCE MECHANIC II IN BUILDINGS & GROUNDS

- COUNCILMAN CREIGHTON
; OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION
| mizcn was seconvep sy __ COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM

RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and hereby is authorized to publlsh
| md post the following Help Wanted Ad:

HELP WANTED

|  PLEASE TAKE NOTICE THAT THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD IS SEEKING
| (UALIFIED INDIVIDUALS TO SERVE IN THE POSITION OF MAINTENANCE MECHANIC
| II IN BUILDINGS & GROUNDS. INTERESTED INDIVIDUALS MUST SUBMIT AN
| APPLICATION TO THE ACCOUNTING DEPARTMENT, 200 HOWELL AVENUE,
| RIVERHEAD, NEW YORK, 11901 BETWEEN THE HOURS OF 8:30 A.M. AND 4:30
| .M, MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY. NO APPLICATIONS FOR THIS POSITION WILL BE
| A\CCEPTED AFTER APRIL 7, 1995. THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD DOES NOT
gg[mmcnxuxnawa ON THE BASIS OF AGE, RACE, COLOR, NATIONAL ORIGIN, SEX OR
| AANDICAPPED STATUS IN THE EMPLOYMENT OR PROVISION OF SERVICES.

BY ORDER OF: |
THE RIVERHEAD TOWN BOARD
BARBARA GRATTAN, TOWN CLERK




Resolution # 201

349
owormn A QJopted

|COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM o rexep T FOLLOWING RESOLUTION
WHICH WAS SECONDED BY COUNCILMAN CREIGHTON

. WIIEREAS, due to the maternity leave of Nadia Chiaramonte there is an availability for a 90
{ Dty Temporary Stenographer in the Juvenile Aid Bureau; and |

[ fWI]EREAS, the position of 90 Day Temporary Stenographer was duly advertised; and
' 'WHEREAS, all applicants were thereafter interviewed;

{NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that Madlyn Davis be and hereby is, appointed to
§ ¢ position of 90 Day Temporary Stenographer with the Juvenile Aid Bureau effective March
§ 121995 at the hourly rate of $10.60; and

f"E.IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk hereby is, authorized to forward a
i g-:t‘;ﬁed copy of this resolution to Madlyn Davis, Tim Hubbard, and the Accounting
| »*partment.

The Vote
Giliam  Yes. \/
Creighton  Yes

PMY&_([NO

The Resolution Is thersfore
deciared duly adopted

EEF

1]




s AdOpted”

RESOLUTION # 202

AHARDS BID FOR PURCHASE OF GRASS SEED AND CHEMICALS
W FOR THE
MAINTENANCE OF TOﬂN FACILITIES

Adopted: March 21, 1995

PRUS'NOWS” offered the following resolution which
s seconded by __ COUNCILMAN STARK .

-wg ﬂEEREAS the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a
| aotice to bidders for the purchase of grass seed and chemicals
- | for the maintenance of Town facilities; and

‘|  WHEREAS, two (2) bids were received, opened and read aloud
fon the 20th day of March, 1995, at 11:05 a.m. at Town Hall, 200
fowell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, the date, time and place
given in the notice to bidders. ' - |

. ' NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the bid for the
_;ﬁ?mmnase of grass seed and chemicals be and is hereby awarded to

”Qﬁwtlsland Cauliflower Association - Items 1, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10
*iﬁco, Inc. - Items 2, 3, 4; and

e IT FURTHER RESOEVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby
jfxized to forward a certified copy of this resolution to Long
lsland Cauliflower Association, 139 Marcy Avenue, Riverhead, New
M& """ ‘and Lesco, Inc., 20005 Lake Road, Rocky River, Ohio, 44116

> Town Englneer.

The Vote
Gilliam Yea../
Creighton «/
Stark Yeuz No
Prusinowski  Yes . No___

declared duly adopted
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD Ado pt ed

Resolution # 203

GENERAL FUND

IRESOLVED, THAT THE SUPERVISOR BE, AND HEREBY IS, AUTHORIZED TO
HE FOLLOWING BUDGET ADJUSTMENT: |

0 FROM:
41500 AMBULANCE VEHICLE MAINTENANCE  $2,000

TO:
AMBULANCE OFFICE SUPPLY EXPENSE $2,000




Adopted

AWARDS BID FOR SPORTS EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

RESOLUTION #_ 204
ADOPTED:
P
rf |
0 i O;OUNCILMAN CREIGHT offered the following resolution, which

| }EREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a Notice To Bidders for
o E{IUIPMENT & SUPPLIES; and

EREAS, bids were received, opened and read aloud on the 30th day of Jamtary,‘l 995, at
~ {%am, at Town Hall, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, New York, 11901, the date, time and
~ [etgiven in the Notice To Bidders.

| \OW, THEREFORE, BE I'T

ALREE CO., INC.; EAST END SPORTING GOODS; PASSON’S SPORTS;
IRTS; PORT JEFFERSON SPORTS; AND STAT DESIGN as indicated on the
mized pages.

_"_:'_l'-:..'VED, that the Town Board hereby directs the Town Clerk to return any and all bid
in connection with the above.

D, that the Town Clerk be, and hereby is, authorized to forward a éert’iﬁed copy of
lution o CALREE CO., INC.; EAST END SPORTING GOODS; PASSON’S SPORTS;
“A SPORTS; PORT JEFFERSON SPORTS; STAT DESIGN; and all Town Hall

The Votg
Giliam " Yes\/ No____

nts.

Stark Yes No
Prusinowski  Yes No___
" The Resolution is therefore

D, that the bid for SPORTS EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES  be, and hereby is,
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BID AWARD ON SPORTS EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

ITEM EAST END PLAZA PORT JEFF. STAT
NO. DESCRIPTION : CALREE SPORTING PASSONS SPORTS SPORTS DESIGN

FOOTBALL EQUIPMENT

NOTE*=*JERSEYS & HELMETS HAVE GIANTS NAME & NUMBERS ON THEM**
1 CHRIN SETS 89.06 :
2 FACE MASK: SCHUTT NOPOJR _ 7.50
SCHEUTT NJOPJR : 7.90 -
RIDELL WHITE ZE3D "NO BID*® "NO BID*
3 POOTBALLS: WILSON BLEM TDJ _ - 3 : : i9.50
WILSON BLEM K2 17.50
WILSON K2 21.50
WILSON TDJ 23.75
GIRDLE SHELLS - ADAMS 495 ' 5:.75
GIRDLE PADS - ADAMS 1666 6.75
HELMETS - RIDELL W/FACEMASK MODEL 35 (WHITE) "NO BID* BNO BID"
HELMETS - VSR-Y NFL NY GIANTS *NO BID*® *NO BID*
JERSEYS,GAME - BIKE 1587 NYLON-ROYAL BLUE 21.64
w/two color full block numbers white on red/front & back
JERSEYS, GAME - BIKE 1587 NYLON-WHITE
w/two color full block numbers royal blue on red/front & back
10 JERSEYS, PRACTICE - BIKE 1522 ROYAL BLUE _ : = 9.50
w/one color full block numbers white/front & back
11 JERSEYS, PRACTICE - BIKE 1522 WHITE = . ; 9.50
w/one color full block numbers royal/front & back
12 JERSEYS, PRACTICE - BIKE 1522 RED _ 9.50
w/one color full block numbers white/front & back
13 LETTERING - SURNAME-BLOCK LETTERING ONE COLOR/BACK : _ .
14 LINE MARKERS-EVERY 10 YARDS ' 127 .54
15 NECK ROLLS: PRODOWN FBYDMARK 9.41
16 PADS - GOAL POST : - 86.00
17 PADS,JAW,RIDDELL: #45725 VINYL : : ; : 40.83
$#45728 UNIVERSAL 34.12
18 PADS KNEE,ADAMS (2 PER SET) : = _
19 PADS, SHOULDER,RIDDELL: PRODOWN SP-16 BULLDOG : : 24.75
BIKE 26-28
20 PADS, SHOULDER: RAWLINGS 11-12
- PRODOWN SP-16 BULLDOG

21.64

o) 0 <3 oy U i

- 2.50

'q?‘b?S'

21 PADS, aaau:.m STRAPS,POWER PAC 1° (PRICE PER DOZEN) e e e
2 PADS, _m %ﬁsa _ s e e




BID AWARD ON SPORTS EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

ITEM : EAST END PLAZA PORT JEFF. STAT
NO. DESCRIPTION CALREE SPORTING  PASSONS SPORTS SPORTS DESIGN

29 PANTS,PRACTICE - BIKE P340 W/BELT - WHITE : o 8.50

30 T-BOOKS - ADAMS SPH 12 _ ; 0.45

31 CEIN STRAPS - RIDELL = 5 4

32 CHIN STRAPS SNAP - RIDELL _ 0.15

33 INFLATION KITS - RIDELL 20.35 :

34 TACKLING DUMMY ATHLETIC SPECIALTIES-48*° : 76.85

35 PAINT - LATEX (LINE FIELD) 39.04

36 GATORADE - POWDERED MIX (1GAL.PKGS.) 28.95

37 COOLERS - INSULATED (5GAL.) 23.13

SOCCER EQUIPMENT

38 BALLS, SOCCER MACGREGOR MCS30004 6.31
39 BALLS, SOCCER MACGREGOR MCS30005 6.26
40 SHIN GUARDS,MACGREGOR MCSOCSG71I 1.30
41 SEIN GUARDS,MACGREGOR MSSOCSGY ' 1.47
42 SEIN GUARDS W/STRAPS YOUTE & ADULT (MSSOCSG6/MSSOCSGS) 1.63
43 GOALIE HELMETS _ _ 20.45
44 GOALIE NETS-202 CM (PAIR) - . &
45 GOALIE JERSEYS - 21.00 we e _
46 REFEREE JERSEYS ' 7.95
47 WHISTLES 0.23
48 MESH EQUIPMENT BAGS 2.15
49 CORNER FIELD MARKERS - FLAGS (4) 22.98
- CONES - 0.51 =
_ - FOAM POST "NO AWARD* ~ "NO AWARD*
50 T-SHIRTS - 8 COLORS W/PAL LOGO & SPONSOR NAME - ADULT | 5.00 =

51 T-SHIRTS - 8 COLORS W/PAL LOGO & SPONSOR NAME - YOUTE - 4.50

BASEBALL EQUIPMENT

NOTE**MESH & FOAM HATS HAVE PAL LOGO OR RHD POLICE SHIELD**
52 BASEBALLS - DIAMOND DOL-A _ 28.97
53 BASES - IN-GROUND (PER SET) 64.00
54 BASES - SPIKED (PER SET) _ - 22.98
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L

Pt ¥

T~ :
BID AWARD ON SPORTS BEQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
ITEM - - EAST END _ PLAZA PORT JEFF. STAT
NO. DESCRIPTION CALREE SPORTING PASSONS SPORTS SPORTS DESIGN
62 CAPS - BASEBALL/GENERIC NAVY BLUE W/WH. STRIPES (YOUTH) 2.75 ' |
63 CAPS - BASEBALL/MESE, NAVY BLUE (ADULT) _ 7.00
64 BATTING HELMETS - RAWLINGS PC78 (RIGHT & LEFT) 8.50
65 BATTING HELMETS - ADAMS PC75 (RIGHT & LEPT) 8.50
66 CATCHER'S HELMET 10021
67 CATCHER'S MASK 7.95
68 CATCHER'S MITT (RIGHT & LEFT) 33.12
65 JERSEYS - BUTTON DOWN W/WHITE/NAVY STRIPES AND LOGO 21.00 .
70 DANTS - W/SNAPS NAVY W/WHITE TRIM 20.00
71 PITCEING RUBBER — 5.85
72 SCOREBOOKS 7.10
73 SOPTBALLS, 11° MACGREGOR 11RE 27.95
74 SOPTBALLS, MACGREGOR 12RE, 12FA 30.62 -
75 STIRRUPS, YOUTH | 1.95
76 THROAT PROTECTOR 1.58 e
77 PIELD MARKER, DRY LINE, WHEEL 65LB CAPACITY 121.00
BASKETBALL
78 BACKBOARDS - ALUMINUM 35° X 54° 166.88
79 BASKETBALLS - RAWLINGS NCAA4 (ADULT) s 18.00
80 BASKETBALLS - VOIT CBG 3.37
81 BASKETBALLS - RUBBER (YOUTHE & REGULAR) 3.39
82 SCRIMMAGE VESTS - ONE COLOR | 37.43
83 RIMS - DOUBLE 5/8® THICK - SINGLE 5/8" THICK 30.00
- VOLLEYBALL EQUIPMENT

84 BALLS - MACGREGOR 6770 22,42

.74

85

85

NETS

rcnsznnzanrns uu:?oxns

BRIE?S EH?IRE 1oos_mm BQ!‘AL BhﬂE {YQB‘I‘B§




BID AWARD ON SPORTS EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

1TEM EAST END PLAZA  PORT JEFF. STAT

NO. DESCRIPTION CALREE  SPORTING PASSONS SPORTS SPORTS DESIGN
91 COLLARED SEIRTS - ONE COLOR W/PAL LOGO ON FRONT 7.79
92 T-SHIRTS/SILKSCREENED FRONT & BACK-"BIKE RODEO®- (YOUTH & ADULT) .15 _ .
93 HATS - FOAM W/PAL LOGO OR POLICE SHIELD (ADULT) ; | _ 5 2.00
94 HATS - MESE W/PAL LOGO OR POLICE SEIELD (ADULT) S S 2.00

WATER AND SWIMMING

95 MEN’'S SWIM TRUNKS W/"LIFEGUARD® LOGO (S,M,L,X-L) 16.67
96 WOMEN’'S ONE PIECE SWIM SUITS W/“LIFEGUARD* LOGO (S,M,L) 24.33
97 RESCUE/SURF BOARDS - 12' MARINE RESCUE TYPE "NO AWARD" i L “AWARD"
98 SPINE BOARDS - 6' LENGTH FIBERGLASS "NO AWARD® _ : *NO ~ AWARD®
99 RESCUE TUBE-WRAP AROUND-45°L X 5-1/2"W X 3-1/2"D *NO AWARD" _ g *NO AWARD*
100 BEACH UMBRELLAS - TO FIT ON LIFEGUARD CHAIRS . _ . di s _ e s
101 SUN HELMETS - PLASTIC (LIFEGUARDS) "NO AWARD" 8.42 . ' "NO  AWARD®
102 AIR HORNS - PASSONS MSAIROZE | 8.42 S |
103 WHISTLES - PLASTIC OR STEEL - BT 0.24 _ - =
104 STOPWATCHES 4.88 =
105 LIFE JACKETS - BASIC USCG APPROVED (CHILD/ADULT) “NO AWARD” —INo AWARD"
106 LIFEGUARD TRAINING BOOKS - AMERICAN HEART ASSN. OR RED CROSS "NO ~ BID" . e ; "No  BIDS
107 TORPEDO BUOYS “NO BID* _ o BID*
108 OARS - 6', 8‘, 10’ WOODEN _ "NO ~ BID" 8 *NO ~ BID®
109 BOAT CUSHIONS - BASIC USCG APPROVED - - "NO BID" : AEmmmgmeERe . N 0
TENNIS
110 NETS - 2.6MM OR 3.0MM 49.74
111 POST SET - 3* _ ~ 87.00
112 REEL - LONG HANDLE RATCHET TYPE - : . : - 8.47
113 WATER SQUEEZE - 36° WIDE, FOAM RUBBER 38.00

PLAYGROUND

114 INFANT SWING SEAT-RUBBER aucxzw/swznm conz & SAFETY CHAIN
115 TOT SWING SEAT-RUBBER sucxzm{smzsa CORE & SAFETY CHAIN
116 CUT PROOF SAFETY SEAT-5"W X 24°"L, MOLDED RUBBER =
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BID AWARD ON SPORTS EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

ITEM EAST END PLAZA  PORT JEFF. STAT
NO. DESCRIPTION '  CALREE  SPORTING PASSONS  SPORTS  SPORTS DESIGH
122 PING PONG NETS - NYLON MESH - S5 1.54 =
123 POOL BALLS | 38.50
124 POOL CUE STICKS - ONE PIECE WITH FELT TIP | .05
125 JUMP ROBES - 8', 9’ 16' COTTON/PLASTIC _ 1.44
126 DOUBLE DUTCE ROPES - COTTON 32’ LONG .49
MISCELLANEOUS
NOTE**ALL TANK TOPS, T-SHIRTS & SWEATSHIRTS TO INCLUDE FRONT e _ -
AND BACK LOGO** ' = ,
127 GOLF SHIRTS - COLLARED,100% COTTON - - - 7.79
128 SWEATPANTS n = 7.08
129 SWEATSHIRTS - HOODED, JERZEES,50/50 - 13.60
130 SWEATSHIRTS - JERZEES, 50/50 = . .98
131 T-SEIRTS - RUSSELL 50/50 _ . R Y s
132 TANK TOPS - JERZEES OR EQUIVALENT - 5.74
133 VISORS W/FRONT BRIM GUARD ' . _ Ui = aUsh
134 ROPE - SYNTHETIC 1/16", 1/8", 3/16%, 1/4" .= . "NO BID" = .. BIB'
 BAWARD" iy AWARD*

135 AEROBIC STEPS - 2", 4*, 6", 8" : - NG AW =
136 EXERCISE MATS - INDIVIDUAL . . : 11.87
137 HORSE SHOES - MOLDED RUBBER/STEEL : - 4£.07
138 BOCCI SETS '

20.00




Adopted

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

I RESOLUTION#205

 APPOINTS ADDITIONAL MEMBERSHIP TO
THE RIVERHEAD HAMLET STUDY TASK FORCE

| WUN LMAN PRUSINOWSKI  oprERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION
WAS SECONDED BY _ COUNCILMAN STARK

1 mﬁAs THIS TOWN BOARD BY RESOLUTION #130, DATED FEBRUARY 21, 1995
[ AOINTED MEMBERS TO SERVE ON THE RIVERHEAD HAMLET STUDY TAK FORCE;

_;_;.;-_':"'I‘HEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED THAT THE FOLLOWING INDIVIDUALS ARE
BY NAMED AS ADDITIONAL MEMBERS OF THE RIVERHEAD HAMLET STUDY

. CAROLYN LUNDEN
(CAROLYN KEMPERMANN, ALTERNATE)
- (JOAN MARSHALL, ALTERNATE)

PLANNING DIRECTOR.

The Vote
Gilliam Yu_e._/ﬂo...._
Creighton  Yes _L_ No___
Stak Yﬂm‘{ No
Pusinowsd  Yes .~ No___
The Resolution Is therefore
dectared duly adopted



.‘ S 15 ABSTRACT #11-95 MARCH 9, 1995 (TBM 3/21/95)
m el 9 1 IL A‘:jli. YV ORS fered the following resolution, which was "MW-SIAEK
RESOLVED, that the SUPERVISOR be and is hereby authorized to pay the following:
B RNt O OUNT S S ettt et nonetstsesttssestsetsssTOTAL S sses0000s
s o1 . #54,907.14
s St $0.00
L DRI T st $o.00
¢ POLICE ATHLETIC LEAGUE 004 e 30.00 ¢
E el Fadby 005 E ¥663.75 E
+ RECREATION PROGRAM 006 « $310.00 ¢
. SENTOR WOTRITION 178 COURCIL a7 b P
. DA TROGUN T 5 TR
+ TSGR BULLOING TR 55 * TN
. TEGaT T . TR
. VTR o T 055 06
. TETATR T TAIRTEARCE 3 . T
e TTEi TRIIE TR
« TEVORE 5 GOBNGE SOLLESTIoN 5% T T
. TR TIoRT ; 116 E 30,00 E
« TORLIE TAREENG T . 32,321.64 ¢
+ SOSTRESS DORCVBENTS DISTRICT 118 ¢ T
_ . TO R URBAN DV CoRS TRUST A7 5 . ¥0.00 E
O 53 . ¥730.37
'. + WOSPTTALIZATION SELF TNSURANCE 7T . $0.00 »
. ' 5 RISK RETENTION FOND 175 E ¥9.00 ¢
* UNENPLOYMENT INSURANCE FUND 176 $0.00 o
'- 4 MAIN STREET REHAB PROGRAM 177 $0.00 +
i E REVOLVING LOAN PROGRAM 178 E Joo0
* RESIDENTIAL RERAB in ¥600.00
i E DISCRETIONARY/SMALL CITIES T80 f0.00 ¢
_+ CDBG CONSORTIUM ACCOUNT 181 ¢ 25,00 ¢
E URBAN DEVEL CORP WORKING 183 ¢ $0.00
» RESTORE LTI $0.00 *
E PUBLIC PARKING DEBT LT ¥o.00 *
* SEWER DISTRICT DEBT 382 ¢ $o.00 °
- * WATER DEBT 383 : $0.00 :
E'Fm FUND DEBT SERVICE LTI jo.00 J
* SCAVANGER WASTE DISTRICT DEST 385 ¢ $0.00 * U
¢ TOWN RALL CAPITAL PROJECTS tg o 18,043.95 ¢ m
E EIGHT RUNDRED SERIES w8 » .00 °
* WATER INPROVEMENT CAP. PROJECT 209 ¢ 10,00 ¢ eyl
o CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS 41 E 1000 * Q
E. caxve N SR $o.00 O
* TENIGRS WELPING SENIORS S 580 U
: EISEP 454 : $89 .88 :
* SCAVANGER WASTE CAP PROJECT s . i <
¢ WNUNICIPAL FURL FUSD 635 : $6,431.11 :
» WUNICIPAL GARAGE €6 ERLEFRE T
oS T AT T . TS5 o
: SPECIAL TROST 736 : $0.00 :
E m VASTE s ¢ ¥8,028.00
¢ PAYROLL CLEARING ACCOUNT 358 ° .00 *
. CENTRAL CLEARING ACCOUNT W e 1900 ¢
e e ' 5 $215,503.60 ¢
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ABSTRACT #12-95 MANCH 16, 1995 (Tnm 1/21/95) COUNC" I‘AN
_ oftered the following resolution, which was secondad by | : tSTARK
hoe 'mm that the SUNERVISOR be and is hereby authorized to pay the follaw!rtqr

' .uu.aaoacaaadoaacmauadooaaana.ncao:naaaaa.uogacaoaooaamabs.,.....,,, .

:Tn TOIWN 01 $394,277.78

£ TanRIRG NEYER | 002 ¢ $0.00 +

L e ; G5 s 5o

: FOLICE ATHLETIC LEAGUE i 7000 p

i L e 4 : *

f TEEN CENTER nas f0.00 ¢
E FECREATION TROGRAM no& . 77,180 40 :

: immn mnwrfmn SITE COUNCIL 007 E $0.00 E

‘ D.A.R.E. FPROGRAN FIIND ] o0nR ¢ f0.00 ¢

E CHILD CARE RUIT,DING FUND 505 s Ty
_'.:.-'-nzwnv* e T = i FE3, 390 .

' VATER A T T .

’ = K L] R |

. lm AIR & WATNTENANCE _ L .00 ¢

' FEWER 5 Tl $27,765.59 ¢

* WEFUSE £ GARPAGE COLLECTION 715 ¢ TR LN
i Emw LIGHTING 7iF . R SE R

: PURLIC PARKING 117 ; $2,044. .77 :

-:‘.ﬁfm«q TNTROVEMENTS DISTRICT LA 70.00 E
: T6.R. URNAN DEV CORF TRUST A/ | ELAE §9.00 A

4 WORKER"8 COMPENSATION FUND I . f0.00 *

! WOSFITALIZATION SELF INSURANCE 174 ¢ .00 *

_:._ﬂ'ai." RETENTTON FOUND 175 E fo.00 *

: wm.omm TNSURANCF. FUND | 176 : :.n.oo :

-'i'-"m'smnn RENAR PROGRAM B $0.00 .

g REVOLVING LOAN PROGRAN 178 ¢ f2.508.21 ¢

_ : !&#qi_ﬁgﬂrm. REAR _ i 179 : $0.00 :
i DIGCRETTONARY/SHALL CITIES 150 ¢ $0.00 ¢
| :Fn'iccwmnw ACCOUNT . L F R

:m"" DRVEL CORF WORKING LI fo.00

: RESTORK 1rd : t$0.00 :

. mr,rc PARKING DERT —anl . 000 *

: m DISTRICT DERT 382 : g0.00 :

! WATER DRRT ' ELE .00 ¢
o :mm FOND DERT SERVICE : L fo.00

. -mmmn WASTE DISTRICT DERT s f0.00 ¢ v
/ : %_mw CAPITAT, FROJFCTS iof ptaer oy _

ML TINDRED SERTES fois e CELRLLI m
g+ iﬂm IMTROVEMENT CAF. PROECT L g o l §
T TRITTON CAFTTAL THTROVEIIENTS L et ¢ '

:ﬁ'ﬁr _ : _ o f6.50 a
| :m SFRVICES CLE I e O _
e it WRLFTIG SENTORS _— 53 * #3055 3% ¢ '

:m 54 : £1.157.212 : v
:mm WABTE AP rwooger 490 ¢ e (
s ; BoMG T .

. # L

$ CEL A §i.5av.01 ¢

il 3 A #415.100. 70 :"

575 E fo.00

i ‘ i P L L

CE T fa.no ¢

: *

s E11] ’ T §0_00 :
’ §i.04n 357 A1 ¢

: ‘




Adopted

Town of Riverhead
Resolution # 207

ERS PORTION OF CALVERTON ET S
|  -TOTHERIVERHEAD PLANNING BO

COUNCH.MAN STARK offered the following resolution,
B COUNCILMAN Pm

| ,:I WHERE.AS the Rlverhcad Town Board is in receipt of a report of the Calverton Hamlet
3:._.'- Study Task Force recommending certain changes to the Industrial A Zoning Use District;

e
'''''''

| WHEREAS the Town Board desires to proceed with review of these amendments,

!l NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Riverhead Town Board hereby
4 authorizes the Town Clerk to refer the Industrial Lands Chapter of the Calverton Hamlet
' Study to the Riverhead Planning Board for its report and recommendation.

The Vote
Giliam Yes N
Stark Yes - No___
Prusinowsd Yes L~ No___

ﬂwnmionlsmm
declared duly adopted

361



FAEa8e Bea “19BA of 'Febh. 7 19
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Resolution was tabled and adopted Marcﬁegi?§995 362

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

Resolution #105

| ACCEPTS RESIGNATION OF BRUCE STUKE AND APPOINTS
| MEMBER TO THE BOARD OF ASSESSMENT REVIEW

|  COURCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI offered he following resolution,
mhms seconded by COUNCILMAN STARK.

*f;ﬁﬁunznnns, Bruce Stuke has tendered his resignation from the
| of Assessment Review, thereby creating a vacancy of an

; igé§§d term; and

:gfngEREAS, Richard X. Park has expressed an interest in
ing on said board.

|  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Board hereby

~ [®epts the resignation of Bruce Stuke and appoints Richard X.
|tk to the Board of Assessment Review to fill the unexpired term
 |‘sated by said resignation, which term shall expire on September
|1 1995 and o | il

|  BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is

|¥8by directed to forward a certified copy of this resolution to
‘thard X. pPark, the Board of Assessment Review and the

fé;f%?;“g Department.

| COUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI offered the above resolution to be brought off the
. m& w was seconded by mm smnx_ | .
| COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM voted "No". Councilwoman Gilliam stated that no dis-

| ¥8ion was held at work session, and no information was provided on any individuals
{®lified for the position.

|  COUNCILMAN CREIGHTON, YES; COUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI,YES; COUNCILMAN STARK,YES.

i 5 'nle resolution was therefore declared duly adopted. ThO V ote



riease see 1YBC of Regular T.B. Meeting of Feb.7, 1995
Resolution was tabled and adopted March 21, 1995 363

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
Resolution #106

ACCEPTS RESIGNATION OF BERNADETTE TROYAN AND APPOINTS
MEMBER TO THE BOARD OF ASSESSMENT REVIEW

- COUNCILMAN STARK offered he following resolution, which

| was seconded by co’@jn.m PRUSINOWSKI.

f WHEREAS, Berngdette Troyan has tendered her resignation
{ from the Board of Assessment Review, thereby creating a vacancy
o! an unexpired term; and

1 WHEREAS, Judy O’Connell has expressed an interest in
nrving on said board.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Board hereby
aecepts the resignation of Bernadette Troyan and appoints Judy
| 0'Connell to the Board of Assessment Review to fill the unexpired
| term created by said resignation, which term shall expire on

| Beptember 30, 1995; and |

{  BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is
hereby directed to forward a certified copy of this resolution to
| Judy O’Connell, the Board of Assessment Review and the Accounting

Dipartmant ‘
g COUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI offered the above resolution to be
}glmﬂught off the table and was seconded by COUNCILMAN STARK.

W | COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM voted "No" for the same reasons stated
aﬁyﬁﬁnlnesolut1on $105. Councilman Creighton, yes, Prusinowski, yes,
sﬁ&rk, yes.

' The resolutlon was thereupon declared duly adopted as amended.

Glliam Vn___, No_u_
Creighon  Yes e

mmﬂ\'u.rm

_ The Resolution Is therefore
mdulvadamd
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' g _ TOWN OF RIVERHEAD .; e
U pted Poalugaen f 140 W W

March 21, 1995

| ATHORIZES SUPERVISOR TO EXECUTE AGREEMENT WITH THE RIVE.HEAD
BUSINESS IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT MANAGEMENT ASSOCIATION, INC.

| COUNCILMAN STARK
0 o _ |
| seconded by __ COUNCILMAN PRUSINOWSKI

| ; _ﬂHER.EAS, Article 19-A of the !. General Municipal Law of the

[tste of New York authorizes municipalities, including Towns, to
|#tablish business improvement districts; and

offered the following resolution which

WHEREAS, by Local Law 2 of 1991, the Town has established
.~ Riverhead  Business Improvement District  Management
jociation, Inc. and accepted its Plan to provide services for
 District; and

. WHEREAS, said Plan as adopted, establishes the Riverhead
iness Improvement District Management Association, Inc. as the
for-profit corporation with which the town shall contract for

provision of administrative services necessary to carry out
e District Plan. |

»

~ THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that in consideration of the
ovisions of the Plan and the authority granted to the Busiqess
drovement District by the Law, the Town Board hereby authorizes
cting Supervisor to execute a contract between the_Town‘of
ad and the Riverhead Business Improvement District
ment Association, Inc. for the provision of administrative
es by the Riverhead Business Improvement District
ment Association, Inc. necessary to implement the District

k

"

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk is hereby
:ﬁdnfto forward a certified resolution Ko Barry Barth,
ent, Business Improvement District; Jack Hansen, Financial
istrator; Robert Kozakiewicz, Town A:torney and Andrea
8lss, Community Development Director.

{ .

ILMAN CREIGHTON OFFERED THE ABOVE :
LUTION TO BE BROUGHT OFF THE TABLE, _ :
S SECONDED BY COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM. - .
'GILLIAM,YES,CREIGHTON,YES, PRUSINOWSKI,
YES. | |

ON WAS DECLARED DULY BROUGHT OFF THE

N CREIGHTON OFFERED THE RESOLUTION, WHICH
BY COUNCILWOMAN GILLIAM. =

jgiiiian: yes,'Creighton. yes, Prusinowski,

K, yes. i |
ION WAS DECLARED DULY ADOPTED.

Please see page 250 of Regular T.B. Meeting

1995 64

,.ted




