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NINUTES OF A NEETIN~ OF THE TowN BoARD oF THE TowN OF RIVERHEAD 
HEL D IN THE TowN HALL oN TuESDAy~ DECENBER 19~ 1961 AT 9:30 A. N. 

PRESENT : 

WILLIAN J. LEONARD~ SUPERVISOR 

BRUNO F. ZALOGAJ JR. 
THonAs R. CosTELLO~ JusTICES oF THE PEACE 

ELNER A. STOTZKY 
ULICK BELL~ JR.~ CouNCILNEN 

ALso PRESENT: JAcOB HARDING~ TowN ATTORNEY AND THADDEUS ZENBKO~ 
SUPERINTENDENT OF HIGHWAYS. 

JUST ICE CoSTELLO OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SE COND ED BY COUNC ILNAN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT THE NINUTES OF THE NEETING oF THE TowN BoARD 
HELD ON DECENBER 5~ 1961 BE APPROVED AS SUBNITTED. 

THE VoTE---CouNc IL11AN BELL, YEs~ CouNc ILNAN STOTZKY_, YEs~ 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLO~ YEs~ AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD~ 
YEs. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BIDS FOR ONE (1) 1962 CAR 
FOR USE OF THE POLICE DEPARTNENT WERE OPENED AS FOLLOWS; NET PRICE 
INCL UDES TRADE-IN ALLOWANCE ON ONE (1) 1961 CHEVROLET. 

RIVERHEAD NoToRs~ INc.-------------$1668.00 
CRABTREE-O'KEEFE CHEVROLET~INC.----$1400.00 

BID S ORDERED FILED. 
JUS TICE ZALOGA OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 

SECONDED BY Co UNCI LNAN BELL. 
RESOLVED THAT THE BID FOR ONE CAR FOR USE OF THE POLICE DEPART-

11ENT BE AND IT IS HEREBY AWARDED TO CRABTREE-0 1 KEEFE CHEVROLET~ INC.~ 
RIVERHEAD, N.Y., FOR ONE (1) 1962 CHEVROLET AT A NET COST OF $1400. ~ 
SUBJECT TO ITS BID AND SPECIFICATION FORN SUBNITTED, DATED DECENBER 
14, 1961. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILNAN BELL~ YEs~ CouNCILNAN STOTZKY~ YEs~ 
JusT ICE ZALOGA, YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLO_, YEs~ AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD~ 
YEs. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

A CONNUNICATION DATED DECENBER 6~ 1961 FRON THE LONG IsLAND 
LIGHTING CONPANY WAS SUBNITTED TO THE BOARD ADVISING THAT THEY 
HAVE INSTALLED INPROVED STREET LIGHTING IN THE SOUTH JANESPOR T 
LIGHTING DISTRICT AS PER REQUEST OF THE BOARD. 

CONNUNICATION ORDERED FILED. 

STATENENT OF TAX COLLECTIONS DATED DECENBER 18, 1961 FRON TAX 
RECEIVER, CHARLES ALLEN HoRTON, WAS SUBNITTED TO THE BOARD AND 
ORDERED PLACED ON FILE. 
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AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BIDS FOR TRANSIT-NIX CONCRETE 
FOR USE OF THE HIGHWAY DEPARTNENT FOR THE YEAR 1962 WERE OPENED AS 
FOLLOWS : 

SuFFOLK GENENT PRODUCTS 
A. 1-2-3 NIX~PRICE PER CUBIC YARD-------$14.50 
B. 1-2-4 NIX~PRICE PER CUBIC YARD-------$13.50 
G. 1-2-3 HI-EARLY !fiX~ PRICE PER CUBIC YD$15. 40 

SUFFOLK SAND & STONE CORP. 
A. 1-2-3 lfiX~PRICE PER CUBIC YARD-------$15. 75 
B. 1-2-4 NIX~PRICE PER CUBIC YARD-------$15 . 00 
C. 1-2-3 HI-EARLY !fiX~ PRICE PER CUBIC YD$16. 75 

RIVERHEAD REDI Nix GoRP. 
A. 1-2-3 JfiX~PRICE PER CUBIC YARD-------$15.50 
B. 1-2-4 NIX~PRICE PER CUBIC YARD-------$14.50 
C. 1-2-3 HI-EARLY JfiX~PRICE PER CUBIC YD$16.00 

BIDS ORDERED FILED. 
COUNCILNAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 

SECONDED BY GouNCILl'fAN BELL. 
RESOLVED THAT THE BID FOR TRANSIT-NIX CONCRETE FOR USE OF THE 

HIGHWA Y DEPARTl'fENT BE AND IT IS HEREBY AWARDED TO SUFFOLK CEl'fENT 
PRODUCTS~ ROUTE 58~ RIVERHEAD~ AS FOLLOWS: 

A. 1-2-3 NIX~PRICE PER CUBIC YARD--------$14.50 
B. 1 -2-4 NIX~ PRICE PER CUBIC YARD--------$13. 50 
G. 1-2-3 HI-EARLY NIX~PRICE PER cuBIC YD.$15.40 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT SAID BID BE SUBJECT TO THE BID AND SPECI­
FICAT ION FORl'f SUBl'fiTTED BY SUFFOLK CEl'fENT PRODUCTS, DATED DECENBER 
15, 1961. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILNAN BELL, YEs, GouNCILl'fAN STOTZKY~ YEs~ 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLO~ YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YEs . THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

CoUNCILl'fAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CoUNCILl'fAN BELL. 

RESOLVED THAT THE DESIGNATION OF WILLIAN J . LEONARD, SUPERVISOR 
OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD, TO SERVE AS PoLICE GOl'fl'fiSSIONER OF THE 
RIVERHEAD TowN PoLICE DEPARTl'fENT, PURSUANT TO SEcTION 150, PARA­
GRAPH 2 OF THE TowN LAW BY RESOLUTION OF THE SAID TOWN BOARD OF 
APRIL 4, 1961, BE AND THE SANE IS HEREBY REVOKED. 

THE VoTE- -- GouNCILNAN BELL, YEs, CouNCILNAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
JusT ICE ZALOGA, No, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD~ 
No. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

COUNCILNAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CouNCILlfAN BELL. 

RESOLVED THAT THE TowN CLERK BE AND HE is HEREBY AUTHORIZED 
TO ADVERTISE FOR SEALED BIDS FOR A CRAWLER TRACTOR WITH BLADE 
FOR USE AT THE RIVERHEAD TOWN Dul'fP. 

SPECIFICATIONS TO BE PREPARED BY COUNCILJfAN STOTZKY. 
BIDS TO BE RETURNABLE UP TO 10 A.fl. ON JANUARY 2~ 1962. 
THE VoTE---CouNCILl'fAN BELL, YEs, CouNCILNAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
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JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR 
LEONARD, YEs. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

CoUNCIL/fAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CouNCILHAN BELL. 

RESOLVED THAT RICHARD w. JOHNSON, RIVERHEAD, BE AND HE IS 
HEREBY APPOINTED A HEHBER OF THE RIVERHEAD TOWN RECREATION 
COHHISSION FOR A FIVE YEAR TERH, COHHENCING JANUARY 1, 1962. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILl1AN BELL, YEs, CouNCILHAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
J usTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTicE CosTELLo, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR 
LEONARD, YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY 
ADOPTED. 

ELECTION INSPECTOR's REPORT OF THE ANNUAL ELECTION FOR FIRE 
DISTRICT COHJ1ISSIONER, WADING RIVER FIRE DISTRICT, WAS SUB11ITTED 
TO THE BoARD AND ORDERED PLACED ON FILE. 

ELECTION INSPECTOR'S REPORT OF THE ANNUAL ELECTION FOR FIRE 
DISTRICT COHJ1ISSIONER, RIVERHEAD FIRE DISTRICT, WAS SUBHITTED TO 
THE BoARD AND ORDERED PLACED ON FILE. 

A connuNICATION DATED DECE11BER 13, 1961 FR011 THE SuFFOLK 
COUNTY AGRICULTURAL DEPARTHENT RELATIVE TO THE ACQUISITION OF 
TREES FROJ1 THE NEW YoRK STATE CONSERVATION DEPART11ENT WAS SUB­
l1ITTED TO THE BoARD AND ORDERED FILED. 

A COHHUNICATION DATED DECEHBER 4, 1961 FROH THE LONG ISLAND 
S IGNAL CORPORATION RELATIVE TO THE INSTALLATION OF A TRAFFIC 
LIGHT AT THE INTERSECTION OF COURT STREET AND OsBORNE AVENUE 
WAS SUB11ITTED TO THE BoARD AND ORDERED FILED. 

COUNCILJ1AN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY JUSTICE Z ALOGA. 

RESOLVED THAT THE SuPERVISOR BE AUTFIORIZED TO TRANSFER THE 
sun oF $11,433.25 FRon THE GENERAL TowN CuRRENT SuRPLus AccouNT 
TO THE FOLLOWING SUBSIDIARY 

TowN HALL/OTHER EXPENsEs 
ACCOUNTS AS FOLLOWS : 

TowN HALL/INsuRANCE/FIRE & LIABILITY 
TowN HALL/RETIREl1ENT-TowN SHARE 
PuBLIC SAFETY/DoG WARDEN ExPENSES 

$ 368. 61 
6,083.39 
4,809.47 

1 71. 78 
$11,433.25 

THE VoTE---CouNCILHAN BELL, YEs, CouNCILl1AN STOTZKY, YEs, 
JusT I CE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR 
LEONARD, YEs. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY 
ADOPTED. 

THE F OLLOWING RESOLUTION ADOPTED BY THE PLANNING BoARD ON 
DECEJ1BER 13, 1961 WAS SUBHI TTED TO THE BOARD. 

" WHEREAS, A PUBLIC HEARING FOR THE APPROVAL OF A PLAT, 
SHOWING A REALTY SUBDIVISION KNOWN AS "ROANOKE HOHES, 
SECTION II", LOCATED AT 11IDDLE RoAD, RIVERHEAD, NEw YoRK, 



FILED BY RoANOKE HonEs~ INc.~ 79 LoNG NEcK BouLEVARD~ 
FLANDERs~ RIVERHEAD~ NEw YoRK~ WAS HELD oN DEcEHBER 13~ 
1961~ AT 7:30 P./1.~ BY THIS PLANNING BoARD AFTER ADVER­
TISEHENT IN THE NEWS-REVIEW PUBLISHED ON DECEHBER 7~ 
1961~ AND 

WHEREAS~ NO ONE APPEARED TO OBJECT OR TO PROTEST 
AGAINST APPROVING THE SUBDIVISION~ AND 

WHEREAS~ THIS BoARD FINDS THE suBDIVISION TO BE 
CONSISTENT WITH THE GROWTH AND DEVELOPNENT OF THE 
ToWN IN THAT AREA~ AND 

WHEREAS~ THis BoARD DID FIX oN 11AY 24~ 1961~ THE 
AHOUNT OF PERFORHANCE BOND FOR THE CONSTRUCTION OF 
ROADS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS IN THE 
"RuLES AND REGULATIONS FOR THE DEDICATION OF A PUBLIC 
HIGHWAY IN THE TowN oF RIVERHEAD~ SuFFOLK CouNTY~ NEw 
YoRK" IN THE AHOUNT OF $26~ 000 AND DID SPECIFY THAT 
SAID BOND SHALL NOT RUN FOR A TERN IN EXCESS OF 2 
YEARS~ AND 

WHEREAS~ THE DEVELOPER HAS PROCEEDED IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH RESOLUTION OF J1AY 24~ 1961~ TO HAVE CREATED AN 
EXTENSION TO THE RIVERHEAD WATER DISTRICT AND TO THE 
RIVERHEAD SEWER DISTRICT~ WHICH EXTENSIONS INCLUDE 
THE PROPERTY SHOWN ON NAP OF "RoANOKE HONES, SECTION 
II"~ AND 

WHEREAS, THIS BoARD oN NovEHBER 21~ 1961~ GRANTED 
PERHISSION TO THE DEVELOPER TO ELININATE THE ROUNDED 
CORNER AT THE NORTHEASTERLY INTERSECTION OF J OYCE 
DRIVE AND ROANOKE AVENUE~ PROVIDED THAT THE DEVELOPER 
DEPOSIT IN ESCROW WITH THE ToWN AN ANOUNT OF $300. TO 
ALLOW THE TOWN~ AFTER RECEIVING DEED OF DEDICATION FOR 
J OYCE DRIVE~ TO START PROCEEDINGS FOR THE ACQUISITION 
OF THE REQUIRED LAND TO ROUND AFORESAID CORNER AND 
THAT THE DEVELOPER SHALL PAY ANY ADDITIONAL AHOUNT 
REQUIRED FOR CONDEHNATION PROCEEDINGS AND, IF THE 
COST IS LESS, THE DIFFERENCE TO BE REFUNDED BY THE 
TowN TO THE DEVELOPER~ 

NOW
1 

THEREFORE~ BE IT RESOLVED THAT THis BoARD 
APPROVES THE PLAT FOR FILING IN THE OFFICE OF THE 
CLERK oF SuFFOLK CouNTY AND DIRECTs THE SEcRETARY oF 
THIS BoARD TO AFFIX HIS SIGNATURE TO THE ENDORCEHENT 
PRESCRIBED BY THIS BoARD UPON THE PLAN~ PROVIDED 
THAT 

(1) THE DEVELOPER HAS EITHER CONPLETED THE ROADS 
IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE CONSTRUCTION SPECIFICATIONS 
SET FORTH IN THE "RuLES AND REGULATIONS FOR THE 
DEDICATI ON OF A PUBLIC HIGHWAY IN THE TowN OF RIVER­
HEAD, SuFFOLK CouNTY~ NEw YoRK, " oR ALTERNATIVELY 
FILED A PERFORNANCE BOND IN AN AHOUNT OF $26~000 
WHICH BOND SHALL RUN FOR A TERN NOT EXCEEDING 2 YEARS 
AND AS SET FORTH IN SECTION 277 OF ARTICLE 16 OF THE 

T o wN LAw:-
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" ..• SUCH PERFORnANCE BOND SHALL BE ISSUED 
BY A BONDING OR SURETY COnPANY APPROVED BY THE 
TOWN BOARD OR BY THE OWNER WITH SECURITY ACCEP­
TABLE TO THE TOWN BoARD~ AND SHALL ALSO BE 
APPROVED BY SUCH TOWN BoARD AS TO FORn~ SUFFI­
CIENCY AND nANNER OF EXECUTION"; 
(2) THE DEVELOPER SHALL HAVE SUBniTTED A PETITION 

CREATING A PARK DISTRICT ENCOnPASSING THE AREA SHOWN ON 
nAP OF "RoANOKE HonES~ SECTION I"~ WHICH !1AP WAS DULY 
APPROVED BY THIS BoARD AND FILED IN THE OFFICE OF THE 
CLERK OF SuFFOLK CouNTY~ AND ENC0!1PASSING THE AREA 
SHOWN ON nAP OF "RoANOKE HonEs~ SEcTION II"~ AND FURTHER 
THE DEVELOPER SHALL HAVE DELIVERED SinULTANEOUSLY WITH 
THE PETITION A DEED WITHOUT ANY l10NETARY CONSIDERATION 
TO THE TOWN BOARD~ ACTING AS THE GOVERNING BODY~ OF THE 
PROPOSED PARK DISTRICT FOR THE AREA DESIGNATED ON THE 
l1AP OF "RoANOKE HonES, SECTION "~ AS "PARK AND PLAY­
GROUND "; AND 

(3) THE DEVELOPER HAS DEPOSITED IN ESCROW WITH THE 
TOWN BoARD AN AnOUNT OF $300 FOR THE ACQUISITION OF 
LAND INCLUDING ALL LEGAL SERVICES AND PROCEEDING EX­
PENSES~ IF NECESSARY~ TO ROUND THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF 
JOYCE DRIVE AND RoANOKE AVENUE AFTER THE TI11E THE ROADS 
SHOWN oN nAP OF "RoANOKE HonEs~ SEcT ION II", HAVE BEEN 
DEDICATED AS PUBLIC HIGHWAYS~ AND THE DEVELOPER SHALL 
FURTHER COVENANT WITH THE TOWN THAT HE WILL PAY ANY 
ADDITIONAL COST FOR THIS ACQUISITION~ AND THE TOWN 
SHALL COVENANT WITH THE DEVELOPER THAT THEY WILL RE­
FUND ANY nONIES IF THE ACQUISITION COSTS LESS THAN 
$300~ AND 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THIS BoARD STRONGLY 
RECOl1nENDS THAT THE TowN BoARD AT THE TI11E OF DEDICA­
TION oF THE ROADS IN "RoANOKE HonEs~ SECTION II"~ 
PROCEED WITH AFORESAID ACQUISITION OF LAND AT JOYCE 
DRIVE AND RoANOKE A VENUE~ AND 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE BOND FOR THE 
CONSTRUCTION OF THE ROADS SHALL REnAIN IN EFFECT 
UNTIL SUCH TinE AS NOTIFIED BY THE PLANNING BoARD 
THAT THE InPROVEnENTS HAVE BEEN l1ADE TO THIS BoARD'S 
SATISFACTION OR UNTIL SUCH TinE AS THE ROADS SHALL 
HAVE BEEN DEDICATED TO THE TOWN AND ACCEPTED BY THE 
TowN BoARD AND LAID ouT BY THE SuPERINTENDENT OF 
HIGHWAYS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE "RULES AND REGULA­
TIONS FOR THE DEDICATION OF A PUBLIC HIGHWAY IN THE 
TowN oF RivERHEAD~ SuFFOLK CouNTY~ NEw YoRK~ " ADOPTED 
DECEnBER 2~ 1958~ AND FURTHER THAT THIS BOND nAY BE 
USED IN LIEU OF SECURING AND FURNISHING ANOTHER BOND 
REQUIRED IN PARAGRAPH 12 UNDER GENERAL REQUIREnENTS 
OF AFORESAID "RULES AND REGULATIONS FOR THE DEDICATION 
oF A PuBLIC HIGHWAY IN THE TowN OF RivERHEAD, SuFFOLK 

CouNTY~ NEw YoRK, " AND 
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BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT A COPY OF THIS 
RESOLUTION BE FORWARDED TO THE TowN BOARD OF THE 
TowN OF RIVERHEAD AND TO RoANOKE HoNEs~ INc.~ AND 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THIS BoARD REQUEST 
THE TOWN BoARD TO NOTIFY THIS BoARD OF ITS APPROVAL 
OF THE PERFORNANCE BOND AS REQUIRED BY SECTION 277 
OF THE TOWN LAW~ AND TO NOTIFY THE PLANNING BOARD 
THAT THE DEVELOPER HAS DEPOSITED THE $300. IN 
ESCROW FOR ACQUISITION OF LAND AT THE NORTHEAST 
CORNER OF JOYCE DRIVE AND RoANOKE AVENUE~ AND THAT 
THE DE VELOPER HAS PRESENTED THE PETITION FOR THE 
CREATION OF A PARK DISTRICT AND THE DELIVERANCE 
OF THE DEED FOR 

11
PARK AND PLAYGROUND 11 AREAS AS 

HERETOFOR DESCRIBED. 11 

RESOLUTION ORDERED FILED. 
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END. 

ATTORNEY RoBERT L. TOOKER APPEARED BEFORE THE BoARD IN BEHALF 
oF RoANOKE HonEs~ INc.~ RELATIVE TO THIS NATTER. 

A BOND IN THE ANOUNT OF $26~000.~ RoANOKE HonEs~ INc.~ As 
PRINCIPAL~ CoNTINENTAL CAsUALTY CoNPANY~ As SuRETY~ AND THE TowN 
OF RIVERHEAD~ AS OBLIGEE~ WAS SUBNITTED TO THE BOARD AND ORDERED 
FILED. 

A CHECK IN THE ANOUNT OF $300. FRON ROANOKE HONES~ INC.~ TO THE 
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD WAS SUBNITTED TO THE BOARD AND ORDERED TO BE HELD 
IN ESCROW BY THE SUPERVISOR. 

A PETITION TO CREATE A PARK DISTRICT~ RoANOKE HonEs PARK~ WAS 
SUBNITTED TO THE BoARD AND ORDERED FILED. 

A DEED OF DEDICATION TO A PARK AREA IN ROANOKE HoNES WAS SUBNITT­
ED TO THE BOARD AND ORDERED FILED. 

CoUNCILNAN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CouNCILNAN STOTZKY. 

- X 
IN THE NATTER 

OF THE 
CREA TION oF RoANOKE HoNES PARK IN THE 
TowN oF RIVERHEAD~ CouNTY OF SuFFOLK 
AND STATE oF NEw YoRK. 

- X 

ORDER CALLING 
PUBLIC HEARING 

JANUARY 2~ 1962 

WHEREAS~ A WRITTEN PETITION~ DATED THE 18TH DAY OF DECENBER~ 
1961~ IN DUE FORN AND CONTAINING THE REQUIRED SIGNATURES~ HAS BEEN 
PRESENTED TO AND FILED WITH THE ToWN BoARD OF THE TOWN OF RIVER­
HEA D~ SuFFOLK CouNTY~ NEw YoRK~ FOR THE ESTABLISHNENT OF A PARK 
DISTRICT IN SAID TowN~ TO BE BOUNDED AND DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS: 

ALL THAT CERTAIN PLOT~ PIECE OR PARCEL OF 
LAND~ SITUATE~ LYING AND BEING AT RIVERHEAD~ 
TowN oF RIVERHEAD~ CouNTY OF SuFFOLK AND 
STATE OF NEW YoRK~ BOUNDED AND DESCRIBED AS 
FOLLOWS: 
C0J1J1ENCING AT A POINT FORNED BY THE INTER­
SECTION OF THE NORTHERLY LINE OF J1IDDLE ROAD 

WITH THE WESTERLY LINE OF NADEL DRIVE AND 



RUNNING THENCE IN A GENERALLY NORTHERLY DIRECTION 
ALONG THE WESTERLY LINE OF NADEL DRIVE AND ALONG 
THE ARC OF A CURVE TO THE LEFT HAVING A RADIUS OF 
27.73 FEET A DISTANCE OF 44.69 FEET TO A POINT; 
THENCE ALSO ALONG THE WESTERLY LINE OF NADEL DRIVE 
AND ALONG THE ARC OF A CURVE TO THE LEFT HAVING A 
RADIUS OF 370.08 FEET A DISTANCE OF 293.78 FEET 
TO A POINT; THENCE SoUTH 510 21 1 30" WEST ALONG 
LAND NOW OR FORHERLY OF YouSIK A DISTANCE OF 170.22 
FEET TO A POINT; THENCE NORTH 290 12' WEST ALONG 
LAND NOW OR FORHERLY OF YoUSIK~ BuGDIN~ WELLS~ 
DoROWSKI~ GRABOWSKIJ EvERs~ WoLYNIECJ RusAKJ SIDORKOJ 
STATUKEWICZ~ J1ADZELAN AND OTHERS A DISTANCE OF 
1564.98 FEET TO THE SOUTHERLY LINE OF A PROPOSED 
ROAD KNOWN AS JOYCE DRIVE AND A HONUHENT; THENCE 
SOUTH 69° 10' 40" WEST ALONG LAND NOW OR FORHERLY 
OF J1ADZELAN A DISTANCE OF 212.18 FEET; THENCE ALONG 
THE ARC OF A CURVE TO THE LEFT WITH A RADIUS OF 
24.22 FEET A DISTANCE OF 38.81 FEET TO THE EASTERLY 
LINE OF ROANOKE AVENUE AND A HONUHENT~ THENCE NORTH 
220 35 1 WEST ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE OF ROANOKE 
AVENUE A DISTANCE OF 75.02 FEET TO LAND NOW OR 
FORHERLY OF ANDERSON AND A HONUHENT; THENCE NoRTH 
690 13' 50" EAST ALONG SAID LAND NOW OR FORHERLY 
OF ANDERSON A DISTANCE OF 835.80 FEET TO LAND NOW 
OR FORHERLY OF J1cKAY~· THENCE SOUTH 20° 33' 10" 
EAST ALONG SAID LAND NOW OR FORHERLY OF J1cKAY A 
DISTANCE OF 1563.48 FEET TO A HONUHENT; THENCE 
SOUTH 210 31 1 50" EAST ALSO ALONG SAID LAND NOW 
OR FORHERLY OF J1cKAY A DISTANCE OF 145.62 FEET 
To A POINT; THENCE SouTH 760 08' 10" WEsT A Dis­
TANCE OF 127.44 FEET TO THE EASTERLY LINE OF NADEL 
DRIVE; THENCE IN A GENERALLY SOUTHERLY DIRECTION 
ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE OF NADEL DRIVE AND ALONG 
THE ARC OF A CURVE TO THE RIGHT HAVING A RADIUS 
OF 420.08 FEET A DISTANCE OF 165.64 FEET; THENCE 
IN A GENERALLY SouTHEASTERLY DIRECTION ALSO ALONG 
THE EASTERLY LINE OF NADEL DRIVE AND ALONG THE 
ARC OF A CURVE TO THE LEFT HAVING A RADIUS OF 
29.95 FEET A DISTANCE OF 45.97 FEET TO THE NORTH­
ERLY LINE OF J1IDDLE ROAD; THENCE NORTH 84° 15 1 50" 
WEsT ALONG THE NoRTHERLY LINE oF 11IDDLE RoAD A 
DISTANCE OF 107.67 FEET TO LAND NOW OR FORHERLY 
OF J1ADZELAN AND THE POINT OR PLACE OF BEGINNING, AND 
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WHEREASJ THE PROPOSED PARK DISTRICT IS TO BE CREATED AT NO EXPENSE 
TO THE ToWN OF RIVERHEADJ AND 

WHEREAS, RoANOKE HonEs, INc. HAS TENDERED TO THIS TowN BoARD A 
DEED OF DEDICATION FOR A PROPOSED PARK AREA WITHIN THE HEREINABOVE 
DESCRIBED PROPOSED PARK DISTRICT~ AND 
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WHEREAS, THE SAID RoANOKE HoHES, INc. HAS OFFERED TO PAY ALL 
EXPENSES OF THE CREATION OF THE SAID PROPOSED PARK DISTRICT, NOW, 
THEREFORE, IT IS HEREBY 

ORDERED, THAT A HEETING OF THE TowN BoARD OF THE SAID TowN OF 
R IVERHEAD SHALL BE HELD AT THE TOWN HALL, 220 ROANOKE AVENUE, ON 
THE 2ND DAY OF JANUARY, 1962 AT 11:00 0 1 CLOCK IN THE FORENOON OF 
THAT DAY TO CONSIDER THE SAID PETITION AND TO HEAR ALL PERSONS 
INTERESTED IN THE SUBJECT THEREOF, CONCERNING THE SANE, AND FOR 
SUCH OTHER ACTION ON THE PART OF SAID ToWN BoARD WITH RELATION TO 
THE SAID PETITION AS NAY BE REQUIRED BY LAW OR PROPER IN THE PRE-
HISES. 
DATED: DECEffBER 19, 1961. 

(SEAL) 

TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 

WILLIAN J . LEONARD 
SuPERVISOR 

THONAS R. COSTELLO 
J USTICE OF THE PEACE 

BRUNO F. ZALOGA, J R. 
J USTICE OF THE PEACE 

ELNER A. STOTZKY 
Co uNc ILNAN 

ULICK BELL JR. 
CoUNCILNAN 

NENBERS OF THE TOWN BOARD OF THE 
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD. 

THE VoTE---CouNciLffAN BELL, YEs, CouNCILffAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs., JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

CoUNCILffAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CouNCILNAN BELL. 

IN THE NATTER 
OF THE 

-x 

APPROVAL OF A CERTAIN SUBDIVISION . 
NAP KNOWN As "RoANOKE HoMEs, 
SECT ION 2

11
• 

-X 

RESOLUTION 
OF 

APPROVAL 

WHEREAS, THE PLANNING BoARD HAS FORWARDED TO THIS TowN BoARD A 
CERTAIN RESOLUTION ADOPTED BY IT ON DECEffBER 13, 1961 IN CONNECTION 
WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE PROPOSED SUBDIVISION PLAT KNOWN AS '~OA­
NOKE HonEs., SECTION 2"_, AND 

WHEREAS, RoBERT L. TooKER, EsQ. HAS APPEARED BEFORE THIS TowN 
BOARD THIS DATE AND HAS REQUESTED FAVORABLE ACTION BY THIS TOWN 
BOARD AND HAS IN CONNECTION THEREWITH TENDERED VARIOUS INSTRUffENTS 
AND A SUN OF ffONEY AS REQUIRED BY THE SAID RESOLUTION, NOW, THERE-

FORE, BE IT 



RESOLVED BY THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD_, IN THE 
COUNTY OF SUFFOLK_, NEW YORK_, AS FOLLOWS: 
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SECTION 1. THE PERFO!il1ANCE BOND OF THE CONTINENTAL CASUALTY 
Col1PANY_, AS SuRETY_, IN THE Al10UNT oF TWENTY-SIX THOUSAND & 00/100 
($26_,000.00) DOLLARS IS APPROVED BY THIS TowN BoARD AS TO FOR11_, 
S UFF I C IENTY AND HANNER OF EXECUTION. 

SECTION 2. THIS TOWN BoARD APPROVES THE CONTINENTAL CASUALTY 
Col1PANY AS suRETY IN AccoRDANCE WITH THE NEw YoRK TowN LAw SECTION 
277_, SUBDIV. 1. 

SECTION 3. THIS TOWN BOARD ACKNOWLEDGES RECEIPT OF A DEED OF 
DEDICATION To A PARK AREA IN RoANOKE Ho11Es DATED DECE11BER 18_, 1961_, 
AND WILL HOLD SAID DEED IN ITS POSSESSION WITHOUT RECORDATION UNTIL 
THE ROANOKE H011ES PARK DISTRICT IS CREATED_, AT WHICH TI11E SAID 
DEED OF DEDICATION WILL BE RECORDED. IN THE EVENT THE SAID PARK 
DISTRICT IS NOT CREATED BEFORE JANUARY 1_, 1963) THE SAID DEED OF 
DEDICATION SHALL BE RETURNED TO ROANOKE H011ES) INC. AND SHALL NOT 
BE RECORDED. 

SECTION 4. THis TowN BoARD ACKNOWLEDGES RECEIPT FR011 RoANOKE 
HonEs_, INc. OF THE sun OF THREE HUNDRED & 00/100 ($300.00) DOLLARS 
WHICH SHALL BE HELD IN ESCROW IN ACCORDANCE WITH A CERTAIN C011nUN­
ICATION OF RoANOKE Ho11ES_, INc. DATED DEcEnBER 19_, 1961 AND FILED 
WITH THE TowN CLERK. 

SECTION 5. THE TOWN ATTORNEY IS DIRECTED TO InnEDIATELY AFTER 
DED ICATION PROCEED TO CONDE11N A GORE PIECE AT THE INTERSECTION OF 
ROANOKE AVENUE AND "JoYCE DRIVE" FOR THE PURPOSE OF ROUNDING SAID 
CORNER. THE EXPENSES OF SAID CONDE11NATION TO BE 11ET FROJ1 THE 
$300 ESCROW DEPOSIT OF RoANOKE Ho11ES_, INc. 

SECTION 6 . THE ToWN CLERK IS DIRECTED TO NOTIFY THE PLANNING 
BoARD THAT THIS TowN BoARD HAS APPROVED THE $26,000 PERFOR11ANCE 
BoND oF RoANOKE HonEs) INc., AS RE QUIRED BY THE NEw YoRK TowN LAw 
SECTION 277_, SUBDIV. J.; THAT RoANOKE Hol1ES., INc. HAS DEPOSITED 
THE SU11 OF $300 IN ESCROW FOR CONDEnNATION OF LAND AT THE NORTH­
EAST CORNER OF "JoYCE DRIVE 11 AND RoANOKE AVENUE.,· THAT RoANOKE 
H011ES, INc. HAS AGREED TO PAY ANY ADDITIONAL EXPENSES INVOLVED 
IN. THE CONDEnNATION OF SAID PARCEL; THAT A PETITION EXECUTED AND 
ACKNOWLEDGED AS REQUIRED BY THE NEw YoRK TowN LAw SECTION 191 HAS 
BEEN FILED WITH THE TowN CLERK, AND THAT RoANOKE Ho11Es_, INc. HAS 
TENDERED A DEED OF DEDICATION FOR A PARK AND PLAYGROUND AREA IN 
RoANOKE Hol1ES DEVELOP11ENT. 

SECTION 7. THIS RESOLUTION SHALL TAKE EFFECT Il111EDIATELY. 
THE ADOPTION OF THE FOREGOING RESOLUTION WAS DULY PUT TO A 

VOTE ON ROLL CALL WHICH RESULTED AS FOLLOWS: 
AYES; WILLIA11 J. LEONARD 

BRUNO F. ZALOGA 
THol1AS R. CosTELLO 
EL11ER A. STOTZKY 
ULICK BELL, JR. 

NOES: NoNE. 
THE RESOLUTION WAS DECLARED UNANI110USLY ADOPTED. 

COUNCIL11AN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CoUNCIL11AN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT THE TowN OF RIVERHEAD LEASE FR011 "ScHEINBERG AND 
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WoLF", RoANOKE AvENUE, RIVERHEAD, N.Y., FOR PARKING PURPOSES, THE 
PROPERTY AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF GRIFFING A VENUE AND SECOND 
STREET, RIVERHEAD, N.J., AT THE ANNUAL RENTAL OF $960.00 FOR A 
PERIOD OF ONE YEAR, EFFECTIVE FEBRUARY 1, 1962, AND FURTHER 

RESOLVED THAT THE SUPERVISOR BE AUTHORIZED AND DIRECTED TO ENTER 
INTO SAID LEASE IN THE NAHE OF THE TOWN AND TO PAY THE CONSIDERA­
TION FOR THE SAHE. 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE TowN CLERK, WITHIN 10 DAYS HEREAFTER , 
SHALL POST AND PUBLISH A NOTICE WHICH SHALL SET FORTH THE DATE OF 
THE ADOPTION OF THIS RESOLUTION AND CONTAIN AN ABSTRACT OF SUCH 
A CT OR RESOLUTION CONCISELY STATING AS HEREIN THE PURPOSE THEREOF 
AND THAT THE SAID RESOLUTION IS SUBJECT TO PERHISSIVE REFERENDUH. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILHAN BELL, YEs, CouNciLHAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
J usTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BIDS FOR GASOLINE FOR POLICE 
VEHICLES FOR THE YEAR 1962 WERE OPENED AS FOLLOWS: 

EAsT IsLAND G.L.F.--------------.19t PER GAL.-HIGH GRADE 
l'fiLLIGAN TRUCK TERHINAL---------.19. 9t " " 

BIDS ORDERED FILED. 
A DISCUSSION WAS HELD RELATIVE TO SAID BIDS. JUSTICE ZALOGA 

STATED THAT CONSIDERATION SHOULD BE GIVEN TO THE USE OF "REGULAR" 
GA SOLINE IN THE POLICE CARS WHICH COULD RESULT IN SUBS~ANTIAL 
S A YINGS. THE TOWN ATTORNEY AND THE CHIEF OF PoLICE STATED THEY 
WERE NOT SATISFIED WITH THE FORH OF THE BID. 

COUNCILHAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY JUSTICE ZALOGA. 

RESOLVED THAT uPoN RECOHHENDA TION oF THE TowN ATTORNEY AND TFlE 
CHIEF OF POLICE THAT ALL BIDS RECEIVED FOR GASOLINE FOR POLICE 
VEHICLES FOR THE YEAR 1962, OPENED AT 10:15 A.H. ON DECEl1BER 19, 
1 961, BE AND THEY ARE HEREBY REJECTED. 

THE VoTE---CouNc ILHAN BELL, YEs, CouNc ILHAN SToTzKY, YEs, 
J usTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS TFlEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

COUNCILHAN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CoUNCILl1AN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT THE TowN CLERK BE AND HE Is HEREBY AUTHORIZED To 
RE-ADYERTISE FOR BIDS FOR GASOLINE FOR TOWN OWNED POLICE VEHICLES 
FOR THE YEAR 1962. 

SPECIFICATION AND BID FORl1 TO BE PREPARED BY THE CHIEF OF 

PoLICE. 
BIDS TO BE RETURNABLE UP TO 10:15 A.H. ON JANUARY 2, 1962. 
THE VoTE---CouNciLHAN BELL, YEs, CouNCILHAN STOTZKY, YEs, 

JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BIDS FOR TIRES FOR PoLICE 
VEHICLES FOR THE YEAR 1962 WERE OPENED AS FOLLOWS: 



VANDYCK & YousiK, INc.-------------$15.26 
NouNTING------No cHARGE 

TRADE-IN--$2.00 PER TIRE UPON 
INSPECTION 
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SuFFOLK CooP. G.L.F.--------------$1 5 .30 TO $1 9 .97 EACH 
NouNTING------No CHARGE 

TRADE-IN--NONE 
BIDS ORDERED FILED. 

JUSTICE ZALOGA OFFERED TffE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY COUNCILI1AN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT THE BID FOR APPROXII1ATELY 40 TUBELESS TIRES FOR 
TOWN OWNED POLICE VEHICLES FOR THE YEAR 1962 BE AND IT IS HEREBY 
AWARDED To VANDYcK & YousiK~ INc.~ 1165 EAsT NAIN STREET~ RIVER­
HEAD~ AT A PRICE O.F $15. 26~ SUBJECT TO ITS BID AND SPECIFICATION 
FORI1 SUBI1ITTED~ DATED DECEI1BER 13~ 1961. 

THE VoTE---CouNciLI1AN BELL~ YEs~ CouNCILI1AN STOTZKY~ YEs~ 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLO~ YEs, AND SuPERVISOR 
LEONARD, YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

A RESOLUTION ADOPTED BY THE PLANNING BOARD ON DECEI1BER 13, 1961 
WAS SUBI1ITTED TO THE BOARD AS FOLLOWS: 

" WHEREAS, THE TowN BoARD OF THE TowN oF RIVERHEAD 
REFERRED TO THIS BoARD A COJ111UNICATION WHICH THEY 
HAD RECEIVED FROI1 THE WADING RIVER CIVIC ASSOCIA­
TION WHEREIN THE CIVIC AsSOCIATION SUGGESTED A 
CHANGE OR 110DIFICATION IN THE PRESENT Z ONING 
ORDINANCE TO CURTAILJ1ENT OR ABOLISHI1ENT OF TRAIL­
ER PARKS OR 110BILE TRAILER PARKS IN THE TOWN OF 
RIVERHEAD, AND 

WHEREAS~ TffiS BoARD HAS BEEN COGNIZANT OF 
THE PROBLEI1S WHICH 11AY ACCRUE FROI1 THE ESTABLISH-
11ENT OF TRAILER PARKS WITHIN THE TOWN OF RIVER­
HEAD AND THE PROBLEI1S WHICH ARE NOW ENCOUNTERED 
IN ENDEAVORING TO ENFORCE THE PRESENT CAJ1P ORDIN­
ANCE~ AND 

WHEREAS, THIS BoARD HAS INCLUDED THE ITEI1 OF 
TRAILER PARKS IN THE CONTEI1PLATED COI1PREHENSIVE 
PLANNING UNDER THE URBAN PLANNING AsSISTANCE 
PROGRAI1~ 

NOW~ THEREFORE~ BE IT RESOLVED~ THAT THIS 
BOARD REQUEST THAT THIS 11ATTER OF TRAILER PARKS 
BE TABLED UNTIL SUCH TII1E AS IT 11AY BE CONSIDER­
ED IN THE PLANNING FOR THE TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 
uNDER THE URBAN PLANNING AssiSTANCE PRoGRAI1. " END. 

RESOLUTION ORDERED FILED. 
IT WAS THE CONSENSUS OF THE BoARD THAT THIS 11ATTER BE TABLED 

AS REQUESTED BY THE PLANNING BoARD. 

AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BIDS FOR TWO (2) SNOW PLOWS 
FOR USE OF THE HIGHWAY DEPARTI1ENT WERE OPENED AS FOLLOWS: 



, I 
DAN NITCHELL & SoNs----------------$3310.00 
GEORGE NALVESE & Co., INc.--------- 2580.00 
NuNICIPAL NAcHINERY Co., INc.------ 3272.00 

BIDS ORDERED FILED. 
flATTER TABLED UNTIL THE NEXT NEETING. 
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AT 11 A.N. NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING RELATIVE TO THE ESTABLISHNENT 
OF A LIGHTING DISTRICT TO BE KNOWN AS "AQUEBOGUE LIGHTING DISTRICT 
No. 2

11 
WAS READ AND SUBNITTED TO THE BoARD. e 

ALSO SUBNITTED TO THE BOARD BY THE TOWN CLERK WAS AN AFF4DAVIT 
OF POSTING REQUIRED NOTICES. 

SUPERVISOR LEONARD DECLARED THE HEARING OPEN TO ANYONE WISHING 
T O BE HEARD FOR OR AGAINST THE ESTABLISHNENT OF SAID DISTRICT. 

No ONE WISHING TO BE HEARD FOR OR AGAINST THE ESTABLISHNENT OF 
SAID DISTRICT AND NO CONNUNICATIONS HAVING BEEN RECEIVED RELATIVE 
THERETO, SUPERVISOR LEONARD DECLARED THE HEARING CLOSED. 

J USTICE ZALOGA OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
S ECONDED BY COUNCILNAN STOTZKY. 

X 

IN THE NATTER 
OF 

T HE .ESTABL I S HNENT OF A LIGHTING DISTRICT, . 
T O BE KNOWN AS "AQUEBOGUE LIGHTING DIS­
TRICT No. 2, AQUEBOGUE, TowN oF RIVERHEAD,: 
NEW YORK. , 

X 

ORDER 

ESTABLISHING LIGHTING 
DISTRICT. 

THE PETITION IN THIS NATTER, TOGETHER WITH THE NECESSARY NAP 
ATTACHED THERETO, HAVING BEEN FILED WITH THE TOWN BOARD AND AN 
ORDER HAVING BEEN DULY ADOPTED BY SAID BoARD ON DECENBER 5 , 1961, 
CALLING FOR A HEARING OF ALL PERSONS INTERESTED IN THE NATTER ON 
THE 19TH DAY OF DECENBER, 1961, AT 11.'00 O'CLOCK IN T9:E FORENOON 
A T THE TOWN HALL, RIVERHEAD, NEW YoRK, AND A HEARING HAVING BEEN 
DULY HELD AT SUCH TINE AND PLACE AND THE TOWN BoARD HAVING DETER­
N INED IN THE AFFIRNATIVE, AS FOLLOWS: 

(A) THAT THE PETITION CONPLIES WITH THE REQUIRENENTS OF SECTION 
1 91 OF THE TOWN LAW AS TO SUFFI CIENCY OF SIGNERS. 

(B) THAT THE PETITION IS SIGNED AND ACKNOWLEDGED AS REQUIRED 
BY LAW AND IS OTHERWISE SUFFICIENT. 

(C) THAT ALL THE PROPERTY AND PROPERTY OWNERS WITHIN THE PRO­
POSED DIS TRICT ARE BENEFITED THEREBY. 

(D) THAT ALL TH:E PROPERTY AND PROPERTY OWNERS BENEFITED ARE 
INCLUDED WITHIN THE LINITS OF THE PROPOSED DISTRICT. 

(E) THAT IT IS IN TH:E PUBLIC INTEREST TO GRANT THE RELIEF 
/L" SOUGHT, AND -o<.A/'t\.'f 

THE PERNISSION OF THE STATE CONPTROLLER NOT ~~ REQUIRED FOR 
THE ESTA B LISHNENT OF SAID DISTRICT, AS PROVIDED BY TOWN LAW SECTION 
194, PARAGRAPH 6, IT IS HEREBY 

RESOLVED AND ORDERED THAT A LIGHTING DISTRICT, TO BE KNOWN AS 
"AQUEBOGUE LIGHTING DISTRICT No. 2", AS DESCRIBED BELOW, BE AND THE 
SANE IS HEREBY ESTABLISHED, TO WIT:-

BEGINNING AT A POINT FORNED BY THE INTERSECTION 
OF THE CENTER LINE OF LAND OF THE L.I. RAIL ROAD 



WITH THE WESTERLY LINE OF ffEETING H oUSE C~EEK 
BOULEVARD WHERE SAID BOULEVARD CROSSES THE 
LAND oF THE LoNG IsLAND RAIL RoAD AND RUNNING 
THENCE FROn SAID POINT OF BEGINNING EASTERLY 
ALONG THE CENTER LINE OF THE LAND OF THE LONG 
IsLAND RAIL RoAD TO A POINT FORnED BY THE PRO­
LONGATION NORTHERLY OF THE EASTERLY LINE OF THE 
LAND OF C. T. REEVE AND OTHERS; THENCE SOUTH­
ERLY ALONG THE PROLONGATION NORTHERLY OF THE 
EASTERLY LINE OF C. T. REEVE AND OTHERS AND 
ALONG THE EASTERLY LINE OF LAND OF C. T. REEVE 
AND OTHERS TO A POINT DISTANT NORTHERLY 200 
FEET FROn THE NORTHERLY LINE OF THE PECONI C 
BAY BOULEVARD; THENCE EASTERLY ON A LINE PARA­
LLEL AND DISTANT 200 FEET NORTHERLY OF THE 
NORTHERLY LINE OF THE PECONIC BAY BOULEVARD 
TO A POINT IN THE CENTER LINE OF REEVES CREEK; 
THENCE SOUTHWESTERLY, WESTERLY AND NORTHERLY 
ALONG THE CENTER LINE OF R EEVES CREEK T HROUGH 
PECONIC BAY ALONG THE CENTER LINE OF NEETING 
HOUSE CREEK TO A POINT ON A PROLONGATION 
SOUTHEASTERLY OF THE NORTHERLY LINE OF THE 
LAND OF V. LEWIN, J R.; THENCE NORTHWESTERLY 
AND NORTHERLY ALONG THE PROLONGATION OF THE 
NORTHERLY LINE OF LAND OF V. LEWIN, J R. AND 
ALONG THE LAND OF V. LEWIN, J R. TO THE WESTERLY 
LINE OF NEETING HousE CREEK BouLEVARD; THENCE 
NORTHERLY ALONG THE WESTERLY LINE OF ffEETING 
HousE CREEK BouLEVARD TO THE POINT oR PLACE oF 
BEGINNING. 
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ALL ACCORDING TO A CERTAIN nAP PREPARED BY ALDEN W. YouNG, PRo­
FESSIONAL ENGINEER AND LAND SURVEYOR, DATED J ULY 27, 1961. 
DA TED: DEcEnBER 19, 1961. 

(sEAL) 

WILLIAN J. LEONARD 
SUPERVISOR 

BRUNO ZALOGA I JR. 
JUSTICE OF THE PEACE 

THONAS R. COSTELLO 
JUSTICE OF THE PEACE 

ELNER A. STOTZKY 
Counc ILl1AN 

UL I CK BELL I J R. 
CouNc ILl1AN 

NENBERS OF THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN 

OF RIVERHEAD SUFFOLK COUNTY , NEW YORK. 
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THE VoTE---CouNCIL!1AN BELL_, YEs_, CouNCIL!1AN STOTZKY_, YEs_, 
J usTICE ZALOGA_, YEs_, J usTICE CosTELLO_, YEs_, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD_, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

COUNCIL!1AN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION W~ICH WAS 
S ECONDED BY COUNCIL!1AN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT THE LoNG IsLAND LIGHTING ConPANY BE AND IT rs 
HEREBY AUTHORIZED TO l1AKE A SURVEY FOR STREET LIGHTING IN AQUEBOGUE 
L IGHTING DISTRICT No. 2_, ESTABLISHED PURSUANT TO RESOLUTION OF THE 
T owN BoARD oN DECE!1BER 1 9_, 1961. 

THE VoTE---CouNciLl1AN BELL_, YEs_, CouNciLl1AN SToTzKY_, YEs_, 
J usTICE ZALOGA, YEs_, JusTICE CosTELLO_, YEs_, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD_, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BIDS FOR 30_,000 FEET OF SNOW 
FENCE AND 3_,000 SNOW FENCE POSTS FOR USE OF THE HIGHWAY DEPART!1ENT 
WERE OPENED AS FOLLOWS: 

CHE!1UNG SuPPLY CoRP. - -----------------PosTs---. 9 9 t EACH 
FENCE---.1483 PER FOOT 

CAPITOL HIGHWAY 11ATERIALS, INc. -------PosTs---. 88t EACH 
FENCE- - -.1 7t PER FOOT 

11UTUAL STEEL ConPANY------------------PosTs-- - .96t EACH 
FENCE---.1602 PER FOOT 

LocAL STEEL AND SuPPLY Co., INc.------PosTs---.94t EACH 
FENCE---.1 5 6 PER FOOT 

SuFFOLK CooP. G.L.F. SERVICE, INc.----PosTs---. 76t EACH* 
FENCE---.1 57 PER FOOT 

*(NOT ACCORDING TO SPECIFICATIONS) 
B IDS ORDERED FILED. 

CouNciL!1AN STOTZKY coNTACTED CHE!1UNG SuPPLY CoRP. AND THEY 
A GREED TO FURNISH T~E FENCE ONLY. COUNCIL!1AN STOTZKY ALSO CONTACT­
ED CAPITOL HIGHWAY J1ATERIALS_, INC._, AND THEY AGREED TO FURNISH TFlE 
P OSTS ONLY. 

COUNCIL!1AN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
S ECONDED BY JUSTICE ZALOGA. 

RESOLVED THAT TFlE BID FOR 30_,000 FEET OF SNOW FENCE BE AND IT 
r s HEREBY AWARDED TO CHE!1UNG SuPPLY CoRP ... P. 0. Box 52 7 _, EL!1IRA_, 
N.J._, AT A DELIVERED PRICE OF$ .1483 PER LINEAL FOOT_, SUBJECT TO 
ITS BID AND SPECIFICATION FOR/1 SUB!1ITTED DATED DECE!1BER 15_, 1961, 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE BID FOR 3_,000 SNOW FENCE POSTS BE 
A ND IT IS HEREBY AWARDED TO CAPITOL HIGHWAY J1ATERIALS_, INC._, ROUTE 
6 _, BALDWIN PLACE_, N.J._, AT A DELIVERED PRICE OF $.88 EACH_, SUBJECT 
TO ITS BID AND SPECIFICATION FOR/1 SUB!1ITTED DATED DECE!1BER 14_, 1961. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILl1AN BELL_, YEs_, CouNciL!1AN STOTZKY_, YEs_, 
J usTICE ZALOGA_, YEs_, JusTICE CosTELLO_, YEs_, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD_, 
YEs. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BID FOR REPOWERING HIGHWAY 
DEPART!1ENT sNow-Go_, 11oDEL TU-3_, WAS suBl1ITTED TO THE BoARD AS 
FOLLOWS : 

H.O. PENN 11ACHINERY Co._, INc.----------$5,950.00 
BID ORDERED FILED. 
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A DISCUSSION FOLLOWED RELATIVE TO THIS HATTER. 
SUPERINTENDENT OF HIGHWAYS ZEHBKO STATED THAT ffR. STACHIW HAD 

INSTALLED A DIFFERENT ENGINE IN THE SNO-GO AT NO COST TO THE TOWN, 
AND THAT THE HACHINE WAS AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION BY THE BoARD, 
AND THAT HE FELT THAT THE TOWN HAD GOTTEN GOOD USE FROH THIS HACH­
INE AND ITS HONEYS WORTH. 

JUSTICE ZALOGA STATED THAT HE WASN'T CONCERNED WITH THE NUHBER 
OF HOURS THIS HACHINE WAS USED. HE WAS CONCERNED, WHETHER OR NOT, 
THE HACHINE WAS REPAIRED AND WHO PAID THE BILLS. 

JUSTICE ZALOGA FURTHER STATED THAT IF STACHIW HAD LIVED UP TO 
HIS OBLIGATIONS, HE WAS SATISFIED. HE QUESTIONED, HOWEVER, WHETHER 
IT WOULD BE WISE TO SPEND ANOTHER $6000 ON THIS HACHINE. 

SUPERINTENDENT OF HIGHWAYS ZEHBKO REPLIED THAT IF A DIESEL 
ENGINE WAS INSTALLED IN THIS HACHINE, THE HIGHWAY DEPARTHENT WOULD 
HAVE A HACHINE EQUIVALENT TO A NEW $35,000 HACHINE. 

TowN ATTORNEY HARDING ASKED SuPERINTENDENT oF HIGHWAYS ZEHBKO 
IF THE BIDDER HAD HELPED HIH PREPARE THE SPECIFICATIONS FOR THIS 
BID. SUPERINTENDENT OF HIGHWAYS REPLIED IN THE AFFIRHATIVE. 

TOWN ATTORNEY HARDING THEN STATED THAT WHERE THERE IS ONLY ONE 
BID AND THIS BIDDER HELPED TO PREPARE THE BID SPECIFICATIONS, 
CERTAINLY THIS HUST BE LOOKED UPON WITH GREAT CARE AND STUDY. 

AFTER FURTHER DISCUSSION IT WAS THE CONSENSUS OF THE BoARD THAT 
THIS HATTER BE TABLED. 

AFTER BEING DULY ADVERTISED SEALED BIDS FOR LIQUID ASPHALT 
REQUIREHENTS FOR USE OF THE HIGHWAY DEPARTHENT FOR THE YEAR 1962, 
WERE OPENED AS FOLLOWS: 

AsPHALTS, INc. 
A - FuRNISHED PRICE PER 

ROADSIDE POINTS AND 
11(] ITEHS---.1061 
RS ITEHS---.1061 

GALLON TO BE DELIVERED TO 
APPLIED BY TOWN EQUIPHENT. 

RC ITEHS---.1 061 
ss ITEHS---.1061 

B - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE PICKED UP AT 
PLANT BY ToWN EQUIPHENT. 
NC ITEHS---.1046 RC ITEHS---.1046 
RS ITEHS---.1046 ss ITEHS---.1046 

R. LANSDELL BITUHINOUS CORP. 
A - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE DELIVERED TO 

ROADSIDE POINTS AND APPLIED BY TOWN EQUIPHENT. 
NC ITEHS---.1368 RC ITEHS---.1368 
RS ]TEHS---.1368 ss ITEHS---.1368 

B - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE PICKED UP AT 
PLANT BY TOWN EQUIPHENT. 
110 ITEHS---.1218 RC ITEHS---.1218 
RS ITEHS---.1218 ss ITEHS---.1218 

WELCH AsPHALT ConPANY 
A - FuRNISHED PRICE PER 

ROADSIDE POINTS AND 
NC ITEHS---.1222 
RS ITEHS---.1222 

GALLON TO BE DELIVERED TO 
APPLIED BY ToWN EQUIPHENT. 

RC ITEHS---.1222 
SS JTEHS---.1272 



B - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE PICKED UP AT 
PLANT BY ToWN EQUIPNENT. 
NC ]TENS---.1222 RC lTENS---.1222 
RS lTENS---.1222 ss ]TENS---.1272 

c. B. VAN ALEN, ]NC. 
A - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE DELIVERED TO 

ROADSIDE POINTS AND APPLIED BY TOWN EQUIPNENT. 
NC lTENS---.15 RC lTENS---.15 
RS lTENS---.155 ss lTENS---.1 5 5 

B - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE PICKED UP AT 
PLANT BY TOWN EQUIPNENT. 
NC lTENS---.14 RC ]TENS---.14 
RS lTENS---.145 ss lTENS---.145 

BI!fAsco, INc. 
A - FuRNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE DELIVERED TO 

ROADSIDE POINTS AND APPLIED BY TOWN EQUIP!fENT. 
NC ]TENS---.14 RC lTENS---.14 
RS ]TE!fS---.14 ss lTE!fS---.14 

B - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE PICKED UP AT 
PLANT BY TOWN EQUIPNENT. 
NC lTEns---.14 RC lTEns-~-.14 
RS ]TENS---.14 ss lTE!fS---.14 

RAsoN AsPHALT, INc. 
A - FURNISHED PRICE PER 

ROADSIDE POINTS AND 
NC ]TENS---.1182 
RS ]TE!fS---.1194 

GALLON TO BE DELIVERED TO 
APPLIED BY TOWN EQUIP!fENT. 

RC lTE!fS---.1182 
SS fTE!fS---.135 

B - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE PICKED UP 
NC ]TE!fs---No BID RC ]TEns---No BID 
RS ]TE!fS---No BID SS ]TE!fS---No BID 

BIDS ORDERED FILED. 
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COUNCIL!fAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CouNCIL!fAN BELL. 

RESOLVED THAT THE BID FOR LIQUID ASPHALT REQUIRE!fENTS FOR USE 
OF THE HIGHWAY DEPART!fENT~ FOR THE YEAR 1962, BE AND IT IS HEREBY 
AWARDED TO AsPHALTS~ ]NC., flATTITUCK, N.Y.~ SUBJECT TO ITS BID 
AND SPECIFICATION FOR!f SUBNITTED DATED DECE!fBER 18, 1961, AT THE 
FOLLOWING PRICES: 

A - FuRNISHED PRICE PER 
ROADSIDE POINTS AND 
NC ]TE!fS---.1061 
RS ]TENS---.1061 

GALLON TO BE DELIVERED TO 
APPLIED BY TowN EQUIP!fENT. 

RC ]TE!fS---.1061 
SS fTENS---.1061 

B - FURNISHED PRICE PER GALLON TO BE PICKED UP AT 
PLANT BY TOWN EQUIP!fENT. 
NC ]TE!fS--- . 1046 RC ]TE!fS---.1046 
RS ]TE!fS---.1046 ss lTE!fS---.1046 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT SAID PURCHASES BE !fADE UNDER THE DIRECTION' 
OF THE SUPERINTENDENT OF HIGHWAYS. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILNAN BELL, YEs, CouNCIL!fAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVIsoR LEONARD, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 
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AT 11:45 A.N.J NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING RELATIVE TO THE ADOPTION 
OF PROPOSED ORDINANCE No. 30J REGULATING PARKING ON SECOND STREETJ 
WAS READ AND SUBniTTED TO THE BOARD. 

NOTICE OF HEARING ORDERED FILED. 
SUPERVISOR LEONARD DECLARED THE HEARING OPEN TO ANYONE WISHING 

TO BE HEARD IN FAVOR OF OR IN OPPOSITION TO SAID ORDINANCE. 
No ONE WISHING TO BE HEARD AND NO COnffUNICATIONS HAVING BEEN 

RECEIVED RELATIVE THERETO} SUPERVISOR LEONARD DECLARED THE HEARING 
CLOSED. 

IT WAS THE CONSENSUS OF THE BoARD THAT SECTION 1661J PARAGRAPH 
7J OF THE VEHICLE AND TRAFFIC LAW WAS APPLICABLE IN THIS INSTANCE 
IN LIEU OF SECTION 1623J SUB. 3J OF THE VEHICLE AND TRAFFIC LAW. 

JUSTICE ZALOGA OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY COUNCILffAN BELL. 

WHEREAS} AFTER DUE PUBLICATION oF NoTICEJ A PuBLIC HEARING} 
UPON AN ORDINANCE TO BE KNOWN AS ORDINANCE No. 30J WAS DULY AND 
PROPERLY HELD IN THE TOWN HALL ON THE 19TH DAY OF DECEHBERJ 1961J 
AT 11:45 A.N. ON THAT DAYJ 

NOW~ THEREFORE~ BE IT RESOLVED AND ORDAINED THAT THE FOLLOWING 
PROPOSED ORDINANCE BE ADOPTED: 

ORDINANCE NO. 30 
ORDINANCE REGULATING PARKING ON SECOND ST. 

SECTION 1. THE PARKING} STOPPING AND STANDING OF ALL 
VEHICLES~ nOTOR OR OTHERWISE} ON THE NORTH 
SIDE oF SEcOND STREETJ IN THE TowN OF RIVER­
HEAD} NEW JoRKJ COffffENCING FROff THE EAST 
CURB OF ROANOKE AVENUE AND RUNNING EASTERLY 
FOR A DISTANCE OF THREE HUNDRED FIFTEEN 
(315) FEETJ IS HEREBY PROHIBITED AT ALL 
TINES. 

SECTION 2. THE PARKING OF ALL VEHICLES ON THE NORTH 
AND SOUTH SIDES OF WEST SECOND STREETJ 
BETWEEN RoANOKE AvENUE AND GRIFFING AvE­
NUE} BETWEEN THE HOURS OF 9 A.N. AND 5 P.N. 
ON WEEKDAYS} WITH THE EXCEPTION OF HOLIDAYS} 
IS HEREBY PROHIBITED FOR A PERIOD IN EXCESS 
OF 30 niNUTES. 

SECTION 3. VIOLATION OF THE ABOVE ORDINANCE SHALL 
CONSTITUTE A TRAFFIC INFRACTION (PURSUANT 
TO SECTION 1661J PAR. 7 OF THE VEHICLE a 
TRAFFIC LAW)~ AND UPON CONVICTION SHALL 
BE PUNISHABLE BY A FINE NOT TO EXCEED 
TwENTY-FIVE ($25.00) DoLLARS OR IHPRISON­
nENT NOT EXCEEDING 10 DAYS. OR BOTH. 

THE TowN BoARD FURTHER RESOLVES AND ORDAINS THAT THE TowN CLERK 
OF THE TowN OF RIVERHEAD IS HEREB1 AUTHORIZED AND DIRECTED TO ENTER 
THIS ORDINANCE IN THE HINUTES OF THE TOWN BOARDJ TO PUBLISH A COPY 
THEREOF} ONCE IN THE NEWS-REVIEWJ THE OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER PUBLISHED 
IN THE TOWNJ AND TO POST A COPY THEREOFJ ON THE SIGN BOARD nAIN­
TAINED BY THE TOWN CLERK PURSUANT TO SUBDIVISION 6 OF SECTION 30 



OF THE PROVISIONS OF THE TOWN LAW~ AND TO FILE IN HIS OFFICE 
AFFIDAVITS OF SAID PUBLICATION AND POSTING AND THAT SAID ORDINANCE 
No· 30 SHALL TAKE EFFECT 10 DAYS AFTER SUCH P'JBLICATION AND POST­
ING. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILnAN BELL~ YEs~ CouNCILnAN STOTZKY~ YEs~ 
JusTICE ZALOGA~ YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLo~ YEs~ AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD~ 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

CoUNCILnAN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY COUNCILnAN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT SuPERINTENDENT oF HIGHWAYS ELECT~ THADDEUS 
ZEnBKO~ SHALL FURNISH A PUBLIC OFFICIAL BOND IN THE sun OF $4000.~ 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE TowN BoARD DOEs AND IT HEREBY APPRO­
VES BOND #221777 (2 YEAR TERn), THADDEUS ZEnBKO~ PRINCIPAL AND 
THE GLOBE lNDEnNITY ConPANY~ SuRETY~ IN THE sun oF $4000. 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT A COPY OF THIS BOND~ WITH THE APPROVAL 
OF THE TOWN BOARD AND TOWN ATTORNEY ENDORSED THEREON~ BE FILED 
IN THE OFFICE OF THE SUFFOLK COUNTY CLERK. 

THE VoTE---CouNciLnAN BELL~ YEs~ CouNCILnAN STOTZKY~ YEs~ 
JusTICE ZALOGA~ YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLO~ YEs~ AND SuPERVISOR 
LEONARD~ YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

CoUNCILnAN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CoUNCILnAN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT JusTICE OF THE PEACE ELECT~ THonAs R. CosTELLO~ 
SHALL FURNISH A PUBLIC OFFICIAL BOND IN THE SUn OF $4000.~ 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE TowN BoARD DOES AND IT HEREBY APPROV- ' 
ES BOND #901252 (4 YEAR TERn)~ THOnAS R. COSTELLO~ PRINCIPAL AND 
THE GLOBE ]NDEnNITY ConPANY~ SURETY~ IN THE sun OF $4000. 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT A COPY OF THIS BOND~ WITH THE APPROVAL 
OF THE TOWN BoARD AND TOWN ATTORNEY ENDORSED THEREON~ BE FILED 
IN THE OFFICE oF THE SuFFOLK CouNTY CLERK. 

THE VoTE---CouNciLnAN BELL~ YEs~ CouNciLnAN STOTZKY~ YEs~ 
JusTICE ZALOGA~ YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO~ YEs~ AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

COUNCILnAN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY COUNC ILnAN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT SuPERVISOR ELECT~ WILLIAn J. LEONARD~ sHALL 
FURNISH A PUBLIC OFFICIAL BOND IN THE SUn OF $40~000.~ 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE TowN BoARD DOES AND IT HEREBY 
APPROVES BOND #946317 (2 YEAR TERn)~ WILLIAn J. LEONARD~ PRIN­
CIPAL AND THE TRAVELERS ]NDEnNITY ConPANY, SURETY~ IN THE SUn OF 

$40~ 000. 
FURTHER RESOLVED THAT A COPY OF THIS BOND~ WITH THE APPROVAL 

OF THE TOWN BoARD AND TOWN ATTORNEY ENDORSED THEREON, BE FILED 
IN THE OFFICE oF THE SuFFOLK CouNTY CLERK. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILnAN BELL~ YEs~ CouNciLnAN STOTZKY, YEs~ 
JusTICE ZALOGA~ YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLO~ YEs, AND SuPERVISOR 
LEONARD, YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY 

ADOPTED. 



COUNCILNAN BELL OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY COUNCILNAN STOTZKY. 

RESOLVED THAT TowN CLERK ELECT~ ANTHONY F. GADZINSKI, SHALL 
FURNISH A PUBLIC OFFICIAL BOND IN THE SUN OF $100~000., 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE TowN BoARD DOEs AND IT HEREBY APPROVES 
BOND #946303 (2 YEAR TERN), ANTHONY F. GADZINSKI, PRINCIPAL AND 
THE TRAVELERS INDEHNITY CoHPANY~ SURETY~ IN THE SUH OF $100,000. 

FURTHER RESOLVED THAT A COPY OF THIS BOND~ WITH THE APPROVAL 
OF THE TOWN BoARD AND TOWN ATTORNEY ENDORSED THEREON, BE FILED 
IN THE OFFICE OF THE SUFFOLK CoUNTY CLERK. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILHAN BELL~ YEs~ CouNciLNAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs~ JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs~ AND SuPERVISOR 
LEONARD~ YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY 
ADOPTED. 

COUNCILHAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY CouNciLHAN BELL. 

RESOLVED THAT THE TowN CLERK BE AND HE Is HEREBY AUTHORIZED TO 
ADVERTISE FOR SEALED BIDS FOR ONE (1) "V" TYPE SNOW PLOW FOR USE 
OF THE RIVERHEAD HIGHWAY DEPARTNENT. 

SPECIFICATIONS TO BE PREPARED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF HIGHWAYS. 
BIDS TO BE RETURNABLE UP TO 9:45 A./1. ON JANUARY 2~ 1962. 
THE VoTE---CouNc ILHAN BELL, YEs, CouNc ILHAN STOTZKY~ YEs~ 

JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusT ICE CosTELLO, YEs~ AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

JUSTICE ZALOGA OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 
SECONDED BY JusT ICE Cos TELL 0. 

RESOLVED THAT THIS BoARD Go oN RECORD AS AGAINST THE ESTABLISH­
HENT OF A DISTRICT COURT SYSTEH FOR SUFFOLK COUNTY AND BEING IN 
FAVOR OF THE RETENTION OF THE JUSTICE OF PEACE COURTS AND FURTHER 
THAT THIS BOARD RECOHHENDS THAT THE JURISDICTION OF THE JUSTICE 
OF PEACE CoURTS BE RAISED UPWARDS FRON $500.00. 

THE VoTE---CouNciLHAN BELL~ YEs~ CouNCILHAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs~ AND SUPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YES . THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

COUNCILHAN STOTZKY OFFERED THE FOLLOWING RESOLUTION WHICH WAS 

SECONDED BY CouNCILNAN BELL. 
RESOLVED THAT THE LoNG IsLAND LIGHTING CoHPANY BE AND IT IS 

HEREBY AUTHORIZED TO INSTALL A STREET LIGHT ON POLE #2 ON JACKSON 
STREET (ROAD), AQUEBOGUE LIGHTING DISTRICT #1. 

THE VoTE---CouNCILHAN BELL, YEs, CouNCILHAN STOTZKY, YEs, 
JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs, JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, 
YES. THE RESOLUTION WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

A CONNUNICATION DATED DECENBER 6, 1961 FROH THE LONG IsLAND 
RAIL ROAD RELATIVE TO THE INSTALLATION OF A BLINKER LIGHT AT THE 
WASHINGTON AVENUE CROSSING IN JAHESPORT WAS SUBHITTED TO THE 
BOARD AND ORDERED FILED. 
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A COffffUNICATION DATED DECEffBER 14, 1961 FROff THE PuBLic SERVICE 
COffffiSSION WAS SUBffiTTED TO THE BoARD RELATIVE TO ~E INSTALLATION 
JF A BLINKER LIGHT AT THE WASHINGTON AVENUE CROSSING IN JAffESPORT. 

THEY SUGGESTED THAT A CONFERENCE BE ARRANGED FOR A DISCUSSION 
OF THIS ffATTER. 

]T WAS THE CONSENSUS OF THE BoARD THAT THE TowN CLERK WRITE TO 
THE PUBLIC SERVICE COffffiSSION.AND REQUEST THAT SAID CONFERENCE BE 
HELD ON JANUARY 16, 1962 AT 11 : 30 A. /1. 

THE TowN BoARD coNVENED AS A BoARD oF AuDIT AND EXAffiNED ALL 
TOWN BILLS TO DATE, THE TOTAL OF WHICH WAS AS FOLLOWS: GENERAL 
TowN---$16,426. 72 AND !1ACHINERY FuND---$5,612. 79. ON ffOTION ffADE 
BY COUNCILHAN STOTZKY AND SECONDED BY JUSTICE ZALOGA, IT WAS 
RESOLVED THAT THE BILLS BE APPROVED AS RENDERED. THE VoTE--­
CoUNCILffAN BELL, YEs, CouNCILffAN STOTZKY, YEs, JusTICE ZALOGA, YEs, 
JusTICE CosTELLO, YEs, AND SuPERVISOR LEONARD, YEs. THE RESOLUTION 
WAS THEREUPON DECLARED DULY ADOPTED. 

THERE BEING NO FURTHER BUSINESS ON NOTION AND VOTE, THE ffEETING 
ADJOURNED TO HEET ON FRIDAY, DECEffBER 29, 1961 AT 9:30 A. /1. 

~F. TowN CLERK 

AFG: ffVB 


