TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME:

LUBRICANT ITEMS

BID OPENING DATE:

1/16/2020

RELADYNE NORTHEAST PLANET EARTH
GABRIELLI TRUCK SALES LLC/CIRCLE RECYCLING & MILES PETROLEUM CO|MY GUY AUTO SUPPLY
COMPANY: INC LUBRICANTS RECOVERY DAVID WEBER OIL CO INC NAPA
CONTACT: JOSEPH DENIGRIS JAY BIRNBAUM GREGORY ADLER NOEL WEBER ANGELA STERN JASON ESPOSITO
PHONE #: 631-758-6200 EXT.4483 631-234-8900 631-226-7526 201-438-7333 631-694-4488 631-591-2887
ITEM[  QTY/UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE || NET PRICE ||UNIT PRICE|[ NET PRICE |[UNIT PRICE|[NET PRICE|[UNIT PRICE[ NET PRICE [[UNIT PRICE||NET PRICE [J[UNIT PRICE||NET PRICE
2
1 55 GALLON TRANSMISSION FLUID $  425.86 905.72| $  449.00 | $ 898.00 $ 68475 $ 136950 |$ 65450 | $ 1,309.00 | $ 822.80 | $ 1,645.60
Gibraltar Multi-vehicle
DRUMS QUOTED BRAND Sunoco Value One NO BID syn ATF Miles Petroleum Motorcraft
2
2 120 LBS GEAR OIL $ 20448 |$ 40896 |$ 149.00 | $ 298.00 $ 17760 | $ 35520|$ 24200 | $ 48400|$% 14280 $ 285.60
KEGS QUOTED BRAND MACK Bulldog Starfire NO BID Gibraltar EP Gear Miles Petroleum Citgo
15 HYDRAULIC OIL
3 55 GALLON $ 356.66 | $ 534990 |$ 237.00 $ 3,555.00 $ 27170 | $ 407550 | $ 392.00 | $ 5880.00|$ 284.90 $ 4,273.50
DRUMS QUOTED BRAND Sunoco Value One NO BID Gibraltar Premium AW Miles Petroleum Starfire
4 2000 15 W 40 ENGINE OIL $ 564 | $ 11,280.00 $ 6.24 | $12,480.00 | $ 6.40 | $12,800.00 | $ 396.75 | $14,427.27
GALLONS
QUOTED BRAND NO BID All Fleet NO BID Gibraltar Ultra LX Miles Petroleum Starfire
5 PERMANENT ANTIFREEZE & SUMMER
5 55 GALLON COOLANT (FULL STRENGTH) $ 50662 | $ 253310)$% 35225 |$ 1,761.25]$% 549.00 | $2,745.00 | $ 546.70 | $ 2,73350|$ 620.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 382.00  $ 1,910.00
DRUMS QUOTED BRAND Shell Duramax Planet Earth Pahnol Gold Full Strength Miles Petroleum Pride Premium
2
6 120 LBS SUPER CHASSIS GREASE (RED) $ 30492 |$ 60984 ]| 248.00  $ 496.00 $ 33360 $ 667.20|$ 34200 | $ 68400]|% 166.80 $ 333.60
KEGS QUOTED BRAND Mobil Delvac All Fleet NO BID Gibraltar Permaflex Miles Petroleum Super S
2
7 |55 GALLON ALL PURPOSE TRANS & TORQUE FLUID $ 45286 |$ 90572 ]|$ 304.00  $ 608.00 $ 38280 $ 76560|3% 43120 | $ 86240|$% 24150 | $ 483.00
QUOTED BRAND Sunoco Value One NO BID Gibraltar UTF Miles Petroleum Starfire
2
8 120 LBS SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 80W/140 $ 512.00 | $ 1,024.00]$ 490.00  $ 980.00 $ 35640 $ 71280]|% 589.00 | $ 1,178.00|$ 23880 | $ 477.60
KEGS QUOTED BRAND Black Bear Phillips 66 NO BID Gibraltar Super Syn Lube Miles Petroleum Starfire




