

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE  
 BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME:		CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT																										
BID OPENING DATE:		11/12/2020																										
COMPANY:		Shannon Chemical Corp			Twin County Swimming Pool Maintenance & Supply Co., Inc.			Progressive Growers Inc.			Pencco, Inc.			George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.			Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.			PVS Technologies, Inc.			Kuehne Chemical Company, Inc.			Brenntag Northeast LLC		
CONTACT:		Daniel C. Flynn			Randy Cestaro			Mark Matulonis			Sarah Duffy			Donald C. Helwig			Christina Imbrogno			Craig Mikkelsen			Susan K. Anthony			Kirsten O'Donnell		
PHONE #:		610-363-9090			631-249-1249			631-591-3540			979-885-0005			215-785-3000			785-842-7424			313-571-1100			973-589-0700			484-818-1687		
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE SUBMITTED WITH BID?		Yes																										
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY	UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURER	DELIVERY									
1	PPG ACCU-TAB SL TABLETS (CHLORINE) 55 LB. CONTAINERS APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR – 25 CONTAINERS PER DELIVERY PRICE PER PAIL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$169.9103/ Westlake	5-7 days ARO	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid										
2	FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40% SOLUTION 4,000 BULK DELIVERIES APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES PER YEAR PRICE PER DRY TON	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$760.00/ Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.	3 days ARO	\$776.00/ PVS Technologies	2-5 Days	No Bid		No Bid										
3	HYDRATED LIME – 55 LB. BAGS	No Bid		No Bid		\$10.80/ Graymont	36 hours	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid										
4	SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25% SOLUTION 55 GALLON CONTAINERS APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES PER YEAR-20 DRUMS PER DELIVERY PRICE PER DRUM *price to include cleanup fee, if applicable	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$84,5671/ Westlake	5-7 days ARO	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$142.30/ Various	3-4 days									
5	POTASSIUM PERMANGNATE FREE FLOWING 55 LB. CONTAINERS APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES PER YEAR-25-30 PAILS/PALLET PRICE PER POUND	\$1.73/ Organic Ind. Libox Chem.	24-36 hours	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$1,8617/ United Mineral	5-7 days ARO	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$1,789/ Carus	3-4 days									
6	SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LB. BAGS APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR – 50 BAGS PER DELIVERY PRICED PER POUND	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$0.506/ Church & Dwight	5-7 days ARO	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$0.6025/ Church & Dwight	3-4 days									
7	CITRIC ACID 50% 55 GALLON DRUM	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$487.4853/ Coyne Chemical	5-7 days ARO	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$255.20/ JBL	3-4 days									
8	SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 15% SOLUTION – BULK APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH – 250 GAL. PER DELIVERY PRICE PER GALLON	No Bid		\$3.25/ Kuehne Chemical minimum delivery 150 gals; any delivery less than 150 gals will be charged for 150 gals	48 hours	No Bid		No Bid		\$3,3426/ Kuehne Chemical \$16.1176/ Genesis Alkali 1 pallet min (48 bags)	5-7 days ARO	No Bid		No Bid		\$8.00/ Kuehne Chemical Co. Inc. *	2-3 Days ARO	No Bid										
9	DENSE SODA ASH 58% 50 LB. BAGS	No Bid		No Bid		\$24.75/ Ciner	36 hours	No Bid		\$9.60/ Genesis	5-7 days ARO	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$9.60/ Genesis	3-4 days									