TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[BID NAME:

BID OPENING DATE:

2020 Annual Construction Contrac

5/27/2020

COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc. South Fork Asphalt Excav Services Corazzini Asphalt Laser Industries, Inc Suffolk Paving Corp. Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.
[Aviard No. 1 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - Low Quantity
A i Dwrion | Unt | cuaniy | esimacd uaniy ] riccant Tat e o Tat e o Ta e o Tat e univcos Tat e o Tat e unitcos Tat e o Tat e o Tat e
1 2 |unclassified Excavation | cv | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 $10000 510,000 0 0 4000 4,000,
2y [Fmotoftnsielle | oy | 1200 100 50 50 50 50 50 510000 510000 50 50 4000 54,0000
Embankment-Borow | oY | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 55000 55,0000 0 0 $1500 $1.500.0
358
as.sor [Emoenkment-select oy | 1200 100 50 50 50 50 50 8000 58,0000 50 50 52000 52,0000
Granuler Fil
as.gs [Embenkment-Grading | gy |y 00 100 0 0 0 0 0 55000 55,0000 0 0 52000 52,0000
Subgrade
4 [stabilzed Mixec-In-Place | sy | 1-2,000 1000 5 50 50 50 50 52000 520000 0 0 51500 515,000,
Recycled Base Course
4p [Reoveled Concrete ov | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 58000 58,0000 0 0 52000 52,0000
|nggregete . .
25.C[Casting Adjustment B | 15 3 50 50 50 50 50 $500.00 15000 0 0 50000 51,5000
255 [subgrace AreaMaterial | Y | 15 3 0 0 0 0 0 55000 s150.0 0 0 $10000 53000
259 [1030 PavementPatch | Ea | 1-5 3 50 50 50 50 50 250000 575000 50 50 565000 519500
Rut Avaidance Asphall
49 [concrete, Type 6FRATop | Ton | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 25000 525,000 0 0 516500 516,500
Course
Rut Avaidance Asprall
52 [Coneete, Type 3RA Ton | 1200 100 50 50 50 50 50 525000 525,000 0 0 $16500 516,500
pinder Course
55 [Asphait Conerete Type 1.8 Ton | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 $25000 525,000 0 0 s11500 $11,500.
57 |asphalt Emulsions Gal 10005000 3000 0 0 0 0 0 5400 512,000, 50 50 5100 53,0000
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy | 1s00 20 0 0 0 0 0 $18.00 45000 0 0 51000 52,5000
116 [Pavement Markings | 11000 500 50 0 0 0 50 500 525000 50 50 5350 17500
Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 1 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $169,150.00) NOBID NOBID $86,00000
(Aviard No.2 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - High Quantity
At e No. |Descipt Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
2 2 |unclassified Excavation | CY | 201-500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 53000 510,500 53000 510,500
2y [Femowtofunsiatle | ey 20500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 50 5100 53500 53000 510500
358 [Embenkment-Borow | CY | 201-500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 100 53500 1200 $4.2000
as.scr [Emoenkment-select oy | 201-500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 50 5100 53500 52000 57,000
Granuler Fil
as.gs [Emberkment-Grading | gy f 501500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 100 $350.0 600 52,1000
Subgrade
Stabilized Mixed-In-Place 2001-
4 [aaeyein s Coure s | Yoo 3500 50 50 50 50 50 50 50 600 521,000 600 521,000
o [ee ov | 201-500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 $1500 55,2500 51000 53,5000
25.C[Casting Adjustment B | 610 s 50 50 50 50 50 50 50 520000 51,6000 40000 53,2000
255 [Subgrace AreaMaterial | Y | 610 8 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 $10000 58000 $10000 58000
259 [10%0 PavementPatch | Ea | 6-10 s 50 50 50 50 50 50 50 510000 80,0 60000 4,800,
Rut Avaidance Asphall
49 [concrete, Type 6FRATop| Ton | 201500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 $10000 535,000 s11500 40,250,
Course
Rut Avaidance Asprall
52 [Conerete, Type Ton | 201500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 50 8000 528,000 s11500 40250,
pinder Course
55 Ton | 20500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 4000 514,000 59000 531,500
|Asphat Concrete Type 1. 8
s0L-
57 U e 10000 50 50 50 50 50 50 0 5200 520,000 100 510,000
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy [sor-1s0of 1000 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 100 51,0000 800 58,0000
116 [Pavement Markings L [roonso0 3000 0 0 0 0 0 0 50 5100 53,0000 s150 45000
Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 2 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $142.350.00) 5202,100.00)




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY:

Louis Barbato Landscaping

The LandTek Group, Inc

South Fork Asphal

Excav Services

Corazzini Asphal

Laser Industries, Inc

Suffolk Paving Corp

Rosemar

KJB Industries Inc.

| Award No. 3 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - Low Quantity.

At e No. |Descipt Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
3 1 |cleaingana Grunbing | Acre | 025 1 0 0 0 0 0 52000000 520,000 0 0 $1000000 510,000
2 |Unclassified Excavation | v | 1200 100 50 50 50 50 50 510000 510000 0 0 4000 4,000
Embankment-Borow | oY | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 55000 55,0000 0 0 100 s1000
358
Emoankment - Select oy | 1200 100 50 50 50 50 50 56000 56,0000 50 50 52000 52,0000
Granuler Fil
3s-SGF
Embankment-Grading | gy | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 52000 52,0000 0 0 $1500 $1.500.0
Subgrade
3s.6s
4 [stabilzed Mixec-in-Place | sy | 1-2,000 1000 50 50 50 50 50 52000 520000 0 0 51500 515,000,
Recycled Base Course
o e ov | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 58000 58,0000 0 0 52000 52,0000
25.C[casting Adjustment B | 15 3 50 50 50 50 50 $600.00 518000 0 0 60000 51,8000
255 [subgrace AreaMaterial | Y | 15 3 0 0 0 0 0 s12500 sa75.0 0 0 $10000 53000
259 [1030 PavementPatch | Ea | 1-5 3 50 50 50 50 50 250000 575000 50 50 580,00 52,4000
Rut Avaidance Asphall
49 [concrete, Type 6FRATop | Ton | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 25000 525,000 0 0 s17000 517,000
Course
Rut Avaidance Asprall
52 [Conerete, Type 3RA Ton | 1200 100 50 50 50 50 50 525000 525,000 0 0 $16500 516,500
pinder Course
55 Ton | 1200 100 0 0 0 0 0 25000 525,000 0 0 s11500 $11,500.
|Asphat Concrete Type 1. 8
57 |asphalt Emulsions Gal 10005000 3000 0 0 0 0 0 5500 515,000 50 50 5100 53,0000
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy | 1s00 20 0 0 0 0 0 $18.00 45000 0 0 800 52,0000
116 [Pavement Markings | 11000 500 50 0 0 0 50 5300 15000 50 50 5350 17500
116- [StrawWood Fiber Mulch-
swnt [remporay sy | 1500 20 0 0 0 0 0 500 51,2500 0 0 300 7500
116.5p (0200 Mulch - sy | 1500 250 0 50 50 50 50 500 12500 50 50 5300 7500
[Temporary
118- [Seed and StrawiWood
o [rier i Temporary | Y| 150 20 0 0 0 0 0 700 17500 0 0 300 $750,0
1185 [Straw Bale - Temporary | LF | 1500 250 50 50 50 50 50 s1500 37500 50 50 s1200 53,0000
118G |Geotextiles sy | 120 100 0 0 0 0 0 $18.00 $1.800.0 0 0 1200 $1.2000
118-5F [silt Fence - Temporary | LF | 1500 250 50 50 50 50 50 s1500 37500 50 50 s1200 53,0000
Drainage Structure Inet
118D [Protection, Prefabricated - | Ea | 15 3 0 0 0 0 0 535000 51,0500 0 0 20000 $600.0
[Temporary
1183 faute Mesh sy | 120 100 50 50 5 50 50 5400 4000 50 50 5200 52000
11g-sce[Spzed Constuton | gy |y 500 100 0 0 0 0 0 52000 52,0000 0 0 51000 51,0000
Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 3 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $193,675.00) NOBID NOBID $102,100.00)
[ Avard No. 4 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - High Quantity
A e, s i || Quansiy| Esimaed quantiy Oocet Toralprice Ooccet ot price Oocet ot price UnitCost ot price Dok cot ot price Ooecot ToalPrce Unit Cost ToalPrce Uit Cost ToalPrce Uit Cost ToalPrce
4 1 |Clearingand Gruoting | Acre | 265 5 50 50 50 50 50 50 500000 525,000 $3,00000 515,000, $5,00000 525,000
2 |unclassified Excavation | CY | 201-500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 4000 514,000, 53000 510,500 53000 510500
Embarkment - Borrow | Y [ 201500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 52000 57,000 001 sas 5100 53500
8
Embankment - Select ov | 201-500 350 0 0 0 0 0 0 52000 57,0000 001 S35 52000 57,0000
(Granuler Fill
35.5GF
moankment-Grading. |y | 201500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 52000 57,000 5100 53500 5400 s1.4000
Subgrace
ses
Stabilized Mixed-In-Place 2001
4 | Recyced Base Couree sy | e 3500 0 0 0 s0 0 0 675 523,625 s550 519250, 600 521,000
ap [Recycled Concrete oy | 201-500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 53000 510,500 51000 535000 1200 $4.2000
|Aggregate
25C |Casting Adjustment B | 610 8 0 0 0 0 0 0 25000 52,0000 55000 40,0 560000 $4.800.0




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, Inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc
255 [Subgrack AreaMaterial | CY | 610 5 50 50 50 50 50 50 2000 sta00 2000 sta00 3000 s2400
259 (1030 pavementPach | Ea | 610 8 50 50 50 50 50 50 4000 sa200 000 s2400 560000 548000
Rut Avoidance Asphal
49 [Concrete, Type 67RATop | Ton | 201500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 s10000 535,000 598,00 34,300 s12000 42,000
|Course
Rut Avoidance Apral
52 [Concrete, Type 3RA Ton | 200500 0 50 50 50 50 50 50 $10000 535,000 58000 526,000 $12000 42,000
pinder Course
55 Ton | 201500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 565,00 s22.750 1000 s14000 s11000 538500
|Asphalt Concrete Type 1
5001 -
El ca | 10000 50 50 50 50 50 50 5500 550000 5200 20000 5200 30000
112 [Topsol and Seed sy [so-1s0 1000 50 50 50 50 50 50 5200 520000 500 550000 800 55,0000
116 [pavement Markings F [roorsd 3000 50 50 50 50 50 50 $150 45000 $150 45000 $150 45000
L8 [SawWood Fiber Muleh-| gy | o100 1,000 50 50 50 50 50 50 s10.00 s10,000 5100 51000 5300 530000
WM [Temporary
1185y 32020 Mulch - sy |swo1s0| 1000 50 50 50 50 50 50 s1000 s10000 5200 530000 5200 530000
[remporary
118 Seed and Strawtood
sovn [ oo oot | v [ sooso0 | 1000 50 50 50 50 50 50 s10.00 s10,000 5100 51000 5300 530000
1185 [SrawBale-Temporary | LF [ 5001500 1,000 50 50 50 50 50 50 s1000 s10000 s1.00 510000 s1200 $12,000
118G [Geotenies sy | 201500 350 50 50 50 50 50 50 s10.00 535000 5100 s3500 5200 sT000
118 [SiftFence - Temporary | LF [s01-1500 1000 50 50 50 50 50 50 s1000 s10000 5300 530000 s1200 $12,000
Dreinage Swracture nlet
1180 [protction Prfabricated- | Ea | 610 5 50 50 50 50 50 50 s75.00 S5000 55000 sa000 520000 516000
[remporary
1189 |ite Mesh sy | 201500 0 50 50 50 50 50 50 5500 517500 5200 510500 5200 sT000
11g.scE|punmzed CORSILEON gy 501500 350 B 50 B B B B 500 517500 5100 s3500 s10.00 535000
“Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 4 NoBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 530345500 $166,357.00 528379000
| Award No. 5 Drainage Installation
At e No. |Descipt Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost TotalPrice Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
5 | 2 |Unchssified Excavation | v [ 201-500 350 50 555,00 $19.250 50 48,00 s16.800 50 52000 $31500 50 50 52000 570000
ap |[Recycled Conerete ov | 110 50 5 55000 525000 B 250 516250 50 55000 525000 50 50 55000 525000
|Aggregate
Remove an Replace
7R [Removeand R | o 50 50 55000 525000 50 55050 29750 50 55000 525000 50 50 $10000 $50000
7agR |Remove & Replace | o1 50 50 1000 520000 50 3800 519000 50 1000 520000 50 50 3000 515000
Concree Header
Remove an Replace
arp [Remove nd sy | 1% 2 50 520000 $50000 50 s17500 43750 50 518000 45000 50 50 520000 50000
134" [Underdrainipe 4" Dia. | LF | 100 50 50 1200 s5000 50 s1250 s6z5.0 50 s11.00 s5500 50 5 500 s2500
130:6" [Underdrain Pipe 6" Dia. | LF | 1400 50 50 $18.00 s9000 50 s16.00 s8000 50 s13.00 56500 50 50 5800 4000
130" [Underdrainipe 8" Dia. | LF | 1100 50 50 2000 51000 50 2000 51000 50 s18.00 s9000 50 50 s10.00 ss000
130.4" [polyetnytene Pipe-4Dia. | L | 1100 50 50 $18.00 s9000 50 s1600 s8000 50 2000 $10000 50 50 s15.00 s7500
139.12" [Polyethylene Pipe 12 Dia|  LF | 1100 50 50 1000 520000 50 52000 s14500 50 535,00 517500 50 50 52000 510000
130.15" [Polyethylene pipe 157 Dia|  LF | 1100 50 50 4200 521000 50 2000 $14500 50 4000 520000 50 50 52000 510000
130.16" [Polyethylene Pipe 16 Dial  LF | 1100 50 50 555,00 527500 50 s37.00 518500 50 555,00 527500 50 50 3000 515000
130.24" [polyethytene pipe 247 Dia|  LF | 1100 50 50 56000 530000 50 556,00 528000 50 $75.00 37500 50 50 55000 525000
13.30" [Polyethylene Pipe 20" Dial  LF | 1100 50 50 565,00 532500 50 565,00 532500 50 58000 4000 50 50 55000 530000
13-36" [Polyethylene Pipe 367 Dia|  LF | 1100 50 50 $65.00 32500 50 s7400 37000 50 595,00 547500 50 50 $65.00 32500
130.48° Polyethylene ipe 46" Dia|  LF | 1100 50 50 58000 54000 50 59200 546000 50 s10500 552500 50 50 s70.00 535000
Leaching Pools (5 Dinx
aa [ g | 15 3 50 5375000 s11.250 50 $390000 $11.700 50 $400000 $12,000 50 50 $410000 s12.300
s fworeoins | o || I I su I R s ) . swa « I R stsom
Leaching Pools (5 Dinx
ac | g | 15 3 50 4500000 $15.000 50 $490000 s14700 50 4500000 $15.000 50 50 $480000 s16400




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, Inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.
ap [iareon oD | |y s wof s Py 0o s 00 wof s 200 w wof oo 5000
ue fumioreos 0D | | g s wof s sss00 wof s a0 wof s 00 ® wof s 500
ap oo ooomx | g, | s wof oo 3000 wof s ssso wof oo 3000 w 0] oo st
N N I s wof oo a0 0o meoc 170 wof s s1200 ® S [ 500
238 |Catch Basins Type B Ea. 1-5 3 $0. $5,000.00 '$15,000. $0. $4,200.00 $12,600. $0. $4,100.00 $12,300. $0. $0. $3,700.00 $11,100.
anco[gnesmTrea sy |y s B - s1s000 Y - suas00 Y - s1s500 ® B - s1s000
] il I : o o 21000 0 o s16500 0 smom s2s500 w o s s15000
¢ fcampngismn | & | 15 s Y - s10s00 o s suz00 o o suz00 ® B - s15000
25-S  [Subgrade Area Material cy 1 1 $0. $100.00 $100.00 $0. $110.00 $110.00 $0. $120.00 $120.00 $0. $0. $200.00 $200.0C
20 [ouorammenran | & | 15 s wof s saa00 Y - w2500 wof s saa00 ® Y - 2400
[k o || s wof s 0500 wof s sus wof s 200 w 0o s 0500
e ] IV s B - somo B - suam00 B - 24000 ® B - s1s000
21Dl Z;p MIE.E'T D/Base Ea. 1-5 3 $0. $2,200.00 '$6,600.0 $0. $2,450.00 '$7,350.0 $0. $2,500.00 '$7,500.0( $0. $0. $2,500.00 '$7,500.0(
w | 1w : wof  ssoo @ wof o0 samo wof w0 o ® wof a0 m
rcecon

112 [Topsoil and Seed sy 1-500 250 $0. $10.00 '$2,500.0 $0. $22.00 '$5,500.0 $0. $21.00 '$5,250.0 $0. $0. $15.00 $3,750.0

Tt B Comparin Prics Avard o 5 wosio s Nos 3500500 Nos sansco Nos Nos sungeaco

| Award No. 6 - Mill and Overlay - Low Quanitity.

At e No. Descrption Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price UnitCost TotalPrice UnitCost TotalPrice UnitCost TotlPrice UnitCost TotalPrice Uit Cost TotalPrice UnitCost TotalPrice Uit Cost TotalPrice UnitCost TotlPrice
o | [ommsrmise | o | g 2 ® ® . s ® ® ® . - 2000 ss000
ass [gammdSoAgEe | oy | gy 10 50 50 s15.00 s1s00 50 50 50 5100 s 2000 s2000
25:C. |Casting Adjustment e | 15 3 s1.00 s 50 50 50 510000 3000 550000 515000
g [fsphatConaete Tuing | gy | 5200 100 50 50 595,00 595000 50 50 50 55000 55,0000 513500 $13500.
Jnd Levelng Course
Rt Avoidance Asphall
48 [Concrete, Type 6FRATop | Ton | 1200 100 50 50 s17500 $17.500 50 50 50 $13000 $13.000 $13500 $13500
Course
Rut Avoidance Asphall
52 |Concree, Type 3RA Ton | 1200 10 0 0 $150.00 $15000 0 0 50 1000 540000 s13500 s13500
Binder Course
Miling of Asphaltc
59 [iing of Asprali sy | 13000 1500 50 50 s11.00 516500 50 50 50 5800 $12,000 5800 s12.000
116 |Pavement Markings [ 1-200 1000 50 50 5030 s3000 50 50 0 s $10000 s200 20000
118- [StawWood Fiber Mulch -
s [reme sy | 100 20 50 50 s1.00 s2500 50 50 50 s1.00 s2500 s1.00 s2500
1165y (0200 Mulch - sy | 1500 250 50 50 5100 s2500 50 50 50 5100 s2500 5100 s2500
[Temporary
118- [Seed and SranrWood
S [Fiber Mulch - Temporary | Y| 5% 20 0 50 s1.00 s2500 50 50 0 st s2s00 st s2s00
116 [Staw Bale - Temporary | LF | 1500 250 0 50 600 S15000 0 0 0 $3:00 s7500 s10.00 s25000
118G |Geotextiles sy | 1200 100 50 50 s1.00 s1000 50 50 50 s1.00 s1000 5200 s2000
118.5F [Sift Fence - Temporary | LF [ 1500 250 50 50 5100 s2500 50 50 0 s s2s00 s1200 30000
Drainage Structre et
1180 |Protecton,Prefabricated- | Ea. | 15 s 50 50 s1.00 55 50 50 50 s1.00 55 520000 510000
[Temporary
1183 [oute Mesh sv | 120 10 0 0 s su00 0 0 0 s su00 s su00
oscefpomsconn | T - I I om0 - - I I S . om0
Total Bid Comparison Award N NoBID NOBID 56188300 NoBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 53732000 96435000

[ Award No. 7 - Mill and Overlay - High Quanitity

A% o st unt | iy | esimaa uany




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc
w [ | o | | “ I s “ a] am U s “
7
wss o | o | o | - I w0 - I I I o -
25 [casting Adjustment B | 1s s si00.00 32000 0 0 525000 520000 5100 s 50
|AsphattConcrete Truing
o oo Ton | 2011000 e 50 50 595,00 557,000 50 50 55000 20000 55000 530000 50
Rt Avoidance Asphall
49 [Concrete, Type 67RATop | Ton | 2011000 &0 0 50 s10000 550000 0 0 58500 55100 s15.00 $4500. 0
|Course
Rut Avoidance Asphall
52 [Concrete, Type 3RA Ton | 2011000 e 50 50 595,00 557,000 50 50 55000 20000 4000 s26000 50
pinder Course
sg [Miling of Asphalic sv [soonsoo| 4000 0 0 500 2400 0 0 400 $16000 $3:00 s1200 50
Concrte Pavement
116 [pavement Markings o [1zo0| 1000 50 50 5030 3000 50 50 5175 517500 s1.00 510000 50
Ls - |StawWood Fber Mulh | gy 5011000 70 0 0 s s7500 0 0 s s7s00 s s7500 0
SWM [Temporary
Seed and Mulch -
[ Sovoy sy | sort000 750 50 50 s1.00 s7500 50 50 s1.00 sT500 s1.00 sT500 50
118- [Seed and Srawiwood
S ey | SY | sovt00 70 0 0 s s7s00 0 0 s s7500 s s7500 0
1185 [StawBale-Temporay | LF [so1000[ 750 50 50 $6.00 45000 50 50 s1.00 s7500 s1.00 sT500 50
118 [Geotexiles sv | 2050 30 0 0 s 300 0 0 s 300 s 300 0
118:5F [SiftFence - Temporary | LF | 501-1000 750 50 50 s1.00 sT500 50 50 s1.00 s7500 s1.00 sT500 50
Drainage Suuctre et
1160 |protection, Prefabricaed - | Ea. | 610 10 0 0 10 st 0 0 5100 s 5100 s 50
[remporary
1189 |ite Mesh sv | 200500 500 50 50 s1.00 $5000 50 50 s1.00 $5000 s1.00 $5000 50
L1g-sce|punmzed CnSILEOn |y | 201500 350 50 50 5100 s3500 50 50 5100 s3500 5100 s3500 50
“TotalBid Comparison Award No.T NoBID NoBID s211.485.00 NoBID NoBID NoBID 513562000 511699550 NOBID
[Award No. 8 - Concrete Flatwork and Curbing - Low Quanitity
Award | tem No.|Descrip Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity|  unit cost ol Price Unit Cost TolalPrce Uit Cost ToalPrce Uit cost ToalPrice Unit Cost TolalPrice Unitost ToalPrice Unit Cost ToalPrice Unit cost ToalPrce Uit ost ToalPrce
No.
5 50 510000 $5000 50 50 52000 s4500 50 50 $10000 $5000
8 | 20 |Removalof Unsuiabiemad cv | 110
10 0 s125.00 s12500 0 0 s15.00 s7s00 0 0 $100.00 $10000
6 |Detecablewamingunis | e | 1-25
7 |concree curb T ) 100 50 4000 $40000 50 50 555,00 55000 50 50 $65.00 965000
A [concrete Header | 1 10 0 s000 30000 0 0 s2000 20000 50 50 s10.00 51000
[Remove and Replace
7R [Removeand K | v 100 50 55000 $50000 50 50 555,00 55000 50 50 s1000 570000
7agR |Remove & Replace I ) 100 50 200 532000 50 50 525,00 525000 50 50 s10.00 51000
Concrte Header
8 [umboelgian Blockcurn|  LF | 1200 100 50 535,00 35000 50 50 555,00 55000 50 50 4000 540000
arp |Remove and Replece | 1 10 0 s10.00 $40000 0 0 55700 557000 0 0 s10.00 540000
9 [concret Sidewali sy | 1100 50 50 511000 $55000 50 50 s10800 55,4000 50 50 511000 55000
oRR[Remove and Repace 1100 50 50 s13000 5565000 0 0 suroo 558500 0 0 su000 570000
Concrte Sicewalk o
. [cotored and mprintea
04 (e s s | o | 50 50 12000 960000 50 50 516000 580000 50 50 513000 65000
10 |COtered and imprinied 1100 50 50 s135.00 567500 0 0 $180.00 590000 0 0 su0.00 570000
Concrete sidevalk 5" | g,
Remove and Replace
10-4RRColored and Imprinted 1100 50 50 s12500 962500 50 50 516000 59,0000 50 50 58000 $40000
Concrete Sidewalk- 4| v
Remove and Replace
106°RRColored and mprinted L1100 50 0 su000 570000 0 0 $198.00 599000 0 50 58000 540000
|Concree - 6* sv
11 |concrete Aprons 50 $11500 28750 50 50 s11700 29250 50 50 $13000 32500
sv | 10 2
1iRR [Jemove o Replece 50 s12000 512000 50 50 s13500 513500 50 50 s13000 513000
» sv | 12 10
12 |Trench Drain 50 s1000 35000 50 50 58000 $40000 50 50 510000 50000
| 10 50
0 500 s5000 0 0 800 S0 0 0 500 ss000
130-4" polyetnylene pipe-4°Dia. | LF | 1200 100
50 s1000 $10000 50 50 s1400 $1.4000 50 50 s1200 512000
112_[Topsoil and Seed sv | 10 10




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc
NOBID 7152500 NOBID $72165.00 NOBID $85525.00 NOBID NOBID $7025000
“Total Bid Comparison Award No. 8
[ Award No. 9 - Concrete Flawork and Curbing - High Quanitity
Aviard | tem No.|Descript Uit | Quanty | estimated Quaniy|  unitcost ot Prce Unit Cost ol Prce Uit Cost ol Prce Uit Cost Total Prce Unit Cost Toat Prce Unit Cost TotlPrice UnitCost TotlPrice UnitCost ot Price UnitCost ot Price
No.
0 $100.00 s15000 0 0 9000 $13500 0 0 0
9 | 20 |removatof nsutalema] cv | 11-20 15
50 55000 530000 50 50 s15.00 45000 50 50 50
6 |Detecablewamingunits | ¢ | 26100 ®
7 [concrete curp |0 s 0 2800 $16,600. 0 0 s10.00 2400 0 0 0
A |Concrete Header e foor-r00 60 50 52000 s12,000 50 50 s2000 s12,000 50 50 0
7R |Remove and Replace |0 s 0 500 s2100 0 0 $45.00 s2100. 0 0 0
Concrte Curb
[Remove and Replace
7aRR [femove iR e foor-r00 60 50 2800 $16.800 50 50 2000 $18,000 50 50 0
s |0 s 0 s23.00 S13600. 0 0 55000 3000 0 0 0
[Remove and Replace
LN ot TR CURTE 50 2500 $15.000 50 50 55200 sa1200 50 50 50
9 |concete Sidewlk sv | 10500 0 0 9000 s2100. 0 0 59200 28700 50 50 50
[Remove and Replace
arp [Remove i Repa o | 0 50 s10500 s31500 50 50 s10800 32400 50 50 50
104+ |SOtored and imprinted 101:500 300 50 511000 533,000, 50 50 513000 539,000 50 50 50
Concrete idevalk 4" | g,
. [cotored and mprineea
1o |Gol0redand Imprn o | Y 50 s11800 535,400 50 50 14000 42,000 50 50 50
Remove and Replace
10-4RR Colored and Imprinted 101500 300 0 s1200 3360 0 0 s13000 3300 0 0 0
|Concree Sicevilk - sv
Remove and Replace
106RR|Colored and Imprinted 100500 Y 50 s12200 536,600 50 50 14000 42,000 50 50 50
Concrete - 6° sv
11 |concrete Aprons 0 $105.00 s7875.0 0 0 $108.00 581000 0 50 50
sv | st s
umn [feTovemd e o s 12000 w o s su200 w w w
" sv | 2-10 5
12 [Trench Drsin 0 56500 $1300. 0 0 8000 $16,000 50 50 50
e | 030 20
130.4 |Polyethylene Pipe 4° D 0 5500 517500 50 50 $6.00 521000 50 50 50
e | s 350
112 [Topsol and Seed sv | 201500 350 0 s10.00 35000 0 0 s1350 s47250 0 0 0
Total Bid Comparison Award No. & NOBID 3032500 NoBID 537585000 NoBID 541008500 NOBID NOBID NOBID
| Award No. 10 - Permeable Paver Parking LotRoadway - Low Quanitity
Award | tem No.|Descrip Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity|  unit cost TotalPrice Unit Cost ToalPrce Unitcost ToalPrce Uit cost ToalPrice Unit cost TolalPrice Unitcost TolalPrce Unit Cost TolalPrce Unitcost ToalPrce Uit cost ToalPrce
No.
50 555,00 $16500 50 50 55000 515,000 50 50 2000 590000
o | 2 | o | 1w o
0 $10000 550000 0 0 s75.00 37500 0 0 $10000 550000
6 |Detecablewamingunits | s¢ | 1100 ES
7 |concree curb | v 20 50 45,00 $11.250 50 50 53500 587500 50 50 4000 s10000
s | 100 20 0 2800 570000 0 0 .00 587500 0 0 .00 587500
9 [concret Sidewali sy | 1% 2 50 511000 27500 50 50 s10800 527000 50 50 $10000 525000
to [lored g imprneed 50 $115.00 528750 50 50 513000 32500 50 50 8000 520000
Concrte Sidewalk-
sv | 150 =
11 |concrete Aprons 50 12000 530000 50 50 s11700 29250 50 50 510000 525000
sv | 10 2
12 [Trench Drsin 0 $150.00 $75000 0 0 $150.00 $75000 0 50 s20000 s10,000
| 100 0
130.4° [polyetnytene ipe-47Dia. | LF | 1100 s0 50 s1000 $5000 50 50 s1000 $5000 50 50 2000 510000
74 [paintd Lines e | 11000 0 0 s ss000 0 0 s200 $10000 50 50 5200 51000
112 [Topsoil and Seed sy | 120 100 50 800 $8000 50 50 s1200 12000 50 50 s1200 512000
1900 |Concrete Grid Pavements | Y | 0-1,000 0 0 su000 $70,000 0 0 s135.00 67500 0 0 s12000 550000
Permesble nerlocking
190 [Concrete Pavement - Eco- | Y 500 50 $13500 567,500 50 50 $13000 565,000 50 50 1000 s10000
hisge




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, Inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.
L —
s50-pp Conemopramen -5 | v | 010 0 © s sorsm © © s sosom © © s0m smo0m
e
o1 [unpaers o fo-1om| w0 © susm ss75m © © susm ss75m © © s12000 sc000
Tota ia Comparon Avird o 10 Noa> sa017500 Noaip Noa> Nosip sa0az500 NoaiD Noa sazgs000
s No 11 - PermessPar Parking LoRosdy - High Quanity
avart [ oesr unt | quny | esimaaurny|  unicos T e unicos Tt e unicos Tt e unicos T e unicos T e unicos Tt e unicos T e unicos T e unicos Tt e
o
© sio sw00m © © 500 szm0 © © ©
u | o | or |smamo| w0
© ss000 suas00 © © s11000 s15500 © © ©
o o wmrgus | st | 1w | 10
7 e cu | soa| 0 © 2000 s25om. © © 500 s2m0 © © ©
o fumoogogmickcun| ¢ |sorio0| %0 © 2500 s1a750 © © 2000 20500 © © ©
[ S—— s |am| © 2000 sorsn © © s saa000 © © ©
104 Soreda imprines © s soarsa © © s12000 s07500 © © ©
s lam| =
e © s ssom © © swm sarsa © © ©
o || w
2 [t oran © s10m stom. © © s10000 s1500 © © ©
v ||
s paeiroe 40 | 15 | 120 | 10 © s1000 st © © s1000 st © © ©
) - I e ) © 510 saoma © © 150 45000 © © ©
gy e s |mso| © s1000 7m0 © © 20 ssom © © ©
1900 [corcee caapavemsns | v |worso| om0 © s sa05 0000 © © s12000 sas000 © © ©
e ToRy
505 [Contepvement-Exo- | sy [s0mnsooo] 2000 © s sarsomo © © s sarsommo © © ©
e
Formee o
1009 Conrmepement- S5~ | sy | wo1so0o] 3000 © s10m sss00onc © © s12000 sas000 © © ©
e
91 [unener s |oms| 20w © susm sassonnc © © susm sassomnc © © ©
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 11 NOBID $1,627,875.00| NOBID NOBID NOBID $1,624,125.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID
| Award No. 12 - Surface Treatments - Low Quantity
Award | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
o
[ —
| o |0 | 0 © © © © © © © 000 2000
104 [Asphalt Emulsion Slurry sY 1-1,000 500 $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $50.00 '$25,000.
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 12 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $45,000.00|
|Award No. 13 - Surface Treatments - High Quantity
Award | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
o
rinoussurce © © © © © © © ©
5 | w0 [rresmen s |uomsm] 2w
104 [Asphalt Emulsion Slurry $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0.
o |uomso] 2o
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 13 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
|Award No. 14 - Crack Sealants
Award | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. ‘Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
o
——
" 4 Icrack Sealant LF 1-1000 500 0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $4.00 '$2,000.0( $7.00 $3,500.0¢
o Remfoad Ptyrer
to ot zmameCrck | 15 | 1100 | 0 © © © © © © so00 s s ssom
s
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 14 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID $5,000.00f $8,500.00f




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, Inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.
|Award No. 15 - Chain Link Fence - Low Quantity
Award | Item No. [Descripti Unit | Quantity [ Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price. Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
b
i [Vl CosiCran ik I w200 w I su2s00 w I . sa000
9 LF 0-100 50
a1 Cotd hain Link © 0000 s20000 © © 2600 s1000 © © s10000 s50000
o LF 0-100 50
1085G-4) |Vinyl Coated Chain Link 3 $0. $350.00 $350.00 $0. $0. $140.00 $140.00 $0. $0. $500.00 $500.0C
Single Gate
1085G-61 |Vinyl Coated Chain Link 31 $0. $385.00 $385.0( $0. $0. $210.00 $210.0C $0. $0. $500.00 $500.0¢
108SG-8) |Vinyl Coated Chain Link 3 $0. $425.00 $425.00 $0. $0. $290.00 $290.0C $0. $0. $500.00 $500.0C
Single Gate
1085G-~ | Vinyl Coated Chin Link 81 $0. $900.00 $900.0C $0. $0. $650.00 $650.0C $0. $0. $900.00 $900.0¢
108SG-6 | Vinyl Coated Chain Link & $0. $1,000.00 '$1,000.0( $0. $0. $750.00 $750.00 $0. $0. $900.00 $900.0C
[Double Gate
1085G-81 | Vinyl Coated Chin Link 81 $0. $1,200.00 '$1,200.0¢ $0. $0. $800.00 $800.0C $0. $0. $900.00 $900.0¢
16 9 LF 101-500 300
g [V Comd hain Link © s11.00 © © 2000 s00000 © © B
o LF 101-500 300
9 LF 101-500 300
1085G-41 | Vinyl Coated Chin Link 31 $0. $50. $0. $0. $140.00 $280.0C $0. $0. $0.
9 Ea 0-10 2
1085G-81 | Vinyl Coated Chin Link 31 $0. $90. $0. $0. $290.00 $580.0C $0. $0. $0.
1085G-4) | Vinyl Coated Chain Link & $0. $200.0C $0. $0. $650.00 $1,300.0¢ $0. $0. $0.
[Double Gate
1085G-61 | Vinyl Coated Chin Link 81 $0. $220.0C $0. $0. $750.00 '$1,500.0¢ $0. $0. $0.
1085G-8) | Vinyl Coated Chain Link & $0. $240.00 $0. $0. $1,000.00 '$2,000.0 $0. $0. $0.
[Double Gate
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 16 NO BID $33,570.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID $32,780.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID
|Award No. 17 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - Low Quantity
Award | Item No. [Descripti Unit | Quantity [ Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
b
P R B o] sosoo s suson s w w [ s
o wm| o
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 18 NO BID NO BID $67,500.00| NO BID NO BID NOBID $69,750.00| $63,750.00| NO BID
| Award No. 19 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - High Quantity
Award | Item No. [Descripti Unit | Quantity [ Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price. Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price
b
16 | 5 [Coane e otRATe | Ton | somsoe  som B I . - w I - cwamo] s szamo w




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, Inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 20 NO BID NO BID $26,000.00| NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $36,250.00|
oo s inercours s i ity
Award | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
b
a | w [ | T [soom| @ wf s - @ o - - @ @
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 22 NO BID NO BID $264,000.00| NOBID NOBID NOBID $231,000.00| $225,000.00| NO BID
| Award No. 23 - Pavement Patches - Low Quantity
Award | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
b
R A— @ wf  sum om0 s 000 o - swom N - swom
s ¢ lowm| w
u s |mso] a0
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 24 NOBID NOBID $18,000.00| NOBID $28,500.00| NOBID $60,000.00] NO BID $30,000.00]
|Award No. 25 - Latex Modified Surface Treatment - Low Quantity
Award_ | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
N
10 Mottt st @ @ @ @ @ @ @
x o Jionsw] s
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
| Award No. 27 - Sodding - Low Quantity
Award | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
b
s ot sowon suon siao @ o ssom @ @ @
21 SY 1-5000 1,000 $9.00




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

[COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc South Fork Asphal Excav Services Corazzini Asphal Laser Industries, Inc Suffolk Paving Corp Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 27 $9,000.00 $14,000.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID '$15,000.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID
o 28-Sy - High Qi
vt v o [pcr unt | quny | esimaaurny|  unicos T e unicos Tt e unicos Tt e unicos T e unicos T e unicos Tt e unicos T e unicos Tt e unicos Tt e
o
113 [Sodding $60,000.00 $8.00 $60,000. $0. $0. $12.00 $90,000. $0. $0. $0.
® T s000
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 28 '$60,000.00| $60,000.00| NOBID NOBID NOBID $90,000.00] NO BID NO BID NO BID
|Award No. 29 - Poured In Place Safety Surface
Award_ | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
o
20 | 1sug [foraintuesaey sc2smo0 © © © © © © sas00 sc2500
SY 1-1000 500 $125.00
B T el P o500 © © © © © © s0m sosom
o | v | w0 s
o P Sy
15140 [t 10 Gt ser5t000 © © © © © © s12900 seas00
SY 1-1000 500 $135.00
Tota ia Comparon Avird o 29 150000 Noai> Noai> Noaio Noaip Noaip Noa woaip s19700000
| Award No. 30 - Painted Lines - Low Quanitity
Award | item No. | Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price. Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
o
0 | 7 s ies | [ © © © © 2 s1 © © 29 st
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 30 NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $1,750.00| NO BID NO BID $1,250.00f
|Award No. 31 - Painted Lines - High Quanitity
Award | Item No. |Descripti Unit | Quantity | Estimated Quantity Unit Cost. ‘Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost ‘Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
o
a | e faneones I e ) © © © © 20 s00000 © © 150 45000
Tota ia Comparon Avird o 31 wosio Noaio Noaio NoaiD Noaip soomaq Noai> woei> P
o 32 - Concrets Ry Parking Lot Pt
) o unt | quny | esimaaurny|  unicos T e unicos T e unicos T e unicos T e unicos T e unicos T e unicos T e unicos Tt e unicos Tt e
o
% | = L I © © © © © © © s0m s350m.
st conee Top o
@ T | oso0 | a0 © © © © © © © s12600 sa400
|Asphaltic Concrete Binder
sia cwrr| oo | = © © © © © © © so500 stozs0
o s o ot
o | oso | w0 © © © © © © © 20 ss000
eyt coerts g
51-AR SQFT | 0-500 250 $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $0. $10.00 '$2,500.0
% [pameavs | 0w © © © © © © © © 2000 s10000
g | 0w % © © © © © © © 5000 2500
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 32 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $91,750.00]




