
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

2020 Annual Procurement Contract
5/27/2020

NO BID 51,750.00$  

NO BID 30,000.00$  

NO BID 15,500.00$  

40,250.00$  NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 54 62,700.00$  NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 55 11,500.00$  10,000.00$  

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 56 10,962.50$  NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 57 16,250.00$  NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 58 55,500.00$  45,000.00$  

Item Description Unit Quantity Estimated Unit Cost Total Price Unit Cost Total Price
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 59 23,500.00$  NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 60 572.00$       NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 61 1,440.00$    NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 62 2,160.00$    NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 63 NO BID NO BID

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 64 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID 1,750.00$   

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 68 NO BID 3,300.00$    

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 69 NO BID NO BID

BID NAME:
BID OPENING DATE:  

COMPANY: Barbato Nursery Corp East Island Asphalt
Award No. 50 - Asphalt Materials Loaded into Town of Riverhead Trucks

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 50

Award No. 51 - Cold Patch Loaded into Town of Riverhead Trucks
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 51

Award No. 52 - Sand Asphalt Base Course Loaded into Town of Riverhead Trucks
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 52

Award No. 53 - Baseball Field Soil Materials 
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 53

Award No. 54 - Composite Soil Mix, Pea Gravel 

Award No. 55 - Recycled Concrete Aggregate

Award No. 56 - Certified Wood Fiber Safety Surface

Award No. 57 - Landscaping Wood Mulch

Award No. 58 - Blue Stone

Award No. 59 - Trap Rock

Award No. 60 - Ready-Mix Concrete - Low Quantity

Award No. 61 - Ready-Mix Concrete - Mid Quantity

Award No. 62 - Ready-Mix Concrete - High Quantity

Award No. 63 - Drainage Pipe

Award No. 64 - Topsoil, Fertilizer, Lime

Award No. 65 - Planting Mix
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 65

Award No. 66 - Asphalt Pavement Crack and Joint Sealant - Low Quantity 
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 66

Award No. 67 - Asphalt Pavement Crack and Joint Sealant - Mid Quantity 

Award No. 69 - Drainage Rings & Top Slabs

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 67

Award No. 68 - Asphalt Pavement Crack and Joint Sealant - High Quantity 
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