
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

2020 Annual Construction Contract

 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $169,150.00 NO BID NO BID $86,000.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $142,350.00 $202,100.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $193,675.00 NO BID NO BID $102,100.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $303,455.00 $166,357.00 $283,790.00

NO BID $203,490.00 NO BID $195,085.00 NO BID $220,445.00 NO BID NO BID $180,650.00

NO BID NO BID $61,883.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $37,390.00 $64,350.00

NO BID NO BID $211,485.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $135,820.00 $116,995.50 NO BID

NO BID $71,525.00 NO BID $72,165.00 NO BID $85,525.00 NO BID NO BID $70,250.00

NO BID $330,325.00 NO BID $375,850.00 NO BID $410,095.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID $320,175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $310,325.00 NO BID NO BID $312,950.00

NO BID $1,627,875.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,624,125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45,000.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,000.00 $8,500.00

NO BID $12,260.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7,390.00 NO BID NO BID $17,700.00

NO BID $33,570.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32,780.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $26,250.00 NO BID $26,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,250.00

NO BID NO BID $67,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69,750.00 $63,750.00 NO BID

NO BID NO BID $267,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $230,280.00 $232,200.00 NO BID

NO BID NO BID $26,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,250.00

NO BID NO BID $66,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69,750.00 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID $264,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $231,000.00 $225,000.00 NO BID

NO BID NO BID $5,100.00 NO BID $6,000.00 NO BID $10,000.00 NO BID $10,000.00

NO BID NO BID $18,000.00 NO BID $28,500.00 NO BID $60,000.00 NO BID $30,000.00

BID NAME:
BID OPENING DATE:  5/27/2020

COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc. South Fork Asphalt Excav Services Corazzini Asphalt Laser Industries, Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.
Award No. 1 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - Low Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 1

Award No. 2 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - High Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 2

Award No. 3 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - Low Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 3

Award No. 4 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - High Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 4

Award No. 5 Drainage Installation

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 5

Award No. 6 - Mill and Overlay - Low Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No.6

Award No. 7 - Mill and Overlay - High Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No.7

Award No. 8 - Concrete Flatwork and Curbing - Low Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 8

Award No. 9 - Concrete Flatwork and Curbing - High Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 9

Award No. 10 - Permeable Paver Parking Lot/Roadway - Low Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 10

Award No. 11 - Permeable Paver Parking Lot/Roadway - High Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 11

Award No. 12 - Surface Treatments - Low Quantity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 12

Award No. 13 - Surface Treatments - High Quantity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 13

Award No. 14 - Crack Sealants 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 14

Award No. 15 - Chain Link Fence - Low Quantity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 15

Award No. 16 - Chain Link Fence - High Quantity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 16

Award No. 17 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - Low Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 17

Award No. 18 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - Mid Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 18

Award No. 19 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - High Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 19

Award No. 20 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - Low Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 20

Award No. 21 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - Mid Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 21

Award No. 22 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - High Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 22

Award No. 23 - Pavement Patches - Low Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 23

Award No. 24 - Pavement Patches - High Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 24



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

COMPANY: Louis Barbato Landscaping The LandTek Group, Inc. South Fork Asphalt Excav Services Corazzini Asphalt Laser Industries, Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. Rosemar KJB Industries Inc.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$9,000.00 $14,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$60,000.00 $60,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $90,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$195,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $197,000.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,750.00 NO BID NO BID $1,250.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9,000.00 NO BID NO BID $4,500.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $91,750.00

Award No. 25 - Latex Modified Surface Treatment - Low Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 25

Award No. 26 - Latex Modified Surface Treatment - High Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 26

Award No. 27 - Sodding - Low Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 27

Award No. 31 - Painted Lines - High Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 31

Award No. 32 - Concrete Roadway/Parking Lot Patches

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 32

Award No. 28 - Sodding - High Quantity 

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 28

Award No. 29 - Poured In Place Safety Surface

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 29

Award No. 30 - Painted Lines - Low Quanitity

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 30


