Teresa Baldinucci

Timothy Hubbard 4 W Second Street Purchasing Director
Supervisor Riverhead, NY 11901 631-727-3200 Ext. 271
TO: Supervisor Hubbard; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Kern,

Merrifield, Rothwell, Waski; James Wooten, Town Clerk ; Vanessa
LeCann, Deputy Town Clerk; Drew Dillingham, Town Engineer; Ken
Testa, Town Engineer

CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing Technician; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s
Office; Shannon Clifford, Engineering

FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Director
DATE: August 14, 2025
RE: Bid Opening Report for 2025 Annual Construction Contract

9 bids were received and opened on August 7 at 11am:

Laser Industries Inc

1775 Route 25

PO Box 315

Ridge, NY 11961
nickc@laserindustriesinc.com

Delalio Coal & Stone Co., Inc.
DBA South Fork Asphalt

224A North Main St
Southampton, NY 11968
general@southforkasphalt.com

The LandTek Group Inc

105 Sweeneydale Ave

Bayshore, NY 11706
estimatinggroup@landtekgroup.com

Suffolk Paving Corp

30 N Dunton Ave
Medford, NY 11763
stefansp@optonline.net

KJB Industries Inc

14 Center Dr
Riverhead, NY 11901
kjbindustries@aol.com

Bid tabulation is attached. Bids have been sent to the Engineering Department for

review.

Rosemar Construction Inc
56 Pine Street

East Moriches, NY 11940
Jbellotti@rosemar.com

Safety Marking LLC

255 Hancock Ave
Bridgeport, CT 06605
cthomas@safetymarking.net;

Grace Industries LLC

336 South Service Road
Melville, NY 11747
jkassap@hauglandlic.com

Corazzini Asphalt

PO Box 1281

Cutchogue, NY 11935
office@corazziniasphalt.com



COMMODITY: 2025 ANNUAL CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT

BID OPENING DATE: 8/7/2025
DeLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork
COMPANY NAME: Safety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. Rosemar Contracting Inc ~ Grace Industries LLC Corazzini Asphalt
CONTACT: Steven Treglia John Gulino Perry DeLalio Jr. Michael Ryan Joseph Arpin Bob Panchak Linda Bianca Jonathan Kassap Richarrd Corazzini
PHONE #: 203-333-6870 631-924-0644 631-288-0037 631-691-2381 631-698-1791 631-727-5600 631-878-2323 516-336-6720 631-734-5600
[Award No. 1 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
1 2 Unclassified cy 12200 100 $95.00 $9,500.00] $60.00] $6,000.00 $60.00 $6,000.00
Excavation

Removal of

20 cy 1-200 100 $95.00] $9.500.00f $60.00) $6.000.00) $80.00] $8.000.00)
Unsuitable Material

[Embankment -

38-B cy 1200 100 550.00] $5,000.00} $30.00) $3,000.00 $50.00] $5,000.00)
Borrow
Embankment - Select
3S-SGF . cy 1-200 100 $80.00] $8,000.00f $30.00) $3,000.00 $50.00] $5,000.00)
Granular Fill

[Embankment -

35-GS sY 1-200 100 $50.00 $5,000.00] $30.00] $3,000.00 $45.00 $4,500.00
Grading Subgrade

Stabilized Mixed-In-

4 Place Recycled Base | SY 1-2,000 1,000 $20.00 $20,000.00) $18.00) $18.000.00 $20.00 $20,000.00)
Course
Recycled Conerete | .
4P PN cy 1-200 100 $90.00 $9,000.00) $30.00) $3,000.00 $60.00 $6,000.00
25.C Casting Adjustment | Ea 15 3 $500.00) $1,500.00 $500.00 $1,500.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
258 Subgrade Area cy 15 3 $50.00) $150.00 $50.00 $150.00 $100.00 $300.00]
Material
25 ;2‘::’" Pavement Ea. 15 3 $2.500.00) $7.500.00) $1.500.00 $4.500.00]  $2.500.00) §7,500.00
Rut Avoidance
49 Asphalt Concrete, Ton 1-200 100 $260.00) $26,000.00} $200.00) $20,000.00 $210.00) $21,000.00)
Type GFRA Top
Course
Rut Avoidance
52 Asphalt Concrete, Ton 1-200 100 $260.00) $26,000.00} $200.00) $20,000.00 $150.00) $15,000.00)
Type 3RA Binder
Course
55 (Asphalt Conrete Ton 1-200 100 $250.00) $25,000.001 $75.00] $7,500.00 $150.00) $15,000.00)
Type 1. Base Course
57 Asphalt Emulsions | Gal 1,000-5000 3000 $5.00 $15.000.00) $4.50 $13,500.00 $4.00) $12,000.00
112 Topsoil and Seed sy 1-500 250 $18.00 $4,500.00) $15.00 $3,750.00 $20.00 $5,000.00
116 Pavement Markings | LF 1-1000 500 $5.00 $2,500.00) $5.00 $2,500.00 $5.00 $2,500.00

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 1 NO BID $174,150.00 NO BID NO BID $115,400.00 $134,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. _ Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
Award No. 2 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - High Quantity

Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
No. Quantity
2 2 Unclassified cy 201 - 500 350 $90.00 $31,500.00} $50.00] $17,500.00 $40.00 $14,000.00) $60.00] $21,000.00)
JExcavation
2u Removal of cy 201 - 500 350 $80.00 $28,000.00} $5.00 $1,750.00 $50.00 $17,500.00) $5.00 $1,750.00
Unsuitable Material
35-B i::’::k"'e"' N cy 201 - 500 350 $60.00 $21,000.00} $5.00 $1,750.00 $20.00 $7.000.00 $5.00 $1,750.00
- Seleet

cy 201 - 500

$30.00] $10,500.00) $5.00) $1,750.00) $40.00] $14,000.00) $5.00) $1,750.00)
Granular Fill

35-GS [Pmbankment - sy 201 - 500 350 $50.00 $17,500.00} $5.00 $1,750.00 $8.00 $2,800.00 $5.00 $1,750.00
Grading Subgrade

Stabilized Mixed-ln-
4 Place Recycled Base | SY 2,001 - 5,000 3500 $8.00) $28,000.00] $7.00) $24,500.00 $10.00) $35,000.00] $7.00) $24,500.00)
Course

[Recycled Concrete

4p cy 201 - 500 350 $80.00) $28,000.00] $10.00 $3.500.00 $22.00) $7.700.00 $10.00 $3.500.00
Aggregate
25.C (Casting Adjustment | Ea. 610 8 $600.00) $4.800.00) $400.00 $3.200.00 $600.00 $4.800.00 $400.00 $3.200.00
N Subgrade Arca }
258 Ml oy 610 8 $100.00] $800.00 $100.00 $800.00 $100.00 $800.00) $110.00 $880.00)
25.p }'}2"2:‘“ Pavement Ea 6-10 8 $1,200.00) $9.600.00] $1,000.00 $8.00000]  $2.300.00 $18.400.00[  $1.100.00 $8,800.00)
Rut
Avoidance
49 S;Z';]“:e Ton 201-500 350 $200.00] $70,000.00] $125.00 $43,750.00 $135.00 $47,250.00) $125.00 $43,750.00)
Type 6FRA
Top Course
Rut Avoidance
52 Asphalt Conerete, | | 201-500 350 $200.00) $70,000.00} $110.00) $38,500.00 $135.00) $47,250.00) $110.00) $38,500.00)
Type 3RA Binder
Course
55 [sphalt Concrete Ton 201-500 350 $150.00) $52,500.00} $30.00] $10,500.00 $120.00) $42,000.00) $30.00] $10,500.00)
Type 1. Base Course
s7 Asphalt Emulsions | Gal 5001-15.000 | 10000 $5.00) $50,000.001 $2.00) $20,000.00 $2.00) $20,000.00] $2.15 $21,500.00)
12 [Topsoil and Seed Sy 501 - 1,500 1000 $18.00) $18,000.00] $7.00) $7.000.00 $12.00) $12,000.00) $8.00) $8,000.00
116 Pavement Markings | LF 1,001-5000 3,000 $2.00 $6.000.00) $1.50 $4.500.00 $2.00 $6.000.00 $2.00 $6.000.00
‘Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 2 NO BID $446.200.00 NO BID NO BID $188,750.00 $296,500.00 $197,130.00 NO BID NO BID




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
[Award No. 3 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Iiem No|Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
No. Quantity
Clearing and
3 1 rusbine Acre 025 1 $20,000.00) $20,000.00) $20,000.00 $20,000.00]  $25.000.00) $25,000.00) $18,000.00] 18,0000
i
2 Unclassified cy 1200 100 $90.00 $9,000.00] $60.00] $6,000.00 $80.00 $8,000.00| $50.00)  $5,000.00
JExcavation
388 E::’::k'“e"' N cy 12200 100 $50.00 $5,000.00] $30.00] $3,000.00 $50.00 $5.000.00| $3000]  $3,000.00
[Fmbankment - Select| .y 1-200 100 $50.00 $5.000.00) $40.00) $4,000.00 $60.00 $6.000.00 $40.00|  $4.000.00
Granular Fill
38-GS Embankment - 3% 1200 100 $20.00) $2,000.00) $20.00) $2,000.00) $40.00} $4,000.00) $20.00} $2,000.00)
Grading Subgrade
Stabilized Mixed-ln-
4 Place Recycled Base | SY 1-2,000 1,000 $20.00 $20.000.00) $18.00) $18,000.00 $23.00) $23,000.00] $15.00]  $15,000.00
Course
Recycled Conerete | 3 ) N
4p cy 1200 100 $90.00 $9.000.00) $50.00) $5.000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $35.00]  $3.500.00
Aggregate
25.C (Casting Adjustment | Ea. 15 3 $500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $1.500.00 $600.00 $1.800.00 $300.00 $900.00
. Subgrade Arca } _ ﬁ ﬁ
258 N oy 15 3 $125.00 $375.00 $90.00 $270.00 $100.00 $300.00] $90.00) $270.00]
25p :}2";:'“ Pavement Ea 15 3 $2,500.00) $7.500.00] $2,000.00 $6.000.00]  $2.500.00 $7,500.00 $1,75000]  $5,250.00
Rut Avoidance
49 Asphalt Concrete, | 12200 100 $260.00] $26,000.00] $200.00 $20,000.00 $215.00 $21,500.00) $185.00]  $18,500.00)
Type 6FRA Top
Course
Rut Avoidance
52 Asphalt Concrete, | ) 12200 100 $260.00) $26,000.00} $200.00) $20,000.00 $215.00) $21,500.00) $160.00]  $16,000.00)
Type 3RA Binder
Course
Asphalt Concrete s
55 Ton 1200 100 $250.00] $25,000.00] $50.00) $5.000.00 $160.00 $16,000.00) $40.00]  $4,000.00
Type 1, Base Course
s7 Asphalt Emulsions | Gal 1,000-5000 3000 $5.00 $15.000.00) $5.00 $15.000.00 $4.00 $12,000.00) sa7s|  $14.250.00)
112 [Topsoil and Seed sy 1-500 250 $18.00 $4,500.00) $15.00) $3,750.00 $16.00 $4,000.00 51000 $2.500.00
116 Pavement Markings | LF 1-1000 500 $3.00 $1,500.00) $3.00) $1,500.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $1.00) $500.00
1igswfStraw/Woed Fiber f -, 1-500 250 $5.00 $1,250.00] $5.00 $1,250.00 $6.00 $1,500.00 $1.00 $250.00)
Mulch-Temporary
118-SM Seed and Mulch - sy 1500 250 $5.00 $1,250.00] $4.00 $1,000.00 $4.00 $1,000.00| $1.00 $250.00)
Temporary
od and
118-SSWM Straw/Wood Fiber | SY 1-500 250 $7.00) $1,750.00) $5.00) $1.250.00 $6.00) $1,500.00 $3.00) $750.00
IMulch - Temporan
18- T:“;‘;:::: LF 1-500 250 $15.00 $3.750.00) $10.00) $2,500.00 $16.00) $4,000.00 s1s00]  $3,750.00
118G Geotextiles sy 1-200 100 $18.00 $1,800.00) $10.00 $1,000.00 $12.00) $1,200.00 $10.00]  $1,000.00
Silt Fence - 3 : )
118-SF LF 1-500 250 $15.00 $3.750.00) $15.00) $3,750.00 $16.00 $4,000.00 s15.00]  $3.750.00
Temporary
Drainage Structure
118-D nlet Protection, Ea. 15 3 $350.00] $1.050.00) $300.00 $900.00 $300.00 $900.00) $100.00 $300.00]
Prefabricated -
Temporary
118.) ute Mesh sy 1200 100 $4.00 $400.00 $2.00 520000 5200 520000 5200 520000
Stabilized
118-SCEConstruction sy 1-200 100 $20.00 $2,000.00) $20.00) $2,000.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $2000]  $2.000.00
Entrance
‘Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 3 NO BID $194,375.00 NO BID NO BID $144,870.00 $179.400.00 NO BID NO BID $124,920.00




DeLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. uffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
[Award No. 4 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - High Quantity
Award Estimated
Item NoJDescription Unit Quantity Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost $0.00]  Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
No. Quantity
Clearing and -
4 1 eatbine Acre 265 s $3,500.00 $17,500.00]  $7.000.00) 53500000 5400000 $20,000.00) $3,800.00 19,0000
i
2 Unclassified cy 201 - 500 350 $40.00] $14,000.00 $50.00 $17,500.00) $44.00] $15,400.00) $30.00)  $10,500.00
JExcavation
35-B E::’::k'““"' B cy 201 - 500 350 $1.00| $350.00) $15.00 $5.250.00 $1.00| $350.00) $1.00 $350.00)
[Fmbankment - Select| -y 201 -500 350 $1.00 $350.00 $30.00 $10.500.00) $1.00 $350.00 $1.00 $350.00

Granular Fill

38GS Embankmen - sy 201 - 500 350 $1.00) $350.00 $6.00) $2,100.00 $1.00) $350.00] $1.00) $350.00]
Grading Subgrade

Stabilized Mixed-Tn-

4 Place Recycled Base | SY 2,001-5000 | 3500 $6.50 $22,750.00 $10.00 $35,000.00) $7.00 $24,500.00 s6.00]  $21,000.00)

Course

[Recycled Conerete

4P oy 201 - 500 350 $25.00 $8.750.00 $20.00) $7,000.00 $33.00 $11,550.00] $2000]  $7.000.00
Ageregate
25.C (Casting Adjustment | Ea. 610 8 $500.00 $4,000.00 $600.00 $4.800.00 $750.00 $6.000.00 $200.00]  $1,600.00)
. Subgrade Arca }
255 Ml cy 610 3 $20.00 $160.00) $100.00 $800.00) $22.00 $176.00) $5.00) $40.00)
25-p :}2";:‘0 Pavement Ea 6-10 8 $500.00) $4,00000]  $2,000.00 $16,000.00) $500.00) $4,000.00 $30.00 $240.00)
Rut Avoidance
49 Asphalt Conerete, | 201-500 350 $125.00) $43,750.00 $130.00) $45,500.00) $135.00) $47,250.00) $135.00]  $47,250.00)
Type 6FRA Top
Course
[Rut Avoidance
52 Asphalt Conerete, | 201-500 350 $100.00) $35,000.00 $130.00) $45,500.00) $110.00) $38,500.00) $110.00  $38,500.00)
Type 3RA Binder
Course
55 Asphalt Conerete Ton 201-500 350 $35.00) $12,250.00 $130.00) $40.00] $14,000.00) $30.00)  $10,500.00
Type 1, Base Course
s7 Asphalt Emulsions | Gal 5001-15000 | 10000 $3.00 $30.000.00 $3.00 $30,000.00 $32.500.00) s3.00]  $30,000.00)
112 [Topsoil and Seed Sy 501 - 1,500 1000 $10.00 $10,000.00 $12.00) $12,000.00) $15,000.00) $12.00]  $12,000.00
116 Pavement Markings | LF 1,001-5000 3,000 $1.50 $4.500.00 $1.50 $4,500.00 $2.00 $6.000.00 siso|  $4.500.00)
HigswfSiraw/Woed Fiber f -, 500-1500 1,000 $2.00 $2,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 $2.00]  $2,000.00
Muleh - Temporary
118-SM ?::p"o':i;""'“h - sy 500-1500 1,000 $2.00 $2,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 $2.00]  $2,000.00
Seed and
118-SSWM Straw/Wood Fiber | SY 500-1500 1000 $2.00 $2,000.00 $4.00 $4,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 $2.00]  $2,000.00

Mulch - Temporary

1185 Suraw Bale - LF 500-1500 1,000 $8.00) $8,000.00 $15.00) $15,000.00) $10.00 $10,000.00] $9.00]  $9.000.00
Temporary

118-G Geotextiles SY 201 - 500 350 $2.00] $700.00| $3.00] $1,050.00f $3.00] $1,050.00f $3.00] $1,050.00f
118-SF Silt Fence - LF 501 - 1,500 1000 $10.00] $10,000.00 $15.00 $15,000.00) $10.00] $10,000.00) $1.00)  $11,000.00
Temporary

Drainage Structure
118-D nfct Protection, Ea 6-10 8 $200.00) $1,600.00 $300.00) $2,400.00 $220.00) $1,760.00 $200.00]  $1,600.00)
Prefabricated -

Temporary

118-J Jute Mesh SY 201 - 500 350 $3.00) $1,050.00) $4.00) $1,400.00) $5.00) $1,750.00) 54.50) $1,575.00)
Stabilized
118-SCE|Construction sY 201 - 500 350 $4.00) $1,400.00 $10.00] $3,500.00) $5.00) $1,750.00) $1.00) $350.00)
Entrance

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 4| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $236,460.00 $365,300.00 $271,236.00 NO BID $233,755.00




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAM afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
[Award No. 5 Drainage Installation
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
No. Quantity
5 2 Unclassified cy 201 - 500 350 $80.00 $28,000.00} $30.00 $10,500.00) $30.00] $10,500.00)
JExcavation
4-p Recycled Conerete | -y 1-100 50 $80.00 $4,000.00] $50.00 $2,500.00 $30.00] $1,500.00
Aggregate
Remove and Replace
7RR " LF 1-100 50 $100.00) $5.000.00) $120.00 $6,000.00 $100.00 $5,000.00
(Concrete Curb
Remove and Replace ) X )
7ARR ) LF 1100 50 $40.00 $2,000.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $50.00) $2,500.00
Concrete Header
Remove and Replace | 3 3
9RR temove Sy 1-50 25 $180.00 $4,500.00) $220.00 $5,500.00 $180.00 $4,500.00
Cone. Sidewalk
13U-4" ﬁ‘:‘""“‘" Pipe-4" | g 1-100 50 $15.00 §750.00) $6.00 $300.00) $14.00] §700.00)
13U-6" g:‘:"dm‘" Pipe-6" | 1 1-100 50 $18.00 $900.00) $10.00 $500.00) $20.00] $1,000.00|
13U-8" g:‘f”d'a‘" Fipe 8" |y 1100 50 $22.00 $1,100.00 $12.00 $600.00 $20.00) $1,000.00
13P-4" ;“’;’e'h"e“ Fiped™| 1 1-100 50 $24.00 $1,200.00] $12.00 $600.00) $20.00] $1,000.00
Polyethylene Pipe -
13p-12" el LF 1-100 50 $40.00 $2,000.00 $30.00 $1,500.00 $40.00) $2,000.00
13P-15" T;’iy;'l:y'g“e Pipe- | 1-100 50 $45.00) $2,250.00 $30.00) $1,500.00) $40.00) $2,000.00)
13p-18" T;};‘;‘I‘flc"° Pipe- | g 1-100 50 $55.00) $2.750.00 $40.00) $2,000.00) 55000 $2,500.00)
13P-24" ;’:l’;":y'e“ Pipe- | g 1-100 50 $80.00) $4,000.00) $55.00} $2,750.00) $75.00) $3,750.00)
13P-30" ',gl’;'i:"'e"e Pipe- | 1 1-100 50 $80.00} $4,000.00) $60.00} $3,000.00) $72.00) $3,600.00)
Polyethylenc Pipe -
13P-36" o b LF 1-100 50 $100.00) $5.000.00) $70.00 $3,500.00 $90.00) $4,500.00
13p-48" 5;}”;:‘?'““ Pipe- | g 1-100 50 $115.00 $5.750.00 $80.00) $4,000.00) 590,00 $4,500.00)
Leaching Pools (8' _ . 35
214 s 41 Ea 15 3 $4,500.00 $13,500.00) $4,500.00) $13,50000] 5400000 $12,000.00
Ceaching Pools (8 _ .
218 i 81 Ea 15 3 $5.000.00) $15.000.00) $5.200.00) 51560000 $5.000.00 $15,000.00]
21C [Leaching Pools (8 Ea 1-5 3 $15,600.00} $5,500.00) $16,500.00]  $5,200.00 $15,600.00}
Dia.x 12'L)
21D ;f:i‘?ﬁ)%“'s I Y 1-5 3 $4.800.00 $14,400.00] $5,500.00 $16,500.00]  $4.500.00) $13.,500.00)
20E 'E::ih;fﬂp”'s ar g, 1-5 3 $6,100.00 $18,300.00} $6,200.00 $18,600.00]  $7,300.00) $21,900.00)
Ceaching Pools (10° L
21F in 170 Ea 15 3 $6,700.00) $20.100.00) $6.600.00) $19.800.00| 5600000 $18,000.00]
3A (Catch Basins Type A | Ea. 15 3 $4,500.00) $13.500.00) $4.400.00) 1320000 $5.000.00 $15.,000.00)
3B (Catch Basins Type B | Ea. 15 3 $4,500.00) $13.500.00) $4.700.00) 1410000 $4.500.00 $13.500.00)
23AXD (Catch Basins Type A 15 3 $700.00) $2,100.00] $600.00) $1,800.00 $600.00) $1,800.00
Add Dept
23BXD (Catch Basins Type B -y 15 3 $900.00) $2,700.00] $800.00) $2,400.00 $600.00) $1,800.00
Add Depth
25.C (Casting Adjusiment | Ea. 15 3 $400.00) $1.200.00) $800.00 $2400.00]  $1.200.00) $3,600.00
258 i;’:’i:j‘ Area cy 1 1 $100.00 $100.00 $200.00 $200.00 $100.00 $100.00
N 10X10 Pavement _ - .
25-p e Ea 15 3 $1,800.00) $5.400.00) $2,200.00) $6,600.00]  $1,200.00] $3,600.00
27-MH [Manholes-41D/Base | -, 15 3 $3,900.00) $11,700.00} $4,300.00] $12,900.00) $500.00) $1,500.00
Section 36"
[Manholes-
27-MHADX 41D/ Additional VF 15 3 $800.00) $2,400.00) $600.00 $1,800.00 $700.00 $2,100.00
Depth




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: Safety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. Rosemar Contracting Inc ~ Grace Industries LLC Corazzini Asphalt
Drop Inlets-2' . y
27-D1 o | Ee 15 3 $2,500.00) $7,500.00] $3,000.00] $9.000.00)  $3,000.00] $9.000.00
ID/Base Section 3
53 Tack Coat Gal 1-10 5 $25.00 $125.00) $20.00 $100.00) $15.00] $75.00
112 Topsoil and Seed SY 1-500 250 $21.00 $5,250.00} $25.00 $6,250.00) $20.00] $5,000.00)
‘Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 5| NO BID §235,575.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $217,500.00 $203,625.00 NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 6 - Mill and Overlay - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price
No. Quantity

6 2u Removal of cy 150 25 $5.00 $125.00) $10.00 $250.00) $20.00] $500.00) $10.00 $250.00)
Unsuitable Material

458 Suabilized Sol cy 125 10 $1.00| $10.00] $50.00 $500.00) $1.00| $10.00 $1.00 $10.00
Aggregate Subbase

[Asphalt Concrete
48 Truing and Leveling | Ton 1-200 100 $40.00] $4,000.00 $150.00) $15,000.00) $40.00] $4,000.00 $50.00)  $5.000.00
Course

Rut Avoidance
[Asphalt Concrete,
Type 6FRA Top
Course

Ton 1200 100 $150.00) $15,000.00] $165.00) $16,500.00) $170.00) $17,000.00) $140.00)  $14,000.00]

Rut Avoidance
[Asphalt Concrete,
Type 3RA Binder
Course

Ton 1200 100 $40.00) $4,000.00 $155.00) $15,500.00) $40.00) $4,000.00) $50.00] $5,000.00)

Milling of Asphaltic

y sy 1-3000 1,500 $10.00) $15,000.00] $9.00) $13,500.00) $13.50) $20,250.00) $8.00]  $12,000.00
Concrete Pavement

116 Pavement Markings | LF 1-2,000 1,000 $2.00) $2,000.00 $3.00) $3,000.00) $3.50) $3,500.00) $1.50) $1,500.00)

118-SWM Suraw/Wood Fiber | gy, 1-500 250 $1.00| $250.00) $1.00 $250.00) $1.00| $250.00) $1.00 $250.00)
Muleh - Temporary

Seed and Mulch -

118-SM sy 1500 250 $1.00) $250.00 $12.00) $3,000.00 $1.00) $250.00] $1.00) $250.00]
Temporary
Seed and
118-SSWM Straw/Wood Fiber | SY 1-500 250 $1.00) $250.00 $1.00) $250.00] $1.00) $250.00] $1.00) $250.00]

Mulch - Temporary

18-S Straw Bale - LF 1-500 250 $8.00) $2,000.00 $12.00) $3,000.00 $10.00 $2,500.00 s6.00]  $1,500.00
Temporary

118G Gootextiles sy 1200 100 $1.00) $100.00 $10.00) $1,000.00) $1.00) $100.00 S1.00) $100.00

118-SF T:I'“Z‘O':;; LF 1-500 250 $8.00 $2,000.00 $12.00 $3,000.00 $10.00) $2,500.00 s6.00]  $1,500.00

Drainage Structure
118-D Inlet Protecion, Ea. 15 5 $200.00) $1,000.00 $300.00) $1,500.00 $450.00) $2.250.00 $100.00) $500.00)
Prefabricated -

Temporary

118-J Jute Mesh SY 1-200 100 $1.00) $100.00) $1.00) $100.00) $1.00) $100.00) $1.00) $100.00)
Stabilized
118-SCE Construction sy 1-200 100 $1.00) $100.00) $10.00] $1,000.00) $1.00) $100.00) $1.00) $100.00)
Entrance

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 6| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46,185.00 §77,350.00 $57,560.00 NO BID $42,310.00




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
[Award No. 7 - Mill and Overlay - High Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity] Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
No. Quantity
7 2u Removal of oy 51-100 75 $1.00 $75.00] $10.00 $750.00) $1.00 §75.00 $1.00 §75.00
Unsuitable Material
458 Suabilized Soil cy 26-50 35 $1.00| $35.00) $50.00 $1,750.00 $1.00| $35.00 $1.00 $35.00
Aggregate Subbase
[Asphalt Concrete
48 Truing and Leveling | Ton 201-1000) 600 $40.00 $24,000.00 $110.00 $66,000.00] $50.00 $30,000.00] $35.00]  $21,000.00
Course
Rut Avoidance
49 Asphalt Conerete, Ton 201-1000) 600 $88.00 $52.800.00 $115.00 $69.000.00) $89.00 $53.400.00] $92.00  $55.200.00
Type 6FRA Top
Course
Rut Avoidance
52 Asphalt Conerete, Ton 201-1000) 600 $40.00 $24,000.00 $110.00 $66.000.00) $50.00 $30,000.001 $40.00]  $24,000.00
Type 3RA Binder
Course
59 [Milling of Asphalic | gy 3001-5000) 4,000 $4.50) $18.000.00 $7.00) $28,000.00] $19.400.00] s4.75]  $19.000.00
(Concrete Pavement
116 Pavement Markings | LF 1-20000 1,000 $1.50 $1.500.00 $2.50 $2,500.00 $2.50 $2,500.00 $200]  $2.000.00

118-SWM Suran/Wood Fiber | gy, s501-1000) 750 $1.00 §750.00) $1.00 $750.00] $1.00 $750.00] $1.00 $750.00)
Muleh - Temporary

Seed and Mulch -

118-SM Femporary sy s01-1000) 750 $1.00) $750.00 $12.00) $9,000.00 $1.00) $750.00] $1.00) $750.00]
| N
Straw/Wood Fiber | SY s01-1000) 750 $1.00) $750.00 $1.00) $750.00] $1.00) $750.00] $1.00) $750.00]
Muich - Temporar
Straw Bale - L

18-S LE 501-1000] 750 $1.00) $750.00 $12.00) $9.000.00 $1.00) $750.00] $1.00) $750.00]
Temporary

118-G Geotextiles sy 201-500) 350 $1.00) $350.00 $10.00) $3.,500.00 $1.00) $350.00) $1.00) $350.00)

118-SF T:.‘;::;: LF 501-1000) 750 $1.00) $750.00 $12.00) $9.000.00 $1.00) $750.00] $1.00) $750.00]

Drainage Structure
118-D Inlet Protecion, Ea. 610 10 $200.00) $2,000.00 $300.00) $3,000.00| $425.00) $4,250.00 $150.00]  $1,500.00)
Prefabricated -

Temporary

118-J Jute Mesh SY 201-500f 500 $1.00) $500.00) $1.00) 5500.00) $1.00) 5$500.00) $1.00) 5§500.00)
Stabilized
118-SCE Construction sy 201-500f 350 $1.00) $350.00) $1.00) $350.00) $1.00) $350.00) $1.00) $350.00)
Entrance

Total Bid Comparison Award No.7| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $127,360.00 $269,850.00 $144,610.00 NO BID $127,760.00




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
[Award No. 8 - Conerete Flatwork and Curbing - Low Quanitity
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
8 2u Removal of oy 44571 5 $90.00 $450.00) $70.00] $350.00] $100.00) $500.00]
Unsuitable Material
nTe Wamine
6 S:Ts"“h'e Waming | g 44586 10 $75.00 §750.00) $45.00] $450.00) $100.00) $1,000.00|
7 Concrete Curb LF 1-200 100 $55.00 $5,500.00) $65.00 $6,500.00 $85.00) $8,500.00
7A Concrete Header LF 1-200 100 $20.00) $2,000.00) $20.00 $2,000.00 $10.00) $1,000.00
Remove and Replace
7RR . LF 1200 100 $60.00) $6,000.00) $70.00 $7,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00]
Concrete Curb
Remove and Replace . . N N
7ARR ) LF 1-200 100 $25.00 $2.500.00 $22.00 $2.200.00 $10.00 $1,000.00
Concrete Header
8 J(‘L"{‘;’" Belgian Block| - 1-200 100 $55.00 0.00 $30.00] $3,000.00 $60.00 $6,000.00
Remove and Replace
SRR [Jumbo Belgian Block| LF 1200 100 $57.00) $5,700.00) $40.00 $4,000.00 $65.00) $6,500.00
Curb
9 Concrete Sidewalk | sY 1-100 50 $120.00] $6,000.00) $140.00 $7,000.00 $130.00 $6,500.00
Remove and Replace | .
9RR sy 1-100 50 S117.00| $5.850.00) $150.00 $7.500.00 $140.00 $7,000.00
Concrete Sidewalk
(Colored and
1047 imprinted Conerete | SY 1100 50 $140.00) $7.000.00) $150.00 §7,500.00 $160.00 $8,000.00
Sidewalk - 4°
(Colored and
106" imprinted Conerete | SY 1100 50 $165.00 $8.250.00) $160.00 $8,000.00 $165.00 $8.250.00
Sidewalk - 6"
Remove and Replace
10-4"RR (Colored and sy 1100 50 $160.00 $8.,000.00) $160.00 $8.000.00 $160.00 $8,000.00
Imprinted Concrete
Sidewalk - 4"

[Remove and Replace

10-6"RR (Colored and 3% 1-100 50 $178.00) $8,900.00) $170.00) $8,500.00) $165.00) $8,250.00)
Imprinted Conerete -

"

1 Concrete Aprons sY 150 25 $126.00) $3,150.00} $140.00) $3,500.00) $160.00) $4,000.00
Remove and Replace | .,
11IRR " SY 125 10 $162.00) $1,620.00] $160.00) $1,600.00 $180.00) $1,800.00
Concrete Aprons
112 Topsoil and Seed sy 1-200 100 $18.00) $1.800.00) $18.00] $1,800.00 $16.00) $1,600.00
Total Bid Comparison Award No. §] NO BID $78,970.00 NO BID $78.900.00 NO BID $87.900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Award No. 8A - Trench Drain and Polyethylene Pipe-4" Dia. Low Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price
8A 12 Trench Drain LF 1-100 50 $125.00) $6,250.00} $600.00) $30,000.00)
13p-4" ‘D‘;Lyeﬂ\ylenc Piped™| 1-200 100 $17.00] $1,700.00f $10.00] $1,000.00
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 8A| NO BID $7.950.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Award No. 8B - Trench Drain and Polyethylene Pipe-4" Dia. High Quantity

‘Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Totl Price ol Price Total Price ol Price Totl Price Totl Price
5B 12 Trench Drain LF 101300 200 $105.00) $21,000.00) $400.00 $80,000.00)
Polyethylenc Pipe4"
13p-4" ovetiene PIpet -y 201-500 0 $15.00 $5.250.00) $10.00 $3,500.00

Dia.

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 8B| NO BID 5§26,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $83,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
[Award No. 9 - Conerete Flatwork and Curbing - High Quanitity
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
9 2u Removal of oy 1120 15 $90.00 $1,350.00] $75.00] $1,125.00 $100.00) $1,500.00
Unsuitable Material
6 S:T:"“Ne Waming | g 26-100 60 $75.00 $4,500.00] $50.00] $3,000.00 $100.00) $6,000.00
7 Concrete Curb LF 201 - 1,000 600 $32.00) $19.200.00] $40.00 $24,000.00) $60.00) $36,000.00)
7A Concrete Header LF 201 - 1,000 600 $20.00) $12,000.00} $18.00 $10,800.00) $40.00) $24,000.00)
Remove and Replace
7RR . LF 201- 1,000 600 $33.00) $19.800.00] $48.00 $28,800.00) $70.00) $42,000.00]
Concrete Curb
Remove and Replace | X
7ARR ) LF 201-1.000 600 $22.00 $13.200.00) $20.00) $12,000.00 $40.00 $24,000.00)
(Concrete Curb
8 J(‘L"{‘:" Belgian Block| - 201 - 1,000 600 23.00 $13,800.00} $23.00) $13,800.00) $60.00 $36,000.00)
Remove and Replace
SRR [Jumbo Belgian Block| LF 201 - 1,000 600 $25.00) $15,000.00] $25.00 $15,000.00] $70.00) $42,000.00]
Curb
9 Concrete Sidewalk | SY 101-500 300 $108.00] $32.400.00) $110.00 $33,000.00] $130.00 $39,000.00]
Remove and Replace
9RR sy 101-500 300 $120.00] $36,000.00] $130.00 $39,000.00] $140.00 $42,000.00]

Concrete Sidewalk

Colored and
10-4" Imprinted Concrete | SY 101-500 300 $§130.00) $39,000.00) $120.00) $36,000.00) $160.00) $48,000.00)
Sidewalk - 4"

Colored and
106" Imprinted Concrete | SY 101-500 300 $121.00) $36.300.00) $130.00) $39,000.00) $170.00) $51,000.00)
Sidewalk - 6"

Remove and Replace
10-4"RR (Colored and sy 101-500 300 $108.00) $32.400.00) $140.00 $42,000.00) $150.00 $45,000.00)
[mprinted Concrete

Sidewalk - 4"

[Remove and Replace

10-6"RR (Colored and SY 101-500 300 $117.00) $35,100.00) $150.00) $45,000.00) $150.00) $45,000.00)
Imprinted Conerete -

"

1 Concrete Aprons Sy 51-100 75 $80.00 $6,000.00} $115.00) $8,625.00) $200.00) $15,000.00)
[Remove and Replace | .,
11IRR " SY 26- 100 60 $6.00 $360.00) $135.00) $8,100.00| $200.00) $12,000.00)
Concrete Aprons
112 Topsoil and Seed sy 201-500 350 $18.00) $6.300.00) $10.00} $3,500.00 $16.00) $5.,600.00

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 9| NO BID $322,710.00 NO BID $362,750.00 NO BID $514,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt
[Award No. 10 - Permeable Paver Parking Lot/Roadway - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
10 2 Unclassified cy 1-500 300 $90.00 $27,000.00} $60.00 $18,000.00)
|Excavation
Sable Warnine
6 S:Ts"“h'e Waming | g 1-100 50 $90.00 $4,500.00] $100.00) $5,000.00
7 Concrete Curb LF 1-500 250 $38.00) $9.500.00) $80.00) $20,000.00)
8 JC‘:::’“ Belgian Block| - 1-500 250 $39.00) $9.750.00) $60.00) $15,000.00]
9 Conerete Sidewalk | SY 18264 25 $125.00 $3,125.00) $120.00 $3,000.00
(Colored and
1047 Imprinted Concrete | SY 18264 25 $135.00 $3,375.00) $140.00 $3,500.00
Sidewalk - 4"
1 Conerete Aprons sy 18264 25 $135.00) $3.,375.00) $150.00 $3.750.00
12 Trench Drain LF 1-100 50 $140.00] $7.000.00} $600.00 $30,000.00)
13p-4" ;“’;)e'h"e“ Piped™} 1 1-100 50 $11.00 $550.00) $10.00) $500.00]
74 Painted Lines LF 1-1000 500 $2.00 $1,000.00) $3.00 $1,500.00
112 Topsoil and Seed sy 1-200 100 $18.00 $1.800.00) $16.00 $1600.00
190-0 (Conerete Grid sY 0-1,000 500 $135.00) $67,500.00} $200.00) $100,000.00)
Pavements
Permeable
190-P Interlocking Coneretd] g 0-1,000 500 $130.00) $65,000.00} $250.00)
Pavement ~ Eco-
ridge
Permeable
190- PP Interlocking Concrete|  SY 0-1.000 500 $130.00) $65.000.00) $250.00
Pavement - SF-Rima
191 Unit Pavers sy 0-1,000 500 $115.00) $57,500.00) $200.00 $100,000.00)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 10 NO BID $325,975.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $551,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 11 - Permeable Paver Parking Lot/Roadway - Hig]

Award Estimated
ltem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
11 2 Unclassified cy 501-1000 750 $90.00 $67,500.00}
JExcavation
T——
6 Detectable Waming | g 101-200 150 $100.00) $15,000.00}
Units.
7 Concrete Curb LF 501-1000 750 $35.00 $26,250.00)
8 [Jumbo Belgian Block{ -, 501-1000 750 $38.00) 528500001
Curb
9 Conerete Sidewalk | Y 51-100 75 $108.00 $8,100.00)
(Colored and
1047 Imprinted Concrete | SY 51-100 75 $130.00] $9.750.00)
Sidewalk - 4
1 (Conerete Aprons sy 51-100 75 $117.00) $8.775.00)
12 Trench Drain LF 101200 150 $100.00] $15.000.00]
13p-4" ;“’;’e'h"e“ Fipe 41 1 101-200 150 $10.00 $1,500.00]
74 Painted Lines LF 1001-5000 3,000 $1.50 $4,500.00)
112 Topsoil and Seed sy 201-500 750 $12.00 $9,000.00)
190-0 (Conerete Grid sY 1001-5000 3,000 $130.00) $390,000.00

Pavements




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: Safety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. Rosemar Contracting Inc ~ Grace Industries LLC Corazzini Asphalt
Permeable
190-P Interlocking Coneretd] g 1001-5000 3,000 $125.00) $375,000.00
Pavement - Eco-
ridge
Permeable
190- PP Interlocking Conerete]  SY 1001-5000 3,000 $120.00] $360,000.00
Pavement - SF-Rima
191 Unit Pavers Sy 1001-5000 3,000 $110.00] $330,000.00
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 11 NO BID $1,648.875.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 12 - Surface Treatments - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

. 100 Bituminous Surface | 1-1000 500 $60.00] $30,000.00)
Treatment

[Asphalt Emulsion

104 sy 1-1,000 500 $90.00) $45,000.00)
Shurry
‘Total Bid Comparison Award No. 12|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID §75,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(Award No. 13 - Surface Treatments - High Quantity
Award Estimated
Item No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

s 100 Bituminous Surface | 1001-5000 2,500
Treatment

[Asphalt Emulsion

104 2 sy 1001-5000 2,500
Sturry
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 13|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 14 - Crack Sealants
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Elastomeric
14 m Pavement Crack LF 1-1,000 500 $9.00 $4,500.00
Sealant
Fiber Reinforced
" Polymer Modified o 11000 00 $15.00] §7.500.00)
Pavement Crack
Sealant
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 14]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Award No. 15 - Chain Link Fence - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Vinyl Coated C1
1s 108-4' inyl Coated Chain | - 0-100 50 $40.00 $2,000.00) $50.00) $2,500.00 $75.00
Link Fencing
108-6' Vinyl Coated Chain | - 0-100 50 $50.00 $2,500.00] $70.00] $3,500.00 $80.00 $4,000.00
Link Fencing
108-8' Vinyl Coated Chain | - 0-100 50 §52.00 $2,600.00] $80.00] $4,000.00 $85.00 $4,250.00
Link Fencing
1088G-4' Vinyl Coated Chain |- .| 0-5 1 $300.00) $300.00) $350.00) $350.00) $800.00) $800.00)
Link 3' Single Gate
Vinyl Coated C1
1085G-6' inyl Coated Chain | 05 1 $360.00 $360.00] $350.00] $350.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00)
Link 3' Single Gate
Vinyl Coated Chain | 05 1 $385.00 $385.00 $400.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

Link 3' Single Gate




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork
COMPANY NAME: Safety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. Rosemar Contracting Inc ~ Grace Industries LLC Corazzini Asphalt

1088G-4' Vinyl Coated Chain f - ) 0-5 1 $565.00) $565.00) $700.00) $700.00) $1,500.00) $1,500.00)
Link 8' Double Gate
Vinyl Coated Chain
E: - 5665 665. X R . 51,
it s Dosle G | E8 0-s 1 $665.00 $665.00 $800.00 $800.00 $1.800.00 $1.800.00
108SG-8' Vinyl Coated Chain || 0-5 1 $715.00) $715.00) $900.00) $900.00) $2,200.00) $2,200.00)
Link §' Double Gate
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 15|NO BID $10,090.00 NO BID 3.500.00 NO BID $20,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Award No. 16 - Chain Link Fence - High Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Vinyl Coated C1
16 108-4' inyl Coated Chain f - 101-500 300 $40.00 $12.000.00) $40.00) $12,000.00 $70.00 $21,000.00)
Link Fencing
108-6' Vinyl Coated Chain | - 101-500 300 $50.00 $15,000.00} $48.00] $14,400.00) $75.00 $22,500.00)
Link Fencing
108-8' Vinyl Coated Chain | - 101-500 300 $53.00 $15,900.00} $60.00] $18,000.00) $80.00 $24,000.00)
Link Fencing
1088G-4' Vinyl Coated Chain |- | 0-10 2 $300.00) $600.00) $300.00) $600.00) $900.00) $1,800.00)
Link 3' Single Gate
Vinyl Coated C1
inyl Coated Chain | 0-10 2 §720.00] $350.00] $700.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00)
Link 3' Single Gate
108SG-8' Vinyl Coated Chain || 0-10 2 $385.00 §770.00| $400.00] $800.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00)
Link 3' Single Gate
1085G-4' Vinyl Coated Chain | - 0-10 2 $565.00) $1,130.00] $700.00) $1,400.00 $1,500.00] $3,000.00
Link 8' Double Gate
1088G-6' Coated Chain - 0-10 2 $665.00) $1,330.00) $750.00) $1,500.00) $1,800.00) $3,600.00)
Link 8' Double Gate
Vinyl Coated C1
1085G-8' inyl Coated Chain | - 0-10 2 $715.00 $1.430.00 $800.00] $1,600.00) $2.200.00 $4,400.00)
Link §' Double Gate
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 16]NO BID $48.880.00 NO BID $51.000.00 NO BID $84,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Award No. 17 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - Low Quantity
‘Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Rut Avoidance
17 49 Asphalt Concrete, Ton 1-500 250 $12000]  $30,000.00 $120.00) $30,000.00 $150.00) $37,500.00) $124.50]  $31,125.00)
Type 6FRA Top
Course
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 17 NO BID NO BID $30,000.00 NO BID $30,000.00 $37,500.00 NO BID NO BID $31,125.00
[Award No. 18 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - Mid Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Rut Avoidance
18 49 Asphalt Concree, Ton 501-1000 750 $99.00)  $74,250.00) §79.28 $59,460.00 $120.00) $90,000.00) $84.00] $63,000.00) $92.00)  $69,000.00
Type GFRA Top
Course
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 18 NO BID NO BID $74,250.00 NO BID $59.460.00 $90,000.00 $63.000.00 NO BID $69.000.00




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting
[Award No. 19 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - High Quantity

Grace Industries LLC Corazzini Asphalt

Award Estimated
Item No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price

Rut Avoidance

19 49 Asphalt Concrete, Ton 1001-5000 3000 §79.28 $237,840.00) $81.00] $243,000.00) $92.00)  $276,000.00
Type GFRA Top

Course

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 19|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $237,840.00 NO BID $243,000.00 NO BID $276,000.00

Award No. 20 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - Low Quanti

Award i Estimated i i
Item No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

[Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Conerete,
Type 3RA Binder
Course

Ton 1-500 250 $118.00  $29,500.00) $120.00 $30,000.00] $150.00 $37,500.00) $124.00)  $31,000.00]

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 20 NO BID NO BID $29,500.00 NO BID $30,000.00] $37,500.00 NO BID NO BID $31,000.00)

Award No. 21 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - Mid Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price

Rut Avoidance

Asphalt Concree, Ton 501-1000 750 $97.00)  $72.750.00) §79.28 $59,460.00 $120.00) $90,000.00) $79.00] $59,250.00) $90.00)  $67,500.00
Type 3RA Binder

Course

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 21 NO BID NO BID §72,750.00 NO BID $59,460.00 $90,000.00) §$59,250.00 NO BID $67,500.00)

Award No. 22 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - High Quanti

Award i Estimated i i
Item No. [Description Unit Quantit Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

[Rut Avoidance

[Asphalt Cone
2 52 sphalt Conerete, Ton 1001-5000] 3000 §79.28 $237,840.00) §79.00) $237,000.00) $90.00]  $270,000.00
Type 3RA Binder

Course

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 22|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $237,840.00 NO BID $237,000.00 NO BID $270,000.00

Award No. 23 - Pavement Patches - Low Quanti

Award Estimated
Item No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price
23 51 Pavement Patches SF 0-1,000 500 s25.00]  $12,500.00] $18.00) $9,000.00 $29.00] $14,500.00) $21.00)  $10,500.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 23|NO BID NO BID $12,500.00 NO BID $9.000.00) $14,500.00 NO BID NO BID $10,500.00

Award No. 24 - Pavement Patches - High Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price
24 51 Pavement Patches SF 1001-5000 3,000 $17.50]  $52,500.00] $15.00) $45,000.00] $28.00] $84,000.00) $19.00)  $57,000.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 24|NO BID NO BID $52,500.00 NO BID $45,000.00) $84,000.00 NO BID NO BID $57,000.00

Award No. 25 - Latex Modified Surface Treatment - Low Quantity

Award i Estimated i i
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Latex Modified
2 SY - S
s 106 Surface Treatment SY 1-1000 00

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 25|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




COMPANY NAM

Award No. 26 - Latex Modified Surface Treatment - High Quantity

Laser Industries

DelLalio Coal & Stone

DBA South Fork

Asphalt

The LandTek Group Inc

Suffolk Paving Cor

KJB Industries In

Rosemar Contracti

Grace Industries LLC

‘Avard Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
2 106 Latex Modified SY 1001-5000 3,000
Surface Treatment
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 26]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Award No. 27 - Sodding - Low Quan
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Totl Price Total Price Total Price Totl price Total Price
27 13 Sodding sy 1132254 1,000 $14.00 $14,000.00) 515.00) $15,000.00)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 27|NO BID $14,000.00 NO BID $15,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 28 - Sodding - High Quantity
‘Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
28 113 Sodding sy 5001-10000 7,500 $11.00) $82,500.00) 51075 $80,625.00)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 28]NO BID $82,500.00 NO BID $80,625.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Award No. 29 - Poured In Place Safety Surface
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Totl Price Total Price Totl Price Totl Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Pourcd in Place
29 151-6' Safety Surface -6 | sY 1-1000 500 522000 $110,000.00)
Critical Fall Ht
Poured in Place
1518 Safety Surface -8 | sY 11000 500 $225.00 $112,500.00)
Critical Fall Ht
Poured in Place
151110 Safety Surface - 10 | SY 1-1000 500 $230.00 $115,000.00)
(Critical Fall Ht.
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 29]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $337,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Award No. 30 - Painted Lines - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Totl Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
30 74 Painted Lines LF 1-1000 500 $4.85 $2,425.00) 52.99 $1.495.00) $4.00 $2,000.00
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 30 $2,425.00) $1,495.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 31 - Painted Lines - High Qua
Estimated
No Tiem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost [Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
Quantity
31 74 Painted Lincs LF 1001-5000 3,000 52.10) $6,300.0) 51.99 $5,970.0) 52.20) $6,600.00)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 31 56,300.00) $5,970.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Award No. 32 - Concrete Roadway/Parking Lot Patches
Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Totl Price Total Price Totl Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Asphaltic Concrete
32 50 sphatie toncrete Tons 0-500 250 $170.00 $42,500.00 $180.00 $45,000.00)
Top Course
52 Asphaltic Conerete Tons 0-500 250 $170.00] $42,500.00 $180.00 $45,000.00)
Binder Course
(Conercte used for
S1A Roadway CU.FT 0-500 250 575.00) $18,750.00 $82.00 $20,500.00
Replacement
4P [Recycled Conerete CU.FT 0-500 250 $3.00) $750.00 $3.00) $750.00]
Aggregate
SI-AR Reinforcement SQFT 0-500 250 512.00) $3,000.00 $12.00 $3,000.00
74 Painted Lines LF 0-100 50 51000} $500.00 $20.00 $1,000.00
116 Pavement Marking LF 0-100 50 $10.00) $500.00 $20.00) $1,000.00)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 32]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $108.500.00) $116.250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
- ASPHALT TENNIS COURT SURFACE COLOR COATING SYST
‘Award Estimated
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Totl Price Total Price Total price Total price Total Price Total price Total price Total Price




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: Safety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. Rosemar Contracting Inc  Grace Industries LLC Corazzini Asphalt
[Asphalt Tennis Court
3 200 Surface Color SQYD 1-1500 1000 $17.75 $17.750.00) $20.00 $20,000.00)
(Coating System
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 33|NO BID NO BID NO BID $17,750.00 NO BID $20,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 34 - Directional Boring of 1-1/2” Conduit
Award Estimated
ltem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Di iona fl
34 300 Directional Boring of LF 1-100 100 $69.46) $6,946.00)
1-1/2 Conduit
34 300 Directional Boring of} LF 101-500) 500 $38.88 $19.440.00
1-1/2 Conduit
34 300 Directional Boring of LF 501-1000) 1000 $35.06] $35,060.00
34 300 Directional Boring of LF Over 1000|1500 $33.79 $50,685.00
1-1/2 Conduit
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 34|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $112,131.00) NO BID
Award No. 35 — Directional Boring of 2” Conduit
Award . y Estimated ., y 2 2 2 e o ) e
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantty Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total price Total price Total Price Total price Total price Total Price
35 300 [Directional Boring of LF 1-100 100 $69.46 $6.946.00
2" Conduit
35 300 [Directional Boring of LF 101-500] 500 $38.88) $19.440.00
2" Conduit
35 300 Directional Boring of LF 501-1000) 1000 $35.06) $35,060.00
2" Conduit
35 300 [Directional Boring of LF Over 1000|1500 $33.79 $50,685.00
2" Conduit
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 35]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $112,131.00) NO BID
Award No. 36 — Directional Boring of 4” Conduit
Award . . Estimated ., y 2 ) 2 e o 2 e
Ttem No. Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total price Total price Total Price Total price Total price Total Price
36 300 Directional Boring of LF 1-100 100 $73.21 $7.321.00
4 Conduit
36 300 Directional Boring of LF 101-500] 500 $42.63 $21,315.00
4 Conduit
36 300 Directional Boring of LF 501-1000) 1000 $38.81 $38,810.00
4 Conduit
36 300 Directional Boring of LF Over 1000) 1500 $37.54 $56,310.00
4 Conduit
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 36]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $123,756.00) NO BID




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork
COMPANY NAME: afety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc. Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries In Rosemar Contracting Inc__ Grace Industries LLC orazzini Asphalt

Award No. 37 - Directional Boring of 6 Conduit

Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No Quantity Total Price Total Price Totl Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
37 300 Directional Boring of LF 1-100 100 $85.31 $8,531.00)
6" Conduit
37 300 [Directional Boring of LF 101-500) 500 $49.14) $24,570.00
6" Conduit
37 300 Directional Boring of LF 501-1000] 1000 $45.32] $45.320.00
6" Conduit
37 300 Directional Boring of LF Over 1000|1500 $44.09] $66,075.00
6" Conduit
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 37|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $144,496.00) NO BID
[Award No. 38 — Americans with Disabilities Curb and Sidewalks Requirements
[Award Estimated
Ttem No Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
38 608.01050109 (Curb Ramp Each 1 1 $5,500.00 $11,000.00} $11,000.00}
(Configuration Type 1
Curb Ramp .
38 608.01050209 . Each 1 1 $5.000.00) $5.000.00) $11,000.00) $11,000.00]
Configuration Type 2
Curb Ramp
38 608.01050309 Each 1 1 $7,700.00) $7.700.00) $12,000.00] $12,000.00
Configuration Type 3
Curb Ramp
38 608.01050409 . Each 1 1 $8,000.00) $8,000.00) $12.000.00) $12,000.00)
(Configuration Type 4
. Curb Ramp
38 608.01050509 ub ] Een 1 1 $6,900.00) $6,900.00) $12,000.00) $12,000.00
(Configuration Type 5
Curb Ramp
38 608.01050609 . ) Each 1 1 $8.800.00) $8.800.00) $15.000.00) $15,000.00]
Configuration Type 6
Curb Ramp
38 608.01050709 Each 1 1 $6,700.00) $6.700.00) $15.000.00] $15,000.00)
(Configuration Type 7
Curb Ramp
38 608.01050809 . Each 1 1 $6.600.00) $6.600.00) $12.000.00) $12,000.00
Configuration Type §
. Curb Ramp .
38 608.01050909 ub Each 1 1 $5,900.00) $5,900.00) $15,000.00) $15,000.00
(Configuration Type 9
Curb Ramp
38 608.01051009 Configuration Type Each 1 1 $5.,500.00) $5.500.00) $15,000.00] $15,000.00]
10
Curb Ramp
38 608.01051109 Configuration Type Each 1 1 $800.00) $800.00 $30.000.00) $30,000.00)
11
Curb Ramp
38 608.01051209 Configuration Type Each 1 1 $900.00) $900.00 30,000.00 $30,000.00
12
Curb Ramp
38 608.01051309 Configuration Type Each 1 1 $690.00 $690.00 $16,000.00) $16,000.00
13
Resetting Brick,
38 608.10080008 Block, or Flagstone SF 100 100 $30.00 $3,000.00] $10.00 $1,000.00|
Sidewalks and
Driveways
Cast-in-place
38 609.0405 (Concrete Curb Type LF 0-100 LF 50 $40.00 $2,000.00) $250.00 $12,500.00
M100
Cast-in-place
38 609.0405 (Conerete Curb Type LF 101-750LF| 200 $36.00 $7.200.00) $75.00 $15,000.00)
M100
Cast-in-place
38 609.0405 (Conerete Curb Type LF 750 LF 1000 $34.00 $34.000.00) $65.00 $65.000.00)
M100
Cast-in-place
38 609.0407 (Concrete Curb Type LF 0-100 LF 50 $48.00 $2,400.00) $250.00 $12,500.00)
1100
Cast-in-place
38 609.0407 (Concrete Curb Type LF 101-750LF| 200 $40.00 $8,000.00) $75.00 $15,000.00)
T100
Cast-in-place
38 609.0407 (Conerete Curb Type LF >750LF | 1000 $33.00 $33.000.00) $65.00 $65.000.00)
T100
(Cast-in-place
38 609.0501 (Conerete Curb and LF >750LE[ 1000 $33.00 $33.000.00) $65.00 $65.000.00)
Gutier Type VF150G;




COMPANY NAME:

609.0505

Cast-in-place
Concrete Curb and
Gutter Type M100G

>750 LH

1000

Safety Marking LLC

Laser Industries Inc.

$34.00]

$34,000.00]

DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork
Asphalt

The LandTek Group Inc.

Suffolk Paving Corp.

KJB Industries Inc.

$65.00]

$65,000.00)

Rosemar Contracting Inc

Grace Industries LLC

Corazzini Asphalt

609.0507

Cast-in-place
Concrete Curb and
Gutter Type T100G

>750 LH

1000

§33.00]

$33,000.00]

$65.00]

$65,000.00)

614.060103

Tree Removal Over 4
Inches to 6 Inches
Diameter Breast
Height — Stumps Cut
to Below Grade

Each

$600.00)

$600.00)

$6,000.00f

$6,000.00)

614.060203

Tree Removal Over 6]
Inches to 12 Inches
Diameter Breast
Height - Stumps Cut
to Below Grade

Each

$800.00)

$800.00)

$6,000.00f

$6,000.00)

614.060303

Tree Removal Over
12 Inches to 18
Inches Diameter
Breast Height
Stumps Cut to Below
Grade

Each

$1,200.00}

$1,200.00f

$6,000.00f

$6,000.00)

614.060403

Tree Removal Over
18 Inches to 24
Inches Diameter
Breast Height -
Stumps Cut to Below
Grade

Each

$1,800.00}

$1,800.00f

$7,000.00f

§7,000.00)

614.060503

Tree Removal Over
24 Inches 1036
Inches Diameter
Breast Height
Stumps Cut to Below
Grade

Each

$2,000.00}

$2,000.00f

$7,000.00f

$7,000.00)

614.060603

Tree Removal Over
36 Inches t0 48
Inches Diameter
Breast Height
Stumps Cut to Below
Grade

Each

$2,000.00}

$2,000.00f

$7,000.00f

$7,000.00)

614.060703

Tree Removal Over
48 Inches to 60
Inches Diameter
Breast Height
Stumps Cut to Below
Grade

Each

$1,800.00}

$1,800.00f

$7,000.00f

$7.000.00)

621.03

Cleaning Closed
Drainage Systems

0-250 LF

100

$15.00]

$1,500.00f

$50.00]

$5,000.00)

621.03

Cleaning Closed
Drainage Systems

>250 LF

100

$12.00]

$1,200.00f

$50.00]

$5,000.00)

621.04

Cleaning Drainage
[Structures 0-5

Each

$500.00)

$2,500.00f

$2,000.00f

$10,000.00)

621.04

Cleaning Drainage
Structures =5

Each

$500.00)

$2,500.00f

$1,000.00f

$5,000.00)

670.0106

Foundation for Light
Standards (6FT)

Each

$1,500.00}

$1,500.00f

$7,000.00f

$7.000.00)

670.0108

[Foundation for Light
Standards (8FT)

Each

$1,600.00}

$1,600.00f

$8,000.00}

$8,000.00)

670.18

[Breakaway
Transformer Base
(Aluminum)

Each

$1,100.00}

$1,100.00f

$1,000.00f

$1,000.00)

670.7004

Single Conductor
Cable #6 Gauge

$10.00]

$10.00]

$30.00]

$30.00]

6707006

Single Conductor
Cable #10 Gauge

$8.00)

$8.00)

$40.00]

$40.00]

670.7104

Single Conductor

Direct Burial Cable
#2 Gauge

$10.00]

$10.00]

$30.00]

$30.00]

670.82

[Remove Lamppost
[Foundation

Each

$100.00)

$100.00)

$4,000.00f

$4,000.00)




DelLalio Coal & Stone
DBA South Fork

COMPANY NAME: Safety Marking LLC Laser Industries Inc. Asphalt The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. Rosemar Contracting Inc  Grace Industries LLC Corazzini Asphalt

Relocate Lamppost

38 670.90 ssembly (Not Each 1 1 $1,200.00) $1,200.00] $3,000.00] $3,000.00
including
Foundation)

38 680.5001 [Pole Excavation and oy 1 2 $2,000.00) $4,000.00) $1,000.00) $2,000.00
(Concrete Foundation

38 680.51000010 lter Elevarion for Each 1 1 $600.00) $600.00 $750.00 $750.00
Pullboxes
Pullbox Rectangular

38| 6s0.51050088 Reinforced Concrete | Each 1 1 $1,400.00) $1,400.00) $1,200.00 $1,200.00
(26 Inch x 18 Inch)

38 | 68051050089 Install Pullbox Each 1 1 $400.00) $400.00 $2,000.00) $2,000.00

38 | 68051060088 Plasiic Pullbox Each 1 1 $500.00) $500.00 $300.00 $300.00)

38 68051100010 (Clean Existing Each 1 1 $250.00) $250.00) $1,000.00] $1,000.00
Pullboxes

38 680.520103 (Conduit, Metal Steel, LF Jan-50 30 $20.00) $600.00] $100.00| $3,000.00)
Zine Coated, 1

38 680.520106 (Conduit, Metal Stcel, LF 50-200 100 $30.00) $3.000.00) $100.00 $10,000.00]
Zinc Coated, >

38 680.520108 (Conduit, Metal Steel, LF Jan-50 30 $40.00 $1.200.00 $100.00 $3,000.00
Zinc Coated, 3

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 37|NO BID $293,968.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID $704,350.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID
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