
Town of Riverhead 
4 W Second Street 

Riverhead, NY  11901 
 
 
 
 

TO: Supervisor Hubbard; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Kern, 
Merrifield, Rothwell, Waski; James Wooten, Town Clerk; Vanessa 
LeCann, Deputy Town Clerk; Drew Dillingham, Town Engineer; Ken 
Testa, Deputy Town Engineer 

 
CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing Technician; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s 

Office; Shannon Clifford, Engineering 
 
FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Director 
 
DATE:  August 7, 2025 
 
RE: Bid Opening Report for Fertilizer & Lawn Chemicals  
 
 
 
3 bids were received and opened on August 7, 2025 at 11am: 
 
PROGRESSIVE GROWER 
1129 CROSS RIVER DRIVE 
RIVERHEAD, NY 11901 
mmatulonis@progressivegrower.com 
 
 
NASSAU SUFFOLK TURF 
60 GAZA BLVD 
FARMINGDALE, NY 11735 
tsty@nsturf.com 

LONG ISLAND CAULIFLOWER 
ASSOCIATION 
139 MARCY AVE 
RIVERHEAD, NY 11901 
j.boking@licassoc.com 
 
 
 
 
GE, NY 11961 
nickc@laserindustriesinc.com 

Results of the bid opening are attached. All bids have been forwarded to Engineering 
for review. 

Timothy Hubbard 
Supervisor 

Teresa Baldinucci 
Purchasing Director 

631-727-3200 Ext. 271 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID NUMBER:
BID NAME:
BID OPENING DATE:  

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #: ** OR EQUAL WILL BE CONSIDERED**

ITEM DESCRIPTION SUBSTITUTE UNIT COST SUBSTITUTE UNIT COST SUBSTITUTE UNIT COST

1
GRASS SEED 30% FINE FESCUE, 40% PENTIUM P. RYE, 30% 

GOLDRUSH, KTY BLUE/50# BAGS  Sun and Shade (50lb) $98.70  Sun/Shade (25lb) $44.99 $89.00

2 RAZOR PRO-GAL 2X2.5 GAL CASE** Glyphosate $141.00  Ranger Pro $139.00  Credit Extra (2.5gal) $50.00

3 ROUNDUP – GAL – 2X2.5 GAL CASE** Glyphosate $141.00 No Bid No Bid

4 BAYLETON 1% G-11.25 LB BAG No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 PELLETIZED LIME 40 LB BAG No Bid No Bid (50lb) $8.00

6 PEAT MOSS 3.8 CU FT. BALE No Bid No Bid $17.50

7
SCOTTS 19-0-7 26% SCU .9% PENDIMETHALIN CRABGRASS 

CONTROL 40 LB BAG **
 Lebanon 16-0-5 w/ 

Rodime (50lb) $26.75
Spring Valley 18-0-5 w/.42 

prodicmine (50lb) $23.99
20-0-4 304.lsn, .86% 
Pendimethalin (50lb) $23.50

8 SCOTTS 18-0-9 29% SCU WEED & FEED 48 LB BAG ** No Bid
Growmark 18-0-5 w/lockup (miniprill) 

(50lb) $36.99
Lebanon 20-0-7 25% Methex 

w/trimer (40lb) $27.00

9 ANDERSONS 15-0-5 W/ 2% MERIT 50# BAG  19-0-2 W/ Merit (50lb) $26.95 Nutrite 19-0-2 w/.2% Merit (50lb) $28.99 19-0-2 50% accublue w/.2 merit $27.25

10 24-0-11 40% PSCU 50 LB BAG  Arnurtech 26-0-10 $30.75 22-0-3 40% PCU60 (50lb) $21.99 24-0-11 50% Accublue 2y.fe $23.00

11 4-2-3 BIOBASIC ORGANIC 50 LB BAG  Healthy Grow 2-4-3  $21.25 Sanctuary 3-3-4 (25lb) $23.99 No Bid

12 ROOTS 15-3-8 ORGANIC 50 LB BAG No Bid Nutrite 15-0-6 (50lb) $24.99 No Bid

13 STARTER 10-20-10 50 LB BAG  Arnurtech 18-20-10 $29.85 Starter 18-24-12 (50lb) $27.99 No Bid

14 ACCLAIM EXTRA 2.5 GAL CONTAINER **  1 gallon $725.00 1 gallon $799.00 1 gallon $755.00

15 WATER SOLUBLE 20-20-20  25 LB BAG $44.49 No Bid Plant Marvel $38.50

16 OSMACOTE 15-9-12 5-6 MONTHS 40LB BAG No Bid Nutrite 14-14-14 6 month (50Lb) $38.99 $105.00

17 TURFACE PRO LEAGUE SOIL CONDITIONER (REC. DEPT.) No Bid No Bid (50lb) $14.95

18 GUIDE LIME IN 50# BAGS (REC.) No Bid No Bid Marking Lime $7.00

19 MOUND CLAY BLOCKS (304/PALLET) No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 TURFACE RED MOUND CLAY (50#BAG) No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 PHC TERRA SORB MED. GRADE HYDROGEL 1# JAR No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 PHC TERRA SORB MED. GRADE HYDROGEL 1# JAR No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 TREFLAN WEED PREVENTION 25# BAGS $31.50 Treflan SG (40lb) $38.99 (40lb) $32.00

24 SPEEDZONE HERBICIDE 1 GAL JUG  2.5 gal $225.00 $118.99 $110.50

** " OR EQUAL" WILL BE CONSIDERED

JOHN E. BOKING JR
516-729-0014 631-727-2212

THOMAS STYLOVEK

2025-24
FERTILIZER AND LAWN CHEMICALS
8/7/2025

631-456-7721

PROGRESSIVE GROWER
MARK MATULONIS

NASSAU SUFFOLK TURF LONG ISLAND CAULIFLOWER ASSOCIATION
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