Teresa Baldinucci

Timothy Hubbard 4 West Second Street Purchasing Director
Supervisor Riverhead, NY 11901 631-727-3200 Ext. 271
TO: Supervisor Hubbard; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Kern,

Merrifield, Rothwell, Waski; Vanessa LeCann, Deputy Town Clerk; Drew
Dillingham, Town Engineer; Ken Testa, Deputy Town Engineer

CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing Technician; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s
Office; Shannon Clifford, Engineering

FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Director

DATE: June 9, 2025

RE: Bid Opening Report for Street Light and Traffic Signal Maintenance Repair
Parts

3 bids were received and opened on June 5, 2025 at 11am:

Traffic Systems Inc.

1 Corporate Dr, Suite 1
Holtsville, NY 11742
wteese@trafficsystemsinc.com

Revco Lighting + Electrical Supply
403 Griffing Ave

Riverhead, NY 11901
waynef@revcoelectric.com

General Traffic Equipment Corp
259 Broadway

Newburgh, NY 12550
rays@generaltrafficequip.com

Results of the bid opening are attached. Bids have been forwarded to the Engineering
Department for review.



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: |6/5/2025
COMPANY: General Traffic Equipment Corp Traffic Systems, Inc. Revco Lighting + Electrical Supply
CONTACT: Raymond Staffon William Teese Wayne Ford
PHONE #: 845-569-9000 631-242-4292 631-369-1900
ITEM # II UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
B1 No bid No bid No bid
B2 No bid No bid No bid
B3 No bid No bid No bid
B4 No bid No bid No bid
B5 No bid No bid No bid
TB1 No bid No bid No bid
TB2 No bid No bid No bid
MC1 No bid No bid No bid
MC2 No bid No bid No bid
MC3 No bid No bid No bid
MC4 No bid No bid No bid
MC5 No bid No bid $9.97
MC6 No bid No bid $1.53
MC7 No bid No bid $1.75
MC8 No bid No bid $1.75
MC9 No bid No bid $1.75
MCI10 No bid No bid $1.75
BCl1 No bid No bid $2.41
BC2 No bid No bid $3.74
BC3 No bid No bid $5.03
BC4 No bid No bid No bid
BC5 No bid No bid No bid
BC6 No bid No bid $19.95
FP1 No bid No bid No bid
FP2 No bid No bid No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: |6/5/2025
COMPANY: General Traffic Equipment Corp Traffic Systems, Inc. Revco Lighting + Electrical Supply
CONTACT: Raymond Staffon William Teese Wayne Ford
PHONE #: 845-569-9000 631-242-4292 631-369-1900
ITEM # || UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS

FP3 No bid No bid No bid

FP4 No bid No bid No bid

FP5 No bid No bid No bid

FP6 No bid No bid No bid

FP7 No bid No bid $678.00

FP8 No bid No bid $752.00

FP9 No bid No bid $304.54

FP10 No bid No bid $69.00

FP11 No bid No bid $57.18

FP12 No bid No bid $82.59

FP13 No bid No bid $103.68

FP14 No bid No bid $229.42

FP15 No bid No bid No bid

FP16 No bid No bid No bid

FP17 No bid No bid No bid

FP18 No bid No bid No bid

FP19 No bid No bid No bid

FP20 No bid No bid No bid

FP21 No bid No bid No bid

FP22 No bid No bid $803.83

FP23 No bid No bid $278.83

FP24 No bid No bid No bid

No bid

BF1 No bid No bid No bid

FH1 No bid No bid $28.84

FH2 No bid No bid $15.92

FH3 No bid No bid $16.28

FH4 No bid No bid $16.28
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: |6/5/2025
COMPANY: General Traffic Equipment Corp Traffic Systems, Inc. Revco Lighting + Electrical Supply
CONTACT: Raymond Staffon William Teese Wayne Ford
PHONE #: 845-569-9000 631-242-4292 631-369-1900
ITEM # II UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
LL1 $36.00 $57.00 No bid
LL2 $36.00 $57.00 No bid
LL3 $36.00 $57.00 No bid
LL4 $38.00 $54.50 No bid
LL5 $38.00 $54.50 No bid
LL6 $38.00 $54.50 No bid
LL8 $110.00 $140.00 No bid
LL9 $94.00 $242.00 No bid
LTSI No bid $1,995.00 No bid
LTS2 No bid $528.00 No bid
LTS3 $140.00 $640.00 No bid
LTS4 $£82.00 $175.00 No bid
LTSS No bid $5,175.00 No bid
LTS6 $28.00 $34.50 No bid
LTS7 $30.00 $35.75 No bid
LTSS No bid $1,145.50 No bid
LTS9 No bid $165.00 No bid
LTS10 $150.00 $65.00 No bid
LTSI11 No bid $732.75 No bid
LTS12 No bid $3,360.50 No bid
LTSI13 No bid $3,725.00 No bid
LTS14 No bid $257.75 No bid
LTS15 $150.00 $38.00 No bid
LTS16 No bid $257.75 No bid
LTS17 No bid $116.50 No bid
LTS18 No bid $97.50 No bid
LTS19 No bid $43.25 No bid
LTS20 No bid $20.50 No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: |6/5/2025
COMPANY: General Traffic Equipment Corp Traffic Systems, Inc. Revco Lighting + Electrical Supply
CONTACT: Raymond Staffon William Teese Wayne Ford
PHONE #: 845-569-9000 631-242-4292 631-369-1900
ITEM # || UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
ME1 No bid No bid No bid
ME2 No bid No bid No bid
ME3 No bid No bid No bid
ME4 No bid No bid $280.35
MES5 No bid No bid $179.19
ME6 No bid No bid $215.69
ME7 No bid No bid $45.00
MES No bid No bid $60.00
ME9 No bid No bid $45.00
ME10 No bid No bid ft $1.40
MEI11 No bid No bid No bid
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