
Town of Riverhead 
4 West 2nd Street 

Riverhead, NY  11901 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
TO: Supervisor Hubbard; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Kern, 

Merrifield, Rothwell, Waski; Vanessa LeCann, Deputy Town Clerk; Frank 
Mancini, Superintendent of Water District 

 
CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s Office; Robin 

Halpin, Water District 
 
FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Senior Purchasing Agent 
 
DATE:  January 16, 2025 
 
RE:  Bid Opening Report for Sensus Water Meter & Accessory Equipment, or 

Reasonable Equivalent, & Repair to Meter Reading Equipment for 
Riverhead Water District 

 
2 bids were received and opened on January 16, 2025 at 11am: 
 
Core & Main LP 
1536 Southern Blvd 
Bronx, NY 10460 
paul.meissuer@coreandmain.com 
 
Rio Supply, Inc of New York 
100 Allied Pkwy 
Sicklerville, NJ 08081 
bemens@riosupply.com 
 
 
 
Results of the bid opening are attached. All bids have been forwarded to the Water 
District for review. 

Timothy Hubbard 
Supervisor 

Teresa Baldinucci 
Purchasing Agent 

631-727-3200 Ext. 271 



NET DELIVERED 
PRICE

NET DELIVERED 
PRICE

ITEM 
# DESCRIPTION

IPERL WATER METERS CORE & MAIN
RIO SUPPLY 

Inc Rio Supply Alt product

1 5/8" x 1/2" iPERL meter* 145.00$           334.80$           5/8" x 5/8" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

2 3/4" iPERL meter* 165.00$           360.00$           3/4" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

3 1" iPERL meter* 165.00$           443.70$           1" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

4 3/4" iPERL  Fire Service meter* 210.00$           387.00$           3/4" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter for fire service

5 1" iPERL Fire Service meter* 260.00$           469.80$           1" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter for fire service

*iPERL meters are 2-wire w/6' wire & TRPL sensor and must be supplied with 
strainer

OMNI C2 METER & ACCESSORIES

6 1.5" Omni C2 meter 1,295.00$        1,078.20$        1.5" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

7 2" Omni C2 meter 1,475.00$        1,299.60$        2" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

8 3" Omni C2 meter 1,875.00$        3,971.70$        3" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

9 4" Omni C2 meter 3,225.00$        5,163.30$        4" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

10 6" Omni C2 meter 5,570.00$        8,562.60$        6" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

11 8" Omni C2 meter 10,500.00$       19,098.90$       8" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

12 10" Omni C2 meter 13,625.00$       25,641.00$       10" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

13 Omni C2 Electronic register 400.00$           n/a

14 1.5" C2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 955.00$           n/a

15 2" C2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 975.00$           n/a

16 3" C2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 1,400.00$        n/a

17 4" C2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 1,425.00$        n/a

BID AWARD RECOMMENDATIONS FOR WATER METERS - BID #2024-28 (RWD-2024-20)
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BID AWARD RECOMMENDATIONS FOR WATER METERS - BID #2024-28 (RWD-2024-20)

18 6" C2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 2,720.00$        n/a

**Omni meters may be ordered in 15 1/4" LL or 17" LL

OMNI T2 METERS & ACCESSORIES

19 1.5" Omni T2 meter 865.00$           1,078.20$        1.5" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

20 2" Omni T2 meter 1,030.00$        1,299.60$        2" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter

21 3" Omni T2 meter 1,285.00$        3,971.70$        
3" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/brass strainer and 18" 
laylength

22 4" Omni T2 meter 2,500.00$        5,163.30$        
4" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/brass strainer and 
21.5" laylength

23 6" Omni T2 meter 4,500.00$        8,562.60$        
6" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/brass strainer and 27" 
laylength

24 8" Omni T2 meter 8,410.00$        19,098.90$       
8" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/brass strainer and 30" 
laylength

25 10" Omni T2 meter 10,965.00$       25,641.00$       
10" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/brass strainer and 41" 
laylength

26 Omni T2 Electronic register 400.00$           n/a

27 1.5" T2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 650.00$           n/a

28 2" T2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 675.00$           n/a

29 3" T2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 975.00$           n/a

30 4" T2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 1,000.00$        n/a

31 6" T2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 1,850.00$        n/a

**Omni meters may be ordered in 15 1/4" LL or 17" LL

OMNI F2 METERS & ACCESSORIES

32 4" Omni F2 meter - standard 7,400.00$        10,132.00$       
4" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/stainless steel basket 
strainer and 33" laylength

33 6" Omni F2 meter - standard 9,700.00$        16,669.80$       
6" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/stainless steel basket 
strainer and 45" laylength

34 8" Omni F2 meter - standard 16,050.00$       28,279.80$       
8" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/stainless steel basket 
strainer and 53" laylength
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BID AWARD RECOMMENDATIONS FOR WATER METERS - BID #2024-28 (RWD-2024-20)

35 10" Omni F2 meter - standard 21,400.00$       34,658.10$       
10" Neptune MACH 10 Ultrasonic Meter w/stainless steel basket 
strainer and 68" laylength

36 4" Omni F2 meter - compact 7,133.00$        n/a

37 6" Omni F2 meter - compact 9,500.00$        n/a

38 8" Omni F2 meter - compact 15,055.00$       n/a

39 10" Omni F2 meter - compact 20,325.00$       n/a

40 Omni F2 Electronic register 425.00$           n/a

41 4" F2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 1,370.00$        n/a

42 6" F2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 2,630.00$        n/a

43 8" F2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 3,020.00$        n/a

44 10" F2 measuring chamber assembly TRPL pulse 3,020.00$        n/a

45 Omni F2 fireline bypass retrofit meter 1,700.00$        n/a

**Omni meters may be ordered in 15 1/4" LL or 17" LL

FLEX NET SMART POINT M2 RADIO TRANSEIVERS

46 MXU 510M single port meter transeiver unit for use in non-pit installation 160.00$           n/a

47 MXU 510M dual port meter transeiver unit for use in non-pit installation 225.00$           n/a

48 MXU 520M single port meter transeiver unit for use in pit installation 160.00$           n/a

49 MXU 520M dual port meter transeiver unit for use in pit installation 235.00$           n/a

** Price each for touch coupler & wired version

HANDHELD METER READERING EQUIPMENT

50 Series FL6502 handheld device with communications/charger stand 13,140.00$       n/a

51 Series FL6502 handheld device with communications/charger stand - upgrade 13,140.00$       n/a
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BID AWARD RECOMMENDATIONS FOR WATER METERS - BID #2024-28 (RWD-2024-20)

52 Auto Gun AG6590 1,733.00$        n/a

53 Auto Gun 90° pit probe extension 355.00$           n/a

54 FlexNet Command Link 885.00$           n/a

55 FL6502 handheld reader maintenance program - 4 year
 no bid; no 
longer exists n/a

56 FL6502 handheld reader maintenance program - 1 year
 no bid; no 
longer exists n/a

57 A2 single Ethernet dock for handheld reader maintenance program - 4 year
 no bid; no 
longer exists n/a

58 A2 single Ethernet dock for handheld reader maintenance program - 1 year
 no bid; no 
longer exists n/a

59 Autoread software maintenance program annual/4 year  $        3,700.00 NO BID

COMPANION FLANGES & GASKETS FOR USE WITH OMNI METERS

60 1.5" Companion cast iron meter flange & gaskets** 32.00$             105.00$           Brass

61 2" Companion cast iron meter flange & gaskets** 42.00$             115.00$           Brass

62 4" Companion cast iron meter flange & gaskets** 58.00$             160.00$           

63 6" Companion cast iron meter flange & gaskets** 78.00$             310.00$           

64 8" Companion cast iron meter flange & gaskets** 144.00$           350.00$           

65
**Includes nut and bolt; (2) needed for each meter maintenance & repair parts 
(i.e. freeze plates, gaskets, registers, etc.)

66
% discount off current 2022 catalog list pricing (include copy of current catalog 
pricing sheet)

10% January 1, 
2025 sheet 10%
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