10.36

08.06.2024 ADOPTED

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

TB Resolution 2024-715

AWARDS BID FOR 2024 ANNUAL PROCUREMENT CONTRACT

Councilwoman Merrifield offered the following resolution,
which was seconded by Councilwoman Waski

WHEREAS, Town Board Resolution #2024-429 authorized the Town Clerk to
advertise a Notice to Bidders for sealed bids for 2024 ANNUAL PROCUREMENT
CONTRACT; and

WHEREAS, 5 bids were received, opened and read aloud in the Office of the
Town Clerk, 4 West 2™ Street, Riverhead, NY 11901 on MAY 29, 2024 at
11:00 AM; and

WHEREAS, the bids were reviewed and a bid tabulation was prepared by the
Purchasing Agent and presented to the Town Board for review;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the bid for 2024 ANNUAL
PROCUREMENT CONTRACT be and is hereby awarded as follows:

Award No. 50 to East Island Asphalt

Award No. 53 to Barbato Nursery Corp.

Award No. 54, Item 31-S to Barbato Nursery Corp.
Award No. 54, Item 31-G to SiteOne Landscape Supply
Award No. 55 to SiteOne Landscape Supply

Award No. 56 to Barbato Nursery Corp.

Award No. 57 to SiteOne Landscape Supply

Award No. 58 to GLS Industries LLC

Award No. 59 to GLS Industries LLC

Award No. 60 to Barbato Nursery Corp.

Award No. 61 to Barbato Nursery Corp.

Award No. 62 to Barbato Nursery Corp.

Award No. 63 to T. Mina Supply LLC

Award No. 65 to Barbato Nursery Corp.

Award No. 66 to SiteOne Landscape Supply

Award No. 67 to East Island Asphalt

Award No. 68 to East Island Asphalt; and be it further

RESOLVED, that the Town Board be and does hereby authorize the Purchasing
Agent to return any and all bid bonds received in connection with the above; and be it
further

RESOLVED, that the Town Board be and does hereby authorize various Town
department to secure Town of Riverhead purchase orders from the Purchasing
Department using the Annual Procurement Contract; and be it further
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RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized to forward a copy
of this resolution to:

EAST ISLAND ASPHALT CORP
1217 SPEONK RIVERHEAD RD
SPEONK, NY 11972
jbellotti@rosemar.com

BARBATO NURSERY CORP.
1600 RAILROAD AVE
HOLBROOK, NY 11741
barbatolandscape@aol.com

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
1385 EAST 36™ STREET
CLEVELAND, OH 44114
bids@SiteOne.com

GLS INDUSTRIES LLC

3056 SHORE RD

BELLMORE, NY 11710
ginamarie@glsindustrieslic.com

T. MINA SUPPLY, INC.

17 EXPRESSWAY DRIVE NORTH
MEDFORD, NY 11763
roberto.cano@tmina.com

and the Engineering Department, Community Development Agency, Highway

Department, Sewer District and Water District, Purchasing Department, and Accounting

Department; and be it further

RESOLVED that all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain a copy of this

resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a certified copy of same
may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.

10.36

THE VOTE
RESULT: ADOPTED [UNANIMOUS]
MOVER: Denise Merrifield, Councilwoman
SECONDER: Joann Waski, Councilwoman
AYES: Hubbard, Rothwell, Kern, Merrifield, Waski
This iz to certify that |, the undersigned, Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead, County of Suffolk,
State of Mew York State of Mew York, have compared the forgoing copy of a Resolution with the original now on file in

County of Suffolk | ss:

Town of Riverhead

this office and which was duly adopted on  August 6, 2024

and that the same is a true and correct transcript of said Resolution and the of the whole thereof.

IN WITMESS WHERECDF, | have hereunto set my hand and the official seal of the Town of
Riverhead, on  Aygust 7, 2024

7'{(

wo J)

| %f{,fhféw

, Town Clerk




FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT
OF PROPOSED RIVERHEAD TOWN BOARD LEGISLATION

10.36

A. Type of Legislation Resolution __X Local Law
B. Title of Proposed Legislation: Awards Bid for Annual Procurement Contract
C. Purpose of Proposed Legislation:
D. Will the Proposed Legislation Have a Fiscal Impact?  Yes _ X No
E. If the answer to section D is “yes”, select (a) or (b) below and initial or detail as applicable:
(@) The fiscal impact can be absorbed by Town/department existing resources set forth in approved Town Annual Budget TB
(example:routine and budgeted procurement of goods/services)*if selecting E(a), please initial then skip items F,G and
complete H,l and J;
or
(b) The description/explanation of fiscal impact is set forth as follows:
F. If the answer to E required description/explanation of fiscal impact (E(b)), please describe total Financial Cost of Funding over
5 Years
G. Proposed Source of Funding
Appropriation Account to be Charged: A01-1-1625-401-000-00000; A01-1-1625-404-000-00000

Grant or other Revenue Source:

Appropriation Transfer (list account(s) and amount):

H. Typed Name & |. Signature of Preparer J. Date
Title of 7/25/24
Preparer: Teresa
Baldinucci

Teresa Baldinucci 8/6/2024
K. Accounting Staff L. Signature of Accounting Staff M. Date
Name & Title 7/28/24
Jeanette DiPaola,

Jeanette DiPaola
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COMMODITY:

BID OPENING DATE:

2024 ANNUAL PROCUREMENT CONTRACT

5/29/2024

SiteOne Landscape

10.36.a

S
COMPANY NAME: Barbato Nursery Corp East Island Asphalt Supply GLS Industries LLC T. Mina Supply LLC. >
CONTACT: Kelly Singleton Jen Puco Rosalin Santiago Ginamarie Scarrino Roberto Cano E
PHONE #: 631-285-6767 ext 202 631-803-8127 216-706-9250 ext 2 347-527-0258 631-475-7400 <
Award No. 50 - Asphalt Materials Loaded into Town of Riverhead Trucks §
i o
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity Estlma-ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal N
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price -
S
Asphalt Concrete Type 1, fo)
50 60 Base Course Loaded into Ton 0-500 250 $77.00] $19,250.00 m
Town of Riverhead Trucks %)
=
Rut Avoidance Asphalt g
Concrete, Type 3RA <
62 Binder Course, Loaded Ton 0-500 250 $79.00] $19,750.00 ..
into Town of Riverhead ﬁ
Trucks ~
<
Rut Avoidance Asphalt 8
g4 |Conerete. Type 6FRATop po g 500 | 250 $82.00] $20,500.00 &
Course Loaded into Town -
of Riverhead Trucks %
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 50 NO BID $59,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID %
)
Award No. 51 - Cold Patch Loaded into Town of Riverhead Trucks 8
3 o
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EstlmaAted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal E
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price
Cold Mix Bituminous §
51 66 Pavement Loaded into Ton 0-500 250 8
Town of Riverhead Trucks ;':
o
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ..é
E
Award No. 52 - Sand Asphalt Base Course Loaded into Town of Riverhead Trucks o
- @®©
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EStlma'th Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal —
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price o
-
Sand Asphalt Base Course g
52 72 Loaded into Town of Ton 0-500 250 <
Riverhead Trucks =]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Cﬂ
c
Award No. 53 - Baseball Field Soil Materials g
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EstlmaFed Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal <
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price %
53 28 Baseball Sand Mix CY 0-500 250 $55.50] $13,875.00) =
29 Baseball Clay Mix CY 0-500 250 $75.50] $18,875.00) <
33 Road Sand Mix CY 0-500 250 $55.50] $13,875.00)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 53 $46,625.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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10.36.a

SiteOne Landscape

COMPANY NAME: Barbato Nursery Corp East Island Asphalt Supply GLS Industries LLC T. Mina Supply LLC.
CONTACT: Kelly Singleton Jen Puco Rosalin Santiago Ginamarie Scarrino Roberto Cano
PHONE #: 631-285-6767 ext 202 631-803-8127 216-706-9250 ext 2 347-527-0258 631-475-7400

2024 Procurement (2024-715: Awards Bid for 2024 Annual

Attachment: Bid Award Tabulation
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SiteOne Landscape

10.36.a

COMPANY NAME: Barbato Nursery Corp East Island Asphalt Supply GLS Industries LLC T. Mina Supply LLC.
CONTACT: Kelly Singleton Jen Puco Rosalin Santiago Ginamarie Scarrino Roberto Cano
PHONE #: 631-285-6767 ext 202 631-803-8127 216-706-9250 ext 2 347-527-0258 631-475-7400 <
Award No. 54 - Composite Soil Mix, Pea Gravel g
2 c
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EStlma'th Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal <
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price <
54 31-S Composite Soil Mix CY 0-1000 500 $123.50] $61,750.00) No Bid N
31-G Pea Gravel CY 0-100 100 $179.00] $17,900.00 $99.00 $9,900.00 8
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 54 $79,650.00 NO BID $9,900.00 NO BID NO BID B
et
=
Award No. 55 - Recycled Concrete Aggregate m
i [%2]
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity Estlma-ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal i)
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price E
55 4p  |Recycled Conerete cy | o100 | 500 $25.00] $12,500.00]  $25.00] $12,500.00]  $15.95] $7.975.00]  $37.50| $18,750.00 =
Agoregate <
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 55 $12,500.00) $12,500.00 $7,975.00 $18,750.00 NO BID R
Lo
—
Award No. 56 - Certified Wood Fiber Safety Surface ~
: <
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EstlmaAted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal 8
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price I
- - N
56 15y |Certified Wood Fiber cy 0-500 | 250 $57.85] $14,462.50 -
Safety Surface c
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 56 $14,462.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID g
- (&)
Award No. 57 - Landscaping Wood Mulch 5
i (&)
Award No. Item No. |Description Unit | Quantity Estlma'ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal o
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price E
57 160.L |-andscaping Wood Mulch -\, 0-500 250 $33.50] $8,375.00 $20.75]  $5,187.50
Low Grade g
160-n  |Lndscaping Wood Muleh -y, 0-500 250 $38.50] $9,625.00 $20.75]  $5,187.50 I~
High Grade '
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 57 $18,000.00 NO BID $10,375.00 NO BID NO BID g
=
@©
Award No. 58 - Blue Stone =
i o]
Award No. Item No. |Description Unit | Quantity Estlma'ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal @®©
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price -
58 170-3/8" |Blue Stone - 3/8" CY 0-500 250 $77.00§ $19,250.00) $101.00] $25,250.00 $57.00f $14,250.00 ho]
170-3/4" |Blue Stone - 3/4" CY 0-500 250 $77.00§ $19,250.00) $99.00] $24.750.00 $57.00f $14,250.00 @
170-S  |Blue Stone Screenings CY 0-500 250 $77.00§ $19,250.00) $85.00] $21,250.00 $57.00f $14,250.00 =
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 58 $57,750.00) NO BID $71,250.00 $42,750.00) NO BID _<é
o
Award No. 59 - Trap Rock .
= =
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity Estlma-ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal %
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price =
59 172 Trap Rock CY 0-500 250 $102.50] $25,625.00 $68.00f $17,000.00 c
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 59 $25,625.00) NO BID NO BID $17,000.00) NO BID %
=
<
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SiteOne Landscape

10.36.a

COMPANY NAME: Barbato Nursery Corp East Island Asphalt Supply GLS Industries LLC T. Mina Supply LLC.
CONTACT: Kelly Singleton Jen Puco Rosalin Santiago Ginamarie Scarrino Roberto Cano
PHONE #: 631-285-6767 ext 202 631-803-8127 216-706-9250 ext 2 347-527-0258 631-475-7400 <
Award No. 60 - Ready-Mix Concrete - Low Quantity g
2 c
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EStlma'th Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal <
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price <
60 14 Ready-Mix Concrete CY 0-5CY 2 $440.00 $880.00) N
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 60 $880.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8
-
O
Award No. 61 - Ready-Mix Concrete - Mid Quantity h
R o
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit Quantity| EstlmaAted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal m
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price
61 14 Ready Mix Concrete CY 6-10 CY 8 $289.00] $2,312.00) %
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 61 $2,312.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID <
S
Award No. 62 - Ready-Mix Concrete - High Quantity <
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EStlma'th Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal ﬁ
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price ~
62 14 Ready Mix Concrete CY 11-15CY 12 $289.00] $3,468.00 <
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 62 $3,468.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8
AN
N—r
Award No. 63 - Drainage Pipe —
2 c
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit] Quantity EstlmaAted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal o
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price e
63 30-4" 4" Diameter Underdrains LF] 0-500 250 $3.15 $787.50 8
30-6" 6" Diameter Underdrains LF] 0-500 250 $7.30) $1,825.00 8
30-8" 8" Diameter Underdrains LF] 0-500 250 $13.30) $3,325.00 o
" . S
154n  |¢" Diameter Polycthylene LF| 0500 | 250 $2.30 $575.00 o
Pipe <
15-12" 12 Diameter Polyethylene il 0-500 250 $12.25 $3.062.50 S
Pipe N
" 19 !
1515 |1 Diameter Polyethylene LF| o0-500 | 250 $16.00]  $4,000.00 =
Pipe o
" . -
15.1gn  |!8" Diameter Polyethylene LE| 0500 | 250 $23.65|  $5,912.50 ©
Pipe >
"y o]
15.04n |?#" Diameter Polyethylene LE| 0-500 250 $39.15|  $9,787.50 ©
Pipe =
Y S
15-30" f,?peD iameter Polyethylene LF| 0500 | 250 $57.70]  $14,425.00 =
TEY =
15-36" ifpcD”meter Polyethylene LF| o0-500 | 250 $74.80]  $18,700.00 <
"y 9
15-48" ?fpeD‘ameter Polyethylene LE| 0500 | 250 $128.60]  $32,150.00 [oa)
184 Non-Woven Geotextile SY] 0-1500 1000 $1.35 $1,350.00 E
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $95,900.00 g
e
O
@©
—
=
<
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SiteOne Landscape

10.36.a

COMPANY NAME: Barbato Nursery Corp East Island Asphalt Supply GLS Industries LLC T. Mina Supply LLC.
CONTACT: Kelly Singleton Jen Puco Rosalin Santiago Ginamarie Scarrino Roberto Cano
PHONE #: 631-285-6767 ext 202 631-803-8127 216-706-9250 ext 2 347-527-0258 631-475-7400 <
Award No. 64 - Topsoil, Fertilizer, Lime g
2 c
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EStlma'th Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal <
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price <
64 32-T Topsoil CY 0-100 100 N
32-F Fertilizer Ton 0-5 5 8
32-L Lime Ton 0-5 5 —
Pound '-E
32-S Seed 0-1000 1000 S
S =
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2]
[%2]
o
Award No. 65 - Planting Mix <
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity Estlma-ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal 2
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price
65 34 Planting Mix CY 0-1000 500 $123.50] $61,750.00) LO
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 65 $61,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID .
N
Award No. 66 - Asphalt Pavement Crack and Joint Sealant - Low Quantity 8
Award No. Item No. |Description Unit | Quantity Estlma'ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal &
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price -
66 30-F Granular Fill CY 0-500 250 $42.00] $10,500.00 $57.00f $14,250.00 %
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 66 NO BID NO BID $10,500.00 $14,250.00 NO BID c
s
Award No. 67 - Asphalt Pavement Crack and Joint Sealant - Mid Quantity =}
n (&)
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity Estlma-ted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost To-tal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost To‘tal Unit Cost thal o
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price o
67 4q  |AsphaltPavement Crack ) -y o 1000 | 700 $8.50] $5,950.00 <
and Joint Sealant N
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 67 NO BID $5,950.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 8
c
Award No. 68 - Asphalt Pavement Crack and Joint Sealant - High Quantity S
=
i @©
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity EstlmaAted Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal Unit Cost thal =
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price >
Asphalt Pavement Crack 1001- _(%
68 44 and Toint Sealant Lbs 1500 1,500 $8.00] $12,000.00 -
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 68 NO BID $12,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID _E
@©
=
<
=
m
=
c
(8]
S
e
O
@©
—
=
<
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SiteOne Landscape

10.36.a

COMPANY NAME: Barbato Nursery Corp East Island Asphalt Supply GLS Industries LLC T. Mina Supply LLC.
CONTACT: Kelly Singleton Jen Puco Rosalin Santiago Ginamarie Scarrino Roberto Cano
PHONE #: 631-285-6767 ext 202 631-803-8127 216-706-9250 ext 2 347-527-0258 631-475-7400 <
Award No. 69 - Drainage Rings & Top Slabs g
2 c
Award No. Item No. [Description Unit | Quantity Estlma'ted Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost Tgtal Unit Cost thal <
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price <
4' DIA X 2' HIGH &N
69 16A LEACHING RING EA. 20-Jan 5 8
4' DIA X 4.5' HIGH —
168 |LEACHING RING EA. ] 20-Jan > 2
8' DIA X 2' HIGH =
16C 1L EACHING RING EA. ] 20-an > s
8' DIA X 3' HIGH 2}
16D )| EACHING RING EA. | 20-Jan > -CEG
8' DIA X 3.5' HIGH =
16E || EACHING RING EA. 1 20-Jan > =
8' DIA X 4' HIGH "
1F  |LEACHING RING EA. | 20-Jan > 9
8' DIA X 4.5' HIGH [\I
166 )L EACHING RING EA. ] 20-Ian > N
10' DIA X 2' HIGH o
160 ) EACHING RING EA. ] 20-Jan > )
10' DIA X 3' HIGH +—
' |LEACHING RING EA. | 20-Jan > 5
10' DIA X 4' HIGH e
16) || EACHING RING EA. | 20-Jan > o
10' DIA X 5' HIGH >
- (&)
16K |t EACHING RING EA. ] 20-an > o
Y S
16L 4' DIA CIRCULAR TOP EA. 20-Jan 5 o
SLAB <
8' DIA CIRCULAR TOP AN
16M SLAB EA. 20-Jan 5 8
10' DIA CIRCULAR TOP !I:
16N SLAB EA. 20-Jan 5 o
160 4'X 6' TOP SLAB EA. 20-Jan 5 T
16P 8' X §8' TOP SLAB EA. 20-Jan 5 >
16Q 10' X 8' TOP SLAB EA. 20-Jan 5 '%
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID =
°
@©
=
<
S
m
-
c
(8]
£
e
O
@©
at
=
<
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