

07.02.2024

ADOPTED

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

TB Resolution 2024-606

AWARDS BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT PRODUCTS

Councilwoman Waski offered the following resolution,
which was seconded by Councilman Kern

WHEREAS, 3 bids were received, opened and read aloud in the Office of the Town Clerk, 4 West Second Street, Riverhead, NY 11901 on **May 15, 2024** at **11:00 AM**; and

WHEREAS, the bids were reviewed and a bid tabulation was prepared by the Purchasing Agent and presented to the Town Board for review;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the bid for **FOOD AND MEAT PRODUCTS** be awarded to the vendors indicated below for prices on the attached pages;

Items 1, 6, 8, 56, 58, 61, 115, 189, 215, 257, 259, 262, 270 to:

**Lowney Wholesale Meats
915 Flanders Road
Flanders, NY 11901
Lowney1000@yahoo.com**

Items 3, 7, 11, 12, 13, 34, 41, 43, 46, 53, 54, 57, 60, 70, 74, 78, 83, 85, 87, 88, 92, 98, 104, 159, 162, 166, 169, 170, 174, 175, 176, 177, 181, 182, 184, 192, 193, 194, 221, 224, 233, 243 to:

**H Schrier & Co., Inc.
4901 Glenwood Road
Brooklyn, NY 11234
Steve@schrierfoodservice.com**

Items 2, 4, 5, 9, 10, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 35, 36, 37, 38, 40, 42, 44, 45, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 55, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 71, 72, 73, 75, 76, 77, 79, 80, 81, 82, 84, 86, 89, 90, 91, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 116, 117, 118, 119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137, 138, 139, 140, 141, 142, 143, 144, 145, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 151, 152, 153, 154, 155, 156, 157, 158, 160, 161, 163, 164, 165, 167, 168, 171, 173, 178, 179, 180, 183, 185, 186, 187, 188, 190, 191, 195, 196, 197, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 208, 209, 210, 211, 212, 213, 214, 216, 217, 218, 219, 220, 222, 223, 226, 227, 228, 229, 230, 231, 232, 234, 235, 236, 237, 238, 239, 240, 241, 242, 244, 245, 246, 247, 248, 249, 251, 252, 253, 254, 255, 256, 258, 260, 261, 263, 264, 265, 266, 267, 268, 269, 271 to:

Ace Endico Corp.
80 International Blvd
Brewster, NY 10509
dblaikie@aceendico.com

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized to forward a copy of this resolution to the vendors listed above, and the Seniors and Purchasing Departments; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a certified copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.

THE VOTE

RESULT:	ADOPTED [UNANIMOUS]
MOVER:	Joann Waski, Councilwoman
SECONDER:	Robert Kern, Councilman
AYES:	Tim Hubbard, Robert Kern, Denise Merrifield, Joann Waski
ABSENT:	Kenneth Rothwell

State of New York
 County of Suffolk } ss:
 Town of Riverhead



This is to certify that I, the undersigned, Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead, County of Suffolk, State of New York, have compared the forgoing copy of a Resolution with the original now on file in this office and which was duly adopted on July 2, 2024 and that the same is a true and correct transcript of said Resolution and the of the whole thereof.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and the official seal of the Town of Riverhead, on July 3, 2024

James M. Wooten

, Town Clerk

FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT OF PROPOSED RIVERHEAD TOWN BOARD LEGISLATION

A. Type of Legislation Resolution <u> x </u> Local Law		
B. Title of Proposed Legislation: Awards Bid for Food and Meat Products		
C. Purpose of Proposed Legislation:		
D. Will the Proposed Legislation Have a Fiscal Impact? Yes <u> x </u> No		
E. If the answer to section D is "yes", select (a) or (b) below and initial or detail as applicable:		
(a) The fiscal impact can be absorbed by Town/department existing resources set forth in approved Town Annual Budget <u>TB</u> (example: routine and budgeted procurement of goods/services)*if selecting E(a), please initial then skip items F,G and complete H,I and J;		
or		
(b) The description/explanation of fiscal impact is set forth as follows:		
F. If the answer to E required description/explanation of fiscal impact (E(b)), please describe total Financial Cost of Funding over 5 Years		
G. Proposed Source of Funding Appropriation Account to be Charged: A01-6-6772-451-000-00000 Grant or other Revenue Source: Appropriation Transfer (list account(s) and amount):		
H. Typed Name & Title of Preparer: Teresa Baldinucci	I. Signature of Preparer  <u>Teresa Baldinucci</u> 7/2/2024	J. Date 6/21/24
K. Accounting Staff Name & Title	L. Signature of Accounting Staff	M. Date



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
TIMOTHY HUBBARD, SUPERVISOR
4 WEST SECOND STREET RIVERHEAD, NY 11901
PHONE: 631-727-3200

**BID FOR: FOOD & MEAT PRODUCTS
BID #2024-015**

Ace Endico Corporation
BIDDERS NAME
80 International Blvd
BIDDERS ADDRESS
Brewster, NY 10509
CITY, STATE, ZIP

May 13, 2024
DATE

(914) 347-3131
PHONE NUMBER

alwaikie@aceendico.com
EMAIL ADDRESS

In compliance with your advertisement for bids to be opened at **11:00 am May 15, 2024** and subject to all conditions thereof, the undersigned hereby proposes to furnish the item(s) and/or service(s) itemized in this proposal in accordance with the Notice to Bidders, General Information Agreement and Specifications contained herein on the Bid Proposal Form attached.

Bidder certifies that the prices quoted herein do not include Federal Excise Tax or any Federal, New York State or City Sales Tax and are not higher than prices charged to any governmental or commercial consumer for like merchandise and/or service; and all prices include shipping and freight charges to any Municipal building or site within the Town of Riverhead.

Respectfully submitted,

[Signature]
(SIGNATURE)

John Muraw, Director of Sales Operations
(PRINT NAME/TITLE)

THIS PAGE MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID
VENDOR NAME MUST BE PRINTED ON EVERY PAGE OF BID SUBMISSION

Attachment: Ace Endico (2024-606 : Awards Bid for Food and Meat Products)

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
	GROCERY				
1	ALMONDS, SLICED	3#	27.35	Fresh Choice 590397	3.5 lb
2	APPLE CIDER	8/64 oz.	17.11	" " 180140	4/15 gal
3	APPLES, SLICED, CANNED	6/10	41.43	A-E 680941	
4	APPLESAUCE, NO SUGAR ADDED	6/10	34.52	A-E 631458	
5	BAY LEAF	16 OZ.	5.13	P.C. 766520	
6	BBQ SAUCE, KEN'S OR SWEET BABY RAY'S	4/1 GAL	58.59	SBR 747157	
7	BEANS, GARBANZO (CHICK PEAS)	6/10	32.40	Furnham 825160	
8	BEANS, THREE BEAN SALAD	6/10	44.24	" 824450	
9	BEEF BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	55.25	P.C. Gold 615512	
10	BEETS, SWEET PICKLED, SLICED	6/10	27.49	A.E. 824686	
11	BLACK BEANS, CANNED	6/10	33.72	Furnham 825525	
12	BLACK-EYED PEAS, CANNED	6/10	40.19	" 824546	
13	BREADCRUMBS, PLAIN	6/5#	31.59	Furnham 676020	
14	CABBAGE, SHREDDED (cole slaw mix)	4/5#	22.56	TAYLOR 127307	
15	CEREAL, CREAM OF WHEAT	12/28 OZ	18.39	Quaker 627866	
16	CEREAL, CHEERIOS SINGLE SERVE BOWLPACK	96/10Z	55.13	Gen Mills 627483	
17	CHICKEN BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	52.09	F.C. Gold 615522	
18	CHICKEN BROTH	12/46 OZ	37.18	Colloge Jno 761720	
19	CHIPS, COOL RANCH, IND.	64/1.75 OZ	46.16	FRITO 641310	
20	CHIPS, NACHO CHEESE., IND.	64/1.75 OZ	46.16	Doritos 641379	
21	CHOPPED GARLIC IN OIL	12/2#	37.4	IM160 768616	
22	CINNAMON	16 OZ.	5.49	P.C. 768610	
23	CLAM BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	72.62	F.C. Gold 615518	
24	COFFEE, GROUND, DECAF, MAXWELL HOUSE	29.3 OZ	33.55	LAVAZZA 631182	18 2.5oz
25	COFFEE, GROUND, REGULAR, MAXWELL HOUSE	30.5 OZ	68.44	MAXWELL 630724	6 - 30.6oz
26	COOKIE, OREO, 4-PACK	120/1.6 OZ	51.34	NABISCO 636526	
27	COOKIES, CHOCOLATE CHIP	10#	35.42	Keebler 636684	
28	COOKIES, LORNA DOONES, 4-PACK	120/1 OZ	44.15	NABISCO 636526	
29	COOKIES, OATMEAL	10#	31.07	Keebler 636682	
30	CORN STARCH	24/1#	34.45	ARGO 600720	
31	CORN, WHOLE KERNEL	6/10	35.82	ACE 826898	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
32	CRACKERS, OYSTERETTE TYPE	150 CT	17.47	Zesta 214285	
33	CRANBERRIES, DRIED (OCEAN SPRAY)	10#	18.88	O.S. 590909	2-48oz
34	CRANBERRY SAUCE, OCEAN SPRAY (JELLIED)	6/10	65.56	OS 681096	
35	CROUTONS	5/2.25#	21.64	FC 639276	
36	DRESSING, BALSAMIC VINEGARETTE, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	62.96	Ken 648010	
37	DRESSING, CHAMPAGNE VINEGARETTE, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	63.46	Ken 747153	Spe. Order
38	DRESSING, ITALIAN, KEN'S ZESTY	4/1 GAL	59.27	Ken 648033	
39	DRESSING, ITALIAN, KRAFT ZESTY	4/1 GAL			
40	DRESSING, RANCH, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	61.74	Ken 651116	
41	FISH, TUNA, WHITE	6/66 OZ	105.73	Ruby 665526	
42	FLOUR, ALL PURPOSE	2/25#	19.35	WING 667840	
43	FLOUR WRAP, 12"	72 CT	20.24	CUCINA 450180	
44	FRUIT COCKTAIL IN JUICE	6/10#	46.79	AE 682542	
45	FRUIT SALAD, MEDLEY IN JUICE	6/10#	24.41	FRESHVILLE 200710	8lbs
46	FRUIT SALAD, TROPICAL IN JUICE	6/10#	45.27	AE 682656	
47	GARLIC, GRANULATED	7#	29.12	FC 771080	
48	GLAZE, BALSAMIC	4/12.9 OZ	29.44	ACEFOW 657540	6-12.9oz
49	GRAHAM CRACKER CRUMBS	2/5#	22.20	High 600770	
50	GRAVY MASTER	32OZ	87.44	SANDY 751125	12-32oz
51	JELL-O, RED	12/24 OZ	55.20	Royal 737602	
52	JUICE, APPLE, MOTTS	8/64 OZ	28.45	MOTT 687720	
53	JUICE, CRANBERRY, OCEAN SPRAY	8/64 OZ	32.24	O.S. 688287	
54	JUICE, ORANGE, HOMEMAKER	8/59OZ	32.99	Ruby 689411	8-48oz
55	JUICE, PINEAPPLE	12/46 OZ	38.82	Del Monte 689480	
56	KETCHUP, HEINZ	6/10	56.88	Heinz 683000	
57	KETCHUP, IND. HEINZ	1000 CT	53.41	" 688250	
58	KIDNEY BEANS	6/10	35.93	FURNACE 823860	
59	KIDNEY BEANS	6/10#	"	"	
60	LEMON JUICE, PC	200 CT	18.28	REAL 689040	
61	MAYONNAISE, HELLMANN'S	4/1 GAL	94.89	Hellmann 650090	
62	MAYONNAISE, HELLMANS, PC	210 CT	38.74	" 651770	
63	MAYONNAISE, IMPERIAL	4/1 GAL	38.88	FC 649950	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
64	MUSHROOMS, CANNED	6/10	48.24	CASA 826322	
65	MUSTARD, GULDEN'S	1 GAL	10.22	GULDEN 708680	
66	MUSTARD, GULDEN'S, PC	500 CT	24.58	GULDEN 708680	
67	OATMEAL, QUAKER OATS, OLD FASHIONED	12/48 OZ	66.35	Quaker 627834	
68	ONION, GRANULATED	7#	20.59	FC 774688	
69	ORANGES, MANDARIN, WHOLE SEGMENT	6/10#	36.56	Ruby 681310	
70	OREGANO	16 OZ	8.13	FC 775070	24oz
71	PAM SPRAY	6/17 OZ	25.66	PAM 718736	
72	PAPRIKA	16 OZ	4.31	FC 775201	
73	PARSLEY, FLAKES	8 OZ	7.12	FC 775830	11oz
74	PASTA, EGG NOODLES, WIDE	10#	22.29	Zenith 803580	
75	PASTA, ELBOW MACARONI	20#	14.12	GALATTE 711550	
76	PASTA, PENNE	20#	19.41	ITALICO 711706	
77	PASTA, SPAGHETTI	20#	18.82	" 711706	
78	PASTA, TRI-COLOR, SPIRAL	10#	26.47	Zenith 804473	
79	PASTA, ZITI	20#	18.82	ITALICO 711713	
80	PEACHES, SLICED, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	43.69	AE 68147	
81	PEAR HALVES, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	30.59	AE 681610	
82	PEARS, DICED, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	27.45	AE 703128	
83	PEPPER STRIPS, MIXED RED & GREEN	6/10	45.59	AE 729100	
84	PEPPER, BLACK	16 OZ	7.55	F.C. 77352	
85	PEPPERS, RED, FIREROASTED	6/10	44.65	LA FINE 798138	
86	PINEAPPLE CHUNKS, IN JUICE	6/10	30.96	AE 681770	
87	PINEAPPLE SLICED, IN JUICE	6/10	49.26	Ruby 681850	
88	PORK & BEANS, (BAKED) BUSH'S	6/10	35.21	Bella 735470	
89	POTATO CHIPS	104/1 OZ	48.92	LAY 641810	
90	POTATOES, SWEET, CANNED	6/10	32.65	AE 828405	
91	PRETZEL, VENDING	88 CT	41.39	ROUND 642610	
92	PUDDING, CHOCOLATE	6/10	48.44	LUCKY 740970	
93	PUDDING, LEMON	6/10	25.40	LUCKY 741390	
94	PUDDING, RICE	6/10	26.12	LUCKY 740982	3/10
95	PUDDING, TAPIOCA	6/10	50.66	LUCKY 741810	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
96	RED CABBAGE, SWEET & SOUR, LOHMANN	6/10	54.49	AE 824800	
97	RELISH	4/1 GAL	31.18	MIKE 732592	
98	RICE PILAF, UNCLE BEN'S	6/36 OZ	39.46	UB 744670	
99	RICE, BASMATI	25#	48.82	IMP 744980	4/10
100	RICE, WHITE, PARBOILED, UNCLE BEN'S	25#	32.06	Decia 744500	
101	RICE, WILD, LONG GRAIN, UNCLE BEN'S	6/36#	64.87	UB 745620	
102	SALAD OIL 90/10	6/1 GAL	48.86	INDIGO 712070	
103	SALT	24/26 OZ	21.54	sup 780390	
104	SAUCE, DUCK	4/1 GAL	34.84	AE 747580	
105	SAUCE, SPAGHETTI, ANGELA MIA	6/10	54.26	AMI 788540	
106	SAUCE, SWEET & SOUR, KRAFT	2/64 OZ	55.68	KRAFT 748129	
107	SAUCE, SWEET & SOUR, MINOR'S	6/64 OZ	64.73	MINOR 748190	
108	SAUCE, WORCESTERSHIRE	4/1 GAL	18.67	AE 752282	
109	SAUERKRAUT, OLD FASHIONED BARREL, B&G	1 GAL	21.26	Uncteo 827943	2 GAL
110	SOY SAUCE LOW SODIUM	6/64 OZ	52.89		
111	SPLENDA	2000 CT	38.73	Splenda 787900	
112	STRINGBEANS REG. CUT, CANNED	6/#10	30.15	AE 823731	
113	STUFFING, CHICKEN FLAVOR, UNCLE BEN'S	6/28 OZ	72.48	Uncle Ben's 6764004	6/5502
114	SUGAR, BROWN, LIGHT OR DARK	24/1#	32.58	DOM 786510	
115	SUGAR, WHITE, GRANULATED	50#	38.44	AE 786714	
116	TEA BAGS, BLACK, LIPTON	10/100 CT	54.44	Lipton 796460	
117	TEA BAGS, GREEN, LIPTON	5/100 CT	44.82	Lipton 794810	
118	THYME	16 OZ	2.71	FC 783056	
119	TOMATOES, WHOLE, CANNED	6/10	30.84	LatFede 982521	
120	VEGETABLE OIL	4/1 GAL	45.45	AE 715680	6/1 gal
121	VINEGAR, CIDER	4/1 GAL	11.47	ADORA 655600	
122	VINEGAR, WHITE	4/1 GAL	9.41	ADORA 656400	
123	WATER, POLAND SPRING, BOTTLES	24/16.9OZ	9.84	P-S 831649	32/16oz
124	ZUCCHINI & TOMATOES, CANNED	6/10			
125	CANNED FRUIT, DOLE (IN JUICE)	6/10	39.29	AE 681440	
126	FRUIT CUPS, DOLE (IN JUICE)	36/4OZ	40.06	AE 681250	96 4oz

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
PRODUCE					
127	APPLES (MACINTOSH)	120-140	38.65	FC 150480	
128	BANANAS	10#	6.98	FC 150761	
129	CANTELOUPE	3 CT	5.68	FC 151070	
130	CARROTS	50#	25.83	FC 112515	
131	CAULIFLOWER	12 CT	38.68	FC 112700	
132	CELERY	24 CT 30ct	28.39	FC 112790	
133	CHERRY TOMATOES	10#	11.90	FC 121700	
134	CUCUMBERS	10#	3.21	FC 113260	6 CT
135	FRESH CAULIFLOWER	EACH 3ct	13.16	FC 112700	3ct
136	LETTUCE, ROMAINE HEARTS	24 CT	49.06	FC 115910	12/3ct = 36
137	ONIONS, SPANISH	50#	28.50	FC 117740	
138	ORANGES	1/113 CT	45.41	FC 152620	
139	PEARS	120 CT	52.78	FC 153160	
140	PEPPERS, GREEN	25#	25.67	FC 118610	
141	PEPPERS, RED	25#	33.89	FC 119180	
142	PLUMS, BLACK	28#	28.57	FC 153480	
143	POTATOES, IDAHO	90 CT/50#	22.50	FC 141180	
144	POTATOES, RED, SIZE A	50#	25.89	FC 141440	
145	POTATOES, RED, SIZE B	50#	33.89	FC 141520	
146	POTATOES, SWEET, #1	1/40#	36.89	FC 123140	
147	POTATOES, CHEF	1/40#	24.89	FC 140470	140800
148	POTATOES, YUKON GOLD	50#	41.93	FC 141920	
149	WATERMELON	EACH	17.10	FC 153900	
BAKERY					
150	CROISSANTS	144/2.2 OZ	52.00	Bake Craft	150 2.2oz
151	HERO ROLLS, 3X7	12/6 CT 72	48.72	Werner 210587	50ct
152	MUFFINS, BLUEBERRY	12/6 OZ	16.71	Jonathan 212581	
153	MUFFINS, CORN	12/6 OZ	16.12	" 212583	
154	ROLLS, DINNER	175/1.2 OZ	62.46	FOAD 210730	240 ct
155	ROLLS, HAMBURGER	120 CT	25.88	Chester 306441	
156	ROLLS, HOTDOG	144 CT	26.89	AW 306541	
157	BISCUITS, MINI	175/1.2OZ	43.07	Phil 305988	
FROZEN VEGETABLES					

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
158	ASPARAGUS SPEARS, FROZEN	6/2.5#	44.12	AE 451580	
159	BROCOLLI FLORETS, FROZEN	12/2#	22.85	AE 452040	
160	BRUSSELS SPROUTS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	27.16	AE 452400	
161	CARROTS, BELGIAN CUT, FROZEN	12/2.5# 40#	22.06	AE 452760	
162	CARROTS, DICED, FROZEN	4/2.5# 10#	15.35	AE 4524200	20165
163	CAULIFLOWER, FROZEN, (2 LB. PKGS.)	12/2# 24#	27.89	AE 452850	
164	COLLARD GREENS, FROZEN	12/3#	35.04	AE 452840	35.04
165	GREEN BEANS, WHOLE, FROZEN	12/2.5#	28.89	AE 451860	
166	KALE, FROZEN	12/3#	41.89		
167	OKRA, CUT, FROZEN	12/2#	24.82	AE 453547	
168	ONIONS, PEARL, FROZEN	12/2#	29.08	AE 453630	
169	PEAS & CARROTS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	29.76	AE 453840	
170	PEAS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	30.89	AE 453750	
171	POTATO MEDLEY, LAMB WESTON, #508, FROZEN	5/3#	35.48	Lamb 381429	6 - 2.516
172	SNAP PEAS, FROZEN	12/2#		AE 453820	
173	SPINACH, CHOPPED, FROZEN	12/3#	24.31	AE 454110	
174	SQUASH, YELLOW, SLICED, FROZEN	12/3#	36.79	AE 454300	
175	SQUASH, ZUCCHINI, SLICED, FROZEN	12/3#	34.39	AE 454740	
176	STRING BEANS, CUT	12/2#	20.33	AE 451680	
177	TURNIP GREENS, CHOPPED, FROZEN	12/3#			
178	TURNIPS, DICED, FROZEN	12/3#	22.60	AE 453980	
179	VEGETABLE, CALIFORNIA BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	26.58	AE 452180	
180	VEGETABLE, ITALIAN BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	27.11	AE 454380	
181	VEGETABLE, NORMANDY BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	60.94	453742	4 5.0.
	VEGETABLE, SCANDINAVIAN BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	111.11	AE 454801	
182	VEGETABLE, WINTER BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	23.44	AE 454660	
183					
	FROZEN MEAT/SEAFOOD				
184	CHICKEN CUTLET, PLAIN, FULLY COOKED, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	40/4 OZ 10#	60.78	TYSON 338920	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
185	CHICKEN, BREAST FILETS, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	48 ct/5 OZ	38.67	CRESTVIEW 348781	4oz
186	CHICKEN, CORDON BLEU, BARBER FOODS, FROZEN	36/4oz	53.53	Barber 311 302	
187	CHICKEN, BROCCOLI STUFFED, BARBER FOODS, FROZEN	36/4oz	53.53	Barber 311 302	36 - 4oz
188	CHICKEN, LEG & THIGH, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	48/7.33OZ	51.00	Tyson 328620	
189	HAMBURGERS, 4 OZ PATTY, FROZEN	10#	3.94	AE 512420	
190	RAW TIGER SHRIMP, 21-25 COUNT, CLEANED AND DEVEINED	5/2#	68.37	Pacific 436529	
191	SALMON PIECES, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	10#/4 OZ	68.24	Seabrook 410586	
192	SEA LEGS SUPREME	12/2.5#	81.92	Supreme 415130	
193	SALISBURY STEAK, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	60/4 OZ	93.60	STOBBE 404207	
194	SALISBURY STEAK, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	53/30Z	49.91	ADVANCE 404274	
195	TYSON "HONEY STUNG" FULLY COOKED LIGHTLY BREADED CHICKEN TENDERLOINS	1-8lb 2/5LB	42.50	Dutch Quality 347770	
196	PANAPESCA CAPE HAKE, 1.75-20Z FILLET PORTIONS (TACO CUTS), DEEPSKINNED, BONELESS, IQF	5/2LB	64.47	414313	
197	TYSON "HONEY STUNG" FULLY COOKED LIGHTLY BREADED 8-PIECE CUT CHICKEN	15LB	47.92	TYSON 345742	4PK - 3 3/4 each
	FROZEN DESSERTS				
198	CAKE, BROWNIE, SHEET, FROZEN	2 TRAYS	48.21	DAVID 319280	
199	CAKE, CARROT, SHEET, FROZEN	4/96 OZ	113.58	SARA LEE 319326	
200	CAKE, CHEESE, DAVID'S COOKIES NEW YORK STYLE, FROZEN	2/10"	44.59	DAVID 315278	
201	CAKE, CRUMB, SHEET, FROZEN	EACH	26.53	DAVID 212125	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
202	CAKE, POUND, LOAF, FROZEN	12/16 OZ 192 OZ	25.35	Sweet Start 213030	
203	DANISH, ASSTD. FROZEN, WRAPPED	24 CT	29.83	Chief 309560	
204	ICE CREAM CUP, CHOCOLATE	96/4 OZ	25.74	Blue 300534	48ct
205	ICE CREAM CUP, VANILLA	96/4 OZ	25.74	" 300585	48ct
206	ICE CREAM CUP, CHOCOLATE	24/6 OZ			
207	ICE CREAM CUP, VANILLA	24/6 OZ			
208	LIMONCELLO, PRESLICED, 14 SLICES, FROZEN	4/BOX	55.31	Simply 214711	
209	PIE, COCONUT CUSTARD, SARA LEE	6/10"	51.15	Chief 374380	
210	PIE, PEACH, MRS SMITH'S	6/10"	81.10	Chief 374239	
211	PIE, PUMPKIN, MRS SMITH'S	6/10"	51.19	" 377150	
212	PIES, APPLE, MRS. SMITH'S	6/10"	50.15	" 373440	
213	SORBET, RASBERRY	3 GAL	34.74	Birds 303150	1.24 SAC
214	TIRAMISU, PRESLICED, 14 SLICES, FROZEN	4/BOX	38.13	Simply 214865	1 bx
	FROZEN PREPARED FOODS				
215	CHEESE TORTELLINI - PRECOOKED	10 LB.	27.26	Dairy 494023	
216	COD, BATTERED WITH CORONA, FROZEN	40/4 OZ 10#	83.70	FPI 410836	
217	COD, POTATO CRUSTED, FROZEN	29/5.5 OZ 159 OZ	90.56	Fishery 410848	
218	EGGPLANT ROLETTE, FROZEN	48/3.5 OZ	54.41	Galucci 403262	
219	FISH, SOLE, SCALLOP & CRAB STUFFED, FROZEN	32 CT/5 OZ	95.65	Ukrop 410540	
220	KRABBY CAKES, MRS FRIDAY'S, FROZEN	10#/3 OZ	52.71	Mrs Fri 415227	
221	LASAGNA ROLL UPS, FROZEN	6/3.5 OZ	91.07	TASTY 715060	
222	MEATBALLS, PLAIN, FROZEN	10#/2 OZ	37.44	FRIDGE 508811	
223	MEATBALLS, SWEDISH, FROZEN	10#/2 OZ	93.60	STOBE 404425	
224	MANICOTTI	60/10#	52.81	Servic 734182	10 lbs
225	PIERCE SUPER-CHIK'N, 8 PC CUT, BULK PACK, FROZEN	1/10#			
226	POT ROAST W/GRAVY COOKED	3/6#	6.84	Homamal 504402	2-15 lb
227	POTATO PANCAKE, FROZEN	432/.67 OZ	48.43	Litko 381580	5.0
228	PULLED PORK, FULLY SEASONED	10#	46.00	Smoke 404062	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
229	SAUSAGE LINKS, COOKED	160/1 OZ	31.11	FLAVOR 543290	
230	SHELLS, STUFFED, MEDIUM	120/2 OZ	56.71	JB 715132	
231	STUFFED CABBAGE, FROZEN	48 CT	102.16	CAMP 402130	
232	STUFFED PEPPERS, FROZEN, CAMPBELLS	48 CT	96.47	" 403440	
233	TATER TOTS, FROZEN	10#	28.89	CAVEAT 381760	30 lbs
	FROZEN OTHER				
234	EGG PRODUCT, FROZEN	6/5#	55.56	DEB 353680	
235	JUICE, ORANGE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4 OZ	46.01	SUN 371742	
236	JUICE, APPLE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4 OZ	12.55	SUN 371652	
237	JUICE, PINEAPPLE-ORANGE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4OZ	14.64	SUN 370812	
	DAIRY				
238	BUTTER BLOCK	36/1#	148.95	GRASS 213541	
239	BUTTER PATTIES (individual)	4/4.25# 17#	86.87	GRASS 213271	
240	CANNOLI CREAM BAGS W/CHOCOLATE CHIPS	4/1.5# 6#	25.22 22.33	BKYL 409316	
241	CHEESE, AMERICAN, LOAF, DELUXE WHITE	4/5# 6/5	76.67	GR. LAKE 220491	6/5
242	CHEESE, AMERICAN, SLICED, DELUXE WHITE	4/5#	55.68	HILLDALE 720276	
243	CHEESE, COTTAGE	4/5#	35.43	17000 221966	
244	CHEESE, MOZZARELLA, BLOCK	5#	2.50/16	CEDAR 228890	
245	CHEESE, PARMESAN, PC	200/.5 EA	22.14	COATE 229750	
246	CHEESE, SWISS (4" x 4" LOAF), FINLANDIA	7#	4.58/16	FINL 230860	
247	CHEESE, CHEDDAR, SHREDDED	5#	13.14	GLU 229255	
248	CREAM CHEESE, PC	100/1 OZ	22.22	SMITH 222160	
249	EGGS, FRESH	15 DZ	36.98	ESBE 238210	
250	JUICE, ORANGE, HOMEMAKER	8/59OZ	32.99	Ruby Korp 689411	
251	SOUR CREAM	10#	17.63	AE 238080	
252	WHIPPED CREAM, REAL, EVER-FRESH, AEROSOLE CAN	12/15 OZ	37.36	CLASSIC 238260	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
253	WHIPPED TOPPING, EVERY READY, PIPING BAGS	12/32 OZ	23.25	Rich 409560	
254	YOGURT, ALL LOW FAT, FLAVORS	48/4 OZ	17.89	DANNON 243489	
	MEAT, FRESH				
255	BEEF, BOTTOM ROUND, RAW	4/6-8#	4.18	IBP 503893	15lb
256	BEEF, CHOPPED 80/20, FRESH, RAW	2.90#	18.75 5lb	AE 500685	5lb
257	BEEF, TOP ROUND, TRIMMED & TIED, RAW	15#	5.73/lb	NATON 504361	
258	BONELESS PRIME RIB, OVEN READY, CHOICE	88# AVG	9.99	HARTLAND 502345	
259	CHICKEN BREAST, RAW	40#	88.45	ADICK 518011	
260	CORNED BEEF, LEAN, MOSEY'S	2/7#	5.10	OLD MARY 528289	
261	HAM, DELI, DELUXE, LOW SODIUM	26# AVG	2.71	HARREL 529681	
262	HOT DOGS, ALL BEEF, SABRETT	5#	29.35	Sabrett 533220	
263	PORK BABYBACK RIBS, RAW	18/2.5#	3.18	SMITH 501649	
264	PORK LOIN, RAW, CENTER CUT	2/6-9#	2.26	HATFIELD 524040	
265	ROAST BEEF, DELI, COOKED, TOP ROUND, DELUXE	2/6-8#	7.11	OWAARCH 504680	
266	SAUSAGE, ITALIAN, SWEET, FRESH	10#	29.00	DEVL 523884	
267	SAUSAGE, POLISH, KIELBASA	10#	30.56	JOHNSON 502512	2
268	SAUSAGE, SWEET, TURKEY	160/1 OZ	37.44	Butter Bell 543960	
269	STEW BEEF, FRESH, RAW	10#	38.89	Lee 500650	
270	TURKEY BREAST, COOKED, LOW SODIUM, DELUXE KOHLER	2/9#	6.45/lb	Thyris-Trial 524163	
271	TURKEY BREAST, RAW, OVEN READY, PERDUE	2/10#	5.04/lb	Butter Bell 535350	



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
TIMOTHY HUBBARD, SUPERVISOR
4 WEST SECOND STREET RIVERHEAD, NY 11901
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID FOR: FOOD & MEAT PRODUCTS
BID #2024-015

H,Schrier & Co., Inc.

5/12/2024

BIDDERS NAME

DATE

4901 Glenwood Rd

BIDDERS ADDRESS

Brooklyn, NY 11234

CITY, STATE, ZIP

(631) 307-9570 x:370

PHONE NUMBER

steve@schrierfoodservice.com

EMAIL ADDRESS

In compliance with your advertisement for bids to be opened at **11:00 am May 15, 2024** and subject to all conditions thereof, the undersigned hereby proposes to furnish the item(s) and/or service(s) itemized in this proposal in accordance with the Notice to Bidders, General Information Agreement and Specifications contained herein on the Bid Proposal Form attached.

Bidder certifies that the prices quoted herein do not include Federal Excise Tax or any Federal, New York State or City Sales Tax and are not higher than prices charged to any governmental or commercial consumer for like merchandise and/or service; and all prices include shipping and freight charges to any Municipal building or site within the Town of Riverhead.

Respectfully submitted,

Stephen Maiorano
(SIGNATURE)

Stephen Maiorano, Account Manager
(PRINT NAME/TITLE)

THIS PAGE MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID
VENDOR NAME MUST BE PRINTED ON EVERY PAGE OF BID SUBMISSION

Attachment: H. Schrier & Co., Inc (2024-606 : Awards Bid for Food and Meat Products)

10.6.b

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
GROCERY					
1	ALMONDS, SLICED	3#	28.50	Command	5lb
2	APPLE CIDER	8/64 oz.	n/b		
3	APPLES, SLICED, CANNED	6/10	38.65	Premium	21058
4	APPLESAUCE, NO SUGAR ADDED	6/10	39.75	Premium	11012
5	BAY LEAF	16 OZ.	9.00	Rose L.	51064
6	BBO SAUCE, KEN'S OR SWEET BABY RAY'S	4/1 GAL	68.00	Sweet baby rays	7888
7	BEANS, GARBANZO (CHICK PEAS)	6/10	30.90	Bella	58244
8	BEANS, THREE BEAN SALAD	6/10	46.50	Furman	51430
9	BEEF BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	70.00	Minors	2178
10	BEETS, SWEET PICKLED, SLICED	6/10	38.99	Stolkey	51640
11	BLACK BEANS, CANNED	6/10	30.25	Furman	51456
12	BLACK-EYED PEAS, CANNED	6/10	38.95	G&S	58220
13	BREADCRUMBS, PLAIN	6/5#	30.30	Finest	5728
14	CABBAGE, SHREDED (cole slaw mix)	4/5#	n/b		
15	CEREAL, CREAM OF WHEAT	12/28 OZ	n/b		
16	CEREAL, CHEERIOS SINGLE SERVE BOWLPAK	96/10Z	58.15	Gen mills	124.42
17	CHICKEN BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	59.95	Gold label	23.84
18	CHICKEN BROTH	12/46 OZ	47.95	College inn	15702
19	CHIPS, COOL RANCH, IND.	64/1.75 OZ	n/b		
20	CHIPS, NACHO CHEESE., IND.	64/1.75 OZ	n/b		
21	CHOPPED GARLIC IN OIL	12/2#	32.60	Finest	51270
22	CINNAMON	16 OZ.	5.90	Rose L.	51136
23	CLAM BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	94.00	Minors	2176
24	COFFEE, GROUND, DECAF, MAXWELL HOUSE	29.3 OZ	N/b		
25	COFFEE, GROUND, REGULAR, MAXWELL HOUSE	30.5 OZ	N/B		
26	COOKIE, OREO, 4-PACK	120/1.6 OZ	57.75	Nabisco	4936
27	COOKIES, CHOCOLATE CHIP	10#	39.85	Keebler	10240
28	COOKIES, LORNA DOONES, 4-PACK	120/ 1 OZ	48.99	Nabisco	9920
29	COOKIES, OATMEAL	10#	34.95	Keebler	10242
30	CORN STARCH	24/1#	40.05	Argo	10.94
31	CORN, WHOLE KERNEL	6/10	38.80	Packet	57902

10.6.b

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
32	CRACKERS, OYSTERTTE TYPE	150 CT	26.25	Westminster 9876	
33	CRANBERRIES, DRIED (OCEAN SPRAY)	10#	34.90	Ocen spray 22118	
34	CRANBERRY SAUCE, OCEAN SPRAY (JELLIED)	6/10	61.70	Ruby Kris 21320	
35	CROUTONS	5/2.25#	n/b		
36	DRESSING, BALSAMIC VINEGARETTE, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	68.00	Kens 33306	
37	DRESSING, CHAMPAGNE VINEGARETTE, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	N/B		
38	DRESSING, ITALIAN, KEN'S ZESTY	4/1 GAL	N/B		
39	DRESSING, ITALIAN, KRAFT ZESTY	4/1 GAL	N/B		
40	DRESSING, RANCH, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	75.65	Kens 33304	
41	FISH, TUNA, WHITE	6/66 OZ	105.00	Premium 18562	
42	FLOUR, ALL PURPOSE	2/25#	32.00	Heckers 1944	
43	FLOUR WRAP, 12"	72 CT	19.95	Toufay 92900	
44	FRUIT COCKTAIL IN JUICE	6/10#	52.00	Premium 10044	
45	FRUIT SALAD, MEDLEY IN JUICE	6/10#	n/b		
46	FRUIT SALAD, TROPICAL IN JUICE	6/10#	43.80	Packer 21440	
47	GARLIC, GRANULATED	7#	28.50	Rose L 51244	5lb
48	GLAZE, BALSAMIC	4/12.9 OZ	N/B		
49	GRAHAM CRACKER CRUMBS	2/5#	N/b		
50	GRAVY MASTER	32OZ	12.72	Gravy Master 17215	
51	JELL-O, RED	12/24 OZ	N/B		
52	JUICE, APPLE, MOTT'S	8/64 OZ	31.35	Motts 21086	
53	JUICE, CRANBERRY, OCEAN SPRAY	8/64 OZ	31.55	O/Spray 27138	
54	JUICE, ORANGE, HOMEMAKER	8/59OZ	33.80	Big Squeeze 27060	8/64oz
55	JUICE, PINEAPPLE	12/46 OZ	46.85	Ruby kris 27460	
56	KETCHUP, HEINZ	6/10	61.90	Heinz 7210	
57	KETCHUP, IND. HEINZ	1000 CT	52.99	Heinz 71.80	
58	KIDNEY BEANS	6/10	33.55	Furnan 57450	
59	KIDNEY BEANS	6/10#	33.55	Furnan 57450	
60	LEMON JUICE, PC	200 CT	9.60	Salad fresh 27324	
61	MAYONNAISE, HELLMANN'S	4/1 GAL	100.00	Hellmann's 33110	
62	MAYONNAISE, HELLMANS, PC	210 CT	43.55	Hellman's 33380	
63	MAYONNAISE, IMPERIAL	4/1 GAL	55.05	Admiration 66086	Admiration

10.6.b

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
64	MUSHROOMS, CANNED	6/10	52.60	Packer 58080	
65	MUSTARD, GULDEN'S	1 GAL	N/B		
66	MUSTARD, GULDEN'S, PC	500 CT	NB		
67	OATMEAL, QUAKER OATS, OLD FASHIONED	12/48 OZ	72.15	Quaker 13698	12/42oz
68	ONION, GRANULATED	7#	28.15	Rose L 51388	5lb
69	ORANGES, MANDARIN, WHOLE SEGMENT	6/10#	52.70	Premium 21534	
70	OREGANO	16 OZ	5.10	Rose L 51396	
71	PAM SPRAY	6/17 OZ	29.85	Pam 40350	
72	PAPRIKA	16 OZ	5.15	Rose L: 51416	
73	PARSLEY, FLAKES	8 OZ	7.70	Rose L 51140	
74	PASTA, EGG NOODLES, WIDE	10#	16.10	Italia P 34162	
75	PASTA, ELBOW MACARONI	20#	23.20	Dakota 34046	
76	PASTA, PENNE	20#	19.95	Santa Sophia 34078	
77	PASTA, SPAGHETTI	20#	19.95	Italia 34222	
78	PASTA, TRI-COLOR, SPIRAL	10#	16.30	Italia 34264	
79	PASTA, ZITI	20#	20.50	Italia 34282	
80	PEACHES, SLICED, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	48.95	Packer 11058	
81	PEAR HALVES, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	N/B		
82	PEARS, DICED, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	36.40	Packer 11088	
83	PEPPER STRIPS, MIXED RED & GREEN	6/10	41.30	Packer 58590	
84	PEPPER, BLACK	16 OZ	8.45	Rose L 51460	
85	PEPPERS, RED, FIREROASTED	6/10	41.30	Packer 57034	
86	PINEAPPLE CHUNKS, IN JUICE	6/10	40.05	Packer 21800	
87	PINEAPPLE SLICED, IN JUICE	6/10	38.80	Packer 21870	
88	PORK & BEANS, (BAKED) BUSH'S	6/10	33.15	Furnan 57250	Furnan brand
89	POTATO CHIPS	104/1 OZ	N/B		
90	POTATOES, SWEET, CANNED	6/10	38.80	Packer 58610	
91	PRETZEL, VENDING	88 CT	n/b		
92	PUDDING, CHOCOLATE	6/10	42.45	AFP 24628	
93	PUDDING, LEMON	6/10	46.00	AFP 24610	
94	PUDDING, RICE	6/10	54.65	AFP 24614	
95	PUDDING, TAPIOCA	6/10	53..20	AFP 24622	

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
96	RED CABBAGE, SWEET & SOUR, LOHMANN	6/10	n/b		
97	RELISH	4/1 GAL	35.75	B&G 7458	
98	RICE PILAF, UNCLE BEN'S	6/36 OZ	31.95	Nearer 3848	
99	RICE, BASMATI	25#	N/B		
100	RICE, WHITE, PARBOILED, UNCLE BEN'S	25#	38.10	Par Excellence 19.75	
101	RICE, WILD, LONG GRAIN, UNCLE BEN'S	6/36#	n/b		
102	SALAD OIL 90/10	6/1 GAL	61.50	40032	
103	SALT	24/26 OZ	29.70	51626	
104	SAUCE, DUCK	4/1 GAL	30.60	8632	
105	SAUCE, SPAGHETTI, ANGELA MIA	6/10	62.40	35864	
106	SAUCE, SWEET & SOUR, KRAFT	2/64 OZ	n/b		
107	SAUCE, SWEET & SOUR, MINOR'S	6/64 OZ	n/b		
108	SAUCE, WORCESTERSHIRE	4/1 GAL	n/b		
109	SAUERKRAUT, OLD FASHIONED BARREL, B&G	1 GAL	n/b		
110	SOY SAUCE LOW SODIUM	6/64 OZ	56.30	8666	
111	SPLENDA	2000 CT	N/B	Splenda	
112	STRINGBEANS REG. CUT, CANNED	6/#10	34.50	Packer 34.50	
113	STUFFING, CHICKEN FLAVOR, UNCLE BEN'S	6/28 OZ	46.95	Foothill 5634	
114	SUGAR, BROWN, LIGHT OR DARK	24/1#	46.95	Domino sugar 32036	
115	SUGAR, WHITE, GRANULATED	50#	43.75	Domino 52084	
116	TEA BAGS, BLACK, LIPTON	10/100 CT	5171856.50	Lipton 28514	
117	TEA BAGS, GREEN, LIPTON	5/100 CT	45.15	Lipton 28484	
118	THYME	16 OZ	5.75	Rose L. 517.18	
119	TOMATOES, WHOLE, CANNED	6/10	30.95	Furnan 58760	
120	VEGETABLE OIL	4/1 GAL	67.80	Admiral 40040 --- 6/1 gal	
121	VINEGAR, CIDER	4/1 GAL	13.95	Packer 81.30	
122	VINEGAR, WHITE	4/1 GAL	10.60	Packer 8172	
123	WATER, POLAND SPRING, BOTTLES	24/16.9OZ	N/B		
124	ZUCCHINI & TOMATOES, CANNED	6/10	N/B		
125	CANNED FRUIT, DOLE (IN JUICE)	6/10	43.85	Packer brand 11046	
126	FRUIT CUPS, DOLE (IN JUICE)	36/4OZ	53.00	96 /4.5oz tropical fruit mix- premium/b	
			43.85		

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
PRODUCE					
127	APPLES (MACINTOSH)	120-140	N/B		
128	BANANAS	10#	N/b		
129	CANTELOUPE	3 CT	N/B		
130	CARROTS	50#	N/B		
131	CAULIFLOWER	12 CT	N/B		
132	CELERY	24 CT	N/b		
133	CHERRY TOMATOES	10#	N/b		
134	CUCUMBERS	10#	N/B		
135	FRESH CAULIFLOWER	EACH	N/b		
136	LETTUCE, ROMAINE HEARTS	24 CT	N/b		
137	ONIONS, SPANISH	50#	N/B		
138	ORANGES	1/113 CT	N/B		
139	PEARS	120 CT	N/b		
140	PEPPERS, GREEN	25#	N/B		
141	PEPPERS, RED	25#	N/b		
142	PLUMS, BLACK	28#	N/B		
143	POTATOES, IDAHO	90 CT/50#	N/B		
144	POTATOES, RED, SIZE A	50#	N/B		
145	POTATOES, RED, SIZE B	50#	N/B		
146	POTATOES, SWEET, #1	1/40#	N/B		
147	POTATOES, CHEF	1/40#	N/B		
148	POTATOES, YUKON GOLD	50#	N/B		
149	WATERMELON	EACH	N/b		
BAKERY					
150	CROISSANTS	144/2.2 OZ	N/B		
151	HERO ROLLS, 3X7	12/6 CT 72	N/B		
152	MUFFINS, BLUEBERRY	12/6 OZ	N/B		
153	MUFFINS, CORN	12/6 OZ	N/b		
154	ROLLS, DINNER	175/1.2 OZ	N/b		
155	ROLLS, HAMBURGER	120 CT	N/b		
156	ROLLS, HOTDOG	144 CT	N/b		
157	BISCUITS, MINI	175/1.20Z	N/B		
FROZEN VEGETABLES					

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
158	ASPARAGUS SPEARS, FROZEN	6/2.5#	N/B		
159	BROCOLLI FLORETS, FROZEN	12/2#	22.10	PACKER 98016	
160	BRUSSELS SPROUTS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	39.45	PACKER 60334	
161	CARROTS, BELGIAN CUT, FROZEN	12/2.5# 40#	23.85	PACKER 98042	
162	CARROTS, DICED, FROZEN	4/2.5# 10#	16.00	PACKER 98160	12/2LB
163	CAULIFLOWER, FROZEN, (2 LB. PKGS.)	12/2# 24#	28.75	PACKER 98050	
164	COLLARD GREENS, FROZEN	12/3#	36.00	PACKER 98154	
165	GREEN BEANS, WHOLE, FROZEN	12/2.5#	N/B		
166	KALE, FROZEN	12/3#	38.00	PACKER 98158	
167	OKRA, CUT, FROZEN	12/2#	27.90	PACKER 98172	
168	ONIONS, PEARL, FROZEN	12/2#	n/b		
169	PEAS & CARROTS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	28.45	PACKER 98102	
170	PEAS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	29.80	PACKER 98098	
171	POTATO MEDLEY, LAMB WESTON, #508, FROZEN	5/3#	No Bid		
172	SNAP PEAS, FROZEN	12/2#	N/B		
173	SPINACH, CHOPPED, FROZEN	12/3#	29.05	PACKER 98114	
174	SQUASH, YELLOW, SLICED, FROZEN	12/3#	32.40	PACKER 95120	
175	SQUASH, ZUCCHINI, SLICED, FROZEN	12/3#	33.15	PACKER 98122	
176	STRING BEANS, CUT	12/2#	21.50	PACKER 98074	12/2.5lb
177	TURNIP GREENS, CHOPPED, FROZEN	12/3#	52.00	PACKER 98174	
178	TURNIPS, DICED, FROZEN	12/3#	50.25	PACKER 91874	
179	VEGETABLE, CALIFORNIA BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	30.50	REGAL 98202	
180	VEGETABLE, ITALIAN BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	30.50	PACKER 98084	
181	VEGETABLE, NORMANDY BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	30.50	Regal 98198	
	VEGETABLE, SCANDINAVIAN BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	30.90	PACKER 98192	
182	VEGETABLE, WINTER BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	32.10	PACKER 98232	
183					
	FROZEN MEAT/SEAFOOD				
184	CHICKEN CUTLET, PLAIN, FULLY COOKED, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	40/4 OZ 10#	74.00	PACKER 93544	80 /4oz case

10.6.b

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
185	CHICKEN, BREAST FILETS, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	48 ct/5 OZ	80.00	Koch 95056	
186	CHICKEN, CORDON BLEU, BARBER FOODS, FROZEN	36/4oz	63.80	Barber 92282	
187	CHICKEN, BROCCOLI STUFFED, BARBER FOODS, FROZEN	36/4oz	64.70	Barber 96194	
188	CHICKEN, LEG & THIGH, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	48/7.33OZ	n/b		
189	HAMBURGERS, 4 OZ PATTY, FROZEN	10#	42.00	Wonder 94664	
190	RAW TIGER SHRIMP, 21-25 COUNT, CLEANED AND DEVEINED	5/2#	N/B		
191	SALMON PIECES, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	10#/4 OZ	94.00	90150	
192	SEA LEGS SUPREME	12/2.5#	67.00	Lucky crab meat blend 93102	
193	SALISBURY STEAK, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	60/4 OZ	108.00	Maid rite 96066	120/4oz
194	SALISBURY STEAK, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	53/3OZ	38.79	Maid rite 90562	
195	TYSON "HONEY STUNG" FULLY COOKED LIGHTLY BREADED CHICKEN TENDERLOINS	2/5LB	51.85	Tyson 96456	
196	PANAPESCA CAPE HAKE, 1.75-2OZ FILLET PORTIONS (TACO CUTS), DEEPSKINNED, BONELESS, IQF	5/2LB	N/B		
197	TYSON "HONEY STUNG" FULLY COOKED LIGHTLY BREADED 8-PIECE CUT CHICKEN	15LB	58.25	Tyson 93538	
	FROZEN DESSERTS				
198	CAKE, BROWNIE, SHEET, FROZEN	2 TRAYS	50.00	C.K. 81084	
199	CAKE, CARROT, SHEET, FROZEN	4/96 OZ	114.00	Sara Lee 91924	
200	CAKE, CHEESE, DAVID'S COOKIES NEW YORK STYLE, FROZEN	2/10"	29.50	F&R 81932	1/10"
201	CAKE, CRUMB, SHEET, FROZEN	EACH	29.75	J/Lord 91366	

Packet Pg. 73

228	PULLED PORK, FULLY SEASONED	10#	59.00	Austin blues 93242	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
229	SAUSAGE LINKS, COOKED	160/1 OZ	35.50	Hatfield 89240	
230	SHELLS, STUFFED, MEDIUM	120/2 OZ	n/b		
231	STUFFED CABBAGE, FROZEN	48 CT	117.40	Campbells 92324	
232	STUFFED PEPPERS, FROZEN, CAMPBELLS	48 CT	110.80	Campbells 92364	
233	TATER TOTS, FROZEN	10#	58.10	Cavendish 94546	6/5lb
FROZEN OTHER					
234	EGG PRODUCT, FROZEN	6/5#	75.00	Newberg 88304	
235	JUICE, ORANGE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4 OZ	30.25	Sun cup 93082	
236	JUICE, APPLE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4 OZ	16.95	Sun cup 93080	
237	JUICE, PINEAPPLE-ORANGE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4OZ	17.55	Sun cup 92970	
DAIRY					
238	BUTTER BLOCK	36/1#	N/b		
239	BUTTER PATTIES (individual)	4/4.25# 17#	N/b		
240	CANNOLI CREAM BAGS W/CHOCOLATE CHIPS	4/1.5# 6#	N/b		
241	CHEESE, AMERICAN, LOAF, DELUXE WHITE	4/5#	N/B		
242	CHEESE, AMERICAN, SLICED, DELUXE WHITE	4/5#	N/B		
243	CHEESE, COTTAGE	4/5#	34.80	Crowly 88490	
244	CHEESE, MOZZARELLA, BLOCK	5#	n/b		
245	CHEESE, PARMESAN, PC	200/.5 EA	n/b		
246	CHEESE, SWISS (4" x 4" LOAF), FINLANDIA	7#	n/b		
247	CHEESE, CHEDDAR, SHREDDED	5#	15.75	Packer 88240	
248	CREAM CHEESE, PC	100/1 OZ	47.35	Philly 88132	
249	EGGS, FRESH	15 DZ	n/b	N/b	
250	JUICE, ORANGE, HOME MAKER	8/59OZ	33.80	Big Squeeze 87060	Big Squeeze 8/64oz
251	SOUR CREAM	10#	13.00	Cabot 51b	51b

10.6.b

252	WHIPPED CREAM, REAL, EVER-FRESH, AEROSOLE CAN	12/15 OZ	N/B		
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
253	WHIPPED TOPPING, EVERY READY, PIPING BAGS	12/32 OZ	N/b		
254	YOGURT, ALL LOW FAT, FLAVORS	48/4 OZ	N/B		
	MEAT, FRESH		N/B		
255	BEEF, BOTTOM ROUND, RAW	4/6-8#	n/b		
256	BEEF, CHOPPED 80/20, FRESH, RAW	2.90#	N/b		
257	BEEF, TOP ROUND, TRIMMED & TIED, RAW	15#	N/b		
258	BONELESS PRIME RIB, OVEN READY, CHOICE	88# AVG	N/B		
259	CHICKEN BREAST, RAW	40#	N/B		
260	CORNEED BEEF, LEAN, MOSEY'S	2/7#	N/B		
261	HAM, DELI, DELUXE, LOW SODIUM	26# AVG	N/B		
262	HOT DOGS, ALL BEEF, SABRETT	5#	N/B		
263	PORK BABYBACK RIBS, RAW	18/2.5#	N/B		
264	PORK LOIN, RAW, CENTER CUT	2/6-9#	N/b		
265	ROAST BEEF, DELI, COOKED, TOP ROUND, DELUXE	2/6-8#	N/b		
266	SAUSAGE, ITALIAN, SWEET, FRESH	10#	N/b		
267	SAUSAGE, POLISH, KIELBASA	10#	N/b		
268	SAUSAGE, SWEET, TURKEY	160/1 OZ	N/B		
269	STEW BEEF, FRESH, RAW	10#	N/B		
270	TURKEY BREAST, COOKED, LOW SODIUM, DELUXE KOHLER	2/9#	N/B		
271	TURKEY BREAST, RAW, OVEN READY, PERDUE	2/10#	N/B		



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
TIMOTHY HUBBARD, SUPERVISOR
 4 WEST SECOND STREET RIVERHEAD, NY 11901
 PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID FOR: FOOD & MEAT PRODUCTS
BID #2024-015

Lowney Wholesale Meats

BIDDERS NAME

915 Flanders Road

BIDDERS ADDRESS

Flanders NY 11901

CITY, STATE, ZIP

(631) 484-6428

PHONE NUMBER

Lowney1000@yahoo.com

EMAIL ADDRESS

DATE

5-13-24

In compliance with your advertisement for bids to be opened at **11:00 am May 15, 2024** and subject to all conditions thereof, the undersigned hereby proposes to furnish the item(s) and/or service(s) itemized in this proposal in accordance with the Notice to Bidders, General Information Agreement and Specifications contained herein on the Bid Proposal Form attached.

Bidder certifies that the prices quoted herein do not include Federal Excise Tax or any Federal, New York State or City Sales Tax and are not higher than prices charged to any governmental or commercial consumer for like merchandise and/or service; and all prices include shipping and freight charges to any Municipal building or site within the Town of Riverhead.

Respectfully submitted,

Adam Lowney

(SIGNATURE)

Adam Lowney / owner

(PRINT NAME/TITLE)

THIS PAGE MUST BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED WITH BID
 VENDOR NAME MUST BE PRINTED ON EVERY PAGE OF BID SUBMISSION

Attachment: Lowney Wholesale Meat (2024-606 : Awards Bid for Food and Meat Products)

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024				VENDOR NAME	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
GROCERY					
1	ALMONDS, SLICED	3#	14.00		
2	APPLE CIDER	8/64 oz.	no bid	chef quality / 0539721	
3	APPLES, SLICED, CANNED	6/10	no bid		
4	APPLESAUCE, NO SUGAR ADDED	6/10	no bid		
5	BAY LEAF	16 OZ.	no bid		
6	BBQ SAUCE, KEN'S OR SWEET BABY RAY'S	4/1 GAL	55.00	Sweet Baby Rays / 075640	
7	BEANS, GARBANZO (CHICK PEAS)	6/10	no bid		
8	BEANS, THREE BEAN SALAD	6/10	42.00	quality / 075675	
9	BEEF BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	no bid		
10	BEEFS, SWEET PICKLED, SLICED	6/10	no bid		
11	BLACK BEANS, CANNED	6/10	no bid		
12	BLACK-EYED PEAS, CANNED	6/10	no bid		
13	BREADCRUMBS, PLAIN	6/5#	no bid		
14	CABBAGE, SHREDDED (cole slaw mix)	4/5#	no bid		
15	CEREAL, CREAM OF WHEAT	12/28 OZ	no bid		
16	CEREAL, CHEERIOS SINGLE SERVE BOWLPAK	96/10Z	no bid		
17	CHICKEN BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	no bid		
18	CHICKEN BROTH	12/46 OZ	no bid		
19	CHIPS, COOL RANCH, IND.	64/1.75 OZ	no bid		
20	CHIPS, NACHO CHEESE, IND.	64/1.75 OZ	no bid		
21	CHOPPED GARLIC IN OIL	12/2#	no bid		
22	CINNAMON	16 OZ.	no bid		
23	CLAM BASE, GOLD LABEL	6/1#	no bid		
24	COFFEE, GROUND, DECAF, MAXWELL HOUSE	29.3 OZ	no bid		
25	COFFEE, GROUND, REGULAR, MAXWELL HOUSE	30.5 OZ	no bid		
26	COOKIE, OREO, 4-PACK	120/1.6 OZ	no bid		
27	COOKIES, CHOCOLATE CHIP	10#	no bid		
28	COOKIES, LORNA DOONES, 4-PACK	120/1 OZ	no bid		
29	COOKIES, OATMEAL	10#	no bid		
30	CORN STARCH	24/1#	no bid		
31	CORN, WHOLE KERNEL	6/10	no bid		

Lowney Wholesale Meats

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024				VENDOR NAME	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
32	CRACKERS, OYSTERETTE TYPE	150 CT	no bid		
33	CRANBERRIES, DRIED (OCEAN SPRAY)	10#	no bid		
34	CRANBERRY SAUCE, OCEAN SPRAY (JELLIED)	6/10	no bid		
35	CROUTONS	5/2.25#	no bid		
36	DRESSING, BALSAMIC VINEGARETTE, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	no bid		
37	DRESSING, CHAMPAGNE VINEGARETTE, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	no bid		
38	DRESSING, ITALIAN, KEN'S ZESTY	4/1 GAL	no bid		
39	DRESSING, ITALIAN, KRAFT ZESTY	4/1 GAL	no bid		
40	DRESSING, RANCH, KEN'S	4/1 GAL	no bid		
41	FISH, TUNA, WHITE	6/66 OZ	no bid		
42	FLOUR, ALL PURPOSE	2/25#	38.90	Heckery 537950	
43	FLOUR WRAP, 12"	72 CT	no bid		
44	FRUIT COCKTAIL IN JUICE	6/10#	no bid		
45	FRUIT SALAD, MEDLEY IN JUICE	6/10#	no bid		
46	FRUIT SALAD, TROPICAL IN JUICE	6/10#	no bid		
47	GARLIC, GRANULATED	7#	no bid		
48	GLAZE, BALSAMIC	4/12.9 OZ	no bid		
49	GRAHAM CRACKER CRUMBS	2/5#	no bid		
50	GRAVY MASTER	32OZ	no bid		
51	JELL-O, RED	12/24 OZ	no bid		
52	JUICE, APPLE, MOTT'S	8/64 OZ	no bid		
53	JUICE, CRANBERRY, OCEAN SPRAY	8/64 OZ	no bid		
54	JUICE, ORANGE, HOMEMAKER	8/59OZ	no bid		
55	JUICE, PINEAPPLE	12/46 OZ	no bid		
56	KETCHUP, HEINZ	6/10	52.00	Heinz 549628	
57	KETCHUP, IND. HEINZ	1000 CT	no bid		
58	KIDNEY BEANS	6/10	no bid		
59	KIDNEY BEANS	6/10#	28.00	Heinz Quality 550740	
60	LEMON JUICE, PC	200 CT	no bid		
61	MAYONNAISE, HELLMANN'S	4/1 GAL	78.00	HELLMANS 550824	
62	MAYONNAISE, HELLMANN'S, PC	210 CT	no bid		
63	MAYONNAISE, IMPERIAL	4/1 GAL	no bid		

Lowney Wholesale Meat

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024

VENDOR NAME

Lowney Wholesale Meats

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
64	MUSHROOMS, CANNED	6/10	no bid		
65	MUSTARD, GILDEN'S	1 GAL	14.00	gildens / 050268	
66	MUSTARD, GILDEN'S, PC	500 CT	no bid		
67	OATMEAL, QUAKER OATS, OLD FASHIONED	12/48 OZ	no bid		
68	ONION, GRANULATED	7#	no bid		
69	ORANGES, MANDARIN, WHOLE SEGMENT	6/10#	no bid		
70	OREGANO	16 OZ	no bid		
71	PAM SPRAY	6/17 OZ	no bid		
72	PAPRIKA	16 OZ	no bid		
73	PARSLEY, FLAKES	8 OZ	no bid		
74	PASTA, EGG NOODLES, WIDE	10#	no bid		
75	PASTA, ELBOW MACARONI	20#	22.00	Chet quality / 040320	
76	PASTA, PENNE	20#	no bid		
77	PASTA, SPAGHETTI	20#	no bid		
78	PASTA, TRI-COLOR, SPIRAL	10#	no bid		
79	PASTA, ZITI	20#	no bid		
80	PEACHES, SLICED, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	no bid		
81	PEAR HALVES, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	no bid		
82	PEARS, DICED, NATURAL, IN JUICE	6/10	no bid		
83	PEPPER STRIPS, MIXED RED & GREEN	6/10	no bid		
84	PEPPER, BLACK	16 OZ	no bid		
85	PEPPERS, RED, FIREROASTED	6/10	no bid		
86	PINEAPPLE CHUNKS, IN JUICE	6/10	no bid		
87	PINEAPPLE SLICED, IN JUICE	6/10	6.00	Bonus / 048170	
88	PORK & BEANS, (BAKED) BUSH'S	6/10	no bid		
89	POTATO CHIPS	104/1 OZ	no bid		
90	POTATOES, SWEET, CANNED	6/10	no bid		
91	PRETZEL, VENDING	88 CT	no bid		
92	PUDDING, CHOCOLATE	6/10	no bid		
93	PUDDING, LEMON	6/10	no bid		
94	PUDDING, RICE	6/10	no bid		
95	PUDDING, TAPIOCA	6/10	no bid		

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024				VENDOR NAME		Lowney Wholesale		Meaty	
ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED				
96	RED CABBAGE, SWEET & SOUR, LOHMANN	6/10	nc bid						
97	RELISH	4/1 GAL	nc bid						
98	RICE PILAF, UNCLE BEN'S	6/36 OZ	nc bid						
99	RICE, BASMATI	25#	nc bid						
100	RICE, WHITE, PARBOILED, UNCLE BEN'S	25#	nc bid						
101	RICE, WILD, LONG GRAIN, UNCLE BEN'S	6/36#	nc bid						
102	SALAD OIL 90/10	6/1 GAL	nc bid						
103	SALT	24/26 OZ	nc bid						
104	SAUCE, DUCK	4/1 GAL	nc bid						
105	SAUCE, SPAGHETTI, ANGELA MIA	6/10	nc bid						
106	SAUCE, SWEET & SOUR, KRAFT	2/64 OZ	nc bid						
107	SAUCE, SWEET & SOUR, MINOR'S	6/64 OZ	nc bid						
108	SAUCE, WORCESTERSHIRE	4/1 GAL	38.00	Fracture / 075688					
109	SAUERKRAUT, OLD FASHIONED BARREL, B&G	1 GAL	36.00	Bx6 / 064280					
110	SOY SAUCE LOW SODIUM	6/64 OZ	nc bid						
111	SPLENDA	2000 CT	nc bid						
112	STRINGBEANS REG. CUT, CANNED	6/#10	nc bid						
113	STUFFING, CHICKEN FLAVOR, UNCLE BEN'S	6/28 OZ	nc bid						
114	SUGAR, BROWN, LIGHT OR DARK	24/1#	nc bid						
115	SUGAR, WHITE, GRANULATED	50#	38.00	True (908 / 065240					
116	TEA BAGS, BLACK, LIPTON	10/100 CT	nc bid						
117	TEA BAGS, GREEN, LIPTON	5/100 CT	nc bid						
118	THYME	16 OZ	nc bid						
119	TOMATOES, WHOLE, CANNED	6/10	nc bid						
120	VEGETABLE OIL	4/1 GAL	nc bid						
121	VINEGAR, CIDER	4/1 GAL	18.00	Chetty quality / 065432					
122	VINEGAR, WHITE	4/1 GAL	nc bid						
123	WATER, POLAND SPRING, BOTTLES	24/16.90Z	nc bid						
124	ZUCCHINI & TOMATOES, CANNED	6/10	nc bid						
125	CANNED FRUIT, DOLE (IN JUICE)	6/10	nc bid						
126	FRUIT CUPS, DOLE (IN JUICE)	36/40Z	nc bid						

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024

VENDOR NAME

Lowway Wholesale Meat

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
158	ASPARAGUS SPEARS, FROZEN	6/2.5#	11c bid		
159	BROCOLLI FLORETS, FROZEN	12/2#	11c bid		
160	BRUSSELS SPROUTS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	10c bid		
161	CARROTS, BELGIAN CUT, FROZEN	12/2.5# 40#	11c bid		
162	CARROTS, DICED, FROZEN	4/2.5# 10#	11c bid		
163	CAULIFLOWER, FROZEN, (2 LB. PKGS.)	12/2# 24#	11c bid		
164	COLLARD GREENS, FROZEN	12/3#	11c bid		
165	GREEN BEANS, WHOLE, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
166	KALE, FROZEN	12/3#	11c bid		
167	OKRA, CUT, FROZEN	12/2#	11c bid		
168	ONIONS, PEARL, FROZEN	12/2#	11c bid		
169	PEAS & CARROTS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
170	PEAS, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
171	POTATO MEDLEY, LAMB WESTON, #508, FROZEN	5/3#	11c bid		
172	SNAP PEAS, FROZEN	12/2#	11c bid		
173	SPINACH, CHOPPED, FROZEN	12/3#	26c bid	Quality / 340690	
174	SQUASH, YELLOW, SLICED, FROZEN	12/3#	11c bid		
175	SQUASH, ZUCCHINI, SLICED, FROZEN	12/3#	11c bid		
176	STRING BEANS, CUT	12/2#	11c bid		
177	TURNIP GREENS, CHOPPED, FROZEN	12/3#	11c bid		
178	TURNIPS, DICED, FROZEN	12/3#	11c bid		
179	VEGETABLE, CALIFORNIA BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
180	VEGETABLE, ITALIAN BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
181	VEGETABLE, NORMANDY BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
182	VEGETABLE, SCANDINAVIAN BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
183	VEGETABLE, WINTER BLEND, FROZEN	12/2.5#	11c bid		
	FROZEN MEAT/SEAFOOD				
184	CHICKEN CUTLET, PLAIN, FULLY COOKED, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	40/4 OZ 10#	11c bid		

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024

VENDOR NAME

Lowney Wholesale Meat

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
185	CHICKEN, BREAST FILETS, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	48 ct/5 OZ	11c bid		
186	CHICKEN, CORDON BLEU, BARBER FOODS, FROZEN		11c bid		
187	CHICKEN, BROCCOLI STUFFED, BARBER FOODS, FROZEN		11c bid		
188	CHICKEN, LEG & THIGH, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	48/7.33OZ	11c bid		
189	HAMBURGERS, 4 OZ PATTY, FROZEN	10#	3.85	Mathew / 681576	
190	RAW TIGER SHRIMP, 21-25 COUNT, CLEANED AND DEVEINED	5/2#	11c bid		
191	SALMON PIECES, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	10#/4 OZ	11c bid		
192	SEA LEGS SUPREME	12/2.5#	11c bid		
193	SALSBURY STEAK, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	60/4 OZ	11c bid		
194	SALSBURY STEAK, INDIVIDUALLY QUICK FROZEN	53/3OZ	11c bid		
195	TYSON "HONEY STUNG" FULLY COOKED LIGHTLY BREADED CHICKEN TENDERLOINS	2/5LB	11c bid		
196	PANAPESCA CAPE HAKE, 1.75-2OZ FILLET PORTIONS (TACO CUTS), DEEPSKINNED, BONELESS, IQF	5/2LB	11c bid		
197	TYSON "HONEY STUNG" FULLY COOKED LIGHTLY BREADED 8-PIECE CUT CHICKEN	15LB	11c bid		
	FROZEN DESSERTS				
198	CAKE, BROWNIE, SHEET, FROZEN	2 TRAYS	11c bid		
199	CAKE, CARROT, SHEET, FROZEN	4/96 OZ	11c bid		
200	CAKE, CHEESE, DAVID'S COOKIES NEW YORK STYLE, FROZEN	2/10"	11c bid		
201	CAKE, CRUMB, SHEET, FROZEN	EACH	11c bid		

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024

VENDOR NAME

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
202	CAKE, POUND, LOAF, FROZEN	12/16 OZ 192 OZ	no bid		
203	DANISH, ASSTD. FROZEN, WRAPPED	24 CT	no bid		
204	ICE CREAM CUP, CHOCOLATE	96/4 OZ	no bid		
205	ICE CREAM CUP, VANILLA	96/4 OZ	no bid		
206	ICE CREAM CUP, CHOCOLATE	24/6 OZ	no bid		
207	ICE CREAM CUP, VANILLA	24/6 OZ	no bid		
208	LIMONCELLO, PRESLICED, 14 SLICES, FROZEN	4/BOX	no bid		
209	PIE, COCONUT CUSTARD, SARA LEE	6/10"	no bid		
210	PIE, PEACH, MRS SMITH'S	6/10"	no bid		
211	PIE, PUMPKIN, MRS SMITH'S	6/10"	no bid		
212	PIES, APPLE, MRS. SMITH'S	6/10"	no bid		
213	SORBET, RASBERRY	3 GAL	no bid		
214	TIRAMISU, PRESLICED, 14 SLICES, FROZEN	4/BOX	no bid		
	FROZEN PREPARED FOODS				
215	CHEESE TORTELLINI - PRECOOKED	10 LB.	25.00	Supreme Thawing / 832052	
216	COD, BATTERED WITH CORONA, FROZEN	40/4 OZ 10#	no bid		
217	COD, POTATO CRUSTED, FROZEN	29/5.5 OZ	no bid		
218	EGGPLANT ROLETTE, FROZEN	159 OZ	no bid		
219	FISH, SOLE, SCALLOP & CRAB STUFFED, FROZEN	48/3.5 OZ	no bid		
220	KRABBY CAKES, MRS FRIDAY'S, FROZEN	32 CT/5 OZ	no bid		
221	LASAGNA ROLL UPS, FROZEN	10#/3 OZ	no bid		
222	MEATBALLS, PLAIN, FROZEN	6/3.5 OZ	no bid		
223	MEATBALLS, SWEDISH, FROZEN	10#/2 OZ	no bid	Angelo Mig / 840792	
224	MANICOTTI	10#/2 OZ	no bid		
225	PIERCE SUPER-CHIK'N, 8 PC CUT, BULK PACK, FROZEN	60/10#	33.00	Supreme Thawing / 832097	
226	POT ROAST W/GRAVY COOKED	1/10#	no bid		
227	POTATO PANCAKE, FROZEN	3/6#	no bid		
228	PULLED PORK, FULLY SEASONED	432/.67 OZ	no bid		
		10#	no bid		

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024

VENDOR NAME

Lowney Wholesale Meat

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
229	SAUSAGE LINKS, COOKED	160/1 OZ	no bid		
230	SHELLS, STUFFED, MEDIUM	120/2 OZ	no bid		
231	STUFFED CABBAGE, FROZEN	48 CT	no bid		
232	STUFFED PEPPERS, FROZEN, CAMPBELLS	48 CT	no bid		
233	TATER TOTS, FROZEN	10#	no bid		
	FROZEN OTHER				
234	EGG PRODUCT, FROZEN	6/5#	no bid		
235	JUICE, ORANGE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4 OZ	no bid		
236	JUICE, APPLE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4 OZ	no bid		
237	JUICE, PINEAPPLE-ORANGE, SUNCUP, FROZEN	72/4 OZ	no bid		
	DAIRY				
238	BUTTER BLOCK	36/1#	no bid	Northside / 065420	
239	BUTTER PATTIES (individual)	4/4.25#	no bid		
240	CANNOLI CREAM BAGS W/CHOCOLATE CHIPS	4/1.5# 6#	no bid		
241	CHEESE, AMERICAN, LOAF, DELUXE WHITE	4/5#	no bid		
242	CHEESE, AMERICAN, SLICED, DELUXE WHITE	4/5#	no bid		
243	CHEESE, COTTAGE	4/5#	no bid		
244	CHEESE, MOZZARELLA, BLOCK	5#	no bid		
245	CHEESE, PARMESAN, PC	200/.5 EA	no bid		
246	CHEESE, SWISS (4" x 4" LOAF), FINLANDIA	7#	4.65	Finlandia / 140630	
247	CHEESE, CHEDDAR, SHREDED	5#	no bid		
248	CREAM CHEESE, PC	100/1 OZ	no bid		
249	EGGS, FRESH	15 DZ	no bid		
250	JUICE, ORANGE, HOMEMAKER	8/59OZ	no bid		
251	SOUR CREAM	10#	no bid		
252	WHIPPED CREAM, REAL, EVER-FRESH, AEROSOLE CAN	12/15 OZ	no bid		

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD BID FOR FOOD AND MEAT 2024

VENDOR NAME

Lowney Wholesale / Meqtr

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PRICE	BRAND/PRODUCT CODE	UNIT, IF DIFFERENT THAN SPECIFIED
253	WHIPPED TOPPING, EVERY READY, PIPING BAGS	12/32 OZ	No Bid		
254	YOGURT, ALL LOW FAT, FLAVORS	48/4 OZ	No Bid		
	MEAT, FRESH				
255	BEEF, BOTTOM ROUND, RAW	4/6-8#	No Bid		
256	BEEF, CHOPPED 80/20, FRESH, RAW	2.90#	3.85	Mathews 081567	
257	BEEF, TOP ROUND, TRIMMED & TIED, RAW	15#	5.50	Mathews 081540	
258	BONELESS PRIME RIB, OVEN READY, CHOICE	88# AVG	No Bid		
259	CHICKEN BREAST, RAW	40#	2.80	Meunier 067550	
260	CORNEED BEEF, LEAN, MOSEY'S	2/7#			
261	HAM, DELI, DELUXE, LOW SODIUM	26# AVG	3.75	Patrol 054440	
262	HOT DOGS, ALL BEEF, SABRETT	5#	5.50	Sabrett 023500	
263	PORK BABYBACK RIBS, RAW	18/2.5#	3.25	Smithfield 025400	
264	PORK LOIN, RAW, CENTER CUT	2/6-9#	2.40	IBP 026820	
265	ROAST BEEF, DELI, COOKED, TOP ROUND, DELUXE	2/6-8#			
266	SAUSAGE, ITALIAN, SWEET, FRESH	10#	2.50	Paisano 025670	
267	SAUSAGE, POLISH, KIELBASA	10#	5.25	Kohler 024890	
268	SAUSAGE, SWEET, TURKEY	160/1 OZ	No Bid		
269	STEW BEEF, FRESH, RAW	10#	5.25	Mathews 081440	
270	TURKEY BREAST, COOKED, LOW SODIUM, DELUXE KOHLER	2/9#	5.50	Kohler 024950	
271	TURKEY BREAST, RAW, OVEN READY, PERDUE	2/10#	No Bid		