
Town of Riverhead 
200 Howell Avenue 

Riverhead, NY  11901 
 

TO: Supervisor Hubbard; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Kern, 
Merrifield, Rothwell, Waski; Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk; Michael 
Reichel, Sewer District Superintendent 

 
CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing, Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s Office; Gina 

Hubbard, Sewer District 
 
FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Agent 
 
DATE:  February 7, 2023 
 
RE: Bid Opening Report for Chemicals for the Sewer District 
 
 
5 bids were received by the Town Clerk and opened on January 25, 2024 at 11am: 
 
 
Shannon Chemical Corp. 
PO Box 376 
Malverne, PA 19355 
dcflynn@shannonchem.com 
 
Twin County Swimming Pool 
Maintenance & Supply Co., Inc. 
797 Conklin St 
Farmingdale, NY 11735 
Rpcad7@aol.com 
 
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 
3015 State Rd 
Croydon, PA 19021 
bidadministration@coynechemical.com 
 
Progressive Grower 
1129 Cross River Dr 
Riverhead, NY 11901 
mmatulonis@progressivegrower.com 
 
 
 
Results of the bid opening are attached. 
 

 
 
Tortorella Autochem LLC 
296 West Montauk Hwy 
Hampton Bays, NY 11946 
info@autochemcorp.com 
 
 
 

Timothy Hubbard 
Supervisor 

Teresa Baldinucci 
Purchasing Agent 

631-727-3200 Ext. 271 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

Amended 3/38/2023

BID NAME:
BID OPENING DATE:  1/25/2024

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE SUBMITTED WITH BID?

ITEM DESCRIPTION
UNIT PRICE / 

MANUFACTURER DELIVERY

UNIT PRICE / 
MANUFACTURE

R DELIVERY

UNIT PRICE / 
MANUFACTURE

R DELIVERY

UNIT PRICE / 
MANUFACTURER DELIVERY

UNIT PRICE / 
MANUFACTURER DELIVERY

1

PPG ACCU-TAB SL TABLETS 
(CHLORINE) 55 LB. CONTAINERS
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR – 25 
CONTAINERS PER DELIVERY
PRICE PER PAIL

 No Bid 

 $260/pail 
($4.727lb)        

(25 containers = 
$6,500) 48 hours

  Substitute item 
CCH Cal Hypo 3" 
Tablet, 50lb bucket 

, Baystate     
$329.95/pail 

(6.599lb) 2-3 days

 $223.08/pail 
($4.056/lb)         

Axiall 

 Packaged 
product: 7-
10 business 
days ARO/ 

Bulk 
product: 10-
14 business 
days ARO  No Bid 

2

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25% SOLUTION 55 
GALLON CONTAINERS
APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES PER  YEAR-20 
DRUMS PER DELIVERY
PRICE PER DRUM *price to include cleanup 
fee, if applicable

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $166.6159/drum    
Miniumum 20 drums

per delivery.  
Westlake 

 Packaged 
product: 7-
10 business 
days ARO/ 

Bulk 
product: 10-
14 business 
days ARO  No Bid 

3

POTASSIUM PERMANGNATE FREE 
FLOWING 55 LB. CONTAINERS 
APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES PER YEAR-25-30 
PAILS/PALLET
PRICE PER POUND

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $2.9904/lb 
($164.472/container) 

United Mineral 

 Packaged 
product: 7-
10 business 
days ARO/ 

Bulk 
product: 10-
14 business 
days ARO 

 $3.47/lb 
($190.85/container) 
36 pails per pallet 
Universal and /or 
any NSF Standard 

60 Certified 
Producer 

 1-2 days 
ARO 

4
SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LB. BAGS
APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR – 50 
BAGS PER DELIVERY 
PRICED PER POUND

 No Bid  No Bid 

 $0.89/lb. 
$44.50/bag 

Baystate 2-3 days

$0.7279/lb. 
$36.395/bag      

Church & Dwight

 Packaged 
product: 7-
10 business 
days ARO/ 

Bulk 
product: 10-
14 business 
days ARO No Bid

5

CITRIC ACID 50%
55 GALLON DRUM

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 ($22.1325/gal)  
$1,217.29/drum  
Coyne Chemical 

 Packaged 
product: 7-
10 business 
days ARO/ 

Bulk 
product: 10-
14 business 
days ARO  No Bid 

6

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 15% 
SOLUTION – BULK
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH – 250 GAL 
PER DELIVERY
PRICE PER GALLON

 No Bid 
 $3.85/gal        

Kuehne Chemical 48 Hours
 $4.25/gal      

Kuehne Chemical 2-3 days
 $6.2096/gal    

Kuehne Chemical  

 Packaged 
product: 7-
10 business 
days ARO/ 

Bulk 
product: 10-
14 business 
days ARO  No Bid 

7

DENSE SODA ASH 58%
50 LB. BAGS  $29.45 bag/ 

Sisecam 24-36 Hours  No Bid 
$44.00 bag/ 

Baystate 2-3 days

 $29.5455 / bag*    
Tata Chemicals     

55 bag min         

 Packaged 
product: 7-
10 business 
days ARO/ 

Bulk 
product: 10-
14 business 
days ARO  No Bid 

* George S. Coyne Chemical has issued the following disclaimer in their bid:

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., 
Inc. *

Meredith Haskin
215-785-3000

Yes

Shannon Chemical Corporation 
Daniel C. Flynn
610-363-9090

Yes

Randy P. Cestaro
631-249-1249

Yes

Tortorella Autochem LLC
Kirk Newcombe
631-283-7398

Yes

CHEMICALS FOR RIVERHEAD SEWER DISTRICT

Due to market volatility, both on material supply and freight, the George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. reserves the right to renegotiate pricing should our 
costs increase in excess of 10% during the course of the contract period for CUSTIC SODA, SODIUM BICARBONATE and SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE.

Progressive Growers Inc.
Mark Matulonis
631-591-3540

Yes

Twin County Swimming Pool 
Maintenance & Supply Co., Inc.
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