
Town of Riverhead 
200 Howell Avenue 

Riverhead, NY  11901 
 
 
 
 

TO: Supervisor Aguiar; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Beyrodt, 
Hubbard, Kern, Rothwell; Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk; Mike Zaleski, 
Highway Superintendent 

 
CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing Technician; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s 

Office; Jaime Ritter, Municipal Garage 
 
FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Agent 
 
DATE:  April 20, 2023 
 
RE: Bid Opening Report for Lubricants 
 
 
 
3 bids were received and opened on April 13, 2023 at 11am: 
 

Reladyne Northeast LLC 
35 Drexel Drive 
Bay Shore, NY 11706 
Contractorders@reladyne.com  
 
Romeo Enterprises 
35 Dunbar Avenue 
Piscataway, NJ 08854 
joemromeo@yahoo.com 
 
Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc. 
42 Longwater Drive 
Norwell, MA 02061 
elwood.shannon@cleanharbors.com 
 
 
Results of the bid opening are attached. Bids have been forwarded to the Municipal 
Garage for review.  
 

Yvette Aguiar 
Supervisor 

Teresa Baldinucci 
Purchasing Agent 

631-727-3200 Ext. 271 



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

BID # 2023-9

BID NAME: LUBRICANTS 2023
BID OPENING DATE: 4/13/2023

COMPANY:
CONTACT:
PHONE #:

ITEM # DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY BID PRICE EXTENDED BRAND BID PRICE EXTENDED BRAND BID PRICE EXTENDED BRAND

1

55 GALLON DRUM OF 
TRANSMISSION FLUID MERCON V DRUM 2

NO BID $1,647.07 $3,294.14 AMSOIL (OTF) $513.74 $1,027.48 NOT SPECIFIED

2 120 LBS. KEG GEAR OIL 80W/90 KEG 2 $259.00 $518.00 STARFIRE $734.30 $1,468.60 AMSOIL (AGL) $273.94 $547.88 NOT SPECIFIED

3
55 GALLON DRUMS HYDRAULIC 
OIL DRUM 15 $469.00 $7,035.00 DRYDEN A W32,46 $870.70 $13,060.50

AMSOIL(HCG32 
OR HCG46) $425.30 $6,379.50 NOT SPECIFIED

4 15 W 40 ENGINE OIL GALLON 2000 $10.79 $21,580.00 DRYDENE $18.00 $36,000.00 AMSOIL (SBDF) $9.10 $18,200.00 NOT SPECIFIED

5

55 GALLON DRUMS PERMANENT 
ANTIFREEZE & SUMMER 
COOLANT (FULL STRENGTH) DRUM 5 $439.00 $2,195.00

DURAMAX GREEN 
100% NO BID NO BID NO BID $394.02 $1,970.10 NOT SPECIFIED

6
120 LBS. SUPER CHASSIS GREASE 
(RED) KEG 2 $549.00 $1,098.00 ALL FLEET HI TEMP NO BID NO BID NO BID $539.57 $1,079.14 NOT SPECIFIED

7
55 GALLON ALL PURPOSE TRANS 
& TORQUE FLUID DRUM 2 $597.00 $1,194.00 DRYDENE $1,941.93 $3,883.86 AMSOIL (ATH) $524.16 $1,048.32 NOT SPECIFIED

8
120 LBS. SYNTHETIC GEAR OIL 
80W/140 KEG 2 $609.00 $1,218.00

PHILLIPS 
66/KENDALL $823.10 $1,646.20 AMSOIL(FGO) $283.57 $567.14 NOT SPECIFIED

Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc.Reladyne Northeast LLC
John McTigue
631-234-8900

Romeo Enterprises
Joe Romeo

732-599-3475
Shaynn Mahan
781-490-2346
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