Teresa Baldinucci

Yvette Aguiar 200 Howell Avenue Purchasing Agent
Supervisor Riverhead, NY 11901 631-727-3200 Ext. 271
TO: Supervisor Aguiar; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Beyrodt,

Hubbard, Kern, Rothwell; Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk; Kelly Tocci,
Director of Senior Citizen Programs

CC: Eva Gregorovius, Purchasing Technician; Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s
Office; Karen Westwood, Meals on Wheels Coordinator

FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Agent

DATE: March 30, 2023

RE: Bid Opening Report for Street Light and Traffic Signal Maintenance Repair
Parts

4 bids were received and opened on March 30, 2023 at 11am:

Traffic Systems Inc.

1 Corporate Dr, Suite 1
Holtsville, NY 11742
wteese@trafficsystemsinc.com

City Energy Services
80 Orville Dr, Suite 100
Bohemia, NY 11716
dkane.ces@gmail.com

Revco Electric

403 Griffing Ave
Riverhead, NY 11901
waynef@revco.com

Schwing Electric Supply Corp
1328 E Main St

Riverhead, NY 11901
mattg@schwingelectric.com

Results of the bid opening are attached. Bids have been forwarded to the Engineering
for review.



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/30/2023
COMPANY: City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
B1 No bid No bid $6.95 No bid
B2 No bid No bid $6.39 No bid
B3 No bid No bid $19.85 No bid
B4 No bid No bid $18.45 No bid
B5 No bid $42.00 $53.95 No bid
TB1 No bid No bid No bid No bid
TB2 No bid No bid No bid No bid
MC1 No bid No bid $10.95 Tork5237-ul No bid
MC2 No bid No bid No bid No bid
MC3 No bid No bid No bid No bid
MC4 $168.00 No bid No bid No bid
MC5 No bid $9.21 $14.95 Tork2421 No bid
MC6 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
MC7 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
MCS8 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
MC9 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
MC10 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 No bid
BC1 No bid $2.39 No bid No bid
BC2 No bid $2.39 No bid No bid
BC3 No bid $4.72 No bid No bid
BC4 No bid No bid No bid No bid
BC5 No bid No bid No bid No bid
BCo6 No bid No bid No bid No bid
FP1 No bid No bid No bid No bid
FP2 $279.90 No bid $335.00 ERL1007B540AGRAY No bid
FP3 $218.90 No bid $259.00 ERL1004B540AGRAY No bid
FP4 $1,538.00 No bid $1,725.00 EAPS-2007A402ABFblck No bid
FP5 $1,319.00 No bid $1,485.00 EAPS-2003A402ABFblck No bid
FP6 $528.00 No bid $595.00 No bid
FP7 No bid $722.36 $645.00 FXLEDSSF/7PR No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/30/2023
COMPANY: City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS

FP8 No bid $855.30 $645.00 FXLEDSSF/7PR No bid

FP9 No bid $351.95 No bid No bid

FP10 No bid $61.65 $63.95 No bid

FP11 No bid $51.14 $52.95 No bid

FP12 No bid $74.72 $80.95 No bid

FP13 No bid $94.88 $99.95 No bid

FP14 No bid $229.42 $237.95 No bid

FP15 No bid No bid $663.00 No bid

FP16 $1,370.00 No bid No bid No bid

FP17 No bid No bid No bid No bid

FP18 No bid No bid No bid No bid

FP19 No bid No bid $1,725.00 No bid

FP20 No bid No bid $489.00 No bid

FP21 No bid No bid $557.00 No bid

FP22 No bid $744.71 $685.00 No bid

FP23 No bid $257.58 $275.00 No bid

FP24 $2,060.00 No bid $2,495.00 No bid

BF1 No bid No bid No bid No bid

FH1 No bid $22.89 $19.50 Mersen FEB1111 No bid

FH2 No bid $12.24 $5.95 Mersen ATM15 No bid

FH3 No bid $12.00 $5.95 Mersen ATM20 No bid

FH4 No bid $12.05 $5.95 Mersen ATM30 No bid

LL1 No bid No bid No bid $50.75

LL2 No bid No bid No bid $50.75

LL3 No bid No bid No bid $50.75

LL4 No bid No bid No bid $48.00

LLS No bid No bid No bid $48.00

LL6 No bid No bid No bid $48.00

LL8 No bid No bid No bid $138.25

LL9 No bid No bid No bid $109.00

LTSI No bid No bid No bid $1,780.00
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/30/2023
COMPANY: City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
ITEM # UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
LTS2 No bid No bid No bid $497.00
LTS3 No bid No bid No bid $569.00
LTS4 No bid No bid No bid $149.00
LTSS No bid No bid No bid $6,245.00
LTS6 No bid No bid No bid $28.00
LTS7 No bid No bid No bid $28.25
LTS8 No bid No bid No bid $994.75
LTS9 No bid No bid No bid $143.00
LTS10 No bid No bid No bid $61.25
LTS11 No bid No bid No bid $667.75
LTS12 No bid No bid No bid $3,447.00
LTS13 No bid No bid No bid $3,670.00
LTS14 No bid No bid No bid $212.75
LTS15 No bid No bid No bid $35.00
LTS16 No bid No bid No bid $212.75
LTS17 No bid No bid No bid $97.00
LTS18 No bid No bid No bid $78.50
LTS19 No bid No bid No bid $37.50
LTS20 No bid No bid No bid $17.00
ME1 No bid No bid No bid No bid
ME2 No bid $6.64 $4.95 LEVITON S266C No bid
ME3 No bid $11.05 $8.95 LEVITON S269C No bid
ME4 No bid $126.29 No bid No bid
MES No bid $86.48 No bid No bid
ME6 No bid $210.00 No bid No bid
ME7 No bid $40.00 No bid No bid
MES8 No bid $55.00 No bid No bid
ME9 No bid $39.00 PER JUG No bid No bid
ME10 No bid $1.46 PER FT No bid No bid
MEI11 No bid No bid No bid No bid
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