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05.17.2023 ADOPTED

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD

TB Resolution 2023-361

AMENDS BID AWARD FOR STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL
MAINTENANCE PARTS

Councilman Kern offered the following resolution,
which was seconded by Councilman Hubbard

WHEREAS, by Resolution 2023-322, adopted May 2, 2023, the Riverhead Town
Board awarded the bid for STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE
REPAIR PARTS; and

WHEREAS, upon review of the adopted resolution, it was realized that one item
was mistakenly omitted from the bid award recommendation; and

WHEREAS, the Town Purchasing Agent confirmed with the Engineering
Department that this was an oversight..

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the bid for STREET LIGHT &
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS be awarded to the vendors
indicated below for prices on the attached pages;

ITEMS #LL1, LL2, LL3, LL4, LLS5, LL6, LL8, LL9, LTS1, LTS2, LTS3, LTS4, LTSS,
LTS6, LTS7,LTS8, LTS9, LTS10, LTS11, LTS12, LTS13, LTS14, LTS15, LTS16,
LTS17,LTS18, LTS19, LTS20 TO:

TRAFFIC SYSTEMS INC.

1 CORPORATE DR, SUITE 1
HOLTSVILLE, NY 11742
wteese@trafficsystemsinc.com

ITEMS #MC4, FP2, FP3, FP4, FP5, FP6, FP16, FP24 TO:

CITY ENERGY SERVICES
80 ORVILLE DR, SUITE 100
BOHEMIA, NY 11716
dkane.ces@gmail.com

ITEMS #B5, MC5, BC1, BC2, BC3, FP9, FP10, FP11, FP12, FP13, FP14, FP23, MES9,
ME10 TO:

REVCO ELECTRIC

403 GRIFFING AVE

RIVERHEAD, NY 11901

waynef@revco.com
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ITEMS #B1, B2, B3, B4, MC1, MC6, MC7, MC8, MC9, MC10, FP7, FP8, FP15, FP19,

FP20, FP21, FP22, FH1, FH2, FH3, FH4, ME2, ME3 TO:

SCHWING ELECTRIC SUPPLY CORP
1328 E MAIN ST

RIVERHEAD, NY 11901
mattg@schwingelectric.com

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized
to forward a copy of this resolution to the vendors listed above, and the Engineering and
Purchasing Departments; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that all Town Hall Departments may review and
obtain a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a
certified copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.

THE VOTE
RESULT: ADOPTED [UNANIMOUS]
MOVER: Robert Kern, Councilman
SECONDER: Tim Hubbard, Councilman
AYES: Aguiar, Hubbard, Beyrodt Jr., Rothwell, Kern

This is to certify that |, the undersigned, Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead, County of Suffolk,
State of New York State of New York, have compared the forgoing copy of a Resolution with the original now on file in
this office and which was duly adopted on May 17, 2023

and that the same is a true and correct transcript of said Resolution and the of the whole thereof.

County of Suffolk }ss:

Town of Riverhead
IN WITNESS WHEREQF, | have hereunto set my hand and the official seal of the Town of

Riverhead, on May 18, 2023

Liane M Withete

, Town Clerk
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FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT
OF PROPOSED RIVERHEAD TOWN BOARD LEGISLATION

9.24

A. Type of Legislation Resolution __x Local Law
B. Title of Proposed Legislation: Amends Bid Award for Street Lighting and Traffic Signal Maintenance Repair Parts
C. Purpose of Proposed Legislation:
D. Will the Proposed Legislation Have a Fiscal Impact?  Yes _x No
E. If the answer to section D is “yes”, select (a) or (b) below and initial or detail as applicable:
(@) The fiscal impact can be absorbed by Town/department existing resources set forth in approved Town Annual Budget TB
(example:routine and budgeted procurement of goods/services)*if selecting E(a), please initial then skip items F,G and
complete H,l and J;
or
(b) The description/explanation of fiscal impact is set forth as follows:
F. If the answer to E required description/explanation of fiscal impact (E(b)), please describe total Financial Cost of Funding over
5 Years
G. Proposed Source of Funding
Appropriation Account to be Charged: SL1-5-5182-412-000-00000

Grant or other Revenue Source:

Appropriation Transfer (list account(s) and amount):

H. Typed Name & |. Signature of Preparer J. Date
Title of 5/04/23
Preparer: Teresa
Baldinucci

Teresa Baldinucci 5/17/2023
K. Accounting Staff L. Signature of Accounting Staff M. Date
Name & Title 5/08/23
William Rothaar, G o . Pt
Accounting
Department Wwilliam Rothaar
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

9.24.a

Attachment: Amended 2023 Street Light Parts Bid Award Recommendation (2023-361 : Amends Award

BID TAB SHEET
BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: |3/30/2023
COMPANY: City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
ITEM # [ UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS | UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE || EXCEPTIONS
Bl No bid No bid $6.95 No bid
B2 No bid No bid $6.39 No bid
B3 No bid No bid $19.85 No bid
B4 No bid No bid $18.45 No bid
B5 No bid $42.00 ¥ 5395 No bid
TBI No bid No bid No bid No bid |
TB2 No bid No bid No bid No bid
MCl1 No bid No bid $10.95 Torks237-ul 0% g’ No bid
MC2 No bid No bid No bid No bid
MC3 No bid No bid No bid No bid
MC4 $168.00 No bid No bid _ No bid
MC5 No bid $9.21 4.95 Tork2421 L S No bid
MC6 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 { | , Nobid
MC7 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 ¥\ No bid
MC8 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 (- ) No bid
MC9 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 (v (»”  Nobid
MC10 No bid $1.40 $0.99 Ideal 46-1700 (3™ |,/ No bid
PJ
BCl No bid $2.39 No bid No bid
BC2 No bid $2.39 No bid No bid
BC3 No bid $4.72 No bid No bid
BC4 No bid No bid No bid No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

9.24.a

Attachment: Amended 2023 Street Light Parts Bid Award Recommendation (2023-361 : Amends Award

BID TAB SHEET
BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE:  (3/30/2023
COMPANY: City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
ITEM # [ UNITPRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE || EXCEPTIONS

BC5 No bid No bid No bid No bid

BC6 No bid No bid No bid No bid

FP1 No bid No bid No bid No bid

FP2 $279.90 No bid $335.00 ERL1007B540AGRAY No bid

FP3 $218.90 No bid $259.00 ERL1004B540AGRAY ‘No bid

FP4 $1,538.00 No bid $1,725.00 EAPS-2007A402ABFblck No bid

FP5 $1,319.00 No bid $1,485.00 EAPS-2003A402ABFblck No bid

FP6 $528.00 No bid $595.00 ! No bid

FP7 No bid $722.36 $645.00 FXLEDSSF/7PR_o¢ | ¥ / No bid

FP8 No bid $855.30 $645.00 FXLEDSSF/7PR b| ¥© No bid

FP9 No bid $351.95 No bid No bid

FP10 No bid $61.65 $63.95 No bid

FP11 No bid $51.14 $52.95 No bid

FP12 No bid $74.72 $80.95 B No bid

FP13 No bid $94.88 $99.95 ] No bid

FP14 No bid $229.42 $237.95 No bid

FP15 No bid No bid $663.00 No bid

FP16 $1,370.00 No bid No bid No bid

FP17 No bid No bid No bid No bid

FP18 No bid No bid No bid No bid

FP19 No bid No bid $1,725.00 No bid

FP20 No bid No bid $489.00 No bid

FP21 No bid No bid $557.00 No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

9.24.a

Attachment: Amended 2023 Street Light Parts Bid Award Recommendation (2023-361 : Amends Award

BID TAB SHEET
BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: |3/30/2023
COMPANY: City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
ITEM # [ UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
FP22 I No bid $744.71 $685.00 No bid
FP23 No bid $257.58 $275.00 No bid
FP24 $2,060.00 No bid $2,495.00 No bid
BF1 No bid No bid No bid i No bid
FHI No bid $22.89 $19.50 Mersen FEB1111 ¥ No bid
FH2 No bid $12.24 $5.95 Mersen ATMI15 (ﬁ _ No bid
FH3 No bid $12.00 $5.95 Mersen ATM20 ) No bid
FH4 No bid $12.05 $5.95 Mersen ATM30 No bid
L.l No bid No bid No bid $50.75
LL2 No bid No bid No bid $50.75
LL3 No bid No bid No bid $50.75
LL4 No bid No bid No bid $48.00
LL5 No bid Nobid No bid $48.00
LL6 No bid No bid No bid $48.00
LL8 No bid No bid No bid $138.25
LL9 No bid No bid No bid $109.00
LTSI No bid No bid I No bid $1,780.00
LTS2 No bid No bid No bid $497.00
LTS3 No bid No bid No bid $569.00
LTS4 No bid No bid No bid $149.00
LTS5 No bid No bid No bid $6,245.00
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

9.24.a

Attachment: Amended 2023 Street Light Parts Bid Award Recommendation (2023-361 : Amends Award

BID TAB SHEET
BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: |3/30/2023
COMPANY: City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
|
ITEM # I UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS || UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS
LTS6 No bid No bid No bid $28.00
LTS7 No bid No bid No bid $28.25
LTS8 No bid No bid No bid $994.75
LTS9 No bid No bid No bid $143.00
LTS10 No bid No bid . No bid $61.25
~ LTSI11 No bid B No bid No bid $667.75
LTS12 No bid No bid No bid $3,447.00
LTS13 No bid No bid No bid $3,670.00
LTS14 No bid No bid No bid $212.75
LT815 No bid No bid No bid $35.00
LTS16 No bid No bid No bid $212.75
LTS17 No bid No bid No bid $97.00
LTS18 No bid No bid No bid $78.50
LTS19 No bid No bid No bid $37.50
LTS20 No bid No bid No bid $17.00
MEL1 No bid No bid No bid No bid
ME2 No bid $6.64 $4.95 LEVITON S266C No bid
ME3 No bid $11.05 $8.95 LEVITON S269C No bid
ME4 No bid $126.29 No bid No bid
MES5 No bid $86.48 No bid No bid
ME6 No bid $210.00 No bid No bid
ME7 No bid $40.00 No bid No bid
MES8 No bid $55.00 No bid No bid
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

9.24.a

BID#: 2023-7
BID NAME: ~ |STREET LIGHT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS
BID OPENING DATE: (3/30/2023 B
COMPANY: | City Energy Services Revco Electric Schwing Electrical Supply Corp. Traffic Systems, Inc.
CONTACT: Dennis Kane Wayne Ford John Dunigan Richard Marsanico
PHONE #: 631-588-4801 631-369-1900 631-727-1155 631-242-4292
ITEM # j UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS UNIT PRICE EXCEPTIONS

ME9 I No bid $39.00 PER JUG No bid No bid

ME10 No bid $1.46 PER FT No bid No bid

MEI11 No bid No bid No bid No bid
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Attachment: Amended 2023 Street Light Parts Bid Award Recommendation (2023-361 : Amends Award

Packet Pg. 94




