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04.04.2023 ADOPTED

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
TB Resolution 2023-256

AMENDS BID AWARD FOR SEWER CHEMICALS

Councilman Hubbard offered the following resolution,
which was seconded by Councilman Beyrodt Jr.

WHEREAS, by Resolution 2023-212, adopted March 22, 2023, the Riverhead
Town Board awarded the bid for CHEMICALS FOR RIVERHEAD SEWER DISTRICT;
and

WHEREAS, the awarded bidder for Item #5 notified the Town Purchasing Agent
that there was an error in the measurement unit their bid submission; and

WHEREAS, the Town Purchasing Agent reviewed the bid submission and after
analysis with the Superintendent of Sewer District, agrees that there was an error in the
submission; and

WHEREAS, the awarded bidder for Item #5 is no longer the lowest responsible
bidder for that item.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Board of the Town of
Riverhead hereby rescinds the award of Item #5 for CHEMICALS FOR RIVERHEAD
SEWER DISTRICT to

THORNTON, MUSSO, AND BELLEMIN, INC.
PO BOX 181

ZACHARY, LA 70791
james@tmbwater.com

and be it further

RESOLVED, that Item #5 for CHEMICALS FOR RIVERHEAD SEWER
DISTRICT be awarded to the vendor indicated below for prices on the attached pages:

GEORGE S. COYNE CHEMICAL CO., INC.
3015 STATE RD

CROYDON, PA 19021
bidadministration@coynechemical.com

and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized
to forward a copy of this resolution to the vendors listed above, and the Sewer District
and Purchasing Department; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that all Town Hall Departments may review and
obtain a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a
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certified copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.

9.17

THE VOTE

RESULT:
MOVER:
SECONDER:
AYES:

ADOPTED [UNANIMOUS]

Tim Hubbard, Councilman

Frank Beyrodt Jr., Councilman

Aguiar, Hubbard, Beyrodt Jr., Rothwell, Kern

State of New York
County of Suffolk }ss:
Town of Riverhead

This is to certify that |, the undersigned, Town Clerk of the Town of Riverhead, County of Suffolk,
State of New York, have compared the forgoing copy of a Resolution with the original now on file in
this office and which was duly adopted on April 4, 2023

and that the same is a true and correct transcript of said Resolution and the of the whole thereof.

IN WITNESS WHEREQF, | have hereunto set my hand and the official seal of the Town of
Riverhead, on April 5, 2023

, Town Clerk
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FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT

OF PROPOSED RIVERHEAD TOWN BOARD LEGISLATION

9.17

A. Type of Legislation Resolution x Local Law
B. Title of Proposed Legislation: Amends Bid Award for Sewer Chemicals
C. Purpose of Proposed Legislation:
D. Will the Proposed Legislation Have a Fiscal Impact?  Yes _ x No
E. If the answer to section D is “yes”, select (a) or (b) below and initial or detail as applicable:
(@) The fiscal impact can be absorbed by Town/department existing resources set forth in approved Town Annual Budget
B (example:routine and budgeted procurement of goods/services)*if selecting E(a), please initial then skip items
F,G and complete H,l and J;
or
(b) The description/explanation of fiscal impact is set forth as follows:
F. If the answer to E required description/explanation of fiscal impact (E(b)), please describe total Financial Cost of Funding over
5 Years
G. Proposed Source of Funding
Appropriation Account to be Charged: ES3-8-8130-415-000-00000

Grant or other Revenue Source:

Appropriation Transfer (list account(s) and amount):

H. Typed Name & |. Signature of Preparer J. Date
Title of 3/28/23
Preparer: Teresa
Baldinucci

Teresa Baldinucci 4/4/2023
K. Accounting Staff L. Signature of Accounting Staff M. Date
Name & Title 3/29/23
William Rothaar, G o . Pt
Accounting
Department Wwilliam Rothaar
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

9.17.a

Amended 3/38/2023

BID NAME: CHEMICALS FOR RIVERHEAD SEWER DI
BID OPENING DATE: |1/26/2023 o
O]
=
Twin County Swimming Pool Thornton, Musso, and Bellemin, | George S. Coyne Chemical Co., | Kuehne Chemical Co, (]
COMPANY: * Exception to specifi Shannon Chemical Corp Maintenance & Supply Co., Inc. Inc. Inc. * Inc. Norweco Tortorella Autochem LLC n
CONTACT: Daniel C. Flynn Randy P. Cestaro James Covington Meredith Haskin Cynthia LaValley Maria Rospert Kirk Newcombe —
PHONE #: 610-363-9090 631-249-1249 225-485-2390 215-785-3000 973-589-0700 419-668-4471 631-283-7398 8
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE SUBMITTED WITH BID? Yes Yes Yes Yes n/a No Yes S
UNIT —
PRICE / ®©
UNIT PRICE / UNIT PRICE / UNIT PRICE / UNIT PRICE / MANUFAC UNIT PRICE / UNIT PRICE / ;
ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER || DELIVERY |[|[MANUFACTURER| DELIVERY ||[MANUFACTURER| DELIVERY || MANUFACTURER (| DELIVERY || TURER ([DELIVERY|MANUFACTURER| DELIVERY ||MANUFACTURER| DELIVERY <
Packaged ho]
PPG ACCU-TAB SL TABLETS product: 7- 5
(CHLORINE) 55 LB. CONTAINERS 10 business Substitution:
1 APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR - 25 days ARO/ $198.00/pail  5-7 business| CCH Cal Hypo 3" _g
CONTAINERS PER DELIVERY Bulk ($4.40/1b.) for days; Tablet, 50 Ib. c
PRICE PER PAIL $219.38/pail product: 10- 45 Ib. pail minimum 24 bucket, (5}
($3.99/1b) 14 business Norweco Bio- pails per $249.00/bucket E
No Bid No Bid No Bid Axiall days ARO No Bid Sanitizer order ($4.98/1b.) 2-3 days <
SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25% SOLUTION 55 Packaged
GALLON CONTAINERS product: 7- "
APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES PER YEAR-20 10 business 8
) DRUMS PER DELIVERY days ARO/ N
PRICE PER DRUM *price to include cleanup $283.6765/drum Bulk C"LJ
fee, if applicable Miniumum 20 product: 10- N
drums per delivery. 14 business o
No Bid No Bid No Bid Westlake days ARO | No Bid No Bid No Bid Ql,
Packaged
product: 7- ™
POTASSIUM PERMANGNATE FREE 10 business 8
3 FLOWING 55 LB. CONTAINERS days ARO/ N
APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES PER YEAR-25-30 Bulk 1)
PAILS/PALLET $2.9360/1b product: 10- =
PRICE PER POUND $5.77/1b ($161.48/container) 14 business o
($317.35/container) | 24-36 Hours No Bid No Bid United Mineral days ARO No Bid No Bid No Bid =
Packaged E
product: 7- @
10 business =
)
4 SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LB. BAGS days ARO/
APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR - 50 Bulk E
BAGS PER DELIVERY product: 10- ;
PRICED PER POUND $0.7975/Ib. 14 business $.0798/1b O
No Bid No Bid No Bid Church & Dwight  days ARO No Bid No Bid Baystate 2-3 days [p)
Packaged —
product: 7- o}
10 business g
5 days ARO/ %)
Bulk
CITRIC ACID 50% ($21.8122/gal)  product: 10- '(.%
55 GALLON DRUM $1,199.67/drum 14 business [
No Bid No Bid $1372.80/drum | 7 days Coyne Chemical ~ days ARO | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packaged -E
product: 7- ®©
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 15% 10 business ;
6 SOLUTION - BULK days ARO/ <
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH - 250 GAL PER Bulk =
DELIVERY product: 10- $3.95/gal c
PRICE PER GALLON $5.50/gal $6.4589/gal 14 business Kuehne New ()
No Bid Kuehne Chemical | 48 Hours No Bid Kuehne Chemical | days ARO No Bid No Bid Haven LLC 2-3 days E
S
* George S. Coyne Ch 1 has issued the following disclai in their bid: 9
=
<

Due to market volatility, both on material supply and freight, the George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. reserves the right to renegotiate pricing should our

costs increase in excess of 10% during the course of the contract period for CUSTIC SODA, SODIUM BICARBONATE and SODIUM

HYPOCHLORITE.
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