Teresa Baldinucci
Purchasing Agent
631-727-3200 Ext. 271

Yvette Aguiar
Supervisor

200 Howell Avenue
Riverhead, NY 11901

TO: Supervisor Aguiar; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Beyrodt
Giglio, Hubbard, Kent; Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk; Drew Dillingham,
Town Engineer

CC: Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s Office; Shannon Clifford, Engineering Office
FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Agent

DATE: March 28, 2022

RE: Bid Opening Report for 2022 Annual Construction Contract

8 bids were received and opened on March 17, 2022 at 11am:

Louis Barbato Landscaping, Inc.
1600 Railroad Ave

Holbrook, NY 11741
barbatolandscape@aol.com

The LandTek Group Inc

235 County Line Road

Amityville, NY 11701
estimatinggroup@landtekgroup.com

South Fork Asphalt

224 North Main St
Southampton, NY 11968
general@southforkasphalt.com

Laser Industries Inc

1775 Route 25

PO Box 315

Ridge, NY 11961
nickc@laserindustriesinc.com

Suffolk Paving Corp

30 N Dunton Ave
Medford, NY 11763
stefansp@optonline.net

Rosemar Contracting Inc
PO Box 16

Patchogue, NY 11772
Jbellotti@rosemar.com

KJB Industries Inc

58 Tyler Dr
Riverhead, NY 11901
kjbindustries@aol.com

New York Trenchless

PO Box 2208

Aquebogue, NY 11931
nytrenchless@optonline.net

Results of the bid opening are attached. The bids have been forwarded to the
Engineering Department for review and award recommendation.



COMMODITY: 2022 ANNUAL CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT

BID OPENING DATE: 3/17/2022
Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt ~ The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. ~ Rosemar Contracting Inc New York Trenchless
CONTACT: Anthony Barbato John Gulino Perry DeLalio Jr. Michael Ryan Joseph Arpin Patrick Panchak Linda Bianca John Kenny
PHONE #: 631-285-6767 ext 202 631-924-0644 631-288-0037 631-691-2381 631-698-1791 631-727-5600 631-878-2323 631-874-8444
Award No. 1 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit. Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
1 o |Unclassified cy 1-200 100 $100.00) $10,000.00) $60.00) $6,000.00
Excavation
qy [Removalof oy 1-200 100 $100.00 $10,000.00 $60.00]  $6,000.00)
Unsuitable Material
35-B o cy 1-200 100 $50.00) $5,000.00) $40.00 $4,000.00
Borrow
3s-sGF |EMbankment - Select} ., 1-200 100 $80.00) $8,000.00) $40.00) $4,000.00
Granular Fill
35-GS - sy 1-200 100 $50.00) $5,000.00) $40.00 $4,000.00

Grading Subgrade

Stabilized Mixed-In-

4 |Place Recycled Base | sv 1-2,000 1,000 $20.00 $20,000.00 $18.00|  $18,000.00)
Course
4p [RecycledConerete |- 1-200 100 $80.00) $8,000.00) $40.00) $4,000.00
[Aggregate
25-C |Casting Adjustment | Ea. 15 3 $500.00 $1500.00 $600.00]  $1,800.00
255 [Suborade Area % 15 3 $50.00 $150.00 $100.00 $300.00
Material
25p ;g(’éio Pavement Ea. 15 3 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,500.00]  $4500.00)
Rut Avoidance
49 [Asehatt Concrete, o, 1-200 100 $250.00 $25,000.00 $200.00|  $20,000.00
Type 6FRA Top
Course
Rut Avoidance
5o [AshatConerete, o, 1-200 100 $250.00 $25,000.00 $200.00|  $20,000.00
Type 3RA Binder
Course
55 [Asehait Conerete Ton 1-200 100 $250.00 $25,000.00 $11500]  $11,500.00
Type 1, Base Course
57 |AsphaltEmulsions | Gal 1,000-5000 3000 $4.00 $12,000.00 $5.00]  $15,000.00
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy 1-500 250 $18.00 $4,500.00 $1500]  $3,75000]
116 |Pavement Markings | LF 1-1000 500 $5.00 $2,500.00 $5.00|  $2,500.00

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 1] NO BID $169,150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $125,350.00 NO BID NO BID




Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt _ The LandTek Group Inc. _ Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc.  Rosemar Contracting Inc  New York Trenchless

[Award No. 2 - Mixed in Place Road Reconstruction - High Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit. Quantity Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price
No. Quantity
2 o |Unclassified cy 201 - 500 350 $30.00]  $10,500.00 $55.00]  $19,250.00
Excavation
gy [Removalof oy 201 - 500 350 $3000]  $10,500.00 $500]  $1,750.00
Unsuitable Material
3s-B o cy 201 - 500 350 $12.00 $4,200.00 $5.00) $1,750.00
Borrow
3s-5GF |EMbankment - Select} ., 201 - 500 350 $20.00) $7,000.00 $5.00) $1,750.00
Granular Fill
35-GS - sy 201 - 500 350 $6.00 $2,100.00 $5.00 $1,750.00

Grading Subgrade

Stabilized Mixed-In-

4 |Place Recycled Base | sv 2,001 - 5,000 3500 $6.00|  $21,000.00 $6.00]  $21,000.00
Course
4p  |Recycled Concrete | 201 - 500 350 $10.00) $3,500.00 $12.00) $4,200.00
[Aggregate
25-C  |Casting Adjustment | Ea. 610 8 $600.00]  $4,800.00 $400.00]  $3,200.00
5.5  [Subgrade Area cy 6-10 8 $100.00) $800.00) $100.00) $800.00)
Material
25 ;g;io Pavement Ea. 6-10 8 $1,00000]  $8000.00]  $1,00000]  $8,000.00
Rut
Avoidance
Asphalt
49 Ton 201-500 350 $130.00]  $45500.00 $125.00]  $43,750.00
Concrete,
Type 6FRA
Top Course
Rut Avoidance
5o [Asphalt Concrete, Ton 201-500 350 $130.00]  $45,500.00 $105.00]  $36,750.00
Type 3RA Binder
Course
55 [Asehalt Conerete Ton 201-500 350 $100.00|  $35,000.00 $40.00]  $14,000.00]
Type 1, Base Course
57 |AsphaltEmutsions | Gal 5001 - 15,000 10000 $1.00|  $10,000.00 $200]  $20,000.00
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy 501 - 1,500 1000 $8.00]  $8,000.00 s800]  $8000.00)
116 |Pavement Markings | LF 1,001-5000 3,000 s150|  $4,500.00 s150]  $4500.00

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 2| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $220,900.00 $190,450.00 NO BID




Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt _ The LandTek Group Inc. _ Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc.  Rosemar Contracting Inc  New York Trenchless

[Award No. 3 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - Low Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No.| Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price
No. Quantity
3 1 [Clearingand Acre 0-25 1 $20,000.00) $20,000.00) $20,00000]  $20,000.00
Grubbing
g [Unclasified cv 1-200 100 $100.00] $10,000.00 $6000|  $6,000.00
Excavation
asp  |Embankment- cy 1-200 100 $50.00) $5,000.00) $40.00) $4,000.00
Borrow
as-sqF |Embankment- Select] 1-200 100 $60.00 $6,000.00 $4000]  $4,000.00]
Granular Fill
35-GS " sy 1-200 100 $20.00) $2,000.00 $40.00]  $4,000.00]

Grading Subgrade

Stabilized Mixed-In-

4 |Place Recycled Base | sy 1-2,000 1,000 $20.00 $20,000.00 $18.00]  $18,000.00
Course
4p  |Recycled Concrete oy 1-200 100 $80.00] $8,000.00] $40.00 $4,000.00
[Aggregate
25C  |casting Adjustment | Ea. 15 3 $600.00 $1,800.00) $600.00|  $1,800.00
255 |Suborade Area cy 15 3 $125.00 $375.00 $100.00 $300.00
Material
2P ;géio Pavement Ea. 15 3 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $1500.00]  $4500.00)
Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
9 |rorerraTon Ton 1-200 100 $250.00 $25,000.00 $200.00|  $20,000.00
Course
Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
2 o kA mnge | T 1-200 100 $250.00 $25,000.00 $200.00|  $20,000.00
Course
g5 [Asphalt Concrete Ton 1200 100 $250.00 $25,000.00) $115.00]  $11,500.00
[ Type 1, Base Course
57 |AsphaitEmutsions | cal 1,000-5000 3000 $5.00) $15,000.00 $5.00]  $1500000
112 [Topsoil and Seed sy 1-500 250 $18.00) $4,500.0) $15.00]  $3,750.00)
116 Pavement Markings LF 1-1000 500 $3.00] $1,500.00) $4.00| $2,000.00]

118-sw[Strawwood Fiber g, 1-500 250 $5.00) $1,250.00 s400]  $1,00000
Mulch-Temporary

Seed and Mulch -

118-SM sy 1-500 250 $5.00) $1,250.00 $3.00 $750.00
Temporary

118- eed and

sswm[srawnwood Fiber | sy 1-500 250 $7.00 $1,750.00 $3.00 $§750.00
Mulch - Temporan

1185 [Sraw Bale- LF 1-500 250 $15.00 $3,750.00 $16.00]  $4,000.00)
Temporary

118-G  |Geotextiles sy 1-200 100 $18.00) $1,800.0 $12.00]  $1,200.00)

11855 |Silt Fence- LF 1-500 250 $15.00 $3,750.00 $15.00]  $3,750.00)
[ Temporary

Drainage Structure
Inlet Protection,

118-D Ea. 1-5 3 $350.00f $1,050.00] $300.00} $900.00}
Prefabricated -
Temporary

118-J Jute Mesh SY 1-200 100 $4.00} $400.00f $2.00] $200.00}
Stabilized

118-SCE]Construction sy 1-200 100 $20.00f $2,000.00] $15.00] $1,500.00]
Entrance

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 3]NO BID $193,675.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $152,900.00 NO BID NO BID




Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt _ The LandTek Group Inc. _ Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc.  Rosemar Contracting Inc  New York Trenchless

[Award No. 4 - Roadway/Parking Lot Construction - High Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No.| Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost $0.00] Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
No. Quantity
4 1 [Cearingand Acre 265 5 $5,000.00]  $2500000]  $4,000.00]  $20,000.00
Grubbing
g [Unclassified cv 201-500 350 $30.00]  $10500.00) $40.00]  $14,000.00]
Excavation
3s-p  |Embankment- cy 201 - 500 350 $10.00) $3,500.00 $1.00) $350.00
Borrow
as-sqF |Embankment- Select] 201 - 500 350 $2000]  $7,000.00 $1.00 $350.00
Granular Fill
35-GS " sy 201-500 350 $600]  $210000 $1.00) $350.00

Grading Subgrade

Stabilized Mixed-In-

4 |Place Recycled Base | SY 2,001 - 5,000 3500 $6.00]  $21,000.00 $6.50]  $22,750.00
Course
4p  [Reoycled Conorete |-y 201 - 500 350 $10.00]  $3500.00) $30.00]  $10500.00]
[Aggregate
25-C |casting Adjustment | Ea. 6-10 8 $60000]  $4,800.00 $70000]  $5,600.00
255 |Suborade Area cy 610 8 $30.00 $240.00 $20.00 $160.00
Material
25-p ;géio Pavement Ea. 6-10 8 $1,00000]  $8,000.0 $30.00) $240.00
Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
9 [ e 6FRA Top Ton 201-500 350 $130.00]  $45,500.00 $12500]  $43,750.00
Course
Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
52 [1yre srA Binder Ton 201-500 350 $130.00]  $45,500.00 $105.00]  $36,750.00
Course
Asphalt Concrete
55 [rype1, base Course| ™" 201-500 350 $10000]  $35,000.00 $40.00]  $14,000.00
57 |Asphait Emulsions | Gal 5001 - 15,000 10000 $3.00]  $30,000.00 $3.00]  $30,000.00
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy 501 - 1,500 1000 $10.00]  $10,000.00 $1500]  $15,000.00
116  |Pavement Markings | LF 1,001-5000 3,000 $1.50) $4,500.00 $1.50} $4,500.00f

118-sw[Strawwood Fiber g, 500-1500 1,000 $300]  $3,00000 s300]  $3000.00)
Mulch - Temporary

Seed and Mulch -

118-5M 5% 500-1500 1,000 $300]  $3,00000 $300]  $3000.00)
Temporary
118- Seed and
traw/Wood Fiber | sY 500-1500 1,000 $3.00|  $3,000.00 $300]  $3000.00
SSWM
Mulch - Temporary
1185 [Sraw Bale- LF 500-1500 1,000 $14.00]  $14,000.00) $1000]  $10,000.00)
Temporary
118G |Geotextiles sy 201 - 500 350 $2.00 $700.00 $300]  $1,050.00)
11855 |Silt Fence- LF 501 - 1,500 1000 $12.00]  $12,000.00 $1000]  $10,000.00]
[ Temporary

Drainage Structure
Inlet Protection,

118-D Ea. 6-10 8 $300.00} $2,400.00] $200.00f $1,600.00]
Prefabricated -
Temporary

118-J Jute Mesh SY 201 - 500 350 $2.00] $700.00} $5.00} $1,750.00]
Stabilized

118-SCE]Construction sy 201 - 500 350 $10.00] $3,500.00] $5.00] $1,750.00]
Entrance

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 4] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $298,440.00 $253,450.00 NO BID




Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt _ The LandTek Group Inc. _ Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc.  Rosemar Contracting Inc  New York Trenchless
[Award No. 5 Drainage Installation

Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price
No. Quantity
5 o [Unclassified cy 201 - 500 350 $90.00) $31,500.00) $45.00) $15,750.00) $20.00) $7,000.00 $3000]  $10,500.00
Excavation
4p i:;yrg';:‘ec"””e‘e cy 1-100 50 $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00]  $2,5500.00) $3000]  $1,500.00)
7rr  [RemoveandReplace] - o 1-100 50 $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $105.00]  $5,250.00 $10000]  $5,000.00
Concrete Curb
7aRR  [Removeand Replace] | 1-100 50 $40.00 $2,000.00 $40.00 $2,000.00] $30.00]  $1500.00 $5000]  $2,500.00]
Concrete Header
grR  [Remove and Replace| o 150 25 $180.00) $4,500.00) $200.00 $5,000.00) $200.00 $5,000.00 $180.00 $4,500.00
Conc. Sidewalk
13U-4" gi”:e'dra'” Pipe-4" | | ¢ 1-100 50 $11.00) $550.00) $12.00 $600.00) $5.00) $250.00) $15.00 $750.00)
. |Underdrain Pipe -6"
U | LF 1-100 50 $13.00 $650.00 $18.00 $900.00 $8.00 $400.00 $2000]  $1,000.00)
. |Underdrain Pipe -8"
1w |0 LF 1-100 50 $18.00 $900.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $10.00 $500.00 $2200]  $1,100.00
13p-4" g?;yemy'e”e Pipe-4"{ - 1-100 50 $20.00) $1,000.00) $50.00) $2,500.00) $10.00) $500.00 $25.00) $1,250.00
13p-12" T;',y;:y'e"e Pipe- | (¢ 1-100 50 $35.00 $1,750.00 $45.00) $2,250.00 $25.00]  $1,250.00) s45.00]  $2,250.00)
13p-15" ig"‘ygtl:y'e”e Pipe- | ¢ 1100 50 $40.00) $2,000.00) $50.00) $2,500.00) $25.00) $1,250.00 $45.00) $2,250.00
13p-18" Tg,',y;:y'e"e Pipe- | (¢ 1-100 50 $55.00 $2,750.00 $65.00) $3,250.00 $30.00]  $1500.00) $55.00]  $2,750.00)
13p-24" ;Z"‘ygl:y'e”e Pipe- |\ ¢ 1100 50 $75.00 $3,750.00) $75.00 $3,750.00) $50.00) $2,500.00 $80.00) $4,000.00
13P-30" zg,',ysi:y'e"e Pipe- | (¢ 1-100 50 $80.00 $4,000.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $50.00]  $2,500.00) $80.00]  $4,000.00)
13p-36" zg"‘ygtl:y'e”e Pipe- | ¢ 1100 50 $95.00) $4,750.00) $85.00) $4,250.00) $65.00) $3,250.00 $105.00 $5,250.00
13p-48" zg,',y;!y'ene Pipe- | (¢ 1-100 50 $105.00 $5,250.00 $120.00 $6,000.00 $70.00]  $3500.00) $105.00]  $5,250.00
21A ';:TL'?E)POO'S @ Ea. 15 3 $4,000.00) $12,000.00) $4,100.00 $12,300.00) $4,300.00]  $12.00000]  $4,500.00]  $13,500.00)
218 ;‘?:T;’,‘E)POO'S | e 15 3 $4,700.00 $14,100.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $4800.00]  $14400.00]  $5200.00]  $15,600.00
21C 'E)T:T;”ZE?LP)OO'S @ Ea. 15 3 $5,000.00) $15,000.00) $5,300.00 $15,900.00) $5,100.00]  $1530000]  $5500.00]  $16,500.00)
21D ;:TZ,‘E)POO'S W0 g 15 3 $4,300.00 $12,900.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $530000]  $15900.00]  $5,00000]  $15,000.00
21E ';:T'B'?E)POO'S 0| e 15 3 $5,700.00) $17,100.00) $5,800.00 $17,400.00) $6,000.00]  $1800000]  $5800.00]  $17,400.00)
21F ;:ih'lnzg,soo's W0 15 3 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 $6,400.00 $19,200.00 $6,000.00]  $18000.00]  $6,500.00]  $19,500.00
23A  |catch Basins Type A| Ea. 15 3 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $360000|  $10800.00]  $4,950.00]  $14,850.00)
238 |catch Basins Type B| Ea. 15 3 $4,100.00 $12,300.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $390000|  $11,700.00]  $4,950.00]  $14,850.00]
23AXD E\thgz;f'"s Type Al Ve 15 3 $650.00 $1,950.00) $500.00 $1,500.00) $500.00 $1,500.00 $700.00 $2,100.00
23BXD i:?yz;;:"s Type Bl (e 15 3 $850.00) $2,550.00) $650.00 $1,950.00) $500.00 $1,500.00 $900.00 $2,700.00
25-C |Casting Adjustment | Ea. 15 3 $400.00 $1,200.00 $650.00 $1,950.00 $600.00]  $180000] s150000]  $4500.00
255 ;ﬁg:?;e Area cy 1 1 $120.00 $120.00 $100.00 $100.00 $200.00 $200.00 $100.00] $100.00
25p ;g;:\o Pavement Ea. 15 3 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $120000]  $3600.00]  $120000]  $3,600.00
27-MH Z:c;'i:‘:‘lzs,:g”'mBase Ea. 15 3 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $3,800.00 $11,400.00 $3,600.00]  $10,800.00) $500.00]  $1,500.00
27- Manholes-
1D/Additional VF 15 3 $800.00 $2,400.00 $700.00 $2,100.00 $500.00]  $1,500.00 $800.00]  $2,400.00
mHADx [0




Louis Barbato

COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt ~ The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. ~ Rosemar Contracting Inc. New York Trenchless
arpr |Proplnets2 e, 15 3 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $260000]  $7800.00]  $3250.00]  $9,750.00)
ID/Base Section 3'
53  |Tack Coat Gal 110 5 $25.00) $125.00) $25.00 $125.00) $10.00 $50.00 $50.00 $250.00)
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy 1-500 250 $21.00) $5,250.00) $20.00 $5,000.00) $15.00 $3,750.00 $25.00 $6,250.00
Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 5|NO BID $220,445.00 NO BID $219,675.00 NO BID $188,150.00 $214,200.00 NO BID

[Award No. 6 - Mill and Overlay - Low Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No| Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
No. Quantity
Removal of
6 22U Unsuitable Material CcYy 1-50 25 $5.00] $125.00f $1.00] $25.00) $20.00] $500.00}
4ss  [Dtebilized Soil cy 125 10 $15.00 $150.00) $50.00 $500.00] $1.00) $10.00
[Aggregate Subbase
Asphalt Concrete
48 Truing and Leveling Ton 1-200 100 $110.00} $11,000.00] $90.00] $9,000.00] $40.00] $4,000.00]
Course

Rut Avoidance
[Asphalt Concrete,
[ Type 6FRA Top
Course

49 Ton 1-200 100 $175.00} $17,500.00] $160.00} $16,000.00 $150.00f $15,000.00]

Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
Type 3RA Binder
Course

52 Ton 1-200 100 $175.00} $17,500.00] $145.00} $14,500.00) $40.00] $4,000.00]

Milling of Asphaltic

5 Concrete Pavement

sy 1-3000 1,500 $15.00 $22,500.00] $10.00] $15,000.00 $12.00] $18,000.00]

116  [Pavement Markings | LF 1-2,000 1,000 $2.00) $2,000.00] $3.00) $3,000.00j $3.00} $3,000.00j

118-swi|Strawwood Fiber o 1-500 250 $1.00 $250.00 $1.00 $250.00 $1.00) $250.00
Mulch - Temporary

Seed and Mulch -

118-5M| sy 1-500 250 $1.00 $250.00 $1.00 $250.00 $1.00 $250.00
[ Temporary
118- Seed and
Straw/Wood Fiber | sY 1-500 250 $1.00 $250.00 $1.00 $250.00 $1.00) $250.00
SSWM
Mulch - Temporary
1185 |SUawBale- LF 1-500 250 $10.00]  $25500.00 $1000]  $25500.00) $1000]  $2,500.00)
Temporary
118G |Geotextiles sy 1-200 100 $1.00 $100.00 $1000]  $1,000.00) $1.00) $100.00
118-sp[Silt Fence - LF 1-500 250 $3.00 $750.00 $1.00 $250.00 s1000]  $2,500.00]
[ Temporary

Drainage Structure
Inlet Protection,

118-D " Ea. 1-5 5 $100.00} $500.00f $300.00} $1,500.00] $400.00} $2,000.00]
Prefabricated -
Temporary

118 [Jute Mesh sy 1-200 100 $1.00) $100.00} $1.00] $100.00} $1.00] $100.00}
Stabilized

118-SCE]Construction sy 1-200 100 $1.00] $100.00f $1.00] $100.00} $1.00] $100.00}
Entrance

Total Bid Comparison Price Award No. 6] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75,575.00 $64,225.00 $52,560.00 NO BID




Louis Barbato
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[Award No. 7 - Mill and Overlay - High Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No.| Description Unit. Quantity] Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price
No. Quantity
7 gy [Removalef ey 51-100 75 $1.00 $75.00 $1.00 $75.00
Unsuitable Material
4ss  [Stebilized Soil cy 26-50 35 $1.00 $35.00 $1.00) $35.00)
[Aggregate Subbase
Asphalt Concrete
48 Truing and Leveling | Ton 201-1000f 600 $150.00} $90,000.00| $40.00] $24,000.00]
Course

Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
Type 6FRA Top
Course

49 Ton 201-1000f 600 $95.00 $57,000.00] $90.00] $54,000.00]

Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
Type 3RA Binder
Course

52 Ton 201-1000f 600 $50.00] $30,000.00] $40.00] $24,000.00]

Milling of Asphaltic

sy 3001-5000f 4,000 $6.00] $24,000.00] $5.00] $20,000.00]
Concrete Pavement

59

116  |Pavement Markings | LF 1-2,000f 1,000 $2.00 $2,000.00] $2.00} $2,000.00j

118-sw|Strawwood Fiber o, s01-1000] 750 $1.00 $750.00 $1.00) $750.00
Mulch - Temporary

Seed and Mulch -

118-5M| sy s01-1000] 750 $1.00 $750.00 $1.00) $750.00
[ Temporary
118- |Seed and
Straw/Wood Fiber | SY s01-1000| 750 $1.00 $750.00 $1.00) $750.00
SSWM
Mulch - Temporan
1185 |SawBale- LF 501-1000| 750 $1.00 $750.00 $1.00) $750.00
Temporan
118-G  |Geotextiles sy 201-500] 350 $1.00 $350.00) $1.00) $350.00
118-sF[Sit Fence - LF s01-10000 750 $300]  $2,250.00) $1.00) $750.00
[ Temporary

Drainage Structure
Inlet Protection,

118-D " Ea. 6-10 10 $100.00} $1,000.00] $400.00f $4,000.00]
Prefabricated -
Temporary

118-J Jute Mesh SY 201-500] 500 $1.00] $500.00f $1.00] $500.00}
Stabilized

118-SCE]Construction sy 201-500] 350 $1.00] $350.00f $1.00] $350.00}
Entrance

Total Bid Comparison Award No.7JNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $210,560.00 NO BID $133,060.00 NO BID




Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt _ The LandTek Group Inc. _ Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc.  Rosemar Contracting Inc  New York Trenchless

[Award No. 8 - Concrete Flatwork and Curbing - Low Quanitity

Award . . B Estimated B . . . . ) B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
8 gy [Removalof cy 44571 5 $90.00 $450.00 $75.00 $375.00 $90.00 $450.00
Unsuitable Material
6 E:Efsc‘ab'e Warming | o 44586 10 75.00 $750.00) $200.00 $2,000.00| $100.00]  $1,000.00
7 Concrete Curb LF 1-200 100 $55.00) $5,500.00f $60.00) $6,000.00f $70.00) $7,000.00
A Concrete Header LF 1-200 100 $20.00f $2,000.00] $30.00 $3,000.00] $10.00 $1,000.00j
7rR  [Remove and Replace| | 1-200 100 $55.00) $5,500.00) $60.00) $6,000.00) $80.00) $8,000.00
Concrete Curb
7aRR  [Removeand Replace] - o 1-200 100 $25.00 $2,500.00 $35.00) $3,500.00 $10.00]  $1,00.00
Concrete Header
8 f:“u":? Belgian Bloc] -, ¢ 1-200 100 $55.00 $5,500.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $5000]  $5,000.00
Remove and Replace
8RR |Jumbo Belgian Block| LF 1-200 100 $57.00) $5,700.00f $40.00) $4,000.00f $50.00) $5,000.00
Curb
9 Concrete Sidewalk sy 1-100 50 $108.00f $5,400.00] $110.00} $5,500.00] $125.00} $6,250.00]
oRR  [RemoveandReplace| - 1-100 50 $117.00 $5,850.00 $130.00 $6,500.00 $140.00]  $7,000.00
Concrete Sidewalk
Colored and
10-4"  |imprinted Concrete | SY 1-100 50 $160.00f $8,000.00f $120.00) $6,000.00f $140.00) $7,000.00
Sidewalk - 4"
Colored and
10-6"  |Imprinted Concrete sy 1-100 50 $180.00f $9,000.00] $135.00} $6,750.00] $150.00} $7,500.00]
Sidewalk - 6"
Remove and Replace
104RR [COlored and sy 1-100 50 $180.00 $9,000.00 $125.00 $6,250.00) $140.00|  $7,000.00
Imprinted Concrete
Sidewalk - 4"
Remove and Replace
106Rr [COlored and 5% 1-100 50 $198.00 $9,900.00 $140.00 $7,000.00 $80.00]  $4,000.00)
Imprinted Concrete -
6
11 |Concrete Aprons sy 1-50 25 $117.00) $2,925.00) $115.00) $2,875.00) $150.00) $3,750.00
11pR  [Remove and Replace o, 1-25 10 $135.00 $1,350.00 $120.00 $1,200.00 $160.00]  $1,600.00
Concrete Aprons
112 Topsoil and Seed sy 1-200 100 $14.00f $1,400.00] $10.00 $1,000.00] $15.00] $1,500.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 8NO BID $80,725.00 NO BID $71,450.00 NO BID $74,050.00 NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 8A - Trench Drain and Polyethylene Pipe-4" Dia. Low Quantity
Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
8A 12 Trench Drain LF 1-100 50 $80.00] $4,000.00] $150.00} $7,500.00] $1,500.00] $75,000.00]
13p-4" ;‘:;yemy'e"e Pipe4"] (¢ 1-200 100 $8.00 $800.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $5.00 $500.00
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 8AJNO BID $4,800.00 NO BID $9,500.00 NO BID $75,500.00 NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 8B - Trench Drain and Polyethylene Pipe-4"* Dia. High Quantity
Award - . B Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity ~ Unit Cost Unit Cost B Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost B
No. Quantity [Total Price Total Price [ Total Price Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [Total Price [Total Price
8B 12 [Trench Drain LF 101-300 200 $80.00) $16,000.00) $120.00 $24,000.00) $350.00]  $70,000.00)
134" E‘:;yemy'e"e Pipe4"] (¢ 201-500 350 $6.00 $2,100.00 $18.00 $6,300.00 $5.00]  $1,750.00
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 8b|NO BID $18,100.00 NO BID $30,300.00 NO BID $71,750.00 NO BID NO BID




Louis Barbato
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[Award No. 9 - Concrete Flatwork and Curbing - High Quanitity

Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit. Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
9 qy  [Removalef oy 1120 15 $90.00 $1,350.00 $75.00 $1,125.00
Unsuitable Material
6 E:Efsc‘ab'e warning - sp 26 - 100 60 $75.00 $4,500.00 $100.00 $6,000.00
7 |concrete curb LF 201 - 1,000 600 $40.00) $24,000.00 $32.00) $19,200.00
7A  |concrete Header LF 201 - 1,000 600 $20.00) $12,000.00 $25.00) $15,000.00
7rR  [Remove and Replace| | 201 - 1,000 600 $45.00) $27,000.00) $45.00) $27,000.00)
Concrete Curb
Remove and Replace
7ARR LF 201-1,000 600 $30.00 $18,000.00 $28.00) $16,800.00
Concrete Curb
8 f:“u":so Belgian Bloc] - 201-1,000 600 $50.00 $30,000.00 $23.00 $13,800.00
Remove and Replace
8RR |Jumbo Belgian Block| LF 201-1,000 600 $52.00 $31,200.00 $25.00 $15,000.00
Curb
9 |concrete Sidewalk | sy 101-500 300 $99.00 $29,700.00 $110.00 $33,000.00
orr  [RemoveandReplace| o 101-500 300 $108.00 $32,400.00 $125.00 $37,500.00
Concrete Sidewalk
Colored and
10-4"  |imprinted Concrete | sv 101-500 300 $130.00 $39,000.00 $120.00 $36,000.00
Sidewalk - 4"
Colored and
106" |imprinted Concrete | sv 101-500 300 $140.00 $42,000.00 $130.00 $39,000.00
Sidewalk - 6"
Remove and Replace
104RR [COlored and sy 101-500 300 $130.00 $39,000.00 $121.00 $36,300.00
Imprinted Concrete
Sidewalk - 4"
Remove and Replace
106Rp [COlored and sy 101-500 300 $140.00 $42,000.00 $131.00 $39,300.00
Imprinted Concrete -
o
11 |concrete Aprons sy 51-100 75 $108.00) $8,100.00) $105.00) $7,875.00
11pr  [Remove and Replace| o 26-100 60 $117.00 $7,020.00) $120.00 $7,200.00
Concrete Aprons
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy 201-500 350 $13.50) $4,725.00) $18.00) $6,300.0
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 9|NO BID $391,995.00 NO BID $356,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt _ The LandTek Group Inc. _ Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc.  Rosemar Contracting Inc  New York Trenchless

[Award No. 10 - Permeable Paver Parking Lot/Roadway - Low Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
10 o [Unclassified cy 1500 300 $50.00) $15,000.00) $55.00) $16,500.00) $4000]  $12,000.00
Excavation
6 Bszfsmab'e warning g 1-100 50 $75.00 $3,750.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $100.00|  $5,000.00
7 |concrete curb LF 1-500 250 $35.00) $8,750.00) $45.00) $11,250.0 $50.00]  $12,500.00)
8 ﬁﬂ“’ Belgian Bloc - ¢ 1-500 250 $35.00 $8,750.00) $28.00) $7,000.00 $50.00]  $12,500.00)
9 |concrete Sidewalk | sy 18264 2 $108.00 $2,700.00) $125.00 $3,125.00) $10000|  $2,500.00
Colored and
10-4"  |imprinted Concrete | sv 18264 25 $130.00] $3,250.00 $145.00 $3,625.00 $10000|  $2,500.00
Sidewalk - 4"
11 |concrete Aprons sy 18264 25 $117.00 $2,925.00) $140.00| $3,500.00) $10000]  $2,500.00
12 |rrench Drain LF 1-100 50 $150.00 $7,500.00 $150.00 $7,500.00 $200.00]  $10,000.00
13p-4" g?;yemy'e”e Pipe-4" ¢ 1100 50 $10.00) $500.00 $10.00) $500.00 $20.00) $1,000.00
74 |painted Lines LF 1-1000 500 $2.00) $1,000.00) $1.00) $500.00 $300]  $1,50000)
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy 1-200 100 $12.00) $1,200.00 $8.00 $800.00) $12.00]  $1,200.00)
1900 |Concrete Grid sy 0-1,000 500 $135.00 $67,500.00) $160.00 $80,000.00) $260.00]  $130,000.00
Pavements
Permeable
190.p |Mmieriocking sy 0-1,000 500 $130.00 $65,000.00] $155.00 $77,500.00 $250.00]  $125,000.00
Concrete Pavement —|
Eco-ridge
Permeable
Interlocking
190- PP sy 0-1,000 500 $130.00 $65,000.00 $155.00 $77,500.00 $250.00|  $125,000.00
Concrete Pavement —|
SF-Rima
191 funit Pavers sy 0-1,000 500 $115.00 $57,500.00 $135.00| $67,500.00 $180.00]  $90,000.00
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 10|NO BID $310,325.00 NO BID $361,800.00 NO BID $533,200.00 NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 11 - Permeable Paver Parking Lot/Roadway - High Quantity

Award . . . Estimated B . . . . . ) )
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
1 g [Undlassified cv 501-1000 750 $35.00) $26,250.00 $55.00 $41,250.00
Excavation
6 B:‘i:’ab'e Warning g 101-200 150 $110.00 $16,500.00 $100.00 $15,000.00
7 |concrete curb LF 501-1000 750 $35.00) $26,250.00) $34.00) $25,500.00)
8 JC“UTEO Belgian Bloc | ¢ 501-1000 750 $38.00 $28,500.00 $25.00 $18,750.00
9 |concrete Sidewalk | sy 51-100 75 $108.00 $8,100.00 $90.00 $6,750.00
Colored and
10-4"  |imprinted Concrete | sY 51-100 75 $130.00 $9,750.00 $125.00 $9,375.00
Sidewalk - 4"
11 |concrete Aprons sy 51-100 75 $117.00 $8,775.00) $120.00| $9,000.00
12 |rrench Drain LF 101-200 150 $100.00 $15,000.00 $120.00 $18,000.0
13p-4" ;?;ye‘hy'e"e Pipe 41 ¢ 101-200 150 $10.00 $1,500.00) $10.00 $1,500.00)
74 |painted Lines LF 1001-5000 3,000 $150) $4,500.00) $1.00 $3,000.00
112 |Topsoil and Seed sy 201-500 750 $12.00 $9,000.0 $10.00) $7,500.0
1900 [Concrete Grid sy 1001-5000 3,000 $130.00]  $390,000.00) $150.00]  $450,000.00
Pavements




Louis Barbato
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Permeable

190p  |erlocking sy 1001-5000 3,000 $125000  $375,000.00) $14500]  $435,000.00
Concrete Pavement —|
Eco-ridge
Permeable

190.pp | !mterlocking sy 1001-5000 3,000 $12000]  $360,000.00) $14500]  $435,000.00

Concrete Pavement —|
SF-Rima

191 |Unit Pavers sy 1001-5000 3,000 $115.00) $345,000.00) $120.00) $360,000.00)

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 11NO BID $1,624,125.00 NO BID $1,835,625.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 12 - Surface Treatments - Low Quantity

Award ~ Estimated B B
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
12 100 [Bituminous Surface | g, 1-1000 500 $40.00  $20,000.00
Treatment
104 |Asphalt Emulsion sy 1-1,000 500 $55.00]  $27,500.00
Slurry
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 12]JNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $47,500.00 NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 13 - Surface Treatments - High Quantity

Award . . B Estimated B ) . . . . B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
13 100  [Bituminous Surface § oy 1001-5000 2,500
Treatment
104 [AsphaltEmulsion | gy 10015000 2500
Slurry
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 13]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 14 - Crack Sealants
Award . ) . Estimated B . . . . ) . .
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity B Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost B
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Elastomeric
14 44 Pavement Crack LF 1-1,000 500 $8.00] $4,000.00] $6.50] $3,250.00]
Sealant
Fiber Reinforced
Pol Modified
46 | onmer Moditle LF 1-1,000 500 $12.000  $6,000.00 $850]  $4,250.00
Pavement Crack
Sealant
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 14]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10,000.00 $7,500.00 NO BID

[Award No. 15 - Chain Link Fence - Low Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
15 1084 | ViVl Coated Chain | -, 0-100 50 $40.00 $2,000.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $65.00]  $3,250.00)
Link Fencing
108- | Vinyl Coated Chain | - 0-100 50 $50.00) $2,500.00) $65.00) $3,250.00) $68.00) $3,400.00
Link Fencing
108 |Vinvl Coated Chain | - 0-100 50 $55.00 $2,750.00 $72.00 $3,600.00 $72000  $3600.00
Link Fencing
1085G-4 | ViVl Coated Chain | - 05 1 $325.00 $325.00 $350.00 $350.00 $850.00 $850.00
Link 3 Single Gate
1085G-6 | VIV Coated Chain |- 05 1 $375.00 $375.00 $385.00 $385.00 $950.00 $950.00
Link 3' Single Gate
. |Vinyl Coated Chain
10868 | e one | E2 05 1 $400.00 $400.00 $425.00 $425.00 $1,050.00]  $1,050.00




Louis Barbato
COMPANY NAME: Landscaping, Inc. Laser Industries Inc. South Fork Asphalt ~ The LandTek Group Inc.  Suffolk Paving Corp. KJB Industries Inc. ~ Rosemar Contracting Inc. New York Trenchless

Vinyl Coated Chain

108564 [ e | E2 05 1 $600.00 $600.00 $900.00 $900.00 $1,80000|  $1,800.00
, [Vinyl Coated Chain
108s6-6' [\ e e | E 05 1 $700.00 $700.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,30000]  $2,300.00)
1085G-g | Vinvi Coated Chain |, 05 1 $750.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $1,20000 $2800.00]  $2,800.00)
Link 8' Double Gate
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 15|NO BID $10,400.00 NO BID $13,610.00 NO BID $20,000,00 NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 16 - Chain Link Fence - High Quantity

Award . . . Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity ~ Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost .
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
16 108-4 | Vinyl Coated Chain | - 101-500 300 $40.00) $12,000.00) $43.00) $12,900.00) $65.00]  $19,500.00
Link Fencing
1086 |Vinvl Coated Chain | - 101-500 300 $50.00 $15,000.00] $50.00 $15,000.00] $68.00|  $20400.00]
Link Fencing
108 |Vinvl Coated Chain | - 101-500 300 $55.00 $16,500.00 $61.00 $18,300.00 $72.00]  $21,600.00)
Link Fencing
1085G-4 |VINV! Coated Chain | - 0-10 2 $325.00 $650.00 $350.00 $700.00 $850.00 $1,700.00
Link 3' Single Gate
, [Vinyl Coated Chain
108566 | e one | E2 0-10 2 $375.00 $750.00 $385.00 $770.00 $950.00]  $1,900.00
1085G-g | ViVl Coated Chain |, 0-10 2 $400.00 $800.00 $425.00 $850.00 $1,050.00]  $2,200.00)
Link 3' Single Gate
1085G-4 | Vil Coated Chain | - 0-10 2 $600.00 $1,200.00 $900.00 $1,800.00 $1800.00]  $3,600.0)
Link 8' Double Gate
1085G-6 | VIV Coated Chain |- 0-10 2 $700.00 $1,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00) $2,300.00 $4,600.00
Link 8' Double Gate
. [Vinyl Coated Chain
10868 | i o e oae | E2 0-10 2 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $2,800.00]  $5,600.0)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 16|NO BID $49,800.00 NO BID $54,720.00 NO BID $81,000.00 NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 17 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - Low Quantity

Award . ) B Estimated B . . . ) ) B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Rut Avoidance

17 49 |Asphalt Concrete, Ton 1-500 250 $128.00]  $32,000.00 $15000]  $37,500.00 $135.00]  $33,750.00
Type 6FRA Top
Course
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 17JNO BID NO BID $32,000.00 NO BID $37,500.00 $33,750.00 NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 18 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - Mid Quantity

Award . . B Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity [Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [Total Price [Total Price

Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
Type 6FRA Top
Course

Ton 501-1000 750 $118.00]  $88,500.00| $90.00 $67,500.00] $100.00} $75,000.00] $89.00] $66,750.00)

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 18]NO BID NO BID $88,500.00 NO BID $67,500.00 $75,000.00 $66,750.00 NO BID
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[Award No. 19 - Asphalt Top Course Installed - High Quantity

Award . ) B Estimated B ) . . . . B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Rut Avoidance

19 49 |Asphalt Concrete, Ton 1001-5000 3000 s88.88|  $266,640.00) $79.00]  $237,000.00]
Type 6FRA Top
Course
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 1NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $266,640.00 NO BID $237,000.00 NO BID

[Award No. 20 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - Low Quantity

Award . . B Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity [Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [Total Price [Total Price

Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
Type 3RA Binder
Course

20 52 Ton 1-500 250 $127.00]  $31,750.00f $250.00} $62,500.00] $160.00} $40,000.00]

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 20|NO BID NO BID $31,750.00 NO BID $62,500.00 $40,000.00 NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 21 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - Mid Quantity

Award . ) B Estimated B . . . . ) B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,
Type 3RA Binder
Course

21 52 Ton 501-1000 750 $117.00} $87,750.00] $175.00]  $131,250.00f $88.00) $66,000.00]

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 21iNO BID NO BID $87,750.00 NO BID $131,250.00 NO BID $66,000.00 NO BID

[Award No. 22 - Asphalt Binder Course Installed - High Quantity

Award . . ) Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity [Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [Total Price [Total Price

Rut Avoidance
Asphalt Concrete,

22 2 - T 1001- 7. 261, 77.1 231,000
5 [Type 3RA Binder on 001-5000} 3000 $87.00]  $261,000.00] $77.00]  $231,000.00}
Course
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 22JNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $261,000.00 NO BID $231,000.00 NO BID
[Award No. 23 - Pavement Patches - Low Quantity
Award . . B Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

23 51 Pavement Patches SF 0-1,000 500 $21.00 $10,500.00] $25.00) $12,500.00)
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 23]NO BID NO BID $10,500.00 NO BID NO BID $12,500.00 NO BID NO BID

[Award No. 24 - Pavement Patches - High Quantity

Award . . B Estimated B . . . ) ) B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
24 51 Pavement Patches SF 1001-5000 3,000 $15.75) $47,250.00] $25.00] $75,000.00 $12.00] $36,000.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 24]NO BID NO BID $47,250.00 NO BID NO BID $75,000.00 $36,000.00 NO BID

[Award No. 25 - Latex Modified Surface Treatment - Low Quantity

Award . . B Estimated B . . . ) ) B .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

2 106 [Latex Modified 5% 1-1000 500
Surface Treatment

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 25]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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[Award No. 26 - Latex Modified Surface Treatment - High Quantity

Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
2% 106 |-3tex Modified sy 1001-5000 3,000
Surface Treatment
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 26]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 27 - Sodding - Low Quantity
Award ~ Estimated 5 5
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
27 113 Sodding sy 1132254 1,000 $14.00] $14,000.00] $15.00f $15,000.00] $14.00 $14,000.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 27| $14,000.00] $15,000.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 28 - Sodding - High Quantity
Award . . B Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity ~ Unit Cost Unit Cost B Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost B
No. Quantity [Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [Total Price [Total Price
28 113 Sodding Sy 5001-10000 7,500 $11.00] $82,500.00] $12.00] $90,000.00] $10.00] $75,000.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 28| $82,500.00] $90,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 29 - Poured In Place Safety Surface
Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity ) Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost .
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Poured in Place
29 151-6"  |Safety Surface - 6' sy 1-1000 500 $155.00f $77,500.00] $195.00} $97,500.00)
Critical Fall Ht.
Poured in Place
151-8'  |Safety Surface - 8' sy 1-1000 500 $165.00f $82,500.00) $200.00]  $100,000.00]
Critical Fall Ht.
Poured in Place
151-10" |Safety Surface - 10" sy 1-1000 500 $175.00} $87,500.00] $220.00]  $110,000.00]
Critical Fall Ht.
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 29] ~ $247,500.00| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $307,500.00 NOBID NO BID
[Award No. 30 - Painted Lines - Low Quantity
Award L ) B Estimated B . . . . . B .
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity ~ Unit Cost Unit Cost B Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost B
No. Quantity [Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [ Total Price Total Price [ Total Price [Total Price [Total Price
30 74 Painted Lines LF 1-1000 500 $4.00] $2,000.00] $3.00] $1,500.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 30jNO BID $2,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 NOBID NO BID
[Award No. 31 - Painted Lines - High Quantity
Estimated
No. Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost |Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost | Total Price Unit Cost |Total Price
Quantity
31 74 Painted Lines LF 1001-5000 3,000 $3.00] $9,000.00] $1.80) $5,400.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 31JNO BID $9,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,400.00 NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 32 - Concrete Roadway/Parking Lot Patches
Award Estimated
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
32 5o [fsphaltic Concrete Tons 0-500 250 $160.00]  $40,000.00
Top Course
Asphaltic Concrete
52 Binder Course Tons 0-500 250 $160.00} $40,000.00
Concrete used for
51-A  JRoadway CU.FT 0-500 250 $75.00 $18,750.00)
Replacement
4p  [Recycted Concrete CU.FT 0-500 250 $2.00 $500.00]
[Aggregate
51-AR  |Reinforcement SQFT 0-500 250 $10.00] $2,500.00]
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74 Painted Lines LF 0-100 50 $20.00 $1,000.00j
116 Pavement Marking LF 0-100 50 $20.00] $1,000.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 32]NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $103,750.00 NOBID NO BID
[Award No. 33 - ASPHALT TENNIS COURT SURFACE COLOR COATING SYSTEM
Award . . . Estimated B . . . . ) B .
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity B Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost . Unit Cost R
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Asphalt Tennis Court]
33 200 Surface Color SQ YD 1-1500 1000 $15.00 $15,000.00] $16.80) $16,800.00)
Coating System
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 33]NO BID NO BID NO BID $15,000.00 NO BID $16,800.00 NO BID NO BID
[Award No. 34 — Directional Boring of 1-1/2” Conduit
Award L ) . Estimated . ; ; ; ; ) . :
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity N Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Directional Boring of]
34 300 1-1/2" Conduit LF 1-100 100 $25.00f $2,500.00]
Directional Boring of|
34 300 1-1/2" Conduit LF 101-500] 500 $25.00f $12,500.00]
Directional Boring of|
34 300 1-1/2" Conduit LF 501-1000f 1000 $25.00f $25,000.00]
Directional Boring of|
34 300 1-1/2” Conduit LF Over 1000] 1500 $25.00f $37,500.00]
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 34]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77,500.00
|Award No. 35 — Directional Boring of 2” Conduit
Award _ . . Estimated . . . . . . . .
Item No. [Description Unit Quantity - Unit Cost Unit Cost B Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost B
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
35 300 |Directional Boring of LF 1-100 100 $35.001  $350000
2" Conduit
35 agp  [Direetional Boring of LF 1015000 500 $35.00]  $17,500.00)
2" Conduit
35 00 |Pirectional Boring off LF 501-1000] 1000 $35.00]  $35,000.00)
2” Conduit
35 300 |Directional Boring off LF Over1000| 1500 $35.00]  $52,500.00
2 Conduit
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 35]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $108,500.00
[Award No. 36 — Directional Boring of 4” Conduit
Award Estimated . .
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity . Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
36 agp  [Direetional Boring of LF 1-100 100 $50.00]  $5,000.00)
47 Conduit
36 00 |Pirectional Boring off LF 101500] 500 $50.00]  $25,000.00)
47 Conduit
36 300 |Directional Boring off LF 501-1000] 1000 $50.00]  $50,000.00)
[4” Conduit
36 agp  [Direetional Boring of LF over1000] 1500 $50.00]  $75,000.00)
4™ Conduit
Total Bid Comparison Award No. 36]NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $155,000.00
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|Award No. 37 - Directional Boring of 6” Conduit

Award - ) : Estimated . ; : : : ) . :
Item No. |Description Unit Quantity N Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

No. Quantity Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

37 300 [Directional Boring of LF 1-100 100 $75.00]  $7,500.00)
6” Conduit

37 300 |Directional Boring off LF 101-500| 500 $75.00]  $37,500.00)
6” Conduit

37 300  |Pirectional Boring of LF 501-1000] 1000 $75.00]  $75,000.00)
6” Conduit

37 300  |Pirectional Boring of LF over1000] 1500 $75.00]  $112,500.00
6” Conduit

Total Bid Comparison Award No. 37JNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $232,500.00




