Teresa Baldinucci

Yvette Aguiar 200 Howell Avenue Purchasing Agent
Supervisor Riverhead, NY 11901 631-727-3200 Ext. 271
TO: Supervisor Aguiar; Deputy Supervisor Higgins; Councilpersons Beyrodt,

Hubbard, Kern, Rothwell; Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk; Ray Coyne,
Superintendent of Parks and Recreation

CC: Carol Delvecchio, Clerk’s Office

FROM: Teresa Baldinucci, Purchasing Agent

DATE: March 2, 2022

RE: Bid Opening Report for Printing of Recreation Brochure

4 bids were received and opened on February 17, 2022 at 11am:

All Island Media

145 Marcus Blvd, Ste 2
Hauppauge, NY 11788
jenn.goodman@allislandmedia.com

Graphic Image Inc.

561 Boston Post Road
Milford, CT 06460
randy@graphicimage.net

Atlantic Color Corp

14 Ramsey Road

Shirley, NY 11967
jcalandra@atlanticcolor.com

The Mines Press

231 Croton Ave

Cortlandt Manor, NY 10567
jmiller@minespress.com

Results of the bid opening are attached. All bids have been forwarded to the
Superintendent of Parks and Recreation for review.



TOWN OR RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TAB SHEET

COMMODITY:

PRINTING OF RECREATION BROCHURE

BID OPENING DATE:

COMPANY NAME:

All Island Media

Graphic Image Inc.

Graphic Image Inc.

Graphic Image Inc.

Atlantic Color Corp.

The Mines Press

CONTACT: Jenn Goodman Randy Danenberg Randy Danenberg Randy Danenberg Kathy Martens Jeffrey Miller
PHONE #: 631-750-1229 203-877-8787 203-877-8787 203-877-8787 631-345-3800 914-402-3247
STOCKS QUOTED: TEXT| 35lb Premium 80 News (web) 35# News Text (web) 45# News Text (web) 50# Offset Text P80 35Ib. (web) Paperfect offset 50#
COVER: 100Ib Coated Text 100Ib. Gloss Text 100lb Gloss Text 100lb Gloss Text 100Ib. Coated Text Nantucket Silk Text 100#
ITEM" QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE NET PRICE UNIT PRICE [[ NET PRICE || UNIT PRICE || NET PRICE || UNIT PRICE || NET PRICE [ UNIT PRICE || NET PRICE || UNIT PRICE || NET PRICE
SPRING/SUMMER BROCHURE PRINTING,
FINISHING AND MAILING
Al 20,000 LOT 64pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 9,204.00 $ 10,039.00 $ 11,437.00 $ 13,982.00 $ 8,278.96 $ 11,820.66
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $  206.00 $  502.00 $  572.00 $  699.00 $  357.63 $  461.00
A2 20,000 LOT 68pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 9,463.00 $ 10,659.00 $ 12,190.00 $ 14,977.00 NO BID $ 13,331.00
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $  225.00 $  533.00 $  610.00 $  749.00 $  519.00
A3 20,000 LOT 72pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 9,685.00 $ 10,957.00 $ 12,562.00 $ 15,483.00 $ 9,356.78 $ 13,689.00
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $  231.00 $  548.00 $  628.00 $  774.00 $ 40331 $  536.00
A4 20,000 LOT 76pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 9,827.00 $ 11,255.00 $ 12,934.00 $ 15,989.00 NO BID $ 14,409.00
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $  235.00 $  563.00 $  647.00 $  799.00 $  571.00
A5 20,000 LOT 80pp PLUS 4pp COVER $  10,054.00 $ 11,553.00 $ 13,306.00 $ 16,495.00 $ 9,893.70 $ 15,119.00
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $  240.00 $  578.00 $  665.00 $  825.00 $ 42838 $  610.00
FALL/WINTER BROCHURE PRINTING, FINISHING
AND MAILING
Bl 20,000 LOT 36pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 7,945.00 $ 7,630.00 $ 8,453.00 $ 9,951.00 NO BID $  8,492.32
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $ 156.00 $  382.00 $  423.00 $  498.00 $  310.00
B2 20,000 LOT 40pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 8,207.00 $ 7,928.00 $ 8,825.00 $ 10,457.00 $  6,483.20 $ 8,976.18
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $ 192.00 $  396.00 $  411.00 $  523.00 $ 27644 $  340.00
B3 20,000 LOT 44pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 8,419.00 $  8,226.00 $ 9,197.00 $ 10,963.00 NO BID $ 9,466.25
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $ 198.00 $  411.00 $  460.00 $  548.00 $  370.00
B4 20,000 LOT 48pp PLUS 4pp COVER $ 8,511.00 $ 8,524.00 $ 9,569.00 $ 11,469.00 $ 7,020.12 $ 9,956.10
PER 1000 M ADDITIONAL 1000'S UP TO 25,000 $  200.00 $  426.00 $  478.00 $  573.00 $  301.50 $  480.00




