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01.05.2021 ADOPTED

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
Resolution 2021-47

AWARD AND REJECT BIDS FOR CHEMICALS FOR RIVERHEAD SEWER
DISTRICT

Councilwoman Kent offered the following resolution,
which was seconded by Councilman Beyrodt Jr.

WHEREAS, the Town Board resolution #2020-537 authorized the Town Clerk to
publish and post a notice for sealed bids for CHEMICALS FOR RIVERHEAD SEWER
DISTRICT and;

WHEREAS, 9 bids were received, opened and read aloud in the Office of the
Town Clerk, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, NY 11901 on November 12, 2020 at
11:00 AM; and

WHEREAS, the bids were reviewed and a bid tabulation was prepared by the
Purchasing Agent and presented to the Town Board for review; and

WHEREAS, the low bidder for Item #7 and Item #9, Brenntag Northeast LLC,
has subsequently notified the Purchasing Agent that they are rescinding their bid due to
inability to supply product; and

WHEREAS, the Sewer District Superintendent has reviewed the bids submitted
and has submitted his recommendations to the Purchasing Agent, including rejecting all
bids for Item #8 and going to the next lowest bidder for Item #7 and Item #9.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the bid for CHEMICALS FOR
RIVERHEAD SEWER DISTRICT be awarded to the vendors indicated below for items
indicated at prices on the attached page;

Items #1, 4, 6,7 &9 to George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.
3015 State Rd
Croydon, PA 19021
bidadministration@coynechemical.com

Item #2 to Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.
4321 W 6" St
Lawrence, KS 66049
Kwsna.bids@kemira.com

Item #3 to Progressive Growers
1129 Cross River Dr
Riverhead, NY 11901
mmatulonis@progressiveqgrower.com
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Item #5 to Shannon Chemical Corp.
PO Box 376
Malverne, PA 19355
dcflynn@shannonchem.com

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Board rejects all bids for Item #8;
and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby authorized
to forward a copy of this resolution to all vendors listed above, the Purchasing
Department and the Sewer District; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that all Town Hall Departments may review and
obtain a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and, if needed, a
certified copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk.

THE VOTE
RESULT: ADOPTED [UNANIMOUS]
MOVER: Catherine Kent, Councilwoman
SECONDER: Frank Beyrodt Jr., Councilman
AYES: Yvette Aguiar, Tim Hubbard, Catherine Kent, Frank Beyrodt Jr.
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FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT

OF PROPOSED RIVERHEAD TOWN BOARD LEGISLATION

15.43

A. Type of Legislation Resolution __x Local Law

B. Title of Proposed Legislation: Award and Reject Bids for Chemicals for Riverhead Sewer District

C. Purpose of Proposed Legislation:

D. Will the Proposed Legislation Have a Fiscal Impact?  Yes X No

E. If the answer to section D is “yes”, select (a) or (b) below and initial or detail as applicable:

(@) The fiscal impact can be absorbed by Town/department existing resources set forth in approved Town Annual Budget
(example:routine and budgeted procurement of goods/services)*if selecting E(a), please initial then skip items F,G and

complete H,I and J;
or
(b) The description/explanation of fiscal impact is set forth as follows:

F. If the answer to E required description/explanation of fiscal impact (E(b)), please describe total Financial Cost of Funding over

5 Years

G. Proposed Source of Funding
Appropriation Account to be Charged: ES5-8-8189-415-000-00000

Grant or other Revenue Source:

Appropriation Transfer (list account(s) and amount):

H. Typed Name & I. Signature of Preparer J. Date
Title of 12/22/20
Preparer: Teresa
Baldinucci

Teresa Baldinucci 1/5/2021
K. Accounting Staff L. Signature of Accounting Staff M. Date
Name & Title 12/28/20

William Rothaar, A e . o
Accounting
Department William Rothaar
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD PURCHASING OFFICE
BID TAB SHEET

15.43.a

S
BID NAME: CHEMICALS FOR SEWER DISTRICT o
BID OPENING DATE: 11/12/2020 Y—
[%2]
. o
Twin County Swimming Pool George S. Coyne Chemical Co., —
COMPANY: * Exception to specification Shannon Chemical Corp Maintenance & Supply Co., Inc. Progressive Growers Inc. Pencco, Inc. Inc. Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. PVS Technologies, Inc. Kuehne Chemical Company, Inc. Brenntag Northeast LLC m
CONTACT: Daniel C. Flynn Randy Cestaro Mark Matulonis Sarah Duffy Donald C. Helwig Christina Imbrogno Craig Mikkelson Susan K. Anthony Kirsten O'Donnell —
PHONE #: 610-363-9090 631-249-1249 631-591-3540 979-885-0005 215-785-3000 785-842-7424 313-571-1100 973-589-0700 484-818-1687 o
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE SUBMITTED WITH BID? Yes Yes Yes N/A No Yes Yes No No (]
UNIT PRICE/ UNIT PRICE/ UNIT PRICE/ UNIT PRICE/ UNIT PRICE/ UNIT PRICE/ brel
UNIT PRICE/ MANUFACTURE MANUFACTURE UNIT PRICE / MANUFACTURE MANUFACTURE MANUFACTURE MANUFACTURE UNIT PRICE / Q
ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURER | DELIVERY R DELIVERY R DELIVERY [ MANUFACTURER || DELIVERY R DELIVERY R DELIVERY R DELIVERY R DELIVERY [ MANUFACTURER || DELIVERY D:
PPG ACCU-TAB SL TABLETS (CHLORINE,
55 LB. CONTAINERS °
APAPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR - 25 %
1 CONTAINERS PER DELIVERY
PRICE PER PAIL o]
$169.9103/ 5-7 days —
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Westlake ARO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ©
FERRIC CHLORIDE 37-40% SOLUTION ;
4,000 BULK DELIVERIES <
APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES PER YEAR
2 PRICE PER DRY TON $760.00/ "
Kemira Water $776.00/ N~
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Solutions, Inc. 3days ARO PVS Technologies 2-5 Days No Bid No Bid <t
HYDRATED LIME - 55 LB. BAGS FI|
3 $10.80/ AN
No Bid No Bid Graymont 36 hours No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o
SODIUM HYDROXIDE 25% SOLUTION 55 N
GALLON CONTAINERS ~
APPROX. 7 DELIVERIES PER YEAR-20
DRUMS PER DELIVERY 2
4 PRICE PER DRUM *price to include cleanup ©
fee, if applicable (&)
$84.5671/ 5-7 days $142.30/ =
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Westlake ARO No Bid No Bid No Bid Various 3-4 days E
POTASSIUM PERMANGNATE FREE (]
FLOWING 55 LB. CONTAINERS c
APPROX. 4 DELIVERIES PER YEAR-25-30 O
PAILS/PALLET $1.73/
PRICE PER POUND Organic Ind. Libox $1.8617/ 5-7 days $1.789/ E
5 Chem. 24-36 hours No Bid No Bid No Bid United Mineral ARO No Bid No Bid No Bid Carus 3-4 days
SODIUM BICARBONATE 50 LB. BAG¢ ;
APPROX. 2 DELIVERIES PER YEAR - 50 ]
BAGS PER DELIVERY (/)
PRICED PER POUND $0.506/ 5-7 days $0.6025/ 1
6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Church & Dwight ARO No Bid No Bid No Bid Church & Dwight ~ 3-4 days
CITRIC ACID 50% ©
55 GALLON DRUM $487.4853/ 5-7 days e
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Coyne Chemical ARO No Bid No Bid No Bid 3-4 days 'O
$3.25/Kuehne n
Chemical 5}
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 15% SOLUTION minimum delivery m
-BULK 150 gals; any
APPROX. 2 X PER MONTH - 250 GAL PER delivery less than (@)]
DELIVERY 150 gals will be $8.00/ [
PRICE PER GALLON charged for 150 $3.3426/ 5-7 days Kuehne Chemical = 2-3 Days =
8 No Bid gals 48 hours No Bid No Bid Kuehne Chemical ARO No Bid No Bid Co. Inc. * ARO No Bid ;
$16.1176/ )
DENSE SODA ASH 58% Genesis Alkali ~
50 LB. BAGS $24.75/ 1 pallet min 5-7 days n
9 No Bid No Bid Ciner 36 hours No Bid (48 bags) ARO No Bid No Bid No Bid 3-4 days -
O]
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