



Office of the Town Clerk

Diane M. Wilhelm

Registrar of Vital Statistics

Records Management Officer

Marriage Officer

TO: Supervisor Walter, Councilpersons Dunleavy, Wooten, Giglio, Hubbard, Maryann Tague

FROM: Julie O'Neill, Deputy Town Clerk

DATE: February 29, 2016

RE: Open Bid Report for Paint 2016

5 bids were received and opened on February 29, 2016 at 2:00pm:

*See Attached

Aboffs Inc.
33 Gerard St, #204
Huntington NY 11743
516 462-4999
jtaylor@aboffss.com

Pioneer Manufacturing Company
4529 Industrial Parkway
Cleveland OH 44135
800 877-1500
dford@pioneerathletics.com

Fourmen Corp. d/b/a Willis Paint
35A Mineola Avenue
Roslyn Heights NY 11577
516 621-3772
paintplaceny@optonline.net

The Sherwin Williams Co.
1704 Old Country Road
Riverhead NY 11901
631 727-1616
sw5175@sherwin.com

Mercury Paint Corporation
4808 Farragut Road
Brooklyn NY 11203
718 469-8787
jberman@mercurypaint.com

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 31 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	SUPER PAINT STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 (OR EQUAL)	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	19.49	—
2	ONE COAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE PAINT - ASST. COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	20.95	—
3	OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST. COLORS-BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	NO BID		—	—
4	EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS- BM096 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	21.49	—
5	ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	NO BID	—	—
6	ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 258 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	9.45	—
7	ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX – ASST. COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—		19.49	—
8	ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM 333 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—		20.99	—
9	ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM-207 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	No Bid	—	—
10	INTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM 275 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	14.99	—
11	INTERIOR VINLY LATEX – GLOSS- BM 276 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	21.95	—

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 32 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
12	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM-171 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	20.99	
13	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – SEMI-GLOSS- BM -170 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	21.49	
14	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – GLOSS- BM M 28 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	Benjamin Moore	22.95	
15	MASONRY ENAMEL – GLOSS- BM M22 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	NO BID		
16	PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		Aboffs	24.99	
17	EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS			26.51	
18	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/WATERPROOFING, THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		Woodlife Classic	12.75	
19	FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		Seymour	32.40	
20	AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	NO BID		
	<u>RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS</u>	GALLONS				
21	SPRAY – ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ./ CAN 11.5) 5 STAR	GALLONS		Rustoleum 2x	3.35	
22	RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X	GALLONS		Rustoleum	30.54	
23	NEW METAL PRIMER	GALLONS		Rustoleum	30.54	

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 33 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
24	RUSTOLEUM – ASST. COLORS	GALLONS	_____	NO BID	_____	_____
	<u>WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS</u>					
25	C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	WOODLIFE CLASSIC	12.75	_____
26	THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL – CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	WOODLIFE CLASSIC	12.75	_____
27	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), WOODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	NO BID	_____	_____
28	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SOLID COLORS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	NO BID	_____	_____
29	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SEMI-GLOSS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	NO BID	_____	_____
30	MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, (ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	Minwax	28.95	_____
31	MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	Old Masters	36.50	_____
32	MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	Old Masters	36.50	_____
33	MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	Minwax Helmsman	44.75	_____
34	MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	_____	Minwax Helmsman	44.75	_____

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 34 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
35	VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	OLD MASTERS	43.95	—
36	VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	OLD MASTERS	43.95	—
37	VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	OLD MASTERS	36.50	—
38	VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	OLD masters	36.50	—
39	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS		NO BID		
40	PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL	1 GALLON CANS		NO BID		
41	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS		NO BID		
42	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS		NO BID		
43	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS		NO BID		
44	2 PART EPOXY A	GALLONS		NO BID		
45	2 PART EXPOXY B	GALLONS		NO BID		
46	AQUAPON 09/3/01 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS		NO BID		
47	AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS		NO BID		
48	LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM A 24 SERIES (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS		NO BID		
49	LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97C150 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS		NO BID		

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 35 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50	WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	—	NO BID		
51	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT – 1-1/2";2";2-1/2";3"; 3-1/2";4"	EACH	—	Wobster Aboffs	1 1/2" - 1.80 2" - 2.25 2 1/2" - 3.50	3" - 4.25 4" - 5.95
52	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS ABOVE)	EACH	—	Aboffs	1 1/2" - 2.50 2" - 2.75	2 1/2" - 3.95 3" - 4.50
53	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAMES SIZES)	EACH	—	Aboffs	1 1/2" - 2.00 2" - 2.95 2 1/2" - 4.50	3" - 6.00 4" - 8.50
54	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT	EACH	—	Aboffs	1 1/2" - 2.25	2-3.00 2 1/2" - 4.50
55	9" ROLLERS	EACH	—	Wobster	2.75	—
56	LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP	EACH	—	Encore	2.60	—
57	INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS	EACH	—	Encore	.60	—
58	2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH	—	Dolphin	5.50	—
59	1-1/2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH	—	Dolphin	4.95	—
60	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SMOOTH SURFACES	EACH	—	Aboffs	2.20	—
61	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTACT CEMENT	EACH	—	Bestt	2.75	—
62	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN	EACH	—	Aboffs	2.65	—
63	ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6" MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE ONES)	EACH	—	Premiere	2.45	—
64	4" STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE	EACH	—	Aboffs	9.00	—

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 36 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
65	4" ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	—	Premier	2.25	—
66	6" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	2pack	Aboffs	2.25	2.25
67	4" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	2pack	Shurline	2.25	2.25

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 31 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	SUPER PAINT STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 (OR EQUAL)	GALLONS	PROD # 089	Benjamin Moore	28 ⁰⁰	
2	ONE COAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE PAINT - ASST. COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	103	BM	34 ⁰⁰	
3	OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST. COLORS-BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS (110 DISC)	P22	BM	24 ⁰⁰	
4	EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS-BM096 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	096	BM	36 ⁰⁰	
5	ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS (110 DISC)	P22	BM	24 ⁰⁰	
6	ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 258 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	258	BM	22 ⁰⁰	
7	ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX - ASST. COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	215	BM	28 ⁰⁰	
8	ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS - ASST. COLORS- BM 333 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	333	BM	33 ⁰⁰	
9	ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS - ASST. COLORS- BM-207 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS (207 DISC)	P24	BM	29 ⁰⁰	
10	INTERIOR VINYL LATEX - FLAT- BM 275 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	275	BM	16 ⁰⁰	
11	INTERIOR VINLY LATEX - GLOSS- BM 276 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	276	BM	19 ⁷⁵	

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 32 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
12	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM-171 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	BM 171	171	19 ⁰⁰	
13	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – SEMI-GLOSS- BM -170 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	BM	170	24 ⁰⁰	
14	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – GLOSS- BM M 28 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS (M28 DISC)	BM	P28	29 ⁰⁰	
15	MASONRY ENAMEL – GLOSS- BM M22 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS (M22 DISC)	BM	P22	24 ⁰⁰	
16	PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS (112 DISC)	BM	P22	24 ⁰⁰	
17	EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	BM	640	28 ⁰⁰	
18	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/WATERPROOFING, THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	THOMPSON	WOOD PROTECTOR	18 ⁰⁰	
19	FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	INSL-X BM	TP WHITE	42 ⁰⁰ / 5 GAL PAIL	
20	AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS			N/A	
	<u>RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS</u>	GALLONS				
21	SPRAY – ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ./ CAN 11.5) 5 STAR	GALLONS	AS SPECIFIED		4 ⁸⁰	
22	RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X	GALLONS	AS SPECIFIED		33 ⁰⁰	
23	NEW METAL PRIMER	GALLONS	AS SPECIFIED		33 ⁰⁰	

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 33 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
24	RUSTOLEUM – ASST. COLORS	GALLONS	AS SPECIFIED			
	<u>WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS</u>					34 ⁰⁰
25	C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		17 ⁰⁰	
26	THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL – CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		18 ⁰⁰	
27	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), WOODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		12 ⁷⁵	
28	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SOLID COLORS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	640 BM		31 ⁰⁰	
29	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SEMI-GLOSS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	(DISC)			
30	MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, (ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		18⁰⁰	
				NB		
31	MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC.		36 ⁰⁰	
32	MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC.		36 ⁵⁰	
33	MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	(DISC)		NB	
34	MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	(DISC)		NB	

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 34 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
35	VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		32 ⁰⁰	
36	VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		32 ⁰⁰	
37	VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		41 ⁰⁰	
38	VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	AS SPEC		41 ⁰⁰	
39	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS	538	BM	89 ⁰⁰	
40	PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL	1 GALLON CANS	538	BM	18 ⁰⁰	
41	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS	538	BM	18 ⁰⁰	
42	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS	539	BM	89 ⁰⁰	
43	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS	539	BM	19 ⁰⁰	
44	2 PART EPOXY A	GALLONS	V440	BM	48 ⁰⁰	
45	2 PART EXPOXY B	GALLONS	V440-90	BM	14 ⁰⁰	
46	AQUAPON 09/3/01 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	V450	BM	36 ⁰⁰	
47	AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	V450-90 QT	BM	9 ⁰⁰ / QT	
48	LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM A 24 SERIES (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	NB			
49	LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97C150 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	NB			

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 35 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50	WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS		NB		
51	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT - 1-1/2";2";2-1/2";3";3-1/2";4"	EACH	NOT AVAIL in 4 inches	PACOA	249 349 449 549	
52	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS ABOVE)	EACH		PACOA	249 349 449 549	
53	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAMES SIZES)	EACH		PACOA	249 349 449 549	
54	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT	EACH		PACOA	249 349 449 549	
55	9" ROLLERS	EACH		PACOA	499	
56	LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP	EACH		PACOA	599	
57	INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS	EACH		PACOA	149	
58	2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH		3M	699	
59	1-1/2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH		3M	599	
60	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SMOOTH SURFACES	EACH		PACOA	199	
61	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTACT CEMENT	EACH		NB		
62	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN	EACH		PACOA	249	
63	ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6" MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE ONES)	EACH		PACOA	299	
64	4" STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE	EACH		PACOA	999	

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NO. 16-002-P

ITEM
#

UNIT

PACKAGE

**BRAND
NAME**

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

65

4" ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINI
ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)

EACH

PA COA

249

66

6" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)

EACH

PACO A

120

67

4" MINI COVERS FOR MINI
ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)

EACH

PACO A

109

VENDOR NAME

FOURMEN CORP

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 31 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	SUPER PAINT STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 (OR EQUAL)	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 72-45	27.64	110.56
2	ONE COAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE PAINT - ASST. COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 76-45xx	28.24	112.96
3	OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST. COLORS-BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 7-801xx	46.60	186.40
4	EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS- BM096 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 78-45xx	28.24	112.96
5	ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 6-282x	36.75	147.00
6	ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 258 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 17-45	16.81	67.24
7	ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX – ASST. COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 6-70xx	16.81	67.24
8	ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM 333 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 6-500xx	22.82	91.28
9	ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM-207 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 6-900xx	28.24	112.96
10	INTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM 275 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 1210-xx	17.70	70.80
11	INTERIOR VINLY LATEX – GLOSS- BM 276 OR APPROVED EQUAL <i>This # is Semi Gloss</i>	GALLONS	4 gal./cs	PPG 1251-xx	20.42	81.68

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 32 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
12	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM-171 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	PPG 6-8504	21.62	86.48
13	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – SEMI-GLOSS- BM -170 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	PPG 6-8524	22.82	91.28
14	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – GLOSS- BM M 28 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	PPG 90-1306	46.60	186.40
15	MASONRY ENAMEL – GLOSS- BM M22 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	PPG 7-80120	46.60	186.40
16	PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	PPG 3-617	40.27	161.08
17	EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	Cabot OIL OIL	35.28	141.12
18	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/WATERPROOFING, THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	ZINSSER	11. ⁰⁰ / ₁	44.00
19	FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	1 Five	Scotch RTU	34.45	34.45
20	AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		NO	BID	
	<u>RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS</u>	GALLONS				
21	SPRAY – ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ./ CAN 11.5) 5 STAR	GALLONS	6 per case	KRYLON ASST.	4. ¹⁹ / ₁	25.14
22	RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Rustoleum 69402	34.53	69.06
23	NEW METAL PRIMER	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Rustoleum 25569	34.53	69.06

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 33 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
24	RUSTOLEUM – ASST. COLORS	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Rustoleum Asst.	34.53	69.06
	<u>WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS</u>					
25	C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	Flood	23.88	95.52
26	THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL – CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	Thompson	18.94	75.76
27	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), WOODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	Zinsser	11.00	44.00
28	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SOLID COLORS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		NO	BID	
29	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SEMI-GLOSS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		NO	BID	
30	MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, (ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Minwax	26.82	53.64
31	MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Minwax	28.44	56.88
32	MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Minwax	28.44	56.88
33	MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	1 gal. 1301 Winterbark	41.84	83.68
34	MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	1 gal. 1301 Winterbark	41.84	83.68

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 34 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
35	VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Flecto	43.65	87.30
36	VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Flecto	43.65	87.30
37	VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Flecto	37.23	74.46
38	VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	2 gal./cs.	Flecto	39.49	78.98
39	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS	1 can.	PPG	98.94	98.94
40	PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL	1 GALLON CANS	4 gal./cs.	PPG	19.82	79.28
41	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS	4 gal./cs.	PPG	19.82	79.28
42	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS	1 can.	PPG	113.97	113.97
43	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS	4 gal./cs.	PPG	22.82	91.28
44	2 PART EPOXY A	GALLONS	1 can	PPG	47.50	47.50
45	2 PART EXPOXY B	GALLONS	1 can	PPG	47.50	47.50
46	AQUAPON 09/3/01 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	1 can	PPG	47.50	47.50
47	AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	1 can	PPG	47.50	47.50
48	LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM A 24 SERIES (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	Cubot 1000	22.18	88.72
49	LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97C150 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	4 gal./cs.	Zinsser Okon	35.45	141.80

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 35 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50	WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	NO BID			
51	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT – 1-1/2";2";2-1/2";3";3-1/2";4"	EACH NO 3 1/2	ARROW G032-30 All Packed 12 pc	1 1/2 2 2 1/2 3 4	2.72 2.96 3.96 4.23 5.62	32.64 35.52 47.52 50.76 67.44
52	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS ABOVE)	EACH NO 3 1/2 NO 4	ARROW G032 All Packed 12 pc	1 1/2 2 2 1/2 3	2.87 3.37 4.08 4.52	34.44 40.44 48.96 54.24
53	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAMES SIZES)	EACH NO 3 1/2	ARROW S032 All Packed 12 pc	1 1/2 2 2 1/2 3	2.98 3.42 3.52 4.72	35.76 41.04 42.24 56.64
54	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT	EACH NO 3 1/2 NO 4	ARROW S032 All Packed 12 pc	1 1/2 2 2 1/2 3	3.24 3.60 4.23 4.72	38.88 43.20 50.76 56.64
55	9" ROLLERS	EACH	24 pk. LW200 RF 215-9	Blue Dolphin	2.37	56.88
56	LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP	EACH	10 pk. ARROW RM435	ARROW	4.88	48.80
57	INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS	EACH	72 pk ARROW RM412	ARROW	1.00	72.00
58	2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH	24 pk	Blue Dolphin	4.44	107.76
59	1-1/2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH	24 pk	Blue Dolphin	3.55	85.20
60	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SMOOTH SURFACES	EACH	LW200 All Packed 12 pc.	937 C4 937 C1 937 CY4	1.65 1.30 1.27	19.80 15.60 15.24
61	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTACT CEMENT	EACH	50 pk ARROW 9PBM	ARROW	2.26	113.00
62	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN	EACH	LW200 12 pk	937 C2	1.43	17.16
63	ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6" MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE ONES)	EACH	12 pk ARROW G.S 24-403C	ARROW	2.93	35.16
64	4" STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE	EACH	6 pk ARROW 7095	ARROW	8.91	53.46

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT**BID NO. 16-002-P**

Page - 36 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
65	4" ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	12pk.	ARROW 416-LD3C	2.65	31.80
66	6" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	12pk. 2 pos. Roll	ARROW 65-LD3TP	1.64	19.68
67	4" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	12pk. 2 pos. Roll	ARROW 416-LD3TP	1.40	16.80

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT**BID NO. 16-002-P**

Page - 31 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	SUPER PAINT STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 (OR EQUAL)	GALLONS				
2	ONE COAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE PAINT - ASST. COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
3	OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST. COLORS-BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
4	EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS- BM096 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
5	ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
6	ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 258 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
7	ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX – ASST. COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
8	ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM 333 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
9	ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM-207 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
10	INTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM 275 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
11	INTERIOR VINLY LATEX – GLOSS- BM 276 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 32 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
12	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM-171 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
13	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – SEMI-GLOSS- BM -170 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
14	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – GLOSS- BM M 28 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
15	MASONRY ENAMEL – GLOSS- BM M22 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
16	PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
17	EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
18	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/WATERPROOFING, THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
19	FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	5 gallon pails	Pioneer Brite Stripe Pre-Mix	\$32.00	\$32.00/pail
20	AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
	<u>RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS</u>	GALLONS				
21	SPRAY – ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ./ CAN 11.5) 5 STAR	GALLONS	12 cans/case 20oz/can	Pioneer Quik Stripe Field Marking Paint	\$43.00	\$43.00/case
22	RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X	GALLONS				
23	NEW METAL PRIMER	GALLONS				

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200**BID NAME: PAINT****BID NO. 16-002-P**

Page - 33 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
24	RUSTOLEUM – ASST. COLORS	GALLONS				
	<u>WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS</u>					
25	C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
26	THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL – CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
27	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), WOODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
28	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SOLID COLORS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
29	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SEMI-GLOSS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
30	MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, (ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
31	MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
32	MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
33	MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
34	MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200**BID NAME: PAINT****BID NO. 16-002-P**

Page - 34 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
35	VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
36	VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
37	VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
38	VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
39	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS				
40	PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL	1 GALLON CANS				
41	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS				
42	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS				
43	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS				
44	2 PART EPOXY A	GALLONS				
45	2 PART EXPOXY B	GALLONS				
46	AQUAPON 09/3/01 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS				
47	AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS				
48	LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM A 24 SERIES (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS				
49	LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97C150 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS				

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200**BID NAME: PAINT****BID NO. 16-002-P**

Page - 35 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50	WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS				
51	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT – 1-1/2;2”;2-1/2;3”; 3-1/2”;4”	EACH				
52	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS ABOVE)	EACH				
53	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAMES SIZES)	EACH				
54	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT	EACH				
55	9” ROLLERS	EACH				
56	LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP	EACH				
57	INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS	EACH				
58	2” BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH				
59	1-1/2” BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH				
60	9” ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SMOOTH SURFACES	EACH				
61	9” ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTACT CEMENT	EACH				
62	9” ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN	EACH				
63	ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6” MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE ONES)	EACH				
64	4” STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE	EACH				

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200**BID NAME: PAINT****BID NO. 16-002-P**

Page - 36 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
65	4" ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH				
66	6" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH				
67	4" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH				

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 31 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
1	SUPER PAINT STAIN WHITE #A89w1151 (OR EQUAL)	GALLONS	GALLON	SUPER PAINT SATIN 189 AS SPEC'ED	21 ²⁰	21 ²⁰
2	ONE COAT SELF PRIMING HOUSE PAINT - ASST. COLORS-BM 103 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	SUPER PAINT EXT. LATEX LOW LUSTRE A 78W51	19 ⁹¹	19 ⁹¹
3	OIL BASE HOUSE PAINT EXTERIOR - ASST. COLORS-BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	INDUSTRIAL ENAMEL H/B B54W2401	17 ⁷⁰	17 ⁷⁰
4	EXTERIOR TRIM LATEX ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS-BM096 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	SUPER PAINT EXTERIOR GLOSS A89W1151	23 ¹⁹	23 ¹⁹
5	ALKYD GLOSS SASH & TRIM ENAMEL - ASST. COLORS=BM 110 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	INDUSTRIAL ENAMEL H/B B54W2401	17 ⁷⁰	17 ⁷⁰
6	ROYAL ONE COAT CEILING WHITE-BM 258 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	PRO MAR 200 0 VOC CEILING PT. A27 W5050	13 ²¹	13 ²¹
7	ROYAL ONE COAT INTERIOR LATEX – ASST. COLORS- BM 215 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	CASHMERE Acrylic INT FLAT D16W151	22 ⁵⁵	22 ⁵⁵
8	ROYAL LATEX SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM 333 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	PRO MAR 200 0 VOC SEMI-GLOSS B31W2651	18 ²⁴	18 ²⁴
9	ROYAL ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS – ASST. COLORS- BM-207 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	PRO CLASSIC INT ALKYD SEMI-GLOSS B34 W51	27 ⁶¹	27 ⁶¹
10	INTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM 275 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	PRO MAR 400 0 VOC FLAT B30 W4651	15 ⁷⁷	15 ⁷⁷
11	INTERIOR VINLY LATEX – GLOSS- BM 276 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLON	PRO MAR 400 0 VOC SEMI GLOSS B31W 465X	16 ⁸¹	16 ⁸¹

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 32 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
12	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – FLAT- BM-171 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	DURACRAFT ACRYLIC FLAT COI W251	17 ⁶¹	17 ⁶¹
13	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – SEMI-GLOSS- BM -170 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	DurCraft ACRYLIC GLOSS C14 W251	18 ⁶⁶	18 ⁶⁶
14	EXTERIOR VINYL LATEX – GLOSS- BM M 28 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	Sherwin-Williams DTM B66 W1051	19 ⁹⁷	19 ⁹⁷
15	MASONRY ENAMEL – GLOSS- BM M22 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	INDUSTRIAL ENAMEL ACRYL URETHANE B54 W151	18 ¹⁰	18 ¹⁰
16	PORCH & DECK ENAMEL- BM 112 OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	INDUSTRIAL ENAMEL ACRYL URETHANE B54 W151	18 ¹⁰	18 ¹⁰
17	EXTERIOR WOOD STAIN OLYMPIC OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	SUPER DECK SOLID COLOR S57 W51	15 ⁵⁵	15 ⁵⁵
18	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/WATERPROOFING, THOMPSON WOOD PROTECTOR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	SUPER DECK CLEAR SEALER SD100100	14 ²⁹	14 ²⁹
19	FIELD MARKING PAINT, LATEX (5 GAL. CONTAINER)OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	5 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Field Mark B2W902	35 ⁰⁰ / 5 gal	35 ⁰⁰ / 5 gal
20	AUTOMOTIVE PAINT (OMAHA ORANGE) OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	—	NO BID	—	—
	<u>RUSTOLEUM PRODUCTS</u>	GALLONS				
21	SPRAY – ASST. COLORS (SPECIFY OZ./ CAN 11.5) 5 STAR	GALLONS	Anyon CAN: 1202	Quarator 5 BALL 144-series	343	343
22	RUSTY METAL PRIMER RUST X	GALLONS	—	NO BID	—	—
23	NEW METAL PRIMER	GALLONS	GALLONS	KEM BOND 11/3 METAL PRM B50WEX	19 ⁷⁹	19 ⁷⁹

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 33 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
24	RUSTOLEUM – ASST. COLORS	GALLONS	GALLONS	INDUSTRIAL ENAMEL BS4W2401	17 ¹⁰	17 ¹⁰
	<u>WOOD PRESERVATIVE PRODUCTS</u>			NO BID		
25	C-W-F CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	SUPERDECK EXT. CLEAR SB170010	14 ²⁹	14 ²⁹
26	THOMPSON'S WATER SEAL – CLEAR OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS				
27	WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN (EXTERIOR), WOODLIFE PRESERVATIVE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	SUPERDECK EXT. WATER- BORNE ST STAIN SD5T0005	18 ⁷¹	18 ⁷¹
28	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SOLID COLORS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		NO BID		
29	THOMPSON WATER SEAL – SEMI-GLOSS OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS		NO BID		
30	MINWAX WOOD PRESERVATIVE/STAIN INTERIOR, (ASST. COLORS), 200 SERIES OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	MINWAX STAIN 250 VOC	28 ⁵⁴	28 ⁵⁴
31	MINWAX INTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	MINWAX INT. POLYURETHANE 6500-95896	48 ⁵¹	48 ⁵¹
32	MINWAX INTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	MINWAX INT POLYURETHANE SATIN 6500-95920	48 ⁵¹	48 ⁵¹
33	MINWAX EXTERIOR GLOSS POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	MINWAX EXT GLOSS 133-7708	39 ¹²	39 ¹²
34	MINWAX EXTERIOR SATIN POLYURETHANE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	GALLONS	MINWAX EXT SATIN 133-7724	39 ¹²	39 ¹²

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,

PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 34 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
35	VARATHANE GLOSS WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	6 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Wood Classics 6403-23317	24 ²⁰	24 ²⁰
36	VARATHANE SATIN WATER BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	6 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Wood Classics 6403-23291	24 ²⁰	24 ²⁰
37	VARATHANE GLOSS OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	6 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Midrax 6500-95896	48 ⁵¹	48 ⁵¹
38	VARATHANE SATIN OIL BASE OR APPROVED EQUAL	GALLONS	6 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Midrax 6500-92420	48 ⁵¹	48 ⁵¹
39	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS	5 GALLON PAIL	Sherwin-Williams Property Solutions B20 W3050	59 ⁷⁵ /5gal	59 ⁷⁵ /5gal
40	PITTSBURGH (OR APPROVED EQUAL) SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL	1 GALLON CANS	6 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Property Solutions B20 W3050	12 ²⁰	12 ²⁰
41	PITTSBURGH SPEEDHIDE EGGSHELL (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS	6 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Property Solutions B20 W3050	12 ²⁰	12 ²⁰
42	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	5 GALLON CANS	5 GALLON PAIL	Sherwin-Williams Property Solutions B31 W3050	64 ⁹⁰ /5gal	64 ⁹⁰ /5gal
43	PITTSBURGH SEMI GLOSS (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	1 GALLON CANS	6 GALLON	Sherwin-Williams Property Solutions B31 W3050	13 ⁰²	13 ⁰²
44	2 PART EPOXY A	GALLONS	/	NO BID	specification	
45	2 PART EXPOXY B	GALLONS		too vague		
46	AQUAPON 09/3/01 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	6 GALLON KIT	SW P1F Hi-Performance B67 W201	27 ¹²	27 ¹²
47	AQUAPON 98-98/01 GLOSS PART B (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	6 GALLON KIT	SW P1F Hi-Performance Epoxy B67 V200	12 ¹¹	12 ¹¹
48	LOXON XP WATERPROOFING SYSTEM A 24 SERIES (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	6 GALLONS	Loxon XP by Sherwin-Williams A24 W1451	15 ²¹	15 ²¹
49	LOXON ANTI-GRAFFITI COATING, CLEAR, B97C150 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	6 GALLONS	Sherwin-Williams Anti-Graffiti B97C150	91 ⁹⁰	91 ⁹⁰

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 35 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50	WATERPROOFING COATING, EXTRA WHITE, A24W451 (OR APPROVED EQUAL)	GALLONS	6 GALLONS	Sherwin Williams Loxon XP 124 Series	15.21	15.21
51	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT – 1-1/2"; 2"; 2-1/2"; 3"; 3-1/2"; 4"	EACH	EACH	Sherwin Williams ProVal Trim	2" 3.78 2 1/2" 4.27 3" 4.77 4" 7.06	
52	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR LATEX (SAME SIZES AS ABOVE)	EACH	EACH	Sherwin Williams ProVal Angled Sash	1 1/2 3.35 2 4.00 2 1/2 4.31 3 5.29	
53	STRAIGHT BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT (SAME SIZES)	EACH	EACH	Sherwin Williams ProVal Trim	2" 3.88 2 1/2" 4.77 3 5.29 4" 6.99	
54	ANGLED BRUSHES FOR OIL BASED PAINT	EACH	EACH	Sherwin Williams ProVal White Brisk	1 1/2 3.49 2 4.25 2 1/2 4.55 3 5.71	
55	9" ROLLERS	EACH	EACH	H/D Roller Handle 1300-1497	1.59	1.59
56	LARGE ROLLER PANS, DEEP	EACH	EACH	ProTay 173-5380	6.73	6.73
57	INSERTS FOR DEEP ROLLER PANS	EACH	EACH	liner for ProTay 286-3151	8.84	8.84
58	2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH	Roll	3M 2093 597-9539	5.96	5.96
59	1-1/2" BLUE PAINTERS TAPE	EACH	Roll	3M 2093 597-9534	7.77	7.77
60	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR ROUGH, MED. & SMOOTH SURFACES	EACH	EACH	Contractor Sealer Knit Covers	2.88	2.88
61	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR CONTACT CEMENT	EACH	EACH	Solvent Resistant 155-7057	2.12	2.12
62	9" ROLLER COVERS FOR STAIN	EACH	EACH	4" polyform cover 180-3204	9.74	9.74
63	ROLLER HANDLES FOR 6" MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE ONES)	EACH	EACH	Midwest Ken Handle 180-6678	1.19	1.19
64	4" STAIN BRUSHES THAT FIT BROOM STICK HANDLE	EACH	EACH	4" Stain Brush 171-7214	18.88	18.88

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD – PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

200 HOWELL AVENUE RIVERHEAD, NY 11901,
PHONE: 631-727-3200

BID NAME: PAINT

BID NO. 16-002-P

Page - 36 -

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	PACKAGE	BRAND NAME	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
65	4" ROLLER HANDLES FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	EACH	MINI ROLLER FRAME 6501-20721	241	241
66	6" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	EACH	MINI ROLLER 6501-82702	286	286
67	4" MINI COVERS FOR MINI ROLLERS (NOT WHITE)	EACH	EACH	MINI ROLLER PINK 6501-66700	312	312